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 About the Author

 I live in the beautiful mountains of Lake County California. I have always loved hiking, camping, rafting
and being outdoors. I've also been involved in the martial arts for years—I hold a third degree black belt,
instruct in a Korean karate system, and have taught self-defense. I am happily married to a romantic man
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who often inspires me with his thoughtfulness. We have a yours, mine, and ours family, claiming eleven
children as our own. I have always written books, forcing my ten sisters to read every word, and now my
daughters read and help me edit my manuscripts. It is fun to take all the research I have done on wild
animals, raptors, vampires, weather, and volcanoes and put it together with romance.

 Please visit my website at:www.christinefeehan.com

  

 Magical Sisters

 --3 Rocky Mountain Miracle (2004)--

  

 dedication
 This book is dedicated to Sheila Clover, a woman I admire very much.
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veterinarian questions and, most especially, Tory Canzonetta, a federally licensed trainer at Destiny Big
Cat Sanctuary, a last-stop haven for exotic cats. Visit the website at www.destinybigcats.com and see
the beautiful tigers and other cats! Tory rescues exotic cats and keeps them safe and healthy. She gave
me so much information and opened her heart and sanctuary to me for research.

 I love to hear from readers. Please feel free to visit my website, www.christinefeehan.com and join my
members-only private e-mail list to receive free screen savers, view teasers, and receive new-release
announcements of my books.

 chapter 1
 Cole Steele could hear the screams coming from the room down the hall. He knew those nightmares
intimately, because the demons also visited him every time he closed his own eyes. He was a grown man,
hard and disciplined and well able to drink his way through the night if necessary, but Jase was just a
young teenager. Guilt edged his anger as he made his way through the dark to the boy's room. He should
have done something, to spare his half brother the horrendous legacy of his own past.

 In truth, he hadn't been in touch with his father for years. It hadn't occurred to him that his father would
remarry a much younger woman and produce another child, but he should have considered the
possibility, not just dropped off the face of the earth. Cole shoved open the bedroom door. Jase was
already fully awake, his eyes wide with the terror of his memories. Something twisted hard and painfully
in Cole's chest.

 "I'm here, Jase," he announced unnecessarily. He wasn't good at soothing the boy. He had been born
and bred in roughness and still had a difficult time being gentle. Worse, Jase barely knew him. He was
asking the teenager to trust him in spite of his reputation and the rumors of attempted murder flying freely
through the town. It was no wonder the boy regarded him with some suspicion.
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 "I hate Christmas. Can't we just make it go away?" Jase asked. He threw back the covers and paced
across the room, the same edgy tension in his teenage body that Cole had in abundance as a grown man.
Jase was tall and gangly, like a young colt, all arms and legs, looking a bit like a scarecrow in flannel
pajamas. He had Cole's dark hair, but his eyes must have been his mother's, as they were a deep, rich
brown. Right now, his eyes were wide with terror, and he turned away to hide his trembling.

 Cole felt as if he were looking at himself as a youngster, only Jase had poured himself into books and
Cole had become a hellion. Cole knew what it was like to hide the bruises and the terror from the rest of
the world. He had grown up living in isolation and hiding, and he still lived that way, but he would be
damned if this boy would endure the same.

 "Did he shoot your dog for Christmas?" Cole asked bluntly. "That's what he did for me the last time I
wanted to celebrate the holiday like my friends. I haven't ever wanted a Christmas since. He also beat the
holy hell out of me, but that was insignificant next to the dog."

 Jase faced him slowly. The horror was still all too stark in his eyes. "I had a cat."

 "I'll bet he said you weren't tough enough and that only sissies needed pets and Christmas. He wanted
you to toughen up and be a man. Not get attached to anything."

 Jase nodded, swallowing an obvious lump in his throat. "He did a lot of things."

 "You have burn marks? Scars from cuts? He liked to whip me with a coat hanger. And when I didn't
cry, he took to using other things."

 "I cried," Jase admitted.

 "I did too, at first. He was a mean son of bitch, Jase. I'm glad he's dead. He can't touch you anymore.
I'm not going to lie to you and tell you the nightmares go away because I still have them. We both lived in
hell and he had too much money for anyone to want to believe us." Cole rubbed his hands through his
thick black hair. "He was sick, Jase. I got out, changed my name thinking he'd never find me, and stayed
as far from him as I could possibly get. That's no excuse. I should have kept tabs on him. Maybe I could
have gotten you away from him."

 Jase shook his head. "He never would have let me go."

 "You know what they're all saying, don't you? They think I had something to do with his death."

 Jase nodded, his eyes suddenly wary. "I've heard. Why did you come back?"

 "I was named your guardian in his will. It was the first I'd heard of you. I didn't know you existed until
five months ago. I knew he must have done the same thing to you and your mother that he did to me and
mine. I thought I could protect you, at least until you're old enough to live on your own. I figured I would
be a better guardian than anyone else the court might appoint or that our father had named if I didn't
accept."

 Dawn was creeping in through the huge plate-glass window. Cole watched the sun come up. It was
cold, and the ground outside was covered with several feet of snow, turning the hills into a carpet of
sparkling crystals. "You hungry?"

 "Are you cooking?"
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 Cole managed a lazy shrug even though he really wanted to smash something. It was always there, that
volcano inside him, waiting to erupt. The thought of his father, the time of year, it wasn't all that difficult to
bring rage to the surface. "I thought we'd go into town and give them all something more to gossip about."

 Jase met Cole's eyes squarely. "They say you killed the old man and that you're planning to kill me next.
Sixty-four million dollars is a lot of money, twice as much as thirty-two."

 "They do say that, don't they?" Cole said. "And don't forget the ranch. It's worth twice that easily,
maybe more with the oil and gas deposits. I haven't actually checked into how much yet." His eyes had
gone ice-cold, a piercing blue stare that impaled the boy. "What do you say, Jase? Because in the end,
you're the only one that counts as far as I'm concerned."

 Jase was silent a long time. "I say I'm glad you came back. But I don't understand why he left us the
money and the ranch when he hated us both so much. It doesn't make any sense." He looked around the
enormous room, frowning. "I keep expecting him to show up in the middle of the night. I'm afraid to open
my eyes because I know he's standing over the bed, just waiting."

 "With that smile." Cole's voice was grim.

 Jase nodded, a small shudder betraying the fact that he wasn't as calm as he tried to seem. "With that
smile." He looked at Cole. "What do you do when the nightmares come?" He punched his fist into his
pillow. Once. Twice. "I hate this time of year."

 Cole felt a sharp pain in his chest and the familiar churning in his gut. His own hand balled into a fist, but
he tamped down the smoldering anger and hung on to control for the boy's sake. "I drink. I'm your
guardian, so I have to say that's not allowed for you. At least not until you're a hell of a lot older."

 "Does it work?"

 "No," Cole said grimly. Honestly. "But it gets me through the night. Sometimes I go to the workout room
or the barn. I hung a heavy bag in both places, and I beat on them until my hands hurt. Other times I take
the wildest horse we have and go out into the mountains. I run the hills, using the deer trails, anything to
make me so tired I can't think anymore."

 "None of that works either, does it?" Jase had tried physical activity as well, but he was finding that
talking quietly with his half brother was helpful. More helpful than anything else he'd tried. At least one
person believed him. And one person had gone through the same torment. It created a bond in spite of
the ugly rumors that surrounded his tough, harder-than-nails half brother.

 Cole shook his head. "No, none of it works, but it gets you through the night. One night at a time. He's
dead, Jase, and that's all that matters."

 Jase took a deep breath. "Did you kill him?"

 "No, but I wish I had. I used to lie awake at night and plan how I'd do it. That was before Mom died.
Then I just wanted to get out." Cole studied the boy's face. "Did you kill him?" He concentrated his gaze
on the boy. Every nuance. Every expression, the way he breathed. The flick of his eyes. The trembling of
his hands.

 Jase shook his head. "I was too afraid of him."
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 Cole let his breath out slowly. He had stayed alive using his ability to read others, and he was fairly
certain that Jase was telling the truth. Jase had been in the house when someone had shot Brett Steele
right there in his own office. He wanted to believe that the boy wasn't involved in Brett Steele's death.
Cole wasn't certain how he would have handled it if Jase had admitted he'd done it, and for a man in
Cole's profession, that wasn't a good thing.

 "Cole, did he kill your mother?" For the first time, Jase sounded like a child rather than a
fourteen-year-old trying to be a man. He sank down onto the bed, his thin shoulders shaking. "I think he
killed my mother. They said she was drinking and drove off the bridge, but she never drank. Never. She
was afraid to drink. She wanted to know what was happening all the time. You know what he was like,
he'd be nice one minute and come after you the next."

 Brett Steele had been a sadistic man. It was Cole's belief that he had killed for the sheer rush of having
the power of life and death over anything, human or animal. He'd enjoyed inflicting pain, and he had
tortured his wives and children and every one of his employees. The ranch was huge, a long way from
help, and once he had control over those living on his lands, he never relinquished it. Cole knew he'd
been lucky to escape.

 "It's possible. I think the old man was capable of paying everyone off from coroners to police officers.
He had too much money and power for anyone to cross him. It would be easy enough for a medical
examiner to look the other way if there was enough money in bribes. And if that didn't work, there were
always threats. We both know the old man didn't make idle threats; he'd carry them out."

 Jase met his brother's stare directly. "He killed your mother, didn't he?"

 "Maybe. Probably." Cole needed a drink. "Let's go into town and get breakfast."

 "Okay." Jase pulled a pair of jeans from the closet. They were neatly hung and immaculately clean, just
like everything else in the room. "Who do you think killed him? If it wasn't either of us, someone else had
to have done it."

 "He made a lot of enemies. He destroyed businesses and seduced as many of his friends' wives as
possible. And if he killed anyone else, as I suspect he must have, someone could have known and
retaliated. He liked to hurt people, Jase. It was inevitable that he would die a violent death."

 "Were you surprised he left you the money and guardianship over me?"

 "Yes, at first. But later I thought maybe it made sense. He wanted us to be like him. He had me
investigated and found I spent time in jail. I think he believed I was exactly like him. And the only other
choice of a guardian he had was your uncle, and you know how much they despised one another."

 Jase sighed. "Uncle Mike is just as crazy as Dad was. All he talks about is sin and redemption. He thinks
I need to be exorcised."

 Cole swore, a long string of curses. "That's a load of crap, Jase. There's nothing wrong with you." He
needed to move, to ride something hard, it didn't matter what it was. A horse, a motorcycle, a woman,
anything at all to take away the knots gathering in his stomach. "Let's get out of here."

 He turned away from the boy, a cold anger lodged in his gut. He detested Christmas, detested
everything about it. No matter how much he didn't want the season to start, it always came. He woke up
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drenched in sweat, vicious laughter ringing in his ears. He could fight the demons most of the year, but not
when Christmas songs played on the radio and in every store he entered. Not when every building and
street displayed decorations and people continually wished each other "Merry Christmas." He didn't want
that for Jase. He had to find a way to give the boy back his life.

 Counseling hadn't helped either of them. When no one believed a word you said, or worse, was bought
off, you learned to stop trusting people. If Cole never did another thing right in his life, he was going to be
the one person Jase would know he could always trust. And he was going to make certain the boy didn't
turn out the way he had. Or the way their father had.

 The brothers walked through the sprawling ranch house. The floors were all gleaming wood, the ceilings
open-beamed and high. Brett Steele had demanded the best of everything, and he got it. Cole couldn't
fault him on his taste.

 "Cole," Jase asked, "why were you in jail?"

 Cole didn't break stride as he hurried through the spacious house. At times he wanted to burn the thing
down. There was no warmth in it, and as hard as he'd tried to turn the showpiece into a home for Jase, it
remained cold and barren.

 Outdoors it was biting cold. The frost turned the hills and meadows into a world of sparkling crystal,
dazzling the eyes, but Cole simply ignored it, shoving his sunglasses onto his face. He went past the huge
garage that housed dozens of cars—all toys Brett Steele had owned and rarely ever used—to go to his
own pickup.

 "I shouldn't have asked you," Jase muttered, slamming the door with unnecessary force. "I hate
questions."

 Cole paused, the key in the ignition. He glanced at the boy's flushed face. "It isn't that, Jase. I don't mind
you asking me anything. I made up my mind I'd never lie to you about anything, and I'm not quite certain
how to explain the jail time. Give me a minute."

 Jase nodded. "I don't mind that you've been in jail, but it worries me because Uncle Mike says he's
going to take you to court and get custody of me. If I lived with him, I'd spend all my life on my knees,
praying for my soul. I'd rather run away."

 "He can't get you away from me," Cole promised, his voice grim. There was a hard edge to the set of his
mouth. He turned his piercing blue gaze directly on his young half brother. "The one thing I can promise is
I'll fight for you until they kill me, Jase." He was implacable, the deadly ruthless stamp of determination
clear on his face. "No one is going to take you away from me. You got that?"

 Jase visibly relaxed. He nodded, a short jerky gesture as he tried to keep his emotions under control.
Cole wasn't certain if that was good or bad. Maybe the boy needed to cry his eyes out. Cole never had.
He would never give his father the satisfaction, even when the bastard had nearly killed him.

 It was a long way to the nearest town. There had been numerous guards at the ranch when his father
was alive, supposedly for security, but Cole knew better. Brett had needed his own private world, a
realm he could rule with an iron fist. The first thing Cole had done was to fire all of the ranch hands, the
security force, and the housekeeper. If he could have had them prosecuted for their participation in
Brett's sadistic depravities, he would have. Jase needed to feel safe. And Cole needed to feel as if he
could provide the right atmosphere for the boy. They had interviewed the new ranch hands together, and
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they were still looking for a housekeeper.

 "You, know, Jase, you never picked out one of the horses to use," Cole said.

 Jase leaned forward to fiddle with the radio. The cab was flooded with a country Christmas tune. Jase
hastily went through the stations, but all he could find was Christmas music and he finally gave up in
exasperation. "I don't care which one I ride," Jase said, and turned his head to stare out the window at
the passing scenery. His voice was deliberately careless.

 "You must have a preference," Cole persisted. "I've seen you bring the big bay, Celtic High, a carrot
every now and then." The boy had spent a little time each day, brushing the horse and whispering to it,
but he never rode the bay.

 Jase's expression closed down instantly, his eyes wary. "I don't care about any of them," he repeated.

 Cole frowned as he slipped a CD into the player. "You know what the old man was all about, don't you,
Jase? He didn't want his sons to feel affection or loyalty to anything or anyone. Not our mothers, not
friends, and not animals. He killed the animals in front of us to teach us a lesson. He destroyed our
friendships to accomplish the same thing. He got rid of our mothers to isolate us, to make us wholly
dependent on him. He didn't want you ever to feel emotion, especially affection or love for anything or
anyone else. If he succeeded in doing that to you, he won. You can't let him win. Choose a horse and let
yourself care for it. We'll get a dog if you want a dog, or another cat Any kind of pet you want, but let
yourself feel something, and when our father visits you in your nightmares, tell him to go to hell."

 "You didn't do that," Jase pointed out. "You don't have a dog. You haven't had a dog in all the years
you've been away. And you never got married. I'll bet you never lived with a woman. You have
one-night stands and that's about it because you won't let anyone into your life." It was a shrewd guess.

 Cole counted silently to ten. He was psychoanalyzing Jase, but he damned well didn't want the boy to
turn the spotlight back on him. "It's a hell of a way to live, Jase. You don't want to use me as a role
model. I know all the things you shouldn't do and not many you should. But cutting yourself off from
every living thing takes its toll. Don't let him do that to you. Start small if you want. Just choose one of the
horses, and we'll go riding together in the mornings."

 Jase was silent, his face averted, but Cole knew he was weighing the matter carefully. It meant trusting
Cole further than perhaps Jase was willing to go. Cole was a big question mark to everyone, Jase
especially. Cole couldn't blame the boy. He knew what he was like. Tough and ruthless with no backup
in him. His reputation was that of a vicious, merciless fighter, a man born and bred in violence. It wasn't
like he knew how to make all the soft, kind gestures that the kid needed, but he could protect Jase.

 "Just think about it," he said to close the subject. Time was on his side. If he could give Jase back his life,
he would forgive himself for not bringing the old man down as he should have done years ago. Jase had
had his mother, a woman with love and laughter in her heart. More than likely Brett had killed her
because he couldn't turn Jase away from her. Jase's mother must have left some legacy of love behind.

 Cole had no one. His mother had been just the opposite of Jase's. His mother had had a child because
Brett demanded she have one, but she went back to her model-thin figure and cocaine as soon as
possible, leaving her son in the hands of her brutal husband. In the end, she'd died of an overdose. Cole
had always suspected his father had had something to do with her death. It was interesting that Jase
suspected the same thing of his own mother's death.
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 A few snowflakes drifted down from the sky, adding to the atmosphere of the season they both were
trying so hard to avoid. Jase kicked at the floorboard of the truck, a small sign of aggression, then
glanced apologetically at Cole.

 "Maybe we should have opted for a workout instead," Cole said.

 "I'm always hungry," Jase admitted. "We can work out after we eat. Who came up with the idea of
Christmas anyway? It's a dumb idea, giving presents out when it isn't your birthday. And it can't be good
for the environment to cut down all the trees."

 Cole stayed silent, letting the boy talk, grateful Jase was finally comfortable enough to talk to him at all.

 "Mom loved Christmas. She used to sneak me little gifts. She'd hide them in my room. He always had
spies, though, and they'd tell him. He always punished her, but she'd do it anyway. I knew she'd be
punished, and she knew it too, but she'd still sneak me presents." Jase rolled down the window, letting
the crisp, cold air into the truck. "She sang me Christmas songs. And once, when he was away on a trip,
we baked cookies together. She loved it. We both knew the housekeeper would tell him, but at the time,
we didn't care."

 Cole cleared his throat. The idea of trying to celebrate Christmas made him ill, but the kid wanted it.
Maybe even needed it, but had no due that was what his nervous chatter was all about. Cole hoped he
could pull it off. There were no happy memories from his childhood to offset the things his father had
done.

 "We tried to get away from him, but he always found us," Jase continued.

 "He's dead, Jase," Cole repeated. He took a deep breath and took the plunge, feeling as if he was
leaping off a steep cliff. "If we want to bring a giant tree into his home and decorate it, we can. There's
not a damn thing he can do about it."

 "He might have let her go if she hadn't wanted to take me with her."

 Cole heard the tears in the boy's voice, but the kid didn't shed them. Silently he cursed, wishing for
inspiration, for all the right things to say. "Your mother was an extraordinary woman, Jase, and there
aren't that many in the world. She cared about you, not the money or the prestige of being Mrs. Brett
Steele. She fought for you, and she tried to give you a life in spite of the old man. I wish I'd had the
chance to meet her."

 Jase didn't reply, but closed his eyes, resting his head back against the seat. He could still remember the
sound of his mother's voice. The way she smelled. Her smile. He rubbed his head. Mostly he
remembered the sound of her screams when his father punished her.

 "I'll think about the Christmas thing, Cole. I kind of like the idea of decorating the house when he always
forbade it."

 Cole didn't reply. It had been a very long few weeks, but the Christmas season was almost over. A
couple more weeks, and he would have made it through another December. If doing the Christmas thing
could give the kid back his life, Cole would find a way to get through it.

 The town was fairly big and offered a variety of late-night and early-morning dining. Cole chose a diner
he was familiar with and parked the truck in the parking lot. To his dismay, it was already filled with cars.
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Unfolding his large frame, he slid from the truck, waiting for Jase to get out.

 "You forgot your jacket," he said.

 "No, I didn't. I hate the thing," Jase said.

 Cole didn't bother to ask him why. He already knew the answer and vowed to buy the kid a whole new
wardrobe immediately. He pushed open the door to the diner, stepping back to allow Jase to enter first.
Jase took two steps into the entryway and stopped abruptly behind the high wall of fake ivy. "They're
talking about you, Cole," he whispered. "Let's get out of here."

 The voices were loud enough to carry across the small restaurant. Cole stood still, his hand on the boy's
shoulder to steady him. Jase would have to learn to live with gossip, just as he'd learned to survive the
nightmare he'd been born into.

 "You're wrong, Randy. Cole Steele murdered his father, and he's going to murder that boy. He wants
the money. He never came around here to see that boy until his daddy died."

 "He was in jail, Jim, he couldn't very well go visiting his relatives," a second male voice pointed out with
a laugh.

 Cole recognized Randy Smythe from the local agriculture store. Before he could decide whether to get
Jase out of there or show the boy just how hypocritical the local storeowners could be, a third voice
chimed in.

 "You are so full of it, Jim Begley," a female voice interrupted the argument between the two men. "You
come in here every morning grousing about Cole Steele. He was cleared as a suspect a long time ago
and given guardianship of his half brother, as he should have been. You're angry because your bar
buddies lost their cushy jobs, so you're helping to spread the malicious gossip they started. The entire lot
of you sound like a bunch of sour old biddies."

 The woman never raised her voice. In fact, it was soft and low and harmonious. Cole felt the tone
strumming inside of him, vibrating and spreading heat. There was something magical in the voice, more
magical than the fact that she was sticking up for him. His fingers tightened involuntarily on Jase's
shoulder. It was the first time he could ever remember anyone sticking up for him.

 "He was in jail, Maia," Jim Begley reiterated, his voice almost placating.

 "So were a lot of people who didn't belong there, Jim. And a lot people who should have been in jail
never were. That doesn't mean anything. You're jealous of the man's money and the fact that he has the
reputation of being able to get just about any woman he wants, and you can't."

 A roar of laughter went up. Cole expected Begley to get angry with the woman, but surprisingly, he
didn't. "Aw, Maia, don't go getting all mad at me. You aren't going to do anything, are you? You
wouldn't put a hex on my… on me, would you?"

 The laughter rose and this time the woman joined in. The sound of her voice was like music. Cole had
never had such a reaction to any woman, and he hadn't even seen her.

 "You just never know about me, now do you, Jim?" She teased, obviously not angry with the man. "It's
Christmas, the best time of the year. Do you think you could stop spreading rumors and just wait for the

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


facts? Give the man a chance. You all want his money. You all agree the town needs him, yet you're so
quick to condemn him. Isn't that the littlest bit hypocritical?"

 Cole was shocked that the woman could wield so much power, driving her point home without ever
raising her voice. And strangely, they were all listening to her. Who was she, and why were these usually
rough men hanging on her every word, trying to please her? He found himself very curious about a total
stranger—a woman at that.

 "Okay, okay," Jim said. "I surrender, Maia. I'll never mention Cole Steele again if that will make you
happy. Just don't get mad at me."

 Maia laughed again. The carefree sound teased all of Cole's senses, made him very aware of his body
and its needs. "I'll see you all later. I have work to do."

 Cole felt his body tense. She was coming around the ivy to the entrance. Cole's breath caught in his
throat. She was on the shorter side, but curvy, filling out her jeans nicely. A sweater molded her breasts
into a tempting invitation. She had a wealth of dark, very straight hair, as shiny as a raven's wing, pulled
into a careless ponytail. Her face was exotic, the bone structure delicate, reminding him of a pixie.

 She swung her head back, her wide smile fading as she saw them standing there. She stopped short,
raising her eyes to Cole's. He actually hunched a little, feeling the impact in his belly. Little hammers
began to trip in his head, and his body reacted with an urgent and very elemental demand. A man could
drown in her eyes, get lost, or just plain lose every demon he had. Her eyes were large, heavily lashed,
and some color other than blue, turquoise maybe, a mixture of blue and green that was vivid and alive
and so darned beautiful he ached inside just looking at her.

 Jase nudged him in the ribs.

 Cole reacted immediately. "Sorry, ma'am." But he didn't move. "I'm Cole Steele. This is my brother,
Jase."

 Jase jerked under his hand, reacting to being acknowledged as a brother.

 The woman nodded at Cole and flashed a smile at Jase as she stepped around them to push open the
door.

 "Holy cow," Jase murmured. "Did you see that smile?" He glanced up at Cole. "Yeah, you saw it all
right."

 "Was I staring?" Cole asked.

 "You looked like you might have her for breakfast," Jase answered. "You can look really intimidating,
Cole. Scary."

 Cole almost followed the woman, but at the boy's comment he turned back. "Am I scary to you, Jase?"

 The boy shrugged. "Sometimes. I'm getting used to you. I've never seen you smile. Ever."

 Cole raised his eyebrow. "I can't remember actually smiling. Maybe I'll have to practice. You can work
with me."
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 "Don't you smile at women?"

 "I don't have to."

  

 chapter 2
 Cole Steele was backagain . The bar was jammed, bodies welded together as they moved to the
rhythmic beat of the music Maia Armstrong provided on the drums. The band was hot tonight, she could
feel the music pounding inside of her exactly the way it needed to be to keep the house rocking. She tried
not to see him, tried not to notice his body stretched out in a chair in a sexy, lazy sprawl. The music was
usually all that mattered, all she thought about when she played. She could lose herself in the primal beats,
the familiar feel of her hands on the sticks, whirling them in her fingers and finding that perfect pocket of
sound.

 Music took her far away from the terrible things she saw every day. The things that kept her on the
move, town after town, knowing she could never really settle anywhere. Music was her solace. Cole
Steele changed all that. What was he doing there? Had he already gone through all the women in the
more upscale bars in town?

 He was stinking rich and so sinfully sensual he should be locked up. He wasn't just the local bad boy; he
was a hard, dangerous man, one that wielded absolute power. He knew it too. It was in the arrogance
stamped into his very bones. He sat there watching her through hooded eyes, intent, focused, his hand
absently stroking the long neck of his beer bottle. He looked sosexual to her. It wasn't a charade, he
was really that way, his body hard and hot and… Maia groaned inwardly. She wasnot falling for a bad
boy. She had too much sense and too much self-respect. And he had far too much money and drama for
her even to consider such a folly.

 She wasn't going to look at him, wasn't going to let him get to her. A man like Cole Steele left
fingerprints on a woman, took away her soul, and never returned it to her. Once he left burn marks—and
he would—they would never fade. She refused to allow her gaze to stray his way, although she could feel
the weight of his heavy, brooding stare. Instead, she picked a table near the front and flashed a
high-wattage smile at the nearest man, wanting to focus anywhere but on the dark devil watching her.

 Cole shifted his legs into a more comfortable position in an attempt to ease the relentless ache in his
body. His fingers tightened around the neck of the beer bottle, nearly crushing it. Maia didn't need to be
smiling at any other man in the room, not when she should be smiling at him. She didn't want the others,
wasn't interested in them, but he could see her heightened awareness of him. She wasn't adept at hiding
it.

 Cole knew he was going to have to change his strategy completely. He might even have to eat his words
and actually learn to smile at a woman. He'd wasted nine nights coming down to the El Dorado Saloon
after hearing that Maia Armstrong, the traveling veterinarian, often sat in jamming on the drums in the
evening. He was either losing his touch or his mind. There were a dozen women who'd made it plain they
were willing to go to bed with him, so why was he so damned fixated on the one who refused to give in
to him? With a series of storms coming, most likely bringing severe blizzard conditions, this was going to
be his last chance to persuade her for a long while.

 She'd noticed him all right. He'd made it abundantly clear he was interested. He'd managed half a dozen
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conversations with her. She was always polite, but she kept a distance firmly between them. He tapped
his finger on the small round table as he watched her. Why was he so fascinated by her? Her smile could
light up the entire room, and her laugh was contagious. He shouldn't have noticed, but it was nearly
impossible not to. Especially when she was turning that smile on another man.

 He dreamt of her. Ever since he'd seen her in the diner the nightmares that always plagued him during the
Christmas season had been replaced with highly erotic dreams of her. Even Jase was beginning to tease
him about her, knowing Cole only left the ranch in the evenings to see her. Cole absently stroked the
neck of the beer bottle, wishing it were her skin beneath his fingers. He'd made up his mind he was going
to have to be aggressive with her tonight. Subtle wasn't working at all. He'd had plenty of time to study
her. It was his business to read people. Maia Armstrong was no pushover with men, but she detested
public scenes. She wouldn't fight it if he didn't push beyond her limit.

 A woman leaned close, blocking his vision, deliberately bending over him to give him a better view of
her ample cleavage. He stared up at her with hard eyes and a distinct scowl. "You're blocking the view."

 The woman flushed, but slid into the chair at his table. "You like this band?"

 He glanced at her. Once. A curt dismissal. He stared at her until she got up and stomped away. His rude
behavior would only add to his carefully cultivated reputation of being a complete bastard. What did it
matter? His reputation had been blackened a long time ago. Maybe he really had become a complete
bastard, but the truth was, he rarely found anything he wanted, and he wasn't going to tolerate anyone's
interfering with his getting it. His gaze returned to the woman playing the drums.

 Maia Armstrong intrigued him. It was as simple as that. He'd investigated her, of course. He investigated
anyone and everyone who touched his life, or Jase's. She was the new veterinarian and played in a band
in the evenings. She never took a permanent position in any town, but traveled, often filling in for other
vets. She had taken the place of the local elderly vet who, because of failing health, had been forced to
give up his practice before he could find someone to buy him out. Already, she was popular and very
well thought of by everyone who had worked with her.

 There were rumors about her. Some said she possessed magic. The majority said mysterious things
happened when she was around animals. She managed to save the hopeless and was fast earning a
reputation with the ranchers for being able to handle the wildest stock. The rumor persisted that she was
able to cast spells, on both animals and men, and Cole was beginning to think there might be some truth
to it. He was obsessed with her.

 He took a long, slow pull of his beer, never taking his gaze from her. The band was finishing their set. He
knew their music now, knew Maia's habits. He also knew she was very aware of his reputation, both as
a lady's man and as a dangerous felon. She didn't like gossip, probably because so many people
gossiped about her, and he was fairly certain she wouldn't make a scene when he made his move on her.
He calculated the odds, just like he calculated everything in his life.

 The drum built to a crashing crescendo, and Maia set her sticks aside and swept back stray tendrils of
hair that had escaped from her intricate braid. Her skin was damp, glowing, her smile satisfied. She'd
liked the way the music sounded, and it showed in her expression. Maia was never closed off to the
world the way he was, and Cole found even that intriguing. He had positioned himself perfectly, making it
impossible for her to get to the bar without walking past his table.

 Cole caught her wrist as she swept by him, pretending, as she did each night, not to notice him. He
shifted in his chair so that she was suddenly wedged between his outstretched legs, imprisoning her.
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"Have a drink with me."

 Maia could hear her own heart thundering in her ears. Up close he was overpowering. He looked all
male, his blue eyes dark with a desire he didn't try to hide from her. In fact, he wore his sensuality easily,
with complete confidence, a devil in blue jeans and sin in his heated gaze. She knew the rumors. She
knew what the town suspected Cole of doing. Murder. He'd been in jail. There was a tattoo on his upper
arm, which he'd obviously gotten in jail and didn't bother to try to bide. His body was hard and fit; but
sometimes, when he didn't think anyone was watching, she saw something sad and tragic in his
unguarded expression. And that was truly dangerous.

 The last thing she wanted to do was to add to the rumors flying around him. She couldn't imagine how
difficult it was to be the favorite subject of the town's most malicious gossips. He couldn't possibly have
done a third of the evil deeds attributed to him. Maia patted his dark head, a deliberate show of
camaraderie for the patrons in the bar. At the same time, she wanted to let him know, very politely, that
she wasn't playing his game. She leaned close to him, put her lips against his ear. "The lady sitting on the
barstool to your right is devouring you with her eyes. You have an easy score right there to take care of
any urgent… er… needs you may have."

 Cole felt her warm breath against his ear, the whisper of her lips against his skin. When she leaned into
him he inhaled the scent of her. Peaches and rain could be very intoxicating. His fingers around her wrist
kept her connected to him. "I want you to have a drink with me." His voice was huskier than he intended,
and her close proximity had more of an effect on him than he'd anticipated. His heart pounded, and he
could feel his blood surging hotly through his veins.

 Maia sucked in her breath sharply. Cole Steele was used to giving orders, used to having them obeyed,
and he certainly knew his effect on women. His voice was almost mesmerizing. She could feel the hard
column of his thighs pressing against her legs, as his thumb stroked over her bare skin where he held her
arm.

 Maia tugged a little on her wrist, not making it obvious to the curious onlookers. "I don't think that's a
good idea." She smiled to take the sting out of her refusal.

 "You never told me your name."

 "You know my name." Mentally she kicked herself. She was engaging with him when it was the last thing
she should be doing. How in the world did the man manage to be so potent? He was the most sensual
man she'd ever encountered. Her hormones were already in overdrive, just as they'd been for the last few
days. And, of course, it had to be for the resident bad boy.

 "What is it going to hurt to sit at my table and have a beer with me?"

 "Because that isn't what you want from me. Let go." She stood waiting, looking down into his brilliant
eyes. Cold eyes. Eyes that had seen things no one should ever witness. Maia sighed, trying desperately
not to see those things, not to see or feel or react to the pain swirling so deep in their vivid blue depths.
"Please."

 Cole removed his hand instantly. Maia made herself walk when she wanted to run. Her heart was
beating too fast. He was frightening in his intensity, and she was very susceptible to the man he hid behind
his remote mask. She knew a hurt creature when she saw one. Man or animal, her entire being reacted to
them. Cole Steele was one of those creatures, and he was just too darned dangerous for her to get
involved with.
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 "Sounded great tonight," Ed Logan, the bartender said in greeting. He pushed a frosted glass toward her
and leaned close, lowering his voice. "Keep away from him, Maia. He's bad news."

 She tilted the glass, savoring the ice-cold water as it went down her throat. Her gaze strayed toward
Cole Steele. His gaze was on her. Hot. Intense. Drifting over her body possessively. She turned her back
on him, leaning against the bar. Immediately she was all too aware that her movement left Cole staring at
her bottom, encased in tight jeans. It was all she could do not to shift positions immediately. "I have no
idea what you're going on about, Ed."

 "He's got a look about him. He's on the hunt for a woman, and it's rather obvious he has his sights set on
you. You don't play with a man like that and win."

 "You're such a sweetheart, Ed. I'd marry you myself if you weren't already taken. You can stop
worrying. Cole Steele is so far out of my league that I don't even want to play. He'll settle his sights
elsewhere fast enough. He'll get bored and move on to greener pastures."

 "Just so you know to be careful. People are saying bad things about him. Most probably aren't true, but
I know men, and he's dangerous."

 "At least to women," she agreed. "Seriously, Ed, I can look after myself."

 "He made a whole lot of enemies in this town when he came in five months ago and fired the crew that
was working out at the ranch. Times are hard and in the winter everyone needs work. No one knows
why he did it, and he isn't saying, but there's hard feelings."

 "A man doesn't fire everyone without a reason, Ed," Maia pointed out. "Especially not a rancher with a
spread the size of his. He needs them. Maybe a few head of cattle were missing. It happens all the time."

 Ed shrugged his shoulders and picked up an empty whiskey glass, dismissing the subject of Cole Steele.
"Loretta said to tell you to drop by anytime. And if you don't have plans for Christmas dinner, you're
invited to that as well."

 "You tell her thank you. Lucky you to have her."

 Ed nodded. "I can't get over you managing to save that dog of hers. She loves that mutt, and I was
certain there was no hope after the car hit it, but you pulled it off."

 Maia patted his hand. It hadn't been Loretta who fell apart when the little Jack Russell terrier had darted
out in front of a car. Big Ed had been sobbing so hard he couldn't speak when he and Loretta had
brought the dog to her.

 She turned away and immediately felt the impact of Cole Steele's piercing gaze. It should have made her
cold, but she felt heat spreading dangerously to every part of her body. She braced herself to get past
him a second time. The jukebox was playing, and a few couples were swaying on the dance floor to a
sultry love song. It might be more prudent to cut across the dance floor, but doing so would brand her a
coward in her own eyes. Or maybe she was feeling reckless.

 He stood up, a lithe, male movement of grace and sheer power, blocking her path. Cole towered over
her. With his wide shoulders and muscular body, he made her feel intensely feminine. His hands found her
wrists, his grip firm, but not hurting her as he drew her arms around his neck, fitting her body tightly
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against his hard, masculine frame. His arms caged hers, his thighs pressing against her until she was
forced to walk backward to the dance floor. Immediately she was engulfed in flames, a wrenching desire
spreading through her body and making her weak with need. His heavy erection was pressed tightly,
unashamedly, against her stomach, spreading flames over her skin.

 She said nothing. She refused to cause a scene by fighting him publicly, and in any case, she'd definitely
wanted this. She wasn't a child who lied to herself. She'd deliberately chosen to walk past him to give him
another opportunity to claim her. She closed her eyes and drifted with him on a tide of sexual awareness,
on arousal, on heat and flames and lust all mixed together. It was a unique experience for her. Maia felt
her body melting into his.

 Cole bent his head to the invitation of her bare neck. With her hair braided, it left her vulnerable to the
brush of his mouth against her pulse. She fit perfectly in his arms, as if she'd been made for him. He felt
the urgent demands of his body, but more than that, there was an unfamiliar longing that rose and lodged
deep where he knew he wasn't going to be able to remove it easily. Maia Armstrong left her brand on
him, and he hadn't even made love to her. Or maybe he was; he'd never actually made love to a woman
before, and maybe that was what he was doing.

 She stole his breath. Took his animal hunger and turned it into something altogether different. Cole's
arms tightened around Maia, urging her body even closer to his, wanting to imprint her into his bones. He
had come to her to rid himself of demons for a night or two, but with her body fitting into his, something
was softening inside of him, and for the first time since his childhood, Cole was terrified. He wanted to let
her go and walk away, to be safe in his isolated world; but he couldn't let go of her warmth or the
promise of magic in the curves of her body pressed so tightly to him.

 Cole became aware that the last notes of the song were fading away. He was completely confident when
it came to women. He was a highly sensual man and knew how to make a woman need him. It always
came easy to him. "I want to go home with you," he said shamelessly.

 Maia pulled out of his arms, refusing the stark hunger and dark intensity that drew other women to him
so easily. She flashed her powerful smile, the one he felt all the way down to his stone-cold heart.

 "Pheromones are nasty little devils, aren't they?" Maia asked. "They strike at the most inopportune
times."

 He couldn't let her go. He saw it in her eyes that she was just going to turn and walk away from him.
"Then come to the ranch with me." Was that really bad boy Cole Steele acting desperate? What the hell
was wrong with him? He should go straight to the woman at the end of the bar who was devouring him
with her eyes and walk out with her. It would serve Maia right. He knew she wanted him. She couldn't
hide her reaction to him.

 "You're afraid of me," he taunted her.

 "Do I look stupid to you?" She stepped back cautiously, making certain she could walk without
trembling. "Any woman with half a brain would be afraid of you. You have trouble stamped on your
forehead and packaged not so subtly there in the front."

 "Nice of you to notice, since you're the one causing the trouble." He made it a challenge.

 "Nice to know I can," she replied, in no way perturbed by the accusation. "Go away, Mr. Steele. You're
way out of my league."
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 The jukebox music shifted into another moody, sensual song, and Cole reached out to pull her back into
his arms. "What puts me out of your league?"

 She tilted her head to look up at him, which was a major mistake. His eyes were such a deep blue,
almost metallic, and he looked at her with dark desire. With hunger. With possession and determination.
There was a ruthless edge to his mouth and a need in the depths of his gaze she couldn't avoid. Her
breath left her lungs in a rush. "Everything. Money. Experience. Life. I don't want to get singed, let alone
burned. You come with far too high a price tag."

 His eyes were locked on hers, and she couldn't break away, held captive in spite of her resolve. It was
the fleeting glimpse of the hurt animal, the shadows of pain and betrayal he hid behind his cool, icy
demeanor that kept her from walking off the dance floor. She slipped her arms around his neck and
allowed her body to sink into the heat of his.

 His chin rubbed the top of her head. "All this time I was thinking you were the one with the high price
tag."

 "You probably think all women come with price tags," she muttered against his chest. She turned her
head to lay her ear over his heart.

 "Don't they?" he asked. "Usually it isn't all that difficult, but you, lady, present a problem."

 Maia listened to the steady rhythm of his heart. "I refuse to be a problem for you. You're the one
insisting on dancing with me. I told you no."

 "I didn't hear you say no."

 "Really?" She smiled against his shirt. "I could have sworn the entire room heard me. I thought I was
very emphatic about it."

 "No, you definitely didn't say no."

 "Well, I should have. My guard must have been down." She laughed softly, and the sound played right
through his body.

 "You're dangerous."

 "Funny. That's what everyone says about you," Maia said.

 Cole bent his head once more to the temptation of her bare neck. She was warm satin. He tasted her,
teased her earlobe with his teeth. Before she could protest his action he lifted his head to distract her.
"Why did you stick up for me in the diner the other day?" he asked. "Everyone believes I killed the old
man. Why don't you?"

 Maia shivered, tried to pull her suddenly scattered defenses back around her. His mouth had sent small
flames licking over her skin. "You were cleared as a suspect. It's all they talk about sometimes, and it
gets annoying. You were a thousand miles away when your father was murdered, but they want to
believe you did it." She burrowed closer to the warmth of his heart without realizing she was doing it.
"You inherited all that money and the ranch after you left home and turned your back on your father. And
then you dared to fire everyone. It's human nature I guess. They want you to be guilty. And it gives them
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someone to talk about."

 "I still might have had it done," he pointed out. His hands traced the contours of her back, slid down to
her waist and over her hips.

 "It was wrong of them. I felt bad for the boy. What is he? About fourteen, fifteen? He just lost his father,
and they want to spread gossip about his guardian. It's malicious, and it makes me angry."

 "He's fourteen, and he hated the old man." Cole heard the contemptuous words come out of his mouth.
He never revealed anything private to anyone, least of all a complete stranger or a woman he had sex
with. What the hell had gotten into him?

 They weren't even dancing anymore, just holding one another and swaying, their bodies moving in a
perfect rhythm. His arms tightened around her, and he drew her hips closer to him. The rest of the room
seemed to have fallen away, leaving them wrapped in a world of two. Maia looked up at his face.
Something fluttered in her stomach. His head began to descend toward hers, inch by slow inch. She
could see lines etched into his face, the shadow on his jaw, his long eyelashes and the intent in his hungry
eyes.

 "Don't you dare."

 "I have to."

 "I said no. Very decisively." Maia pulled her head back to keep his lips from touching hers. She'd be lost
if he kissed her with his sinful mouth. She was taking no chances.

 "You are a such a coward. You're running."

 "Like a rabbit," she confirmed.

 "You haven't asked me why I was in jail. Is that the reason you won't take me home with you?"

 His hands were making slow circles along her spine. His erection was pressed tightly against her
stomach. She ached in places she didn't know could ache. "I haven't asked why because it isn't my
business," she said, breathing a sigh of relief when the song ended. "I have to play."

 Cole let her slip out of his arms because if he held her any longer, he was going to throw her over his
shoulder and take her out of there to any place he could have her to himself for a long, long time. He
managed to make it back to his seat without breaking anything. He took a long pull on the beer. It was
warm and did nothing to cool the fire racing through his veins.

 Cole watched her through half-closed eyes, already staking his claim on her, making certain the other
men in the bar knew she belonged to him. No woman had ever gotten to him before. She seemed lost in
her music, unaware of him when he was burning for her.

 His cell phone beeped, and, scowling, he glanced down to identify the caller. "What is it, Jase?" Cole
demanded, his eyes on Maia. If she smiled one more time at the lunkhead in the front row, he was going
to have to smash his beer bottle right over the man's head.

 For a moment there was silence, then a harsh, tearing sob. "I trusted you. You knew I cared about him.
You knew Celtic High mattered to me."
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 Cole went still. "What are you talking about, Jase? Calm down and tell me what's going on."

 "The bay. He's all torn up. What'd you do to him?"

 "I didn't do a damned thing to him," Cole bit the words out in anger before he could stop them. "I'll have
the vet there in an hour." It was over an hour's drive to the ranch, but he could shave off minutes. He
couldn't blame Jase for accusing him. The kid had been taught not to trust anyone, but it still hurt. Much
worse than that, Cole couldn't help his own suspicions. He'd investigated the kid's past, looking for red
flags, cruelty to animals, anything that might indicate the old man had passed on his sick genes, but he'd
found nothing. Still, the doubt crept in.

 "He's in too much pain," Jase said. "He'll have to be put down. I can't do it. I tried, but I can't do it." He
was sobbing openly. "He went through a fence and he's really torn up. There's wood sticking in his chest
and stomach, splinters buried in his belly and legs. Some of the cuts are down to the bone. I can't put him
down, Cole."

 "Listen to me, Jase. I'll be there in an hour with the vet. Get Al and the other hands to help you. Take
Celtic High to the big barn where all the equipment is. The vet will need light to work on him, and that's
the most sterile environment we have. Tell Al to keep that horse alive."

 "But, Cole," now Jase sounded like a young child seeking reassurance, "he's suffering."

 "I didn't do this, Jase. I wasn't even there."

 "I found your work glove in the snow by the fence." Jase sounded apologetic. "I don't know what I was
thinking. I knew you went to town."

 "I'll be there in an hour," Cole repeated. "Get Al and stick close to him until I figure out what's going on."

 Maia watched Cole's face as he talked on the phone. He gave very little away with his expression, but
something was wrong. She saw the way his hand tightened around the neck of the beer bottle. He'd been
absently stroking it, almost seductively, and now he gripped it as if he wanted to throttle something. Cole
abruptly broke the connection and shoved the cell phone into his pocket, stood up and looked directly at
her.

 At once her heart began to accelerate, pounding in her chest. His gaze was cold, hard, and very direct.
He began to walk toward her with long strides, a ruthless stamp on his features and purpose in every
step. For the first time, she faltered in her playing, losing the rhythm that was so much a part of her. The
band ground to a halt. There was a sudden silence in the bar.

 "Come on. I need you out at the ranch. Let's go." Cole's voice brooked no argument.

 Maia studied his harsh expression. He reached out and caught her arm, nearly pulling her off her stool. "I
said now."

 A murmur of protest went around the room. It didn't deter Cole in the least. He crowded closer to her.

 Maia glanced around the bar, a quick appraisal of the situation, then her gaze was back on his face.
Implacable resolve. He didn't care that others might come to her rescue. He was perfectly prepared to
fight, and worse, he might win.
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 His fingers tightened around her arm. "You don't want me to carry you out," he warned.

 "You don't want me to slap your face either," Maia said, her gaze flicking coolly over his face. "Let's go."

  

 chapter 3
  

 "Don't ever do that again," Maia warned. She paused just outside of the bar to take a deep, calming
breath of the night air. "I know something upset you, and believe me, that's the only reason I'm out here
with you right now. I am not the kind of woman you can order around."

 Cole looked down at her, at the smoldering anger he saw in her eyes. It was snowing large flakes, falling
softly and mutely between them. He reached out, his fingers curling around the nape of her neck, and
pulled her toward him, his mouth taking possession of hers before she could protest.

 She expected his kiss to be as wild and dominating as he was, but it was just the opposite. His mouth
was incredibly gentle on hers, soft but firm, a whisper of fire, his lips brushing at hers with a disarming
tenderness. He lifted his head, his blue eyes nearly dazzling her.

 Cole could feel his heart thudding hard, too hard. There was a curious melting sensation in the region of
his stomach, and his body reacted instantly to the close proximity of hers. He knew immediately he had
made a big mistake. Maia Armstrong was no ordinary woman, and he was going to get burned if he
didn't regain some control, and fast. His fingers massaged the nape of her neck, brushing caresses in her
soft hair. He was renowned for his control, yet she seemed to turn him inside out. His careful defenses
didn't work with her.

 Maia managed to pull away from him. "If this emergency is some sham to get me to your ranch for more
ofthat …" She glared at him and wiped her mouth with the back of her hand, desperate to remove his
taste. His kiss had felt like a brand, making fire race from his lips and tongue to her belly, lower still, so
that she'd felt her body go liquid with desire for him.And he'd barely touched her .

 "Thatwas an apology. And stop trying to wipe it off." He caught her wrist, pulling her hand away from
her mouth, satisfaction mixing with something else in his eyes, something that could have been alarm. He
led her across the parking lot. "I'm used to giving orders and getting things done. We have to get to the
ranch immediately and telling you to come seemed like the fastest way to accomplish that."

 Maia bit down hard on her lower lip. She should have stopped him, slapped him, done anything besides
participate. She touched her mouth. It was still burning. She'd definitely participated. Where was her
pride? Her outrage? The man was more dangerous to her than she'd realized. With an effort, Maia found
her voice again. "You might want to give me the particulars." She sounded a little husky. "What type of
animal, and what's the injury?"

 "A horse. Jase's favorite horse Celtic High, although he won't admit it. Unfortunately, there's a blizzard
coming, a bad series of storms that could hang you up for days. I can't trailer the horse out during the
storm, so I'll need you to come with me now. I can only promise that if it's at all possible, I'll have the
roads cleared for you to return."
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 Maia glanced upward at the rapidly falling snow. "I thought the storm wasn't supposed to hit for several
hours."

 "It's early. We've got to move fast to stay ahead of it."

 "I'll need my rig. I can follow you out," Maia said, switching directions, the professional taking over. "I
have the drugs and everything I need in the sterile packs. I have to call the service and let them know and
get Dr. Stacy to take over while I'm gone. He's able to work on an emergency basis. If we're lucky, we'll
beat the storm."

 "I'll drive. We keep the road to the ranch plowed, but it can get rough in spots," Cole said, easily
keeping pace with her. "And there's no way to plow during a blizzard. Jase said the bay went through a
fence and that it has multiple injuries, gashes down to the bone and splinters of wood embedded in it. He
said he thought the horse was suffering and should be put down, but he couldn't do it."

 "And you want me to save the horse even if it can't ever be ridden again?" Many ranchers put down a
horse that was no longer a working animal.

 "Absolutely. Whatever it takes, as long as the horse isn't suffering," Cole said. "We've got a big ranch.
He can live out his days there."

 Maia nodded. "Okay then. And maybe we'll be lucky, and it won't be as bad as it looks. Horses can
sustain heavy injuries, and if you keep them from getting an infection, can come back quite sound." She
glanced back toward his truck, white from the fall of snow. "I'm used to driving in the snow. You don't
want to leave your truck here."

 "I have plenty of vehicles at the ranch, including a helicopter. And no one's going to touch my truck." His
gaze met hers squarely.

 Maia couldn't prevent the small shiver that went down her spine. Cole was right. Maia knew most of the
townspeople feared him. There was always that dangerous edge to him he couldn't hide, and he didn't
bother to try. Recognizing there was little use in arguing, she pulled out her cell phone and made the call
to her service. The snow fell into her hair and down the neckline of her shirt while she gave the necessary
instructions.

 As she pushed the small phone back into her pocket, she reached for the driver's door just as Cole did.
Maia pulled her hand back to avoid contact. "My rig," she said.

 "But I'm driving. I know the road, and the storm is coming in far faster than we thought. It'll be safer with
me driving because I know every rut and curve in that road." Cole swept the snow from her hair,
sheltering her with his body from the worst of the flurries. "We don't have much time. Give me the keys."

 Maia paused, her hand gripping the keys. "Why were you in jail?" She didn't want it to matter, but it did.
She wasn't about to become another victim because she was too stupid even to ask.

 Cole yanked open the door on the driver's side, swift impatience crossing his face. "Not rape, if that's
what you think. I don't abuse women." He slid behind the wheel and slammed the door with unnecessary
force.

 "Oh, really?" She hurried around the vehicle to slide in beside him, handing him the keys. "All those poor
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women you take to bed must feel pretty abused when you never call them again." The moment she
closed the door she felt trapped. He was potent up close, intensely male. His shoulders were wide, and
his chest thick and well muscled. She could smell the faint scent of his aftershave. And his kiss lingered on
her lips.

 His gaze dwelt on her face for a long moment as he turned the engine on. Immediately "White Christmas"
blared out of the speakers, filling the Toyota Land Cruiser with music. Cole winced and turned it off.

 "We need to get one thing straight right now, Maia," he said. "When I take a woman to bed, shenever
feels abused. And I detest Christmas music."

 "That's two things," she pointed out, furious at herself because she was tantalized by the very thought of
going to bed with him. He was far too arrogant and sure of himself for her liking.And he was a bad boy.
Trouble. The kind of man a smart woman stayed away from . "And I love Christmas music."

 "You would."

 "What does that mean?" He'd dragged her off before she could grab her jacket, and the temperature had
dipped sharply leaving her cold and shivering. Maia switched the heater to full power and rubbed her
arms for warmth.

 "It means you're one of those sappy women who get all gooey around little kids and animals and you
love the holidays. You probably give the garbageman a present." With something close to impatience,
Cole tossed her his jacket. "Put it on until it gets warm in here. And you do, don't you?"

 "There's absolutely nothing wrong with giving the garbageman a present. He works hard." She took the
jacket only because she was freezing, "Why?" she asked.

 "Why what?" He kept his eyes on the road, picking up speed and heading out of town, pushing the
speed limit as well as the margin of safety.

 "Why do you detest Christmas music?" Maia watched him closely. His expression didn't change, but the
tension in the Land Cruiser went up a notch.

 "Doesn't everyone detest Christmas music?" he countered.

 "No, most people love it. It's a happy time of year."

 "Is it?" His voice was grim. "Maybe to you. To me, it's a damned nightmare."

 "I take it you don't buy gifts for your lady friends," she teased.

 He glanced at her then, his gaze ice-cold as it moved deliberately over her body. "I might be willing to
come up with a gift or two for you if that's what it takes."

 Maia locked her fingers together to keep from smacking him and turned her face away to stare out the
window at the white world around her. If not for the injured horse and the thought of the boy waiting for
them, she would have told Cole Steele to go to hell, pushed him out of her truck and driven back to
town.

 Cole felt the silence cut between them like a knife. He preferred quiet. He was never uncomfortable with
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it. Yet with Maia, he found himself wanting to reach out to her, to bridge the gap he was creating
between them. He was fighting for the life he was familiar with, the one he knew and could survive in. He
didn't trust things like laughter and warmth, had never thought about having them for himself until he'd
pulled her into his arms and held her against his body. His body had demanded hers, and that should
have been enough. No-entanglements sex was all he ever wanted, yet he didn't think it would be enough
with Maia. She touched him in ways that were unexpected, intriguing, and frightening all at the same time.

 He turned off the main highway onto the private road that led to the ranch. The snow was heavier than
he'd counted on, but he knew every twist and turn. The snowplow had cleared the road before he left for
town, but already, the surface was covered with a thick white blanket. He peered out at the snowflakes
bursting at the windshield. Maia suddenly tensed and pulled back, making herself smaller in the seat,
throwing up a hand to shield her face. A huge owl nearly slammed into the window, wings outstretched
and flapping, head back, talons extended as if going in for the kill. It had come at them swiftly and
silently, an apparition swooping out of the blinding snow.

 The wicked talons reached straight toward Cole's eyes with only the glass separating them. Beside him,
Maia gasped. He swerved, nearly losing traction, a string of curses erupting from him until he felt the tires
grip and hold. The owl just cleared the top of the vehicle, and Cole breathed a sigh of relief. The bird had
been so close he had been able to see individual feathers on its body.

 Maia huddled inside Cole's jacket, closing her eyes, trying to calm her pounding heart. The owl had
shrieked a warning to her, risked its life to caution her to go back. She glanced at Cole's face, the lines
etched deeply there. The owl had flooded her mind with quick, flashing images of violence. It happened
so fast, Maia hadn't gotten a clear glimpse of the animal's projection. Only the ominous warning. She
took a deep breath and let it out slowly, trying to sort out what the bird was striving to communicate.
Darkness. Horses moving. Men. Flashes of lights that could have been rifle fire. None of it made sense.

 "That's never happened to me before," Cole said. "Maybe it was confused by the storm. Owls see and
hear so well, I imagine accidents would rarely happen."

 "He was in hunting mode."

 Her voice was so low, Cole barely heard her. He flicked a quick glance her way. She looked pale, her
eyes clouded with fear.

 "I'm a good driver, Maia. I'll get us there."

 She didn't answer. Cole sighed. She was doing him a favor, coming out to the ranch in the middle of
what was rapidly becoming a mean blizzard. He should have been more polite. She'd probably worked
all day, and she had a long, cold night ahead of her, trying to save the horse for Jase.

 "I shouldn't have said that about buying you." Cole glanced at her. It was always so easy with women.
He looked at them, they fell into his arms. They had sex, they went home, and he didn't think about them
again. That was how it was supposed to work, but Maia seemed to blow his carefully constructed
barricades all to hell.

 For a moment he thought she wouldn't respond. She didn't turn her head to look at him, but stared out
the window at the flurry of snowflakes. "Why did you?"

 "You get under my skin, and I don't like it," he answered truthfully. "I've never met a woman like you."
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 "You've met a million women like me. It's just that none of them ever stood up to you before." Her voice
was low and half-muffled by his thick jacket, but it found its way into his body, past his skin and muscle
to his very bones.

 She turned back toward him, and his breath left his lungs in a rush. He wasn't used to anyone having that
kind of effect on him, and it shook his usual calm. He kept his expression carefully blank, his warning
system shrieking at him that he was in trouble. "You're an interesting woman. Anyone else would have
jumped on the fact that I admitted you get to me, but not you. You have to be different."

 "It wouldn't serve any purpose to discuss it. I'm not going to sleep with you. I don't do one-night stands.
I'm not at all into casual sex." She managed a small smile. "But I'll admit you're a terrible temptation."

 He glanced at her, felt the wheels slide in a particularly heavy drift of snow, catch, and propel them
forward. She flung out her hand to grab the dashboard, but she didn't tell him to slow down.

 "I always get what I want, Maia." He said it with complete confidence. He didn't know if it was her cool
refusal, the warmth in her small smile, or the stark intensity of his desire for her, but he was determined
she wouldn't elude him. Even when he knew he was risking more than he should.

 "Well, want something else. I don't have a lot of energy to put into fighting with you. You're the kind of
man who normally sets my teeth on edge."

 "And that would be why?"

 "You're arrogant, bossy, too rich for your own good. Sexy as hell, but you know it, so you don't even
bother to be polite. There are a lot of willing women out there, Steele, go after one of them. I told you,
straight up, I'm not a one-night-stand kind of woman. That should be enough for you."

 "It should be, shouldn't it?" His gaze slid sideways toward her for a brief moment. Her hands were
twisted together to keep them from trembling. The vehicle slid several times, but he kept it on the road.
"I'm a good driver, Maia," he reiterated. "Relax. I won't let anything happen to you."

 She tensed again, pushing back into the seat and bracing one hand on the dashboard. He tapped the
brakes, slowing the Land Cruiser just as several deer leapt in front of them. The snow nearly coated
them, giving them a ghostly appearance, eyes shining, tails flicking in alarm. Cole swerved again, barely
missing the high embankment. The deer were gone as silently as they appeared. Maia's breath was
audible in the close confines of the car.

 "I don't know what the hell is going on tonight. Usually the deer are bedded down and under cover
during a storm."

 Maia huddled inside the jacket. The images were more vivid this time, but still jumbled. Fists pounding
into flesh. Blood on the grass. On the rocks. Her mouth was too dry to speak. She could feel a bead of
sweat trickling down the valley between her breasts, but she shivered with cold… with fear.

 Cole slowed the Land Cruiser, anxiety creeping into him. "Maia, are you all right?" He couldn't really
take his eyes from the road, just small glances at her, but she was definitely frightened. "I know it looks
bad out here, but I know the road. This is a good rig. The drifts are so high on the embankments, we
can't possibly get lost, even with the road covered. You must be used to animals rushing out in front of
the truck with all the driving you do." What he wanted to do was stop the truck and pull her into his arms.
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 Maia felt suffocated by the snowy white world enclosing them. "Maybe we should turn around." The
panic in her voice made her wince.

 "We're closer to the ranch than to town. I can't leave Jase out there alone, not with a wounded horse. I
hope he listened to me and got Al to help him. By now, the ranch hands will have gone home to avoid
getting caught in this blizzard." He reached out to comfort her, but she shrank away from him, and he
gripped the steering wheel, angry at himself for the gesture. "Is that what you really want? To turn
around?"

 Maia made an effort to pull herself together. What could she say in her defense? That animals were
warning her away from the ranch? He'd have her thrown in a padded cell. "No, of course not. I take it
that this horse is very special to Jase."

 "He won't admit it, but yes," Cole answered. "If it's at all possible, save the horse for him. The cost
doesn't matter. And if you could make Jase a part of it in some way, maybe have him assist you in
treating the bay and caring for it afterward, that would be great."

 There was something elusive there. Maia heard it, but couldn't grasp it. "Have you always been close to
Jase?"

 "We met when I was given guardianship over him. We had different mothers, and I didn't know he
existed until I was contacted by the private investigators the lawyers hired to find me."

 "How could you not know you had a brother?"

 Cole shrugged. "I checked out of that life a long time ago. When the lawyers told me about Jase, I was
shocked." He frowned. "The snow's really coming down. I left Jase out there with Al, my foreman, to
watch over him."

 "Weren't you afraid you'd get caught in town?"

 "I knew the storm was coming, but I thought I had a couple of more hours before it really hit. I'd never
allow Jase to spend the night alone there, so one way or another, I would have gotten back to the ranch."

 Maia heard the note of honesty, of absolute determination in his voice, and she believed him. Cole was
such a deceptive mixture. He'd come to the bar hunting for sex. He made no apologies for it and cared
little what others thought of him. He exuded complete confidence, even a coldness, yet there were
terrible shadows in his eyes. And there was Jase. He barely knew the teenager, yet he looked out for him
with a fierce protectiveness she would never have credited him with having. She believed Cole would
have tried to walk back to the ranch rather than leave the boy alone with just the foreman. Things didn't
add up.

 "Do you have children of your own?" she asked.

 "What do you think?"

 "I think you'd never let anyone get that close to you. You must have been terrified when you were
named guardian to this boy. Why did you say you'd do it?"

 "What is it they all say? So I can murder him and get all the money instead of sharing it with a kid."
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 "You don't even change expression when you hand out your nonsense. Don't worry, Steele, I don't want
to know your deep dark secrets."

 "You think I have secrets? I thought my life was an open book. Haven't the gossips given you the scoop
on me?" The snow was nearly blinding him as he maneuvered the road. At the rate it was coming down,
he wasn't certain they would make it to the ranch before the road became impassable. Even if he could
call Al to bring out the snowplow, he wasn't all that certain it would do any good. They were no longer in
front of the storm but in the thick of it.

 "Don't you have secrets? Doesn't everyone?" Maia wanted to keep talking. She would have chosen to
sit it out rather than continue driving. It was becoming difficult to see more than a foot in front of the
truck.

 "Even you, Doc? Do you have secrets as well? You're always laughing and seem so carefree, yet you
move from place to place, no home, nothing permanent in your life. No boyfriend who'll get upset when
you move on."

 "Who said I don't have a boyfriend? And I usually fill in for the same vets, so I make a lot of friends
along the way."

 "You don't have a boyfriend, or you wouldn't have let me get away with putting my hands on you while
we were dancing. You aren't that kind of woman."

 Shocked, she turned toward him, but he was staring out the window into the driving snow. "A
compliment. Who would have thought?" Maia burrowed deeper into his jacket. The inside of the car was
warm enough, but his jacket gave her a sense of security. She could smell his scent, masculine and
outdoorsy, the spice of his aftershave. He drove with the same confidence he did everything, and it
helped ease her anxiety a bit, but they seemed to be enfolded in a white, silent world. She wished he'd
play music just to keep her nerves from jangling. She had nothing else to hang on to but their
conversation. And he wasn't comfortable with making small talk.

 "Why don't you have your own practice?" Cole asked, flicking a quick glance her way.

 Maia stiffened. Her eyes held a wariness that hadn't been there before.

 "Maia, it was an idle question to keep the conversation going. You don't have to answer. I detest people
prying into my private life."

 He heard her swift, indrawn breath, and saw her turn toward the passenger-side window. Cole was
ready instantly for trouble, peering through the windshield to try to see what might be coming at him
beyond the heavy shroud of snow. He spotted dark shapes running alongside them, slipping in and out of
his field of vision. "What the hell is that?"

 "Wolves."

 He didn't dare take his eyes off the road to look at her. Cole concentrated on driving, alert for the
moment the wolves would run out in front of the Land Cruiser. He didn't doubt it was wolves. Jase and
he owned several thousand acres, and their ranch backed up to the national forest where wolves had
been relocated.

 "The wolves have always stayed away from my ranch and well back into the forest. What's bringing
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them out?" He glanced at her. Somehow she knew. "You've known the animals were there each time
before we saw them, before they jumped out in front of us."

 "How could I?"

 He didn't listen to the words so much as her voice. It was strained and trembling. She was lying to him.
She knew, but he couldn't figure out how. "I don't know, but you reacted, bracing yourself."

 "I must have seen them."

 A mournful howl rose, sending a shiver down Maia's spine. A second, then a third wolf joined in. A
chorus followed them, long, drawn-out notes of warning. She bit down on her knuckles to keep her teeth
from chattering.

 "What are they doing?" Cole asked. "Why are they running alongside the truck in hunting mode? And the
owl, it was coming in as if hunting, head back, talons extended, coming right at me." Even to him, it
sounded completely ridiculous. Had he not been trapped in the middle of a snowstorm, he wouldn't have
ever said such a bizarre thing, yet it felt right, not strange.

 "I have a certain affinity with animals," Maia admitted. She sent up a silent prayer that he wouldn't ask
what it meant. She didn't know what it meant. "Stop! Don't hit it." She flung out her hand to brace herself
on the dashboard as he fought the Land Cruiser to a halt without even seeing what was in the road.

 Before he could stop her, Maia was out of the vehicle, dragging a bag with her, disappearing into the
swirling white flakes. Cole slammed his fist against the steering wheel, pulled a gun from where it was
holstered in concealment on his calf, and checked the load before he shoved open his own door.

 The snow swirled around him immediately, engulfing him in a white, silent world and as fast shifted with
the wind to allow him glimpses of the animals and Maia. He heard the chuffing of the wolves as they
surrounded the vehicle. Maia crooned to something in the distance. He began to move toward her,
watching the wild creatures warily. Immediately the chuffing turned to warning growls. He froze, trying to
peer through the heavy fall of snow. The wind blasted through the canyon, and he saw her crouched over
something on the ground.

 "Maia? I didn't hit it, did I?"

 "No, it was injured earlier. I'll just be a minute. Get back in the Cruiser. The wolves are getting agitated."

 "I'll stay here and watch your back."

 She hissed her displeasure. Actually hissed. He heard it. "I can't protect you while I'm working. Get in
the car and wait for me." It was a definite order.

 The wind blew a blanket of snow between them again, and when it lifted, he could see the darker shapes
slinking around them. He stayed where he was, afraid of disturbing the precarious balance Maia seemed
to have. The next blast of chilling wind revealed her straightening and backing away from the shape on
the ground, clutching her bag in her hand. She walked quickly toward the Cruiser as the wolf jumped to
its feet, shook itself, and hurried off.

 The moment he slid in beside her, her gaze went to the gun in his hand. "Good grief. I thought you
couldn't carry a gun once you'd been in jail."
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 "Ranchers need guns." He shoved it back into his leg holster and glared at her. "The next time you
decide to take a stroll with a bunch of wolves in a blizzard, let me know ahead of time." He wanted to
shake her although she was already shivering uncontrollably and covered in white and that instantly made
him feel protective of her.

 "I'll do that." She didn't sound as tough as she would have liked with her teeth chattering. "Is that heater
putting out any heat?"

 "Yes, you should warm up again in a minute." He was cautious as he began maneuvering along the road,
alert for any more animals. "Are you going to explain what just happened?"

 Maia pushed the alarming warnings out of her mind and shook her head. "I don't think there is an
explanation. Do you want to tell me how you get away with carrying a gun?"

 "I hide it."

 "I'm not buying that. You wouldn't risk losing Jase over it. You're not even on parole are you? Is all the
gossip untrue? Have you ever been in prison?"

 He sighed. "Maia, I have a job. I'm good at what I do, and I'm good because I don't answer questions.
Most people I just tell to go to hell, or look at them and they shut up. Why don't you believe what
everyone else wants to believe and make it easy on me?"

 She leaned back against the seat, for the first time relaxing. "Because it's all made up, and I prefer to
hear the real story. What kind of job do you have?"

 Exasperated, he glared at her. "It isn't going to happen."

 She thought it was progress that he didn't tell her to go to hell.

  

 chapter 4
 "I'm going to pull your rig into the barn. You'll need all your equipment, right?" Cole asked.

 Maia nodded as she climbed into the backseat. "Keep looking straight ahead while I change into my
scrubs. I don't have a lot of clothes with me and I don't want to get everything filthy."

 "I do have a washing machine."

 "Since I only have what I'm wearing and my scrubs, I'm not taking any chances," she said.

 He glanced at her in the rearview mirror. She was shocked to see humor creeping into his eyes. It wasn't
much, and it faded fast, but it was there. "I managed to keep this thing on the road through animals
running out in front of me and a blizzard, but now you're asking just a little too much. I'm not exactly a
saint."

 Maia wiggled out of her jeans and dragged her familiar soft cotton, drawstring pants over her hips. "You

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


will get us into an accident if you don't watch what you're doing." She tossed her shirt aside and pulled
her loose top over her head, showing the minimum amount of skin. "And I'll bet no one has ever accused
you of being a saint." She whistled as Cole honked the horn in front of a large building. "Nice setup."

 The doors swung open to allow him to drive inside. The barn was huge and very clean, obviously used
as a hospital for the animals on the ranch when needed.

 Jase Steele waited anxiously as they parked the Cruiser in the huge barn. Maia saw his face, puffy and
swollen from shedding tears he thought no one would see. The boy was unable to hide his relief as Cole
unfolded his large frame from the Land Cruiser. "It's bad, Cole," he greeted.

 "Let the vet take a look, Jase," Cole advised. For one moment he thought about hugging the kid, but he
couldn't quite find a way to do it. Instead, he handed the teenager one of the packs. "We'll need your
help."

 "I would have put the horse down, Mr. Steele," Al Benton said, "but the boy refused to let me."

 "Were you able to tell how this happened?" Cole asked, choosing his words carefully.

 Al scowled. "Someone had to have run him into the fence, Mr. Steele. His rump had a couple of welts
on it."

 "Who was around?"

 "All the hands were already gone when Jase called me."

 Cole let his breath out slowly. Al hadn't been with Jase. That didn't sit well with him. Doubt tickled at his
brain, even though he didn't want to think the boy could have done such a thing. It made him feel like a
monster even to entertain such a notion. He ticked suspects off in his mind. Al, the ranch hands, Jase.
The ranch hands were working away from the main house and shouldn't have been there. He shook his
head to rid himself of the persistent doubt about his younger brother. If he was lucky, it was a legitimate
accident. Maia was already walking briskly toward the horse, and he trailed after her, grateful for the
distraction.

 "The wounds are down to the bone, Mr. Steele. The horse isn't going to be any good for work," Al said.

 Maia flashed a brief smile in the foreman's general direction "Let's not draw any hasty conclusions. I
haven't had a chance to assess the damage yet." She glanced at Jase. "You did great getting him in out of
the snow and putting him in the stocks so he can't move."

 "Al helped me," Jase said. "He's been quiet." He patted the horse's neck, his hand trembling. "He didn't
give us any trouble at all."

 "What's his name?"

 "His official name is Celtic High, but I call him Wally." His gaze shifted toward Cole, then away.

 "Let me see what I can do for him." Maia put her hand on the horse's neck as she moved around to look
into its eyes. Her stomach somersaulted. Images crowded in fast and ugly. Brutal, mean memories of an
animal watching helplessly as a boy was beaten and taunted and cruelly punished for nonexistent crimes.
The images were harsh and jumbled together. The animal's sorrow and pain, both physical and
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emotional, beat at her.

 She saw through the horse's eyes, memories of young Jase hiding repeatedly in his stall, only to be
dragged out again and again while the animal could do nothing to help him. She felt the familiar lurching in
her stomach, the sweat beading on her body and the strange dizziness that always accompanied
revelations the animals passed to her. It was her greatest gift, and a terrible curse. She could do nothing
to help the children and animals she saw coming through her practice. She could only remain silent, just
as the animal was forced to do, and move on, move away.

 "Maia?" Cole's hand went to her back to steady her. "Put your head down."

 She kept her hands firmly against the horse, forcing herself to see what the animal was willing to share.
Something stinging his rump. The shadow of a big man in the snow, raising his arm and slamming it down
with purpose. Repeated lashings across the hind legs and rump until the horse ran without thought into the
fence in a desperate effort to escape the terrible blows. Too big to be Al or Jase. Wide enough shoulders
to be Cole, but the horse displayed no nervousness near him.

 "Maia." Cole gripped her hard. "You're as white as a sheet." She was sweating too, and her gaze was
filled with a kind of horror. It had nothing to do with the gaping wounds or the blood. He knew it was
something else, something entirely different.

 Maia shook her head, letting go of the horse's neck and stepping back. "I'm all right." She couldn't look
at him. Couldn't look at Jase. Who had done such things to the boy? Who had kicked him? Broken
bones? Killed pets in front of him?He's fourteen, and he hated the old man . She remembered the icy
cold of Cole's voice when he'd made the statement. But Brett Steele was dead. Who had cruelly
tormented the horse until it had rushed headlong into a strong fence, nearly killing itself?

 Maia forced herself to appear normal. "I'm not the best traveler." She used her .stethoscope to check
the horse's heart, lungs, and bowel sounds, which gave her some time to compose herself before she
faced the Steele brothers.

 "If you don't need me, Mr. Steele," Al said, "I'll be heading back to the house before it gets so bad I
can't make it. My wife's called a hundred times already worried."

 "Yes, by all means, Al," Cole's gaze was on Maia's pale face. He didn't take his hand from her back. He
could feel the small tremors running through her body. "Be careful. This storm looks bad. I take it all the
animals are bedded down in sheltered areas?" His tone implied they'd better be.

 "Yes, sir. It was all taken care of before I let the hands go home." Al turned back. "I know this isn't the
best time, but Fred, my wife's brother, came by again looking to get his job back. He's a good hand, Mr.
Steele. He's got a couple of kids. It's not like there's a lot of work this time of year."

 Jase whipped his head around, his face still and white. The horse suddenly moved, reacting to the boy's
sudden tension. The movement flooded the animal with pain, but the bay rubbed its head against Jase in
an attempt to comfort him. The gesture immediately brought the teenager's attention back to the animal.

 Cole's fingers, on Maia's back, pressed deeper into her skin. There was heat there, a touch of anger. "I
told you no, Al. No one who worked for Brett Steele willever work for me or for Jase. I know he visits
you, but I don't even like the man to set foot on this property. I've looked the other way because I know
family's important to you and your wife, but I don't want to see him and I don't want him to go anywhere
on the ranch other than to your home. Is that understood?" His voice was ice-cold and carried a whip.
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 "Yes, sir."

 "And I don't want you to bring this matter up again." It was a distinct threat. Even Maia recognized it as
such. She glanced at Jase, who was stroking the Bays neck. She touched Cole's wrist. Gently.
Reminding him he wasn't alone. Lines etched his face, and he looked quite capable of anything. Even
murder. If she could see the buried rage rising up to swirl so close to the surface, so could Jase.

 Cole let his breath out slowly, trying to relieve the anger boiling up in him. Al kept hammering away at
getting his brother-in-law a job, but one look at Jase's pale face told him the man had been present
during one or more beatings. He felt like smashing something, preferably Al's face for bringing up the
subject yet again and putting that look back on the boy's face.

 "Yes, Mr. Steele," Al said and turned and walked away.

 Cole looked at Maia. "You ready to do this?" What he wanted to do was thank her, but the words
stuck in his throat. Jase looked as if he couldn't take much more.

 "Al wanted to put him down," Jase said. "He kept telling me it was best. I knew the horse was suffering,
Cole, but I couldn't let him go."

 "I told you to hang on," Cole said. "Let's see what the Doc has to say."

 Maia took the horse's head in her hands a second time and looked into his eyes, acknowledging pain
and memories, giving brief reassurance. She didn't care if the Steele brothers thought she was a nutcase,
the horse deserved some comfort before she went to work. When she was certain the animal understood
what she was going to do, she began her inspection, her face carefully blank as she evaluated the
damage. "Left hock has a three-inch laceration with bone exposed. Right hock, most wounds are
superficial abrasions. We have a left front dorsal forearm laceration through the muscle down to the
bone, approximately five inches long. We have major splintering from the fence around the laceration,
one piece fairly large." It looked like a stake to her, but she was very matter-of-fact, aware of Jase
watching her every expression. She put her hand on his shoulder. "We can deal with this if you're willing
to help out. First I need to give him painkillers and start him on antibiotics, then we'll get to work."

 Jase watched her preparing syringes, his eyes wide. "What are you giving him?"

 "Four different types of painkillers. All of them do something a little different. We don't want him to feel
anything while I work on him, but he has to stand, so we can't exactly knock him out. He'll be sedated
though, Jase." Maia gave the shots deftly, using her fist to strike and numb the muscle before jamming the
needle in. "The last two shots are for tetanus and a good dose of penicillin."

 Jase crooned to the horse as she administered the rest of the shots. "He's been so good. He hardly
moves, and it must hurt so bad."

 "The shots will numb everything for him," Maia assured. "Our next step is to get the wound sites as
sterile as possible. That's imperative. We're going to flush the site, and remove the debris and splinters,
including the large one. Horses can lose a lot of blood, Jase, and still be fine." She worked quickly as she
explained, mixing a liter of saline with Betadine. Without giving Jase any time to think about it, Maia
grasped the small stake with both hands and pulled the large piece of wood from the horse's chest.

 "The barn's well lit, great in fact," Maia said, to keep the boy focused on her and not on the blood. She

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


filled a syringe with the mixture of saline and Betadine. "I need you to begin flushing, Jase. You have to
squirt this all over the wound sites. We'll flush all three sites, and I'll clean them, then suture them. This
one here"—she indicated the hole where the stake had been—"we might leave open to drain."

 Jase took the syringe from her and aimed it at the gaping wound on the horse's foreleg and chest. The
flood of saline and Betadine removed dirt, debris and even splinters. "Is this right?"

 Maia noted his hand was much steadier. "That's exactly what I need. We want the area really, really
clean." She soaked gauze in Betadine and washed the area thoroughly, making certain to rid the wounds
of all foreign objects. "What I'm doing is clipping the skin so we can suture the dean edges. I've flushed it
again with Betadine and deadened the area with lidocaine, so really, Jase, he isn't feeling any of this."

 Cole watched her hands, fingers deft and sure, as she used stents to keep the skin loose as she sutured
the wound. She worked with obvious skill. It took a long time to close the five-inch gash to her
satisfaction.

 "This is a drain. I don't want to close off that hole in him. It's too big and we want to encourage it to
drain. We'll have to really watch that area for infection." Maia spoke patiently to Jase. Her voice was
very calm and her hands steady. "I'm also putting a second drain in the gash as well. The stents will keep
the skin loose, and I think it will heal nicely, but I'll want you to check this area several times a day for
any signs of infection."

 Jase nodded, looking very solemn. "I'll do it, Doctor."

 "I'm Maia Armstrong, Jase."

 He nodded again, ducking his head a little to avoid her gaze. "I can sleep out here with him and sort of
keep watch."

 "It's too cold," Cole said abruptly.

 Maia glanced at Cole from under long lashes. He felt her reprimand all the way to his toes. The woman
knew how to give a look. She turned her high-wattage smile on Jase.

 "That won't be necessary, Jase, although it's so good of you to offer. He'll be fine out here, and I want
him to stay quiet."

 Every now and then she spoke softly to the horse and to Jase, instructing him to flush the wound on the
hock a second time before she worked on it. When he was finished she used gauze soaked in Betadine
to clean it again, removing the last of the dirt and splinters.

 "Is he going to be all right?" Jase asked.

 "We'll see. We have a long way to go." She crouched beside the horse, working close, without fear or
hesitation, as she closed the second gash. She didn't seem to be aware of time passing or the temperature
in the barn dropping.

 "I'm going to put antibiotic paste on him, Jase. You can't let this stuff touch your skin, so we use tongue
depressors to smear it on. Primitive, but it works." She straightened, stretching a little as if her muscles
were cramped from crouching so long beside the horse. "We'll have to take his temperature every day,
and he'll need antibiotics injected into the muscle twice daily. Have you given shots before?"
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 Jase nodded. "A couple of times. Cole's been teaching me. Before, I didn't really go near the animals."

 She smeared the paste on liberally. "Don't worry, soon you'll be an expert in giving horses shots. You're
a natural."

 "Do you really think so? I thought about working with animals a long time ago. I like being around them."
Jase glanced at Cole, dearly nervous by the admission.

 Maia ignored the significant rise in tension and continued applying the antibiotic paste. "I think you're
good with animals. You have to read them, their body language, the look in their eyes. I think you have a
real affinity for that."

 "What do I have an affinity for?" Cole asked.

 Maia laughed, the sound unexpected in the large barn. White vapor drifted around them from the simple
act of breathing. She sent a mischievous smirk in Jase's direction, winking at him. "Trouble, Mr. Steele. I
think you're a magnet."

 Jase made a strangled sound, trying to suppress his laughter. Cole turned away from them. It was the
first real laugh he'd heard from the boy, and the sound flooded him with warmth. Maia had a way of
bringing Jase out of his shell, and Cole was grateful to her, even though he wished he'd been the one to
make Jase laugh.

 "You got that right, Doc," Jase agreed.

 Maia crouched once again beside the horse. "What I'm doing now is putting pressure wraps on three of
his legs to help prevent swelling. I considered putting a stack wrap on his left front, but we'll see how he
does. I think he'd just rub it off. I want to keep a careful record, Jase. I'll put this chart out here, so if you
happen to take his temp or administer his penicillin when I'm gone, we'll have a record of everything."

 "I'll do it," Jase promised.

 "I think we're just about finished. We'll let him rest."

 Maia stretched, yawning as she did so. "I hope you have some extra clothes you're willing to share, Jase.
I didn't bring much with me, and I have a feeling you may be stuck with me a while. I'll need to wash my
scrubs, and I'd really love something to sleep in."

 "Sure, Doc," Jase said, eager to find a way to repay her. "I'll find you something. And you won't have to
worry about getting lost in the snow between the house and barn. All the walkways are covered and
enclosed."

 She smiled at him. "That's handy. I really think he'll be fine. If we weren't in the middle of a full-blown
blizzard, I'd trailer him into the clinic, but I have all my equipment with me. I think we're prepared to
handle anything that comes along."

 "Will I be able to ride him eventually?"

 "Let's make it past the infection stage and see how everything heals," Maia hedged. "He had some nasty
injuries." She patted the horse's side. "He wants to get better, and that's more than half the battle right
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there."

 "Did he tell you that, Doc?" Cole asked, his eyebrow raised.

 "Well, of course. And he's rather fond of Jase as well. I'm surprised a man as sensitive as you didn't
catch all that." She grinned at him and blew on her hands to warm her aching fingers.

 His heart lurched uncomfortably. He couldn't help tucking stray strands of hair behind her ear. She
looked tired. "Jase, you need to shower and hit the sack. I don't want you staying up all night." Cole took
her hands and began to rub them between his own.

 Jase glanced at his watch. "I haven't eaten, Cole. I need food. Sustenance. Something like pizza."

 The moment he said the word, both brothers reacted, expressions shutting down, wariness creeping into
their eyes. They had already compared experiences of their father's reaction when as a boy Cole had
stayed after school to have pizza with his friends. Jase had done the same thing. Brett Steele believed in
absolute control and his punishments had been vicious.

 "I know how to make pizza," Maia said into the silence. "If you have the ingredients, I can make it."
Deliberately she pulled her hands away from Cole and clapped Jase on the shoulder. "You do have
flannel pajamas, don't you?"

 "You're bribing him," Cole pointed out, taking direction from her. Maia seemed to know naturally what
to say and do with the boy, where he was still floundering, feeling his way, knowing he was out of his
depth. "Jase, don't give up your flannels. I think she's hungry enough to make pizza for us anyway."

 "Well, I am, but I had planned on makingyou cook," Maia said.

 Jase snorted. "Don't even go there, Doc. Cole's cooking is downright ugly."

 "Hey, traitor." Cole managed to ruffle the boy's hair. His affectionate gesture startled both of them. He
dropped his hand quickly and Jase suppressed a small grin. "A beautiful woman comes along, and you
side with her."

 "I show good sense, you mean," Jase bantered back. "She can cook."

 Maia's smile widened. "I'm anawesome cook. And I love flannel, so I can be bribed."

 "I have a flannel shirt," Cole said. "If we have to pay for our four-in-the-morning supper, I'll contribute to
the cause." He took Maia's arm. "You're falling down you're so tired. And if you continue to shiver from
the cold any longer, you're going to rattle your teeth loose. Let's get up to the house."

 Jase patted the horse good night and hurried after them. "Thanks, Doc. I know it wasn't easy doing all
that work."

 "I like being a veterinarian. I really think you should give it some thought, Jase. School's hard, and you
have to be at the top of your class to get in, but I'll bet you have the brains for it."

 "He's a great student," Cole acknowledged immediately.

 "I had tutors most of the time," Jase admitted. "My father didn't want me to go away to school."
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 She'd bet he didn't. The wrong person might see his bruises. And a man like Brett Steele wouldn't want
to lose control of his prized possessions. His own sons. She stole a quick glance at Cole's darkly etched
features. He'd managed to escape his father's world, but now he was trapped all over again. What had
that done to him? He was removed from everyone, keeping a distance from the rest of the world, yet
trying desperately to keep the same thing from happening to Jase.

 She sensed that Cole had to let Jase inside of him. Into his heart. His mind. He had to allow himself to
love Jase, to care about him. Obviously he felt affection and a need to protect the boy. And that made
him vulnerable. Brett Steele had effectively tied Cole to him, to this place so haunted with his chilling
ghost. The elder Steele was certain that his money and his influence would enable him to reach his sons
from beyond the grave. Cole was trying to find a way to fight back, to give Jase a life. He just didn't
seem to understand that he and his brother would have to save themselves together, that it was a
package deal.

 "Do you go to a regular school now?" Maia shivered as Cole flicked a switch and the barn went dark.
He waved her through the open door to the covered walkway. The floor was constructed to drain the
water away from the center as the heating coils embedded in the concrete path melted the snow. Drifts of
snow were piled high on either side, cutting the wind.

 "Cole wants me to go to a private school, but I don't mix too well with other kids." Again Jase glanced
nervously at his brother as if he feared he was revealing too much and would be reprimanded.

 "You might like it if you try it," Cole said with no inflection. "You wouldn't have any trouble
academically. You're really smart, Jase, and you know it."

 "That doesn't make me socially acceptable," Jase muttered.

 "Is anyone ever socially acceptable?" Maia asked.

 Cole made a snorting sound of derision. "I'll bet you were the most popular girl in school. Prom queen.
Cheerleader."

 Maia winked at Jase. "What do you think?"

 "I think you should have been if you weren't," Jase said honestly.

 "You don't have to find me flannel pajamas, and I'll still make you a pizza," Maia declared. "That was a
nice thing to say."

 "I said it first." Cole crowded closer to her, keeping his body between her and the elements as best he
could. She was wearing only the thin scrubs and couldn't control her continuous shivering. "You're
making me crazy, Doc." He put his arm around her and pulled her closer to the heat of his body.

 "I'm a mess," she said, drawing away. "I'll need that washing machine."

 He pulled her back to him, slipping his arm around her waist so that she fit even closer. "I don't think you
know how cold you are, Doc. You're turning blue. You look good blue, but it clashes with your spunky
attitude."

 "I'm not spunky." This time she stayed near the intense heat pouring off his body. Warming her. It felt
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good, and she was chilled to the bone. He smelled masculine. She'd never smelled a man before, but
inhaled deeply, taking him into her lungs and trying not to rub her head against his chest like a cat. It
wasn't just the way he felt and smelled, it was the way he made her feel. "No one says spunky anymore."

 She'd never been so physically close to a man before. She moved around too much to form really close
relationships with people. She'd certainly never experienced such tremendous physical attraction before.
Cole Steele made her feel ultrafeminine, completely aware of herself as a woman—and him as a man.
"The word 'spunky' is definitely out," she affirmed.

 As the walked, her body moved against his in a perfect rhythm reminiscent of dancing. She could feel
her color rising, or maybe it was her blood pressure, as she remembered the feel of his body pressed so
tightly against hers when they'd danced together. The last thing she needed was to be trapped for any
length of time on his ranch with him. She had no idea if her self-control was that strong.

 Cole raised an eyebrow at his younger brother. Jase grinned at him, genuine amusement on his face. "I'd
have to agree with Cole on this one, Doc. You are one spunky woman."

 Feeling deeply unsettled by her attraction for the larger-than-life man walking so close to her, Maia was
grateful when Cole opened a side door to the main house, and they were in the snow room. Jackets were
hung on the walls, and boots lined the floor. Both men removed their shoes, and Maia did the same. It
was cool in the room, but far warmer than outside.

 The inside of the house was so warm she felt the blast of heat on her cold skin. The entryway was tiled,
but warm on their feet. She looked up at the archways and high ceilings, her breath catching. "Good grief.
You live here? This is a modern-day miracle."

 Cole and Jase exchanged a long look. Jase cleared his throat. "I'll find you some warm clothes." He
hurried off while Cole pulled a blanket from the back of one of the deep, oversized couches and
wrapped it around her. "How about I make you something hot to drink, and I'll cook tonight." He
glanced out the series of glass windows making up the front of the house. The snow was steady with no
letup. "I think you're going to be here a few days, and you'll get the chance to make Jase your famous
pizza another time. Right now you need to warm up."

 Maia couldn't argue with him. She was shivering uncontrollably. "I'd love a hot shower." Just the idea
sounded like ecstasy.

 The thought of Maia naked in the shower was enough to give Cole heart failure. "Sure." His voice was
husky and she gave him a sharp glance. He put his hand over his heart. "You're killing me."

 "Good. It's about time someone did. All those women come way too easy for you. It isn't good for you,
you know."

 "What? Women? You make me sound like a gigolo. There haven't been all that many." Why was he
defending himself? It was her smile, the way it lit her eyes, the way her soft mouth curved. Inwardly he
groaned. His mouth tightened. His jaw hardened. Why did he have to be so intrigued by everything she
said and did?

 Maia pinned him with her gaze, a small smirk escaping over his reaction. "Therewere that many women.
Point me toward the shower and the bathroom had better have a really good lock on the door. I did
mention I'm proficient in several forms of martial arts, didn't I?"
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 "I knew we were compatible. So am I."

 She heaved an exaggerated sigh. "Of course you are. What was I thinking?"

  

 chapter 5
 Maia threw off the goose-down quilt and sat up. It was impossible to go to sleep. She was so tired she
wanted to scream in frustration, but the house seemed to whisper to her. Evil, haunting whispers she
couldn't ignore. The pain in the house ran deep, was soaked into the walls and floors and ceilings. She
pressed her hands over her ears, trying to drown out the whispers and finally gave up, leaping from the
bed. It wasn't because she was psychic that she could feel the pain radiating out off the walls, it was
because it was so intenseanyone would have felt it.

 The blizzard had to stop soon, or she would be going out of her mind in this place. Maia wandered
through the spacious hall and down the curving staircase. The front of the house was mainly glass, and the
snow reflected light from every source, illuminating the interior of the house with soft silver light. The
house was beautiful, but it was a cold beauty, almost cruel. It gave her the creeps. Shivering, she made
her way toward the kitchen. Something to warm her up might help her sleep. If it weren't so cold, she
would go out to her Land Cruiser and sleep there. "What are you doing up?"

 Maia whirled around, her heart in her throat. Cole Steele was sprawled out on the overlarge couch, long
legs stretched out in front of him and a bottle of Jack Daniel's on the table. Her gaze jumped from the
bottle to his face. In that one, unguarded moment, she caught a glimpse of a man ravaged by pain, by
unspeakable horror, and she knew the truth. Jase had not been the only one to be abused. Cole had
suffered the same torment as Jase, and it explained a lot about the man he had become. Wary.
Dangerous. Solitary. It was a miracle that he had come back to take care of his half brother.

 Cole wrapped his hand around the neck of the bottle, his gaze all at once hot as it drifted with too much
interest over her body. "I asked why you were still up." There was a dark sensuality that called to
everything feminine in her.

 "Ghosts live in this house, but you already know that, don't you?"

 His fingers tightened around the bottle. Without taking his eyes off her, he lifted it to his mouth and took
a drink. His shirt was open, leaving the heavy muscles of his chest bare. There was rage in his eyes. Too
many memories and none of them good. "Yes," he answered abruptly, studying her over the rim of the
bottle. "When they get to be too much, I drown them. Do you want to join me?"

 Maia shook her head, resisting the need in him. So much darkness and intensity, and Cole was very
tempting. She healed hurt animals, and right now, he was far too close to being one. His way of forgetting
was to drink, to have sex with a woman… any woman. "Hot chocolate for me. I presume you must keep
a supply of chocolate on hand with Jase around."

 He nodded and turned away from her, setting the bottle carefully on the table and staring out the huge
glass panel to the pristine snow endlessly coming down. He looked utterly alone, and her heart stilled.
Maia glanced around the enormous room, with its cathedral ceilings, and the curving stairway that went
off in two directions. The house should have been alive with joy and music and Christmas decorations.
There should have been logs in the fireplace and the fragrance of cinnamon and pine wafting through the
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air. Instead there was a boy alone in his room struggling to find a way to survive and a man drowning his
demons in alcohol.

 She shook her head. The pain and suffering in the house was overwhelming for someone as empathic as
she was. And it made her angry on a level she'd never experienced before. Cole and Jase Steele existed,
yet they weren't really living. The ghost lived, and he ruled with an iron fist in the house.

 Maia thought it over as she made the chocolate. The house itself was the most beautiful thing she'd ever
seen, yet it was bleak and as empty as the life Cole Steele seemed to live. Earlier, in the kitchen, Jase had
laughed with her, teasing her about his pajamas being too big when she rolled up the cuffs and generally
acting like a happy boy. Her heart had gone out to him as he worked so hard at being normal when the
very walls of the house shrieked and wept for his suffering.

 Cole had said little, never smiled, his blue gazed focused and direct, watching her watch Jase. Sitting in
the kitchen chair, in his own home, he should have been relaxed, but instead, he had been on edge, wary,
aware of everything around him. Now she knew why. She could have sat in that chef's dream of a
kitchen and wept for both of them. Two men struggling to learn to come together as a family. Wary.
Secretive. Ready to push everything and everyone away—including each other. Everything, healer and
woman and compassionate human being responded to the intense pain in both of the Steeles, but a part
of her, her instinct for self-preservation, wanted to run away and hide. She had no idea what to do to
help either of them.

 With a small sigh of resignation, knowing she couldn't just ignore it all, Maia added marshmallows to the
chocolate and, picking up the mug, went to lean in the doorway to the living room. Cole's head was in his
hands, his body tense, hair damp as if he'd just woken from a night terror—or still remained locked
within it. She dug her fingers into the doorframe to keep from going to him. He wouldn't accept comfort,
unless she offered sex—and she wasn't about to offer herself up as a sacrificial lamb.

 "Go to bed, Maia," he muttered without looking up. "It isn't safe when I'm like this."

 She took a cautious sip of the hot chocolate. Waiting in silence. Cole turned his head and looked at her,
and her heart jumped, nearly melted. "Why are you doing this to yourself?"

 The careful, expressionless mask was back in place, but he couldn't hide the pain revealed in his eyes. It
remained there. Alive and ugly and so ingrained she wanted to comfort him.Needed to comfort him.

 "You think I do this to myself?" There was controlled violence in his voice.

 A shiver of fear went down her spine, but Maia persisted. She gestured around the house. "You keep
this house a monument to the pain and suffering he caused. You live inside his world, and you expect
somehow that you and Jase can overcome it. He's all around you, alive, here in this house, and you don't
do anything to get him out of here."

 "Who do you mean byhe ?" he asked suspiciously. He stood up, tall and lethal, a man who worked hard
to stay in shape, to train himself to be the weapon he'd become. A man who despised pity and refused
sympathy, preferring to remain alone rather than risk trusting anyone. Few knew about his past, he'd
come clean with a soft version for his superiors at work, but never a woman. He didn't need a bleeding
heart trying to stake a claim on him.

 Maia's heart began a frantic pounding. She was very aware she was isolated from help, possibly for
days. Cole looked capable of anything. She forced a shrug, trying to look nonchalant. "The ghost, of
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course. You admitted you have one."

 He shook his head as he took an aggressive step toward her, bare feet making no sound in the thick pile
of carpet. "Don't dodge the truth. Someone's been talking to you. What did they say?"

 She took another sip of chocolate. The cup was shaking so she steadied it with her other hand. "I know
something happened to Jase, yes. It's not all that difficult to figure out. And"—she indicated the bottle
with her chin—"that says it happened to you as well."

 He spat out a string of ugly imprecations, taking a second step toward her. "You don't know anything
about us. Big deal, I'm having a drink. Don't feel sorry for me, Doc, I don't need it."

 Despite her fear—or maybe because of it, Maia burst out laughing. "I definitely am feeling sorry forme ,
not you. Everyone has to live with demons, Steele. Some are worse than others, but we all have them.
It's your choice how you deal with them. Drink yourself silly if that's what floats your boat. Personally, I'd
drive the ghost out of my home. Reclaim it from him. Exorcise him, if you will." She looked around the
house. "It's beautiful here and you've allowed it to become a mausoleum, cold and ugly with something
cruel living in it. I can feel it. You can too. And so can Jase. I don't know why you want to keep it alive,
but, hey"—she shrugged—"it's nothing to do with me."

 Her heart hurt for him. Ached for Jase. But Cole Steele was never going to accept compassion from her.
It would seem too much like pity to him. And if she had sex with him, which he so obviously wanted, it
might get him through the night, but he'd still have to face his nightmares again and again.

 "You're damned right it's nothing to do with you." Cole crossed the room, to stand in front of her. The
top two buttons of his jeans were carelessly unbuttoned as if he'd pulled them on hastily and exited his
bedroom as fast as he could.

 Maia refused to be intimidated. She knew he was being blatantly sexual on purpose, hoping to scare her
away or get her into his bed. The knowledge gave her the confidence to walk right past him and she set
her mug on the coffee table.

 Using her most casual voice, as if they were conversing over a trivial matter rather than one that cut so
deep, she said, "It doesn't matter, Cole. We just believe in handling things differently. It doesn't mean I'm
right, and you're wrong, it just means I wouldn't do things your way, and you wouldn't do them my way."

 His cool blue gaze drifted over her. "What would you do if you lived here with ghosts?"

 It sounded taunting, like a challenge.

 She raised an eyebrow, turned to look around the spacious room. "I wouldn't let him drive me out or
ruin my life. I'm mean like that. If I could actually have a home, no one would take it from me."

 Maia wanted a home, but for some reason wouldn't stay too long in any one place. Cole filed the
information away for future use. "Give me an example. Jase hates Christmas. It wasn't a nice time of year
for him. He doesn't even like to hear the music, it brings on nightmares. If I cranked up "Jingle Bells," I'd
just be making things worse for him." And for himself. He'd looked death in the eye a thousand times,
courted it, spit at it, and he'd never so much as broken a sweat. But the thought of hearing Christmas
music, seeing decorations, reliving nightmares every moment scared the hell out of him.

 Maia nodded. Cole might be telling the truth about Jase, but in the scenario he was describing his and his
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brother's names were interchangeable. She took a deep breath and let it out. She wasn't a psychiatrist,
and she didn't have anything but her instincts to go on, but she knew someone had to reach out to Cole
Steele before it was too late. He shut out the world, preferred to live in isolation, but Jase had provided
him with a small window of opportunity to get his life back. What Cole would not do for himself, he might
be willing to do for Jase, and heal them both in the process.

 "Everyone is different in how they handle these things, but the truth is, Christmas comes every year. Jase
is going to have to face it year after year. And the season seems to come earlier every year. What
happens if he wants to get married and have children? It doesn't mean he can't have a great family life
without celebrating Christmas; but if he falls in love with someone like me, someone who loves
Christmas, it might be difficult."

 Someone like me. Cole's heart did a funny somersault. Maia did love Christmas, and he could see with
her sunny, outgoing, giving personality, she would. She was happy and cheerful, and she wanted a home.
Families celebrated things like Christmas. He nodded, feeling more alone than ever. "I've considered that.
I just don't know how to go about getting him to enjoy the season. If we go into town, and he looks at all
the decorations, that's enough to trigger the nightmares."

 "It started here, didn't it? With his father?" She asked it carefully, not looking at him, not taking a chance
he'd see the knowledge in her eyes. She was treading on very dangerous ground. Cole would be lethal
under the right circumstances, and she didn't want him to feel as if he had to defend himself.

 "Yes." He bit the words between his teeth. It wasn't talked about. Jase wouldn't be happy she knew
he'd been abused, any more than Cole wanted her to know. There was a sense of shame in being a
victim, even if you were a child and couldn't stop it.

 "Jase has to feel his father's presence here all the time, especially if you both leave everything the way it
was.I feel the man's presence. How could you not? If I was making the decisions, and I was going to
keep the ranch, I'd change every single room. I'd redecorate, even use rooms for different things. I take it
Christmas was never celebrated here?"

 "God, no," Cole said. "The old man hated Christmas."

 "Do you know why?"

 Cole shrugged. "I'm guessing his old man hated it, but whatever his reasons, he used it to hurt everyone.
He was at his most dangerous then. He seduced women, even brought them home in front of his wives. If
anyone made the mistake of turning on the radio where he could hear a Christmas song played, and I'm
talking the housekeeper or one of the ranch hands, he'd play it over and over and beat the hell out of Jase
or his wife."

 Or Cole and his mother. Maia sat down in the wide, cushioned chair. She deliberately chose a single
chair rather than the couch to keep a safe distance between them. Cole made her feel vulnerable. There
was too much pain and suffering, and she was a healer. When she felt pain, she responded. She forced
herself to remain calm, to breathe in and out when she wanted to scream with anger at the destructive
monster who had caused so much suffering in his own children. "So in effect, that man is still dictating
what goes on in this house."

 Cole passed his hand over his face, as if to wipe away the memories crowding in. "I fired everyone. The
ranch hands, the housekeeper, anyone that was here and had to have known what was happening to him,
but it didn't help much. I keep Jase with me when we interview people, and I listen to his input. He has a
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say in whom we hire and whom we pass on. I want him to feel safe here."

 "How can he when that man is still in this house? Brett Steele is everywhere, in every room. And he's still
the boss. He forbade you to enjoy such a simple thing as a Christmas season, and you don't. So he wins.
Even from the grave, he wins."

 Cole swore savagely, making Maia wince. She stared out the window to the heavy snowflakes, waiting
for him to regain control of his temper.

 "I'm sorry, Steele. You asked, and I gave my opinion. I'm no professional, and I'm sure you must have
sought counseling for Jase. I shouldn't have said anything when I don't have any experience."

 He waved a dismissing hand. "I wanted your opinion, or I wouldn't have asked. I've considered what
you're saying myself. I guess I just wanted you to say there was another, easier way. I've taken Jase to
counselors; he doesn't trust anyone. He refuses to talk to them."

 "There has to be a really good professional who could help him."

 "Maybe, but I haven't found the person. I can't blame Jase. He tried to get help when his father was
alive, and no one listened. In all fairness, they didn't dare listen. Money talks, and the old man had a lot of
power. He could destroy a business easily and did if his son befriended someone or talked out of turn.
Jase's trust is a fragile thing right now. I'm not going to force him to see anyone until he knows he can
count on me."

 "And can he?" Maia asked quietly.

 "If I never do another thing right in my life, I'll do this. Yes, he can count on me. He's coming first in my
life. I've put my job on hold until he's squared away."

 Maia's gaze met his. "What job?"

 Cole sprawled out in the chair across from her. "Does it matter?"

 "Sure it does. Do you like what you do? Do you miss working?"

 "I like the isolation of it. It's comforting. I know the world and the rules, and nothing is ever a surprise."
Cole was astonished the words slipped out. Maybe he'd had more to drink than he'd realized. He pushed
the bottle away with the tips of his fingers.

 "I guess I feel the same way about my job," Maia said.

 Cole regarded her through half-closed eyes. She was always surprising him. There was something
soothing and right about having her in his house. He could never imagine anyone else ever being there,
but somehow Maia just fit. "Why do you travel so much? You should have a home."

 She flashed him her smile. The one that could knock a man off his feet even from a distance. He'd
wanted that smile turned on him; yet alone in his house, with demons surrounding him and alcohol buzzing
in his veins, it was all too dangerous. She was so beautiful, curled up in the chair, her bare feet tucked
under her. And the question had to be asked, what was under those thin, flannel pajamas? He'd never
considered flannel sexy before, but he was looking at it in an entirely new way.
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 "What? Stop looking at me as if you're the big bad wolf." She shook her head. "I guess you can't help
yourself, you're always in hunting mode."

 Instantly his expression closed down. His gaze was watchful, shrewd. "I don't like games, Maia. What
the hell are you talking about?"

 He was thinking conspiracy theory. She sat across from him, weariness plain on her face, no makeup, no
guile, and he was actually considering the possibility that she had somehow set up the injury to the horse
and was out to get him, using Jase. Had he gone over the edge? To be paranoid of the veterinarian?She
traveled all the time. Was a stranger in town, but was able to gain the trust of those around her
fast . Nonetheless, the little voice that was always asking questions and compiling data persisted.

 Maia saw the wariness in his eyes. The sadden alertness. There was danger, but she couldn't figure out
what button she'd pressed. Talking with Cole Steele was like walking through a minefield. It was no
wonder he preferred one-night stands. No talking, just get down to business and he was safe. "I'm sorry,
I didn't mean to upset you. I was referring to your penchant for hunting for women in bars. I was just
about to say when you're not treating women like sex toys, you're really an okay human being, but I've
changed my mind. You're a very difficult human being."

 His eyes went cold and hard. "What the hell does that mean? I don't treat women like sex toys."

 "Of course you do. It'sexactly what you do. You troll the bars for women willing to get you through the
night, no strings attached. Hopefully you're also a safety boy."

 "Safety boy?" he repeated, unable to believe what she said.

 "I hope you at least protect all those women; otherwise, there's no hope for you at all." She turned away
from him, shrugging her shoulders carelessly when she didn't feel careless at all. She was beginning to be
pulled into the drama in the Steele home, and it frightened her. She didn't want to care about them, or
worry about them. She couldn't afford to get involved with someone like Cole Steele.

 "I'm not about to pick up a disease or get someone pregnant, if that's what you mean. And I don't give a
damn what you think about me."

 His voice was as cold as ice, but he was smoldering with anger. She could tell.

 Maia stared out the glass window, watching the snow coming down relentlessly. It was much safer
looking at the snow than looking at him or around at the ice-cold beauty of the house. "I was stating a
fact, not making a judgment; but you obviously have an entirely different set of values, so of course you
wouldn't see it that way."

 Cole could feel his temper rise. No one managed to get under his skin the way she did, although he
couldn't deny her accusation. He had gone into the bar several nights running with the sole intention of
sleeping with her in the hopes of getting through the Christmas season. Looking at himself through her
eyes wasn't a pretty sight, and the revelation was difficult to take.

 "How do you know how I'd see anything?"

 Maia turned her attention back to him, her too-cool gaze sweeping his face. "I don't, Cole. And I don't
want to know anything. Whatever your suspicions of me are, I'm not looking for a husband, a lover,
money, or anything else. I do my job, and I get out of town."
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 Cole could feel his stomach churning. She'd given him an out. He should go the hell to bed, walk away
and leave her alone. But something held him to the chair. Held him under her gaze. He wished it were
sex. Wished it were the intense physical attraction he felt for her. He didn't want it or need it to be
anything else. He scrubbed his hand over his face, trying to rid himself of the demons that refused to let
go.

 "The first lesson I can ever remember learning was never to trust anyone at all. Not my mother, certainly
not my father, not the housekeeper or any of the hands. It didn't matter how nice or friendly they seemed.
They would report everything to him. They would stand there watching when he killed something I made
the mistake of caring for. They stood in silence when he beat me with his fists or a whip or a hanger or
whatever else happened to be handy." He waved his hand to encompass the ranch. "This was a prison.
There was no way to get away from him. He had his security force, who watched our every moment."

 He was half-angry with himself the moment he revealed one of his darkest secrets. He'd told her by way
of apology for his paranoid conspiracy theories. Or maybe to prove to himself he wasn't as far gone a
human being as he believed he was. Whatever the reason, he couldn't take it back no matter how much
he wished he could.

 Maia was silent, careful to keep her expression from reflecting the horror and compassion in her mind.
She couldn't blow the moment by speaking, by saying or doing the wrong thing. Cole Steele was telling
her something she doubted he'd ever admitted to anyone. He might have glossed over a difficult
childhood, but he'd never spoken the details aloud to another human being. She picked up the mug of
chocolate, now cool, wrapping both hands around it.

 "Don't think I'm telling you this for sympathy," Cole said harshly. "It's important for you to know what
Jase has had to deal with. I don't want him to become like me. I want him to be normal. This is about
Jase. You understand? Just Jase."

 Maia managed to nod, blinking rapidly to keep tears at bay. Cole Steele was a lost man fighting
desperately for his younger half brother. She swallowed the lump threatening to choke her. Who was
going to save Cole?

 "He responded to you. You're the first person I've ever seen him do that with. He has that distance
between him and everyone else, but he laughed with you. Actually laughed. Jase needs something I can't
seem to give him."

 "You're giving him exactly what he needs right now, Cole. Stability and a sense of family. After so many
years, you said he's, what? Fourteen?" At Cole's nod, she continued. "Jase is afraid to trust anyone
completely. He wants to, but it's ingrained in him not to. Time will take care of that. As long as you don't
let him down, he'll count on you and learn to rely on your relationship."

 "Men like Al's brother-in-law, they wanted to pretend what went on here at the ranch was all right, just
something they had to put up with to keep their families going, but they were part of it, holding Jase here,
watching what the old man did to him. I don't want them anywhere near Jase, with their smirks and
patronizing bullshit."

 Maia heard the suppressed rage in Cole's voice. The men he'd fired were luckier than they knew. Cole
was capable of extreme violence. "Jase isn't ever going to get over this completely, Cole. It doesn't work
that way. The things we've experienced become part of who we are. It can make him a stronger, better
person, but he won't ever forget it or be able to get away from the consequences, the impact on his
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personality."

 Cole leaned back in his chair, allowing his breath to leave his lungs. "Who are you, Doc? Where do you
come from?"

 "I'm no big mystery, Steele. I grew up in a small town. My parents were killed in a car accident when I
was about sixteen, and I went to live with my only relative, my grandmother. She was an awesome
woman, and I hope I learned a lot from her. I loved animals, got decent grades, and decided I'd be a
veterinarian. I was about halfway through school when my grandmother died, and I discovered she had a
bit of money put away. It enabled me to buy my own equipment, and the rest is history."

 "Your entire life in a few short sentences." He saluted her.

 Maia smiled at him. "I told you it wasn't a big deal. Now,you are different. You're surrounded by
mystery and intrigue."

 "It's what women find appealing."

 "Really? I thought it was your brooding loner image. I guess it ties in though, I can see that. Are you
going to give tips to Jase on dealing with women?"

 Cole shook his head. "Jase is going to find a really nice woman someday and have a family. He'll have
two kids and come home every night to someone who loves him." He sighed. "He's not excited about
going to a regular school. I was hoping he'd go to a private one or even the public school, but he's always
had tutors, and he isn't comfortable with anything else."

 "He isn't comfortable not being with you. In effect, this ranch has been the only place he's ever been.
Didn't you say your father kept him prisoner here? Or close to it? He's staying in his comfort zone. We all
do that. We stay with what we know."

 Cole tried not to wince. She was lashing him, and she wasn't even aware of it. If anyone stayed in his
comfort zone, it was he. Cole didn't duck the issue. He was an adrenaline junkie, and he kept the rest of
the world at a distance. She was just sitting there, looking beautiful, pointing out his every flaw, and
through it all he had the most incredible urge to kiss her until neither of them could think anymore. "Isn't it
about time you tried to get some sleep?"

 Maia glanced at her watch, deliberately ignoring the flare of desire in his eyes. "You're right. It's already
morning. It doesn't look like we're going to get much of a break from this storm."

 Cole stood up, waited until she'd rinsed out her mug and climbed the stairs to the long sweep of a
landing. "Good night, Doc, thanks for everything you've done."

 Maia smiled at him over her shoulder. "Anytime, Steele."

  

 chapter 6
 "Jase," Cole said casually, "the doc's out with the horse right now, so there's no rush. Before you go out
to check on him I want to run something by you. I need a little advice."
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 Jase sat down at the kitchen table across from his older brother. "What is it?" They'd slept in late, and he
was anxious to make certain his horse had gotten through the night without a problem.

 "The doc." Cole pushed his hands through his hair, leaving it spiked and disheveled. "I checked the
weather, and it looks like we'll be socked in for at least a week."

 "She'll have to stay here?" Jase couldn't prevent the grin from spreading across his face. "I don't mind. I
think the doc's all right."

 "She loves Christmas, Jase, and she'll be stuck here with us probably through the twenty-fifth. She'll miss
it." Cole didn't look at the boy, but stood up and paced across the room in a restless, edgy movement.
"She came out here doing us a favor, she's stuck working; in fact she's already out with Celtic High"—he
glanced briefly at Jase, assessing his expression—"I mean Wally. I don't know, what do you think we
should do?"

 Jase rubbed his hand over his face, subconsciously copying his older brother's gestures. "Anything to eat
around here?" He looked around the room, anywhere but at his brother. "I'm starving, and it smells good
in here."

 "You're always starving. She made breakfast burritos for us. You just scoop up the eggs and wrap them
in the tortilla. The tortillas are still warm."

 Jase made his burrito, took a healthy bite, and sat there chewing, contemplating. "I don't know, Cole.
What do you think? She's really nice. Maybe we could put up a tree or something."

 Cole had his back to the boy, and he closed his eyes, his gut kicking up a protest. His ear was finely
trained, tuned to catch the slightest nuances, and he could hear the combination of hesitancy and hope.
"We've never done that before, either one of us. It might be interesting. The old man would turn over in
his grave."

 "As long as he stays in it," Jase said.

 Cole turned back to face him. "I saw the body, Jase. He's dead." Cole didn't admit he had insisted on
seeing the body. He wouldn't have believed anything or anyone would ever manage to kill Brett Steele.
The man had seemed invincible, a monster with such power he could live forever.Jase had been in the
house when the old man had bought it . Cole tried to push the thought away.Jase wasn't capable of
murder —not even of a monster like their father, was he? That niggling doubt persisted no matter
how hard Cole worked at keeping it at bay.

 "Who do you think killed him, Cole?"

 "It could have been anyone. He had a lot of enemies," Cole answered honestly, feeling relieved that there
were other suspects. "I think the question we need answered iswhy someone killed him. Did it have
anything to do with us? The ranch? The money? Anything that could affect us."

 "I didn't think of that. Why would it have something to do with us?"

 Cole shrugged. "I don't know, but it bothers me that all these rumors are so persistent, the ones about
me trying to do you in. Al mentioned you were helping him feed horses the other day, and you leaned
against the fence in the corner and it gave way. If he hadn't grabbed you, you would have gone over that

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


small cliff. You often lean up against that section when you watch the horses run. I've seen you do it."

 Cole had personally gone out to inspect the fence. Someone had deliberately loosened the post from the
cement. The fall wouldn't have killed Jase, but it might have broken a bone or two. What had been the
point? Any of the new hands could have done it. Cole had hired them out of Jackson Hole, but that didn't
mean they might not be friends with the former crew. Al had even mentioned that his brother-in-law,
Fred, had been around that day.

 "Al said the fence was old and needed repairing."

 "Maybe. But now there's this incident with Wally. Don't you think it's strange my glove was found by the
fence? I haven't been out there in a week, and my work gloves are always in my truck. I don't believe in
coincidence. The old man was murdered, and, even though these incidents seem unrelated, I'm not so
certain they are."

 Jase sagged in his chair. "I was thinking the same thing." He looked at Cole, fear in his eyes. "But I was
thinking maybe it was him. I know it's crazy, Cole, but what if he found a way to come back? I read a
couple of books on the subject, and some people believe a spirit can linger after death, especially if the
death was violent."

 "That's a load of crap, Jase. He's dead and gone."

 "Then why does it feel as if he's still here? I swear I'm afraid to do anything. I even look up when I go
into all the rooms, looking for the cameras he had to watch us all the time." Jase looked about to cry.

 "I destroyed the cameras and all the tapes, Jase. I did it right in front of you. We cleaned him out of
here." Cole cleared his throat. "Maybe we should try a Christmas tree and a few decorations. Let's take
the house back completely. He can't dictate to us what we can or can't do. If you're still feeling him here,
it's because we haven't made the house ours." He tried not to wince as he repeated Maia's logic. "So it's
really up to you if you want to try to celebrate Christmas this year. I'm game if you are."

 Jase shrugged, trying to look casual. "Well, maybe we should do it for the doc. I'd hate for her to be out
here looking after Wally and missing something she loves."

 Cole kept his expression carefully blank. He wasn't about to take away the boy's courage by letting on
that the very thought of trying to celebrate the holiday scared the hell out of him. He knew what he was
getting himself into. Brett Steele had been particularly cruel at Christmas, and the number of Cole's
nightmares increased in direct proportion to days of celebration. "Since I've never actually had a
Christmas, we might need a little help in figuring out what we're supposed to do."

 "You know how pathetic that makes us, Cole?" Jase asked. "I can't go to school with a bunch of other
kids and pretend my life is okay. I know you think I should, but I'm never going to be like them. I don't
want to have to pretend anymore."

 Jase took every occasion to remind Cole he objected strenuously to going into a classroom. Cole
sighed. "I want you to have friends, Jase. You don't want to end up being a loner. If you don't get out
there and mix it up with your peers, you'll never be able to."

 "Is that what happened to you?" Jase asked, belligerence creeping into his tone.

 "As a matter of fact, yes. I grew up the same way you did, remember? You aren't alone in this. I wasn't
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allowed friends either. I had tutors right here on the ranch. If I liked one of the hands too much, he was
sent packing. I don't have friends, and I don't make them. It's a hell of a way to live."

 "I don't want to go to school," Jase said stubbornly.

 Cole was happy the boy was at least telling him how he felt. That said he had grown comfortable enough
with Cole to do so. In the first few weeks they'd been together, the boy had rarely offered an opinion on
anything. "Let's do this, Jase. We'll start with this Christmas thing for the doc. If we can manage to get
through it without the two of us going nuts, maybe we can move forward from there."

 Jase nodded. "I don't mind trying for the doc, but I'm not promising about school." He scooped up more
eggs and rolled them in a tortilla. "She's a pretty good cook, isn't she?"

 "I thought so."

 "You like her don't you, Cole?"

 Cole went very still inside. He tried a casual shrug. "What's not to like?"

 Jase pushed his fork around the table. "Have you gone into the old man's office since he died?"

 Cole's head went up alertly at the boy's tone. "A couple of times, not recently."

 "He has a couple of maps of the ranch that I wanted. I was going to put them in my room, but they're
gone. They were in his desk drawer."

 "What do you mean, 'gone'? No one's here but the two of us. I didn't touch the maps, didn't even know
they were there."

 Cole felt a twinge of alarm. It was a silly thing, a missing map meant nothing at all, so alarms shouldn't be
going off, but he'd long ago learned to pay attention when a small detail was out of place. "Jase, are you
certain the maps were still there after Brett was killed? Someone could have borrowed them."

 Jase nodded. "I looked at them a week or so after he died."

 Cole drummed his fingers on the table. "That was before I fired Justine and Ben Briggs. It didn't occur to
me they might take anything. I wouldn't know it if they did. They worked here for years, so they'd know
more about what was in the house than either of us. They could have robbed us blind, and we wouldn't
know." But why would they take maps and not the Ming vase or the artwork worth thousands? Or any
of the other priceless objects decorating every room of the house. "You're certain of the time line?"

 "Cole, I was terrified to go into his office. I waited a week after he died, then when I pulled the maps
out, I couldn't make myself take them to my room. I folded them carefully and put them back in the
drawer in his desk."

 Cole decided the kid looked scared. "Jase." His voice was very gentle. "Brett Steele is dead, and his
ghost can't do a damned thing to us. It certainly didn't remove maps from his office. You have to stop
reading those books."

 "I didn't think about Justine or Ben taking anything," Jase admitted with a small sigh of relief. "That
makes more sense."
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 "Why were you interested in the maps, Jase?"

 Jase pushed the last bite of burrito around on his plate with his fork. "The ranch is so big, and I hated
that all the workers knew every canyon and peak and I had no idea what they were talking about. They'd
be talking about the cattle being in some canyon; I'd ask where it was, and they'd laugh at me. I hated
that. I hated feeling so small and stupid all the time. I was the boss's son, and they knew more than I did."

 Cole swore savagely under his breath, his back to the boy. Every little hurt added more to Jase's feelings
of inadequacy. The old man had purposely made him look small in front of the ranch hands, belittling him
and correcting him, even publicly humiliating and punishing him every chance he got. Cole knew without
Jase's telling him, because he'd received the same treatment.

 "I'll find you maps of the ranch, Jase," he promised gruffly. "Even if I have to draw them myself."

 "Thanks, Cole." Jase stood up and carried his plate to the sink. "Has the doc been up a long time?"

 Cole inhaled the scent of fresh coffee. "Yeah, she's been up a while. She's out there with that horse of
yours. Go on, I'll take care of cleanup this morning." Cole waved the boy out, not wanting to face Maia
yet. She'd disarmed him without even trying, filling the house with the fragrance of breakfast, giving him
an unfamiliar sense of warmth and home. He sat there for a moment contemplating that. He'd never felt as
if he'd had a home before.

 When he woke up that morning he'd been instantly aware that Maia Armstrong was in his house. Not
just any woman, but Maia Armstrong. He never let a woman spend the night with him, and he always left
their houses immediately after sex. With Maia, everything seemed different, but he couldn't put his finger
on why. It wasn't the fact that he'd awakened with a hell of a hard-on from the erotic dream he'd had
about her, instead of waking from the usual nightmare, tangled in his sheets with a gun in his hand. It was
because she'd brought a sense of home to the monstrosity of a house he occupied.

 He had awakened looking forward to the day and he hadn't experienced that feeling very often. He had
lain there, staring at the ceiling, his heart pounding and his mouth dry, terrified that Maia Armstrong could
do that to him. Make him happy by just being in his house. By making a building seem like a home just
with her presence. By removing the endless nightmares and replacing them with dreams of her. Her smile.
She had a killer smile. Her eyes went soft, almost mesmerizing. The sound of her laughter. It seemed to
vibrate through his body, wrap around him until it squeezed his heart and lungs.

 He swore out loud, jumping up fast enough to knock over his chair and turning around in the huge
kitchen without a real purpose. She was getting under his skin. He should have found a way to seduce
her last night and get it over with; instead, he'd revealed intimate, private details he never should have
admitted. She had ammunition to use against him, and he'd given it to her. "Oh, you're good, lady," he
said. "What are you after?" He picked up the chair, slamming it against the table.

 Immediately he was ashamed of himself. What was he thinking she wanted? Him? She'd made it clear
she had no intention of sleeping with him. His money? That would entail some kind of a relationship with
him. He threw a plate into the soapy water, avoiding the dish-washer. Suds and water splashed over the
edge of the sink. He needed a damned housekeeper, not a girlfriend.

 "Cole!" Jase burst threw the kitchen door, slamming it back on its frame so hard it nearly bounced.
"Come quick. The doc fell and hit her head."
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 Cole rushed past him, his heart in his throat. "How the hell did that happen?"

 "I don't know, I found her on the walkway. There's ice all around her."

 "Ice?" Cole sprinted along the covered walkway. There was snow piled high on either side and more
flakes were coming down rapidly. The walkways had been specifically constructed with a wide overhang
to keep any water from running down onto the surface for the very purpose of keeping ice from forming.
The latticework and snow, piled so high on either side, kept the wind and drafts at bay, forming a
warmer tunnel for them to use in going back and forth between the various buildings.

 Maia lay sprawled on the ground, one hand at the back of her head. Cole could see the bright red blood
staining the white snow underneath her. He crouched beside her, catching her hand gently and drawing it
away from the wound. "Let me see."

 She looked up at him, her wide eyes dazed and slightly unfocused. "I just slipped. It wasn't icy when I
came out here, and I didn't notice the surface."

 Cole felt the lump on her head through the mass of thick dark hair. It was sticky with blood. He studied
the walkway. There was no dripping water that could have caused the snow to ice over the way it had.
The surface was slick with a layer of ice, almost as if someone had sprayed water over it. He studied the
latticework. A few drops of ice clung to the wood just about level with his waist. "Don't move, Doc, just
lie still while I take a look at you."Jase was the only person around . He swore silently. He didn't want
to think the boy could in any way be like their father, but his own past and his job gave him a suspicious
nature. He had to eliminate Jase as a suspect. There were ranch hands—even Al—living on the ranch
and even in a blizzard one of them could have arranged the "accident."

 He glanced once more at Jase. The boy looked so anxious, every instinct Cole possessed told him he
couldn't possibly have sprayed the water on the walkway to make it icy.

 "The fall just stunned me for a minute."

 "Did you get knocked out? Jase, was she out for any length of time?"

 "She swore a lot," Jase reported.

 "Did she now? I wasn't sure you knew how to swear," Cole said, looking down into Maia's eyes. It was
a big mistake. A man could lose himself there. He couldn't look away from her. He bent his head and
brushed a kiss across her mouth to break the spell.

 Her eyelashes fluttered, and she managed to glare at him. "I work with animals, believe me, I know how
to swear. And was that another apology?"

 "Sheer desperation."

 "You do look a bit desperate," Maia conceded, straggling to sit up. "And I didn't lose consciousness. I
think I knocked the wind out of myself, and my head hurts pretty bad, but if you'll help me up, I'll be
fine."

 "I'm going to lift you, Doc. Just put your arms around my neck. Jase, watch your step, the surface is icy,
and we don't need another accident."
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 "I've never seen the walkway ice over before," Jase said. "Maybe there was rain or slush coming down
with the snow."

 "Maybe," Cole conceded, but the temperature was far too cold for rain or slush, and they both knew it.
"Just stay close until I can take a look around, Jase." He lifted Maia into his arms, holding her against his
chest. Her skin was cool after being outdoors for so long. She was heavier than he expected, her muscles
solid and firm. He felt the tension in her the moment he cradled her dose. The same faint fragrance of
peaches and rain he'd noticed the night before clung to her skin and hair.

 "I can walk," she protested. She tried to hold herself rigidly away from him. "I'm raining your shirt." Maia
felt silly being carried by Cole Steele. If her head hadn't been throbbing with enough intensity to make her
teeth ache she would have insisted on walking.

 "Relax, Doc, I have a lot of shirts, and there's only one of you. I don't give a damn about the shirt."

 "That's a good thing, because it's a mess already." She tried to move her head to keep the blood from
dripping onto his shirt.

 Cole made a single sound of impatience and she subsided, trying to relax against him in spite of her
embarrassment. Jase skirted around the ice and hurried ahead to open the door. "I'll get blankets," he
called over his shoulder.

 Cole carried her to the oversized couch, placing her with care in the middle of the cushions. "When you
went to the barn this morning, you're positive there was no ice on the walkway?"

 Maia looked up at the concern on his face. His voice was low, obviously to keep Jase from overhearing.
"It was easy to get to the barn. I remember thinking everyone should have a walkway like that. Most
ranches in the outlying areas use rope or cable as a guideline when it's snowing."

 "We've got cable up in places," Cole said. He took the ice pack and washcloth from Jase as the boy
hurried up to them. "Thanks, Jase. The doc's going to be fine. She just looks a little pale. Women do that
to give men heart attacks."

 Maia laughed. Cole should have known she would in spite of her injuries, but he wasn't at all prepared
for the sound filling the space around them. His space. It was always there, between him and everyone
else, but she didn't seem to see it, and she put things there like her laughter. She was definitely getting
under his skin, and it made him edgier than usual.

 "Well, I don't think you should, Doc," Jase chastised, his hand over his heart, "because I was really
scared."

 "I'm sorry, Jase. I didn't see the ice. I guess I wasn't looking. And just for your information… Ow!"
Maia pulled her head away and glared at Cole as he dabbed at the cut on her head. "That hurts."

 "Stop being such a baby." Cole was extraordinarily gentle as he wiped away the blood. There was an
unfamiliar lump in his throat. All the while he was turning over possibilities in his mind. Had someone
sprayed the walkway with water in order to cause Maia harm? Who could have done such a thing? He
needed to take a closer look at Al and his wife. Find out if anyone had been visiting. Perhaps Fred had
stayed with them instead of going home to his family.

 "Does it really hurt, Doc?" Jase asked, frowning at Cole.
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 "I'm fine," Maia assured. "He's being gentle. I feel a little stupid falling on my head." She wasn't going to
mention the bruises all over her backside. Cole's face was very close to hers, and she could see his long
lashes, the bluish shadowing along his jaw, the tiny lines etched into his weathered features. His gaze met
hers and her heartbeat accelerated instantly. "You're lethal." She didn't mean to say it aloud. She had to
blame the bump on her head. It knocked out her good sense.

 "Yes I am," Cole warned. "Don't forget it."

 Maia looked up at Jase and burst out laughing a second time. "At least I'm not the only one saying dumb
things. Your horse, by the way, is doing great, Jase. No temp, the drains are working, and I gave him his
antibiotic shots, so he's fine for the time being. I didn't feed him, so you'll have to do that. And I want to
move him to a small enclosure where he can get around without hurting himself. The trick is to get him to
walk enough to keep the swelling down, but not so much that he pulls out the sutures or does more
damage."

 "I still have to feed the other horses this morning," Jase said. "I told Al I'd do it so he wouldn't have to
risk driving in the storm. We knew the storm would be bad, so I'll take care of the stables, then let Wally
into the small round pen inside the big barn. I can feed him there, unless you just want him to exercise a
couple of times a day."

 "I'll feed the horses, Jase," Cole said. "Give me a few minutes with the doc here to get her settled, and I'll
go make the rounds."

 "I don't mind, Cole," Jase objected. "I can do the job."

 Cole scowled and opened his mouth to make it a command, but Maia deterred him, touching his wrist
with her fingertips. When he glanced at her she shook her head slightly and turned her head to smile up at
Jase. "Actually, I was hoping you'd stay with me for a little while so we could come up with a plan for
Wally." Her smile widened until it lit her eyes. "I think the name suits him. He likes it."

 "Did he tell you that?" Cole asked, his voice edged with sarcasm.

 "As a matter of fact, he did. What do you say, Jase? Let the grouch feed the horses this morning, and
we'll map out a plan of action for Wally."

 "You may as well plan Christmas for us too." Cole made the suggestion to forestall Jase's protest that the
horse wasn't anything special to him. His heart jumped, slamming hard against the wall of his chest in
protest. He would have taken the proposal back, but the boy suddenly looked hopeful.

 Maia's fingers tightened on his wrist. He hoped to hell she had no idea what the turn in the conversation
cost him. Cole refused to meet her eyes, instead busying himself with getting the matted blood from her
hair so he could see the wound.

 "You sure you didn't try ice-skating," he said gruffly as he looked at the laceration.

 A faint smile softened the lines around her mouth. "I've always wanted to learn, but it wasn't my
intention."

 "I can take her ice-skating if she wants to go," Jase volunteered. "There's a pond that freezes over every
winter. It's great for ice-skating."
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 Cole glanced at the boy's face. He was staring at Maia as if she were a goddess. He sighed and leaned
down, his mouth against her ear, his lips brushing her skin. "Tone it down before the boy asks you to
marry him." The faint scent of peaches in her hair triggered a heat flash that seemed to spread through his
veins straight to his belly and centered in his groin.

 She turned her head so that her mouth was brushing against his cheek. "Really? I didn't realize I had such
an impact."

 Her voice vibrated down his spine. He could have sworn her finger stroked his wrist but when he looked
down, her hand was lying there motionless. Innocent. Her lips were feather-light, soft and full. Cole felt
the burn right through his skin. He jerked away from her. She was reducing him to a smitten teenager.
Jase could fall under her spell, but he was damned if he would. It was supposed to work the other way
around. He certainly wasn't mesmerizing her. And she sure wasn't falling into his bed. Maia looked up at
him, her eyes wide and beautiful, and the breath left his lungs in a rush.

 Cole backed away from the couch. "I think you'll be fine. Jase, get the doc an aspirin and stay with her
while I get the chores done."

 "And you're really fine with decorating the house, or maybe even getting a Christmas tree?" There was a
note of fear in Jase's voice.

 Cole felt the echo of fear in his gut. "Sure. Sounds like a plan." He turned away from them. A woman
who appeared soft and gentle but had a core of steel. A boy, lost in his past and trying desperately to
find security and a home. Cole shook his head. How the hell had he gotten into such a mess? He needed
familiar ground. He was never afraid. He had nothing to lose, and when a man had nothing to lose, he
didn't experience fear. He was letting some little slip of a woman scare the holy hell out of him.

 Outside, he examined the ice-coated walkway. Someone had poured water over the snow to form the
icy surface. The hose was buried in the large snowbank on the outside of the walkway, but he could see
the hose had been stuck in one of the latticework holes and sprayed onto the surface. Small droplets of
water had frozen on the lattice.

 Was it Jase? It didn't feel right to him. Jase seemed to be genuine. A nice kid who needed a family.
Could he be as sick and disturbed as their father? They were in the middle of particularly harsh buzzard.
No one else was in the house or around the ranch that Cole was aware of. He studied the ground near
the hose. The boot impressions in the snow were large—too large to be Jase's—and led back toward a
door that opened into the barn. Someone had opened that door and spied on Maia while she worked on
the horse. Jase hadn't been wet or covered in snow when he'd come running in.

 If Maia had gone out early to tend the horse and the walkway had been fine, then only Jase had gone
after her. It was possible Jase had shot the old man. He'd never been ruled out as a suspect. He didn't
want Jase to be guilty, but the evidence wasn't stacking up in the boy's favor.

 Brett Steele had been found in his office, dead from a single bullet smack in the middle of his forehead.
Cole shook his head. Jase had found the injured horse. He could have easily driven the horse into the
fence and then gone to get Al, making a show of being upset and blaming Cole. Jase claimed he found
Cole's glove in the fence.

 Cole straightened and took a cautious look around. His alarms were shrieking at him. Something was
terribly wrong, and he knew he was in danger. Maia Armstrong could very well be too. And Jase.
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 He shook his head, vowing to find out who was sneaking around the ranch and why as he trudged
through the snow to the stables to feed the horses.

 He patted an outstretched neck as one of the horses greeted him, then tossed a flake of hay into the last
feeding bin.

 He ran his hand along one of the horses' backs, bent closer, and noticed a girth mark near the horse's
belly. It could only mean the horse had been ridden recently, within the last couple of days. Cole leaned
down to pick up a foot, examining the hoof. Dirt and debris were caked in the shoe. Very slowly he
lowered the hoof to the stable floor, a slight frown on his face. Al hadn't said anything about taking the
horses out.

 Cole closed the door to the stall and went to examine the saddles and bridles. A large saddle was set to
one side, slightly off kilter, but it didn't mean anything. A rifle scabbard was hooked to the saddle, and it
had a mud pattern splattered across it.

 A muffled footfall alerted him. Cole eased back into the shadows of the tack room and drew the gun
from the holster strapped to his calf. Only the munching of the horses as they chewed hay and the sound
of their continual restless movements in the stalls broke the silence. Cole didn't make the mistake of
moving. He had endless patience when needed. A shadow stretched across the wall, a man holding a
pitchfork out in front of him. Cole stepped out into the open, his gun rock steady, an extension of his arm.

 Every vestige of color drained from Jase's face. He dropped the pitchfork and backed against the stall.
"Don't shoot me."

 Cole swore savagely. "What the hell is the matter with you? Icould have shot you. What were you
thinking?" He shoved the gun out of sight.

 "I came out to help you," Jase defended, his face tight with fear and growing anger. "What are you doing
with a gun?"

 "None of your damned business," Cole snapped. Jase turned and ran out of the stable, disappearing
from Cole's line of vision.

 Cole crushed down the need to throw something. He should have identified the intruder before coming
out of hiding with his gun. He knew better than to let his highly tuned instincts take over completely.
Dammit. He was going to have to explain the gun. How did you tell a teenager your entire world was
made up of conspiracies, and you siphoned through them one at a time to get to the truth?

  

 chapter 7

 Cole entered the living room to find Jase pacing furiously back and forth across the room. The boy cast
a dark, furious look at his brother. Maia looked up and met Cole's gaze, lifting her hands palm up in
inquiry. Jase stopped pacing abruptly and stood breathing heavily, his hands on his hips.

 "You could have killed me! Maybe you want to kill me just like everyone says," Jase burst out. He
glared at Cole. "Maybe you tried to kill the doc just so she wouldn't find out about you."
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 "Jase!" Maia said firmly. "That's enough. You're afraid and angry, but don't say things you can't take
back."

 "He didn't put a gun in your face. He's been in jail. Everyone knows he's been there," Jase continued,
breathing hard, his young face twisted with fear and hurt.

 "Come sit down over here," Maia patted the couch beside her. "I can tell you whatever Cole may have
done or not done in his life, he wouldn't do anything to hurt you. Someone is trying to drive a wedge
between the two of you." She didn't look at Cole. She couldn't bear to see the hurt in his eyes she knew
would be there. He stood motionless, a man apart, isolated, hurt beyond reason and unwilling to risk
himself further.

 Jase flung himself onto the couch beside Maia, tears glittering in his eyes. "I hate this. I hate my life." He
included Maia in his glare. "I hate that you stick up for him. You don't even know him. You don't know
whether he killed our father, or whether he hurt Wally and tried to hurt me. You don't even know
whether or not he covered that walkway with ice in order to hurt you. Everyone says he's after my share
of the money, and maybe he is." A sob escaped, and his chest heaved as he tried to hold the emotion in.

 "That's enough," Cole's tone was low, but it was a whiplash.

 "That doesn't even make sense, Jase," Maia said softly. "I knew about the gun. If you went into the
stable and startled Cole, of course he pulled the gun. Someone hurt your horse. Naturally Cole would be
worried about all of our safety."

 Jase rubbed at his eyes with his knuckles, looking four instead of fourteen. Cole let out his breath slowly
as his younger brother's expression became somewhat mollified.

 "Cole, you need to talk to Jase. I can leave the room if you want me to, but he needs you to share your
life with him. You're helping whoever is persisting in these rumors about you trying to kill Jase. You're
enabling whoever is attempting to keep you from trusting one another by remaining silent about your past.
If you want this to work between you, you have to trust one another, and the only way to do that is to get
to know each other." Maia held her breath, waiting for Cole to tell her to go to hell.

 There was a long silence. She stole a quick glance at his face. His rugged features were very still,
expressionless. He stared over her head at the wall behind them. A muscle jerked in his jaw, the only sign
that he'd heard her. She could feel Jase trembling, could feel the tension in his body winding tighter and
tighter. With a small sigh, she twisted her fingers together. What could she say to convince them?

 "I saw the shadow of a man holding a pitchfork and thought someone was stalking me. I didn't know it
was you. I yelled at you because I was afraid I could have hurt you accidentally. I didn't hurt the horse,
and I sure don't want your money."

 Jase looked a little embarrassed. "Maybe I didn't mean everything I said. It just reminded me of…
things."

 "I know what you mean," Cole said. "He shoved a gun in my face more than once too. I'm sorry I
scared you."

 "That's all right." Some of the tension began to drain from the boy's body.

 "I was in jail, Jase." Cole took a deep breath, let it out. His fingers curled involuntarily into a fist. "I work
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for the DEA. I went into prison undercover to stop a very large drug ring involving guards, inmates, and
the supply trucks. I've worked undercover most of my life. It's an isolating job and makes you very
distrustful of everything and everyone around you." He made the confession in a rush, wanting to get it
over with, half-horrified that he was letting them both into his life. "I don't tell people what I do. It's habit,
and it's kept me alive over the years."

 Maia kept her lips firmly pressed together, astonished, not by what he'd said, but that he'd admitted it.
Cole Steele was not a man who'd easily reveal the details of his life. She wanted to console him, put her
arms around him and hold him close, but neither Jase nor Cole could allow a show of compassion.
Beside her, Jase was trembling, uncertain how to react to his brother's revelation. Tension coiled around
Cole, his face a mask without expression. Only his eyes were alive, turbulent and raw with pain.

 "You're some kind of a cop?" Jase asked. His voice cracked, making him sound younger and even less
sure of himself.

 Cole nodded. "I have a small apartment in San Francisco that I rarely use. Most of the time I'm on the
road, sent undercover to various countries. Sometimes it's here in the U.S. We carefully cultivated my
reputation and network in the drug world. When the old man was investigating me, the P.I. raised a red
flag, and we fed him the details of my life just the way we do everyone who investigates me. I was using a
different name, and the private investigators just assumed I'd covered my tracks to be rid of the old man.
They bought my undercover role and took it at face value. So now Cole Steele has the same background
as my persona at work."

 "And you didn't want me to know?"

 Cole flinched inwardly at the hurt in the boy's voice. "I wanted to wait until we knew each other better,
Jase. Things have been so bad for you. I'm not used to being around anyone for an extended period of
time. I had to know if I could be someone you could count on."

 "But you let all those people say that you were here to kill me."

 Cole nodded. "And I'll continue to let them say it. I don't care what people say or think about me. I'm
only concerned with what you say and think."

 "I tried not to think they might be right, but I found your glove by the fence. And sometimes, when you
look really mean, you look a little bit…" Jase trailed off.

 The knot in his gut tightened. Cole refused to look at Maia. "I've seen the resemblance. I always carry a
gun, Jase."

 "I guess I'm not supposed to tell anyone."

 "I'd rather you didn't," Cole said.

 "Are you going to go away again?"

 Maia felt the boy beside her, stiff and awkward. She could feel fear rolling off him and immediately
locked her gaze with Cole's. Pleading with him. Hurting for him. Did he realize how important that single
question was? The relationship between the two brothers was so fragile.

 Cole felt the impact of Maia's eyes. He swallowed his first careful answer. He had promised himself he
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would change the boy's life. He couldn't very well do it from a distance. His leave of absence might turn
out to be far longer than he'd anticipated. "I'll stay as long as you need me, Jase. Or want me. It's up to
you."

 Jase jumped to his feet. "All right then. I won't say anything." His voice was gruff, covering his emotions.
"I'm sorry I believed those people, even for a minute."

 "I think you were smart to be careful, Jase. After what we've been through, we need to build our
relationship on solid ground."

 Jase nodded and practically ran from the room.

 Maia guessed he was close to tears. "I'm sorry," she said. "I didn't mean to intrude on such a personal
moment with Jase. I couldn't figure out a way to leave gracefully in the middle of it all. I won't say
anything about your life to anyone."

 "I never thought you would" And he hadn't. That was the strange part. It never once occurred to him she
might reveal the truth about what he did. And did that mean he trusted her? Cole turned away from her to
stare out the window at the driving snow. "We have a problem here, Doc. More than one, and I'm going
to need your help."

 "You don't think the ice got there naturally, do you?" Maia said shrewdly.

 "No I don't. And I don't think a ghost is running around the ranch turning on hoses and arranging
accidents with the horses."

 She studied his face. He wore an expressionless mask, but there was something frightening about the
expression in his eyes. "It's Jase, isn't it? You're worried about him."

 Cole glanced toward the door. "Yeah, I'm worried."

 Maia sighed. "It was definitely a human driving Wally through the fence."

 He spun around, his gaze sharp as it raked her face. "What makes you so sure?"

 She pulled the ice pack away from her head. "If I told you, you'd want me locked up in a little cell.
Suffice to say, I just know."

 He stalked across the room and crouched down in front of her, his face inches from hers. "Not good
enough. Tell me."

 Maia pushed at the wall of his chest. "Stop invading my space. I don't know you well enough to tell you.
I don't know anyone that well." She couldn't think straight with him so close. He was the most sensual
man she'd ever met. His eyes were just so intense, his features etched with need.

 "I told you about the DEA."

 "You told Jase, not me. I just happened to be in the same room."

 "I toldyou . You know damn well I was telling you." He pulled away from her, a flash of irritation on his
face. "I don't even know why I wanted you to know, but if I'm going to come unraveled around you, the
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least you could do is open up a little."

 "You aren't asking for a little. You had me investigated before you ever made your big move on me,
didn't you?"

 "Hell yes. I'd investigate the pope if his life touched Jase's life." He stood up and put the length of the
room between them, his eyes alive with the suppressed rage that was always swirling so close when he
confronted his own demons.

 She stared up at him for a long moment. "You investigated Jase too, didn't you?"

 "I'm not about to apologize for it either, Doc. You have no idea what our lives were like." He stopped
abruptly, going very still, watching her expression. "Or do you? How do you know things?"

 Maia hesitated. She was going to ruin her chances of ever being a permanent veterinarian anywhere if
she told him.

 "It's important. Do you really know things? Would you know if Jase drove that horse into the fence? Or
if I did it?" How could she know?

 Maia caught a glimpse of the fear in him, and it all fell into place. He suspected Jase of being like their
father. It made sense. "It wasn't Jase. The man was too big." She didn't want to continue, but she couldn't
let him think such a monstrous thing.

 "How do you know?"

 "The animals."

 The room went totally silent. Maia shifted deeper into the cushions, trying to avoid seeing the look she
knew would be in his eyes. She pressed her fingers into her eyes in an effort to relieve the headache that
continued to pound.

 Cole studied her face for a long time. "You mean they really do talk to you?" he asked, trying hard to
keep skepticism from his voice. She was being serious and waiting for him to scoff at her. Maia
Armstrong had secrets; it was there in her eyes, in the way she avoided looking at him, and he intended
to find out what they were.

 "Not exactly," she hedged. "Look, do we have to do this? Is it really necessary?"

 "You know things about me no one else knows. Hell you know more about the Steele family than most
people do. What are you afraid of?"

 "I'm a veterinarian, Steele. You think people are going to want some nutcase treating their animals? And
that's what they'll call me." She didn't have to tell him anything. She could stare him down, tell him to go
to hell, be stubbornly silent. Maia was capable of all of those things. So why was she sitting there like
some sacrifice, waiting for the axe to fall?

 "No one is here but the two of us." Cole was back in front of her, crouching down, his hand on her
knee. His piercing blue eyes caught and held her gaze as if to give her courage. "How do the animals talk
to you?" Could it really be possible? There was no getting around the fact that several animals had run
out in front of his vehicle as he drove through the blizzard to get to the ranch, and each time she had
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known they were there before they could actually see them.

 Maia shook her head, but couldn't look away from him. There was no escaping Cole Steele and his
brother, or their pain, shrieking at her from the depths of their being.

 "Telling you the truth about working for the DEA wasn't so bad once I did it. It was actually a relief to
tell you the truth. I don't talk about the old man and my childhood, but now you know, and I don't have
to worry that somehow I'll slip up and you'll find out things that I've kept hidden away."

 "It isn't the same thing, Cole."

 "Just say it, Maia. You know I'm going to badger you until you do."

 It was the way he said her name. A caress. A silky, satin tone that brushed over her skin and slipped
inside of her. Disarmed her. He always called her "Doc" and somehow by using her first name it created
an intimacy between them. A trust. "I see their memories. I don't know how, but I've always been able to
see things they've seen. The memories come to me in images, very vivid and, most of the time, very
distressing."

 He caught her chin in his hand, forcing her to look at him. "Why would you be afraid to tell me?"

 Maia pulled away from him, shrinking back against the thickly upholstered couch. "Most people would
just think I was crazy." She shook her head, her gaze avoiding his. "I know it sounds crazy." Why had
she even admitted it? What was wrong with her? She knew better than to say anything. Cole Steele of all
people. What was she thinking?

 "Tell me what Wally saw."

 Maia's gaze jumped to his. Held there. "A young boy dragged from the stable, kicked, beaten around
the head and shoulders. Something thin and long hitting the child over and over. The boy screaming. The
man was about your height, but thinner. Once he dragged the boy out by his hair. He slapped him
repeatedly in the face." She swallowed, rubbed her hand over her face as if to clear away the memories.
"The boy was Jase and the abuse didn't just happen once." She pressed her fingertips against her eyelids
again as if she could shut out the vision. "I hate that I know these things because there's never anything I
can do about it."

 Cole's palm curved around the nape of her neck, his fingers massaging the tension out of her. "It never
occurred to me that animals would be witnessing crimes."

 "Just because they can't talk doesn't mean they don't see things."

 Cole turned over her revelation in his mind, over and over. It was a fascinating premise. Could it be
true? He had his hand on her, could feel the tension running through her body. She was waiting for him to
scoff at her, yet the idea that she could really "see" memories of an animal was bizarre. She could easily
have guessed the things that had happened to Jase.

 "What about the attack on the horse? Who drove him into the fence?"

 "A large man, tall with wide shoulders. It couldn't have been Jase. He's small and thin, and Wally likes
him."
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 "Tall like me, you mean," Cole said, his voice cool.

 "Yes, but Wally likes you too." It sounded so stupid. Utterly ridiculous. Maia shook her head, her face
flaming. "I know it sounds weird. Go ahead, tell me I belong in a mental institution."

 The pad of his thumb absently stroked her pulse. Each brush sent small tongues of fire licking over her
skin. Electricity seemed to leap from his skin to hers. She forced air through her lungs, waiting for him to
react. Waiting for his condemnation.

 "Who told you that you were crazy?" he asked quietly.

 She flinched. She tried not to, but she couldn't prevent her reaction. "Does it matter? It does sound
crazy."

 "I think so."

 She lifted her chin, her turquoise eyes blazing into his. "A man I dated. Another vet. I thought we were
close, and he asked me how I managed to figure out what was wrong all the time with wild animals, and I
was dumb enough to answer him."

 "And he said you were crazy?"

 "I don't blame him. Unfortunately, he told everyone at the clinic, including the pet owners, and I was out
of work. That I did blame him for."

 Cole leaned in close and brushed his lips, feather-light over hers. Her heart somersaulted. "He was the
idiot, Maia." He pulled back slightly, blinking so that her attention was drawn from his mouth to his
lashes. He was so masculine, but for those incredible eyelashes. She wanted to touch his face, to feel his
skin. Cole Steele was totally mesmerizing, and she could see why women fell so easily under his spell.

 "You're way out of my league, Steele. Sit over there somewhere and stop touching me." She pointed to
a chair across the room.

 "Am I getting to you?" A ghost of a smile flickered over his mouth for the briefest of moments.

 Maia's heart stuttered in reaction. She'd never seen him smile, and she couldn't actually call the curve to
his lips a smile, it hadn't lit his blue eyes, but it was enough for her to know if he ever did, she would melt.
"Yes."

 Cole didn't move, his gaze going hot as it moved over her face, focusing on her mouth. "It's about time."

 "Stop that." His mouth was only a scant few inches from hers. She could feel the warmth of his breath.
His body leaned into hers, his chest bumped against her knees. His palm was still curled around the nape
of her neck, and his thumb swept over her jaw. Her stomach tightened. "You're dangerous." Her voice
came out in a whisper. An ache.

 "I thought I was, but I've changed my mind." His lips brushed a second time over hers. Teasing. A
caress that wasn't quite a caress. "I've decided you're the dangerous one. I tell myself to stay away from
you, but I just can't seem to do it." His lips tempted hers again. Firming. Coaxing. His tongue stroked
across the seam of her mouth. His teeth tugged on her lower lip.
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 Maia gasped and let him in. Let him stake his claim. His mouth pressed firmly against her, hot and moist
and all too expert. Somehow he wedged his body between her legs, pulling her close, his arms strong as
they wrapped around her. Her body went boneless, the heat leaping like a wildfire between them.

 His fingers snagged in her hair and she yelped. They pulled apart, staring at one another, Maia gulping
for air. His fingertips moved gently over her scalp. "I'm sorry, I got carried away."

 "I'll say you did!" Jase's voice was stern.

 Cole turned to find the boy leaning his hip against the doorway, his arms across his chest, a frown on his
face.

 "Would either of you like to tell me what's going on?" Jase asked straight-faced, effectively reducing his
older brother to a teenager caught necking.

 "I'd rather not," Maia said, trying not to laugh.

 "I have absolutely no idea what's going on," Cole admitted. "But, whatever it is, it's her fault." He
couldn't stop looking at her, mesmerized by the warm laughter in her eyes, the curve of her mouth. She
hadn't lived a perfect life, he had felt the sadness, the wariness in her when she talked about the strange
ability she had of reading images in the minds of animals, yet she still found joy in life. She made him want
to laugh with her. He wasn't certain he was capable of laughter, but he felt himself wanting to be.

 "Hey now, don't you go blaming anything on me," Maia objected. "Honestly, Jase. He started it." She
rubbed her mouth. "At least I think he did, I can't remember now. But he's such a flirt."

 "He said he doesn't have to smile at women," Jase reported. He was trying desperately to make up for
the accusations he'd leveled at his brother earlier. Unsure of himself, he followed Maia's lead, teasing
Cole.

 Maia's eyebrow shot up. Cole sank back on his knees, groaning aloud. "Jase. That was a brotherly
confidence you weren't supposed to share." He looked at Maia. "We're still trying to get the hang of
being brothers. Neither of us knows a lot about it yet, but I'm certain that was confidential."

 "Brotherly advice?" Maia asked.

 "Something like that," Cole admitted.

 Maia shook her head. "Don't listen to him, Jase. Women like men to smile once in a while. They can
only take brooding hunks for so long, then they get bored."

 "You didn't look bored to me," Jase pointed out, abruptly switching sides.

 Maia laughed again, and the sound wound itself around Cole's heart and warmed his insides.

 "And," Jase added, "it's rather sickening to hear my brother referred to as a hunk."

 "She did call me that, didn't she?" Cole said with evident satisfaction.

 "No one said you weren't a hunk," Maia's blue-green eyes darkened as her gaze drifted over him with
deliberate inspection. "But just because I noticed that you were hot doesn't mean I liked you kissing me."

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


 Jase snorted. "She liked it."

 Cole nodded. "Yeah, I know."

 "So did you." Jase grinned at him mischievously.

 "Way too much. The doc is one of those dangerous women your elders are always going to be warning
you about."

 Maia shoved at Cole with her foot. "I love the way you manage to turn the tables on me. I'm injured
here. You're supposed to be soothing me, not stirring things up."

 Cole raised his eyebrow at her, his eyes going dark. "I don't think I'll touch that." He went back up on
his knees to examine the back of her head. "The ice seems to have done its job and stopped the bleeding
and the swelling."

 "Well good thing, since you weren't paying attention," Maia scolded.

 "I had better things to do." Ignoring her wince, he pushed the matted hair from the cut. "I don't think it
needs stitches."

 Maia jerked her head away. "Since I'm the only one capable of stitching anything, I should say not."

 "I can stitch a wound if I have to. I sewed up my arm once," Cole said.

 Jase and Maia exchanged a long frown. Maia wrinkled her nose. "Don't tell us anything else. I'm going to
have nightmares."

 "I ran into a guard down in Colombia. He had a big knife. He wasn't supposed to be there, and I got
careless."

 Maia reached out and pushed up the sleeve of Cole's shirt to reveal a jagged scar about three inches
long. "You aren't making it up."

 "I don't make things up." Cole got to his feet with a sigh of regret. It was time for all of them to return to
the real world. "Jase, did you and Al go riding the other day? The day Wally was injured?"

 Jase shook his head. "No, the hands took care of the cattle, and Al stayed with me working around the
ranch house. We saw the fence over by the corrals leaning and we repaired that. I nearly fell actually, but
Al caught me before I went down the hill. The post was rotten or something and gave way. I discovered
Wally a couple of hours later when I came back to the ranch house to put away the tools. I called Al,
and he came right away."

 Cole sighed. Someone had taken the horse out earlier. Either Jase was lying to him or something he
didn't understand was going on. "I didn't like the look of the walkway this morning, Jase. It's too much of
a coincidence to have the horse injured and the walkway iced and the fence post give way when you
leaned against it. I don't like any of it."

 "What are saying?" Jase asked.
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 Maia could see the fear creeping back into the boy's eyes and it saddened her. For a few minutes, he
had been a normal teenager, teasing an older brother.

 "I'm just saying we're stuck here until this series of storms passes, and I want you to be careful," Cole
said. "We should stick together when we go outside."

 "Cole, who else is on the ranch? You told me no one was here other than the three of us," Maia said. "Is
it possible you're being…" She broke off when his gaze swept over her face. The dark hunger was gone.
His eyes were back to ice-cold, piercing blue.

 "Paranoid? Maybe. But it's how I stay alive. I don't know what's happening, and until I do I just want to
err on the side of caution." He stood beside Jase, clapping a hand briefly on his shoulder. "That doesn't
mean we can't have fun, or do the Christmas thing, it just means we stick closer together if we go outside.
We can share the work and keep an eye on the doc when she's looking at the horse for us."

 "I came down here to tell the doc that my mother's things are in the attic," Jase said. "There's a chest up
there that might have a few Christmas ornaments in it."

 Cole glanced at Maia's face, trying to get something from her. He wasn't certain what it was.
Reassurance maybe. Courage. The thought of decorating the house turned his stomach.

 "I'd love to see some of your mother's things, Jase," Maia said with her usual warmth. Her gaze was on
Cole, watching his face closely, reading too much.

 He presented a stone carving to the world, a man invincible, one who had no fear, yet she seemed to see
through the barrier between him and the rest of the world. The one woman he wanted to impress. The
only woman who got under his skin and threatened to turn his carefully ordered world upside down was
the one who saw him vulnerable.

 Maia sighed. "Jase, you ever notice Cole can look scary?"

 "I told him he did," Jase said, with a triumphant grin toward Cole. "Just last week I told him that."

 "He does it when he's losing a battle."

 Cole raised an eyebrow. "I don't lose battles. Don't be telling the boy a thing like that." A part of Cole
stood off to the side, observing the banter, the way Maia seemed to be able to bring them all together
when there was always such a distance between him and everyone else. A distance between Jase and
everyone else. He wished he knew how she did it.

 No one had ever teased him before. Even his coworkers refrained from venturing into personal territory
with him, but Maia had no problem giving him a bad time. He reached out, tucked a stray strand of hair
behind her ear before he could stop himself. He wanted to touch her, to feel her skin. He ached for her.
Cole pulled himself up short. He was beginning to want more than her body. He found himself looking for
her smile, listening for her laughter, watching the expressions chase across her face.

 Jase's rude snort of derision dragged him from his thoughts. "You've got it bad, Cole. You're a goner."

 Cole couldn't take exception when he heard the laughter in the boy's voice. It was genuine and even
affectionate. Maia had managed to put it there somehow. He turned away from both of them, a lump in
his throat "I'm denying everything," he managed to get out. His voice was husky, and he knew if he
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looked at her, Maia would have a small knowing smile on her face.

 "What are we going to do with the doc?" Jase asked.

 "She can just sit there holding the ice pack, and we'll go up to the attic and get this box you want. I
finished feeding the horses before I came in. Al's got the cattle under shelter with plenty of feed, so we're
good for a few hours. We may as well start figuring out what we're supposed to do about Christmas."

 Maia's laughter came again. "You sound like a man about to be hung. Christmas isfun , Steele, not a
funeral. Jase, the man has such an Eeyore attitude."

 Cole swung around. "Eeyore? You just called meEeyore ."

 Jase burst out laughing, joining Maia. The sound drifted through the ranch house, dispelling the cold,
barren feeling and replacing it with a warmth that had never been there before.

  

 chapter 8
 Cole dusted off the box before he brought it down to Maia. Jase had obviously managed to remove
things he'd treasured and conceal them before his father could throw them out. It said a lot about the
boy's courage. He'd only been ten when his mother had been killed. He must have been terrified to defy
his father and gather her things. The housekeeper would have reported it had she seen him, and there
were the cameras to avoid, yet the boy had managed to keep a few precious items. As Cole placed the
box carefully in front of Maia, he realized his genuine affection for the boy was growing. And that was
frightening.

 He couldn't warn Maia how much the contents of the box meant to Jase because the teenager was right
beside him, anxiously watching his every move. He could only hope she would notice as she seemed so
aware of every little nuance involving the boy.

 "This is wonderful, Jase," Maia said, warmth and enthusiasm spilling over into the room. "Like
discovering a treasure box. How ever did you know it was up there?"

 Cole let his breath out. "He managed to put up there when he was ten, right after he lost his mother."

 Maia looked up at the gruff note in Cole's voice. "I'll be very careful going through it, Jase, don't worry."
She slipped off the couch and sat tailor fashion on the floor beside the box. "Do you remember what you
put in here?"

 Jase sank down beside her. "Yeah. I never went up to the attic, although I thought about it a lot, but I
was afraid the old man would catch me and throw it all out." He glanced at Cole fearfully as if he might
be revealing too much.

 "That was smart," Cole said. "If he caught you, there would have been hell to pay. While you're looking
over what we have, why don't I fix us something to eat. How's the head feeling, Doc?" He needed her to
look at him. He had to know Jase was safe with her, but he had to get out of the room before that box
was opened.
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 His blue gaze met and clung to hers. Maia sat very still, letting the heat in his eyes wash through her. She
saw into a part of him he tried so hard to hide. Ravaged. Damaged. A man struggling to overcome his
own past in order to save a boy. She didn't want to see it because it only drew her deeper into the lives
of the Steeles and she didn't want that. She'd disclosed too much to him already. Kissed him when she
should have resisted. She ached for the boy he'd been and the man he'd become. "A bit of a headache,
nothing serious," she answered.

 Jase watched Cole leave the room. "He says it's okay to celebrate Christmas; I don't think he really
wants to."

 "Maybe he needs to celebrate it, Jase," Maia said. "He's a grown man, and he's quite capable of
deciding what he does and doesn't want to do. If he's given you the go-ahead, then he must want to
celebrate the holiday as well. And isn't it about time? Christmas is a special time of year. I love the way it
brings everyone together. It's a time for family. Cole never really had a chance to have a family before,
but now he has you." Carefully, she began to open the box.

 "Do you have a family waiting for you to get home?"

 "Not anymore. I was an only child. My parents died when I was sixteen, and I went to live with my
grandmother. I lost her a few years ago. No cousins, no aunts or uncles. I'm pretty much it."

 "That must be awful for you not to have someone to be with when you love it so much."

 Maia smiled at him. "I would prefer to have a huge family, but since I don't, I find ways to celebrate."

 "My father hated Christmas," Jase began in a rush. "He was really mean around Christmas, and he
forbade us to ever have a tree or presents or decorations. If Mom gave me a present, he threw it away
and he…" Jase trailed off. "Mom was like you."

 "She loved Christmas?" Maia pulled open the flaps of the box, nearly holding her breath, careful not to
look at Jase.

 "Yeah. She used to sneak me presents, and when we were alone she'd show me the decorations her
mother had given her. They'd been in her family a long time. She loved the ornaments and always wanted
them on a tree. She used to tell me we'd put them on a tree together someday, but we never did. If she'd
tried to do that, my father would have smashed them… and her."

 Maia took a deep breath and let it out slowly, praying she could come up with the right words for Jase.
The pain and horror and guilt of a young boy being the cause of his adored mother being "smashed" by
his abusive father were in Jase's voice. Despair and helplessness, love and regret were in his eyes. She
was determined to find a way to heal the pain in the boy she was growing so fond of .

 "We can do it for her, Jase. This was her house too, wasn't it? We can give it back to her. If you tell me
the things she loved, we can redecorate and make it your mother's home the way she wanted it. The way
it should have been." Maia leaned toward him. "You asked me how I celebrate. Well, I always do
something fun, but I want to do something for someone. Let's do it for your mother."

 "But she's dead."

 "You think about her every day don't you?"
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 Jase nodded.

 "Then she'll never be dead. It doesn't matter whether you believe in another life after this one, Jase, only
that she's alive through you. She wanted to celebrate Christmas and we can give her this. If you want to
do it. As long as you're comfortable with it." Without waiting for an answer, Maia looked into the box.
Everything was carefully wrapped in paper. She could tell the tissue was old and that Jase's mother had
been the one to preserve many of the items originally. Jase had simply done what his mother had taught
him. Several tissue-wrapped items lay on a folded quilt. She lifted the first one out of the box, brought it
to her lap, and gently began to unwrap it.

 Beside Maia, Jase audibly drew in his breath, his body tensing as she slowly drew back the tissue paper
to reveal the treasure it protected. The ornament was beautiful, a shimmering star, platinum and covered
with glass sparkles that reflected light from every angle so that it seemed to shine on its own right there in
her hand. She held it up.

 "I remember that star," Jase said. "She took it out and held it up just like you're doing. She said when
she was young her mother always put it near the top of the tree closest to the lights so it would shine all
the time."

 "Where are we going to get a tree? We might have to improvise," Maia said.

 Cole had been listening just outside the entryway, unable to stay away. He sighed, knowing she was
drawing him deeper into unknown territory. He moved back into the room to stand in front of her. "We'll
manage a tree, Doc. There's bound to be a break or two in between storms."

 "You'll really get a tree, Cole? Bring it in the house?" Jase asked.

 "Sure. We can put it in front of the window. I doubt if you have enough decorations for a big one, but
we can improvise."

 Maia put the star carefully to one side and reached for a second ornament. "We'll have fun making
ornaments. And I checked out the kitchen. You're certainly not short on food supplies. We can bake all
kinds of things and probably cook a traditional Christmas dinner as well."

 "I like the sound of that," Jase said. "I'm hungry all the time."

 "He's a bottomless pit," Cole confirmed. "We bring in more groceries than we do feed for the stock."

 Jase was thin, even for a teenager. Maia could imagine that he was just beginning to trust enough and be
confident enough in his relationship with Cole to regain his appetite. She leaned back against the couch as
she held up the second ornament. It was an alligator with a red knitted scarf circling the neck. The jaws
of the alligator opened and dosed when she turned the tip of the tail.

 "Why would someone have an alligator hanging on the tree?" Cole asked, taking it from her to examine it
closely. "I thought you always had Santa Claus and things like that. This is pretty cool."

 "Mom was from Louisiana," Jase reminded. "She used to pretend the alligator was going to bite my
finger. She said it was to remind her of home."

 "What else is in there?" Cole asked, curious. He had never really looked at any Christmas ornaments
before, avoiding the decorated trees in the stores wherever he happened to be when the holiday rolled
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around. For most of his life he'd told himself it was stupid, hanging things on trees, but the little alligator
evoking the memories of Jase's mother seemed different.

 Maia handed him the next ornament, a crystal crescent moon with a small baby lying inside the curve of
the moon and a little silver star hanging off the tip. It was dated fourteen years earlier. Cole turned it over
and over. He looked at Jase. "This is commemorating when you were born. I wish I'd had the chance to
meet your mother, Jase."

 "Too bad we can't get to town," Maia said, struggling to keep tears from flooding her eyes. She might
have lost her family, but when she had one, it had been wonderful. She'd been raised to feel secure and
loved by her parents and grandmother. "This will be the first Christmas you're spending together as a
family. We could have picked up an ornament celebrating that."

 "I would have liked that," Jase said, taking the small crystal moon from Cole.

 "The great thing about not having a tradition is, you get to start your own," Maia pointed out.

 "We don't need to go to a store," Cole said gruffly. "I can carve an ornament for us. What do you think
it should be?"

 "Cole's a great wood-carver," Jase said. "You should see some of the things he's done. Something to do
with a horse, Cole. Can you do that?"

 "I can come up with something."

 "Carve the date into it," Maia advised.

 "Dinner's ready if you two want to eat something." Cole said to hide how uncomfortable he was with the
way the conversation was going. Have someone take a few shots at him with a gun, and he was on
familiar ground, but he was feeling his way with Jase, trying to give his brother a sense of security and
home. He couldn't believe he'd opened his mouth and offered to carve a Christmas ornament.

 He shoved his hands through his hair in sudden agitation. He didn't even know what a home was. Who
was he kidding? He was beginning to sweat just thinking about night coming. They'd arisen late after
staying up taking care of the horse, and now the afternoon was waning. He glanced out the window. The
snow was coming down endlessly, large flakes that held them prisoner at the ranch. He hated the place.
How could bringing in a tree and hanging a few ornaments change that?

 Maia set the ornaments back in the box. "After dinner we should build a fire," she said, indicating the
huge stone fireplace that was a showpiece along the center of one wall.

 Jase drew in his breath audibly, his shoulders stiffening and his face paling.

 Cole stood up. "I don't think there's ever been a fire in the fireplace." He reached down and with his
casual strength, pulled her up. He drew her body close to his, bending over her to examine the back of
her head. "You have quite a bump there."

 "And a headache, but it will go away." She knew better than to look up at him with his face so close to
hers, but the temptation was too much. Her gaze met his. His eyes had once again darkened. She put her
hand on his chest to keep a few inches between her and the heat of his body. Just for protection. If she
knew any incantations for self-defense, she would have been chanting them. "What's the use of having a
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fireplace if you never light a fire?"

 Cole exchanged a long look with Jase, even as his hand came up to capture Maia's. To press her palm
tighter against his heart. "Good question."

 "You think we should try to light a fire?" Jase was breathing too fast, almost gasping for air. He actually
looked scared, searching the living room as if someone might have heard them talking.

 "Calm down," Cole said gently. "You're starting to wheeze. He's dead, Jase. Keep telling yourself that.
This is our house now, and we can have a damned fire in the fireplace if we want to have one." He
allowed Maia escape him. "You're right. We have a ghost in the house, and I want him gone."

 Jase slowed his breathing, following Cole's direction until the wheezing was gone. "All right, we'll light the
fire."

 Maia followed them into the kitchen. Cole swept his arm briefly around Jase's shoulders. It was
momentary, but he'd done it obviously without thinking about it and that pleased her. "I'm sorry if I'm
stepping on everyone here," she said. "I'm not trying to push anything on the two of you. You're both
obviously uncomfortable with having a fire. We don't need one. Please don't change everything for me.
It's your home, do whatever makes you comfortable."

 "Our father liked to brand things," Cole said. "Including people."

 Maia winced at the grim tone. She stared in horror first at Cole, then Jase. "No way." She felt sick,
actually sick.

 The brothers nodded.

 How did anyone survive such a childhood? Who was she to tell them how to get over it? Horrified at the
things she'd said to Cole, she gripped the back of a chair, her knuckles white. "Please don't feel like you
have to celebrate Christmas for me. Is that what you're doing?"

 Jase shook his head adamantly. "No, I want to celebrate it for my mother. I thought a lot about what you
said. She loved this house. He wouldn't let her have any of the things she wanted in it, but she would tell
me what she'd put in spots if she had her way. She wanted cream-colored drapes in the library. She said
they'd look great with the wood."

 "Cream-colored drapes? I guess we're going to change the drapes." Cole raised his eyebrows at Maia.
"You know anything about drapes?"

 She laughed just like he knew she would. "Don't panic. We're grown-up. We can figure out how to fit
drapes." Maia didn't feel like laughing, but Cole was trying to bring back levity for Jase's sake, and she
was more than willing to help him.

 Cole knew he could get used to the way the house felt with her in it. Jase set the table, and Cole pulled a
chair around for Maia. "Sit down. You're looking a little pale. I'll see to the horse tonight. Maybe you
should have let me put a couple of stitches in that cut on your head."

 "I don't think so." She glared at him. "You come near me with a needle, and you'll find out how mean I
can be."
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 Jase snorted. "You're a baby, Doc."

 "Oh, like you'd let him sew up your head! I'd wind up looking like Frankenstein's mother."

 Jase grinned at Cole. "She'd make a great monster, don't you think?"

 "Great, just like theThe Nightmare Before Christmas . I'm Sally."

 Jase and Cole exchanged a puzzled look. Both shrugged, nearly at exactly the same moment.

 Maia groaned. "Don't tell me you're both so deprived you never saw that movie? Good grief. Live a
little. Rent it. I'll even spring for it."

 "Yeah, she says that now with the snow coming down, but once the roads are clear, she's going to
renege," Cole said. "Eat your steak."

 "I don't eat meat, but the salad's wonderful," Maia said politely.

 Jase took one look at Cole's face and burst out laughing. "I wish I had a camera."

 "And why don't you eat meat?"

 Maia made a face at him. "I told you why."

 "I guess I could understand if animals talk to you all the time," Cole teased.

 The tone was gruff, but Maia was pleased he'd actually managed to say something to kid her. She tried
to keep a stern face, but she knew her eyes gave her away every time. When she wanted to laugh, it
always showed.

 "You wouldn't want to eat your clients," Jase added.

 "Oh you two are a laugh a minute," Maia said. "You should take your little comedy act out on the road."

 "She's getting grouchy. Must be the headache. Women, by the way"—Cole leaned across the table
toward Jase, to impart his wisdom in a conspirator's overloud whisper—"get headaches a lot."

 Jase's grin widened.

 Maia lifted an eyebrow. "Really? I wouldn't have thought you'd get that reaction, Steele, but now that
I've spent time with you, I can see it."

 Jase nearly fell off his chair laughing, so much so that Cole rolled up a newspaper and smacked him over
the head.

 "It's not that funny, little bro."

 "If I'm little, what's Maia? I'm taller than she is."

 "Everything is taller than Maia."
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 Maia managed an indignant glare. "I'm not short. I happen to be the perfect height. Sheesh, not everyone
has to be a moose."

 "Now she's calling you a moose," Jase said. He was laughing so hard he was beginning to wheeze.

 Cole reached out and put a calming hand on his shoulder. "She's going to kick off an asthma attack if
you're not careful, and she'll be chasing you around the house with that needle she uses on the horse.
Take a breath, Jase. Use your inhaler if you have to."

 Although he was automatically breathing slow, deep breaths to aid his younger brother, Cole was
watching Maia as well. She was clearly becoming distracted, trying to stay in the conversation, but
bothered by something he couldn't hear or see.

 "What is it, Doc?"

 The smile faded from her face, and she turned her head toward the kitchen door. "Do you have a patio
out there, a shelter?"

 "Of course. Everything is connected by walkways to the house," Cole said. "That way, when it snows,
there's no way to get lost."

 Maia stood up, pushing back her chair. "I'll be right back."

 Jase was startled out of his wheezing when she left the room. "What's she up to, Cole?"

 "Lord only knows," Cole said, but he glanced toward the kitchen door. The sound of the wind and tree
branches hitting the house could be heard, but nothing else.

 "I like having her here," Jase confided.

 "So do I." Cole realized it was true. He never spent so much time in anyone's company. Jase had been
the first real commitment he'd made outside of his job. Maia brightened the house, brought warmth and
laughter and a sense of home. His heart lurched at the idea. "Do you think any woman would make this
place feel the way she makes it, or just the doc?" He kept his voice very neutral but found his stomach
was tied up in knots. The kid mattered to him, even his opinion mattered, and that realization was almost
as shocking.

 Jase shook his head. "It's definitely the doc. I like her a lot, Cole."

 Cole crumpled his napkin and threw it on the table. "Yeah, I do too."

 Jase frowned. "You don't sound too happy about it."

 "Would you be? Hell, look at us, Jase. We're about as dysfunctional as two men could get. You think
the doc is going to be looking at me. I can't even make up my mind if I want her to." He shoved his chair
back.

 "She kissed you," Jase pointed out. "Do you think she kisses everyone?"

 Cole's entire body tensed, every muscle contracting. The knots in his belly hardened into lethal lumps.
"She'd better not be kissing everyone," Cole said. There was enough of an edge to his voice that Jase
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looked wary.

 "Are you angry, Cole?"

 "I just don't trust anything I don't understand, Jase. I don't altogether understand the doc or how she
makes me feel." Telling the kid the truth wasn't as easy as he thought it would be when he'd first made the
promise to himself. He hadn't counted on meeting Maia Armstrong and feeling so intensely about her.

 "Well talk nice to her," Jase advised. "Otherwise, you'll scare her off."

 "Scare whom off?" Maia asked as she came back into the room carrying her small bag. She was
dressed in a thick coat and mittens. "If you're talking about me, Jase, your brother doesn't scare me. He's
all growl and no bite."

 "Where the hell do you think you're going?"

 Jase groaned and shook his head, covering his face with his hands. "Do you ever listen? Even I know
you can't talk to women like that."

 "Thank you, Jase," Maia said. "You know, Cole, if you took a few lessons from your younger brother,
you might develop a certain charm."

 "Just answer me."

 Maia sighed, color washing into her face. "I have to make a call."

 "A call? What the hell?"

 "You already said that. Didn't he say that, Jase? Yes, a call. I heard an animal, and I'm going to go see
what's wrong."

 "I didn't hear anything," Jase said, frowning slightly.

 Cole ignored his younger brother, his gaze holding Maia to him. "Didn't you pay any attention to me
saying I wanted everyone to stick together when we went outside?"

 Maia winced a little at his sharp tone. "Yes, of course I did." Truthfully the moment she heard the call of
an animal in distress she hadn't thought of anything else. "I'm just going out onto the patio. You can come
if you want, but you'll have to stay quiet."

 His blue eyes slashed her as she gave the order, but she didn't look away, staring right back at him,
refusing to be intimidated.

 Jase jumped up with determination. "I'm coming too."

 "You just don't want to do the dishes," Cole said.

 The two grabbed jackets and gloves from the rack just outside the door in the small mudroom as they
followed Maia out. Cole hung back watching as she stood on the large covered patio looking out into the
snow. She didn't call out, and he heard nothing, but she suddenly turned her head toward the north and
stepped off the patio into the snow. He moved quickly, catching her arm.
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 "Maia, call whatever it is to you. You can't go out into this. Jase and I will hang back out of the way, but
you stay undercover."

 The storm had let up some, but it had dropped several feet of snow, and with the next serious storm
approaching fast, he didn't want to take any chances.

 "I'm not sure it will come to me with the two of you so close," she said.

 "At least try."

 She hesitated a moment, glanced at Jase, then complied, whistling softly as if calling a dog. The sound of
the wind answered her. Snowflakes fell in a continuous soft drift, muffling sounds of the night.

 "I'm going to have to go out to it," she persisted.

 Cole retained possession of her arm. Something was moving just outside his range of vision, the fall of
snow nearly obscuring it. "Stay here. I want you where I can see you at all times." He whispered it,
straining to see beyond the veil of white.

 Beneath his fingers, Maia suddenly tensed and stepped away from him, moving to the very edge of the
patio. "She's coming in."

 Cole felt the hairs on his body raise. He moved closer to Jase, shifting his body to place himself between
the unknown and his brother. What he wanted to do was drag Maia back into the safety of the house.
While the snow was white and seemed to sparkle everywhere, the clouds were dark and ominous with
the continuing threat of the blizzard. He didn't know if that was what triggered his protective instincts or
whether it was sheer self-preservation, but his warning radar was shrieking.

 The mountain lion emerged out of the snowdrift, covered in flakes, ears flat, eyes alert and watchful. The
yellow-green gaze settled not on Maia, but on the Steele brothers.

 "Maia." Cole reached out and caught the back of her coat, giving it a small tug to try to bring her to him.
"Jase, back into the house. Come on, Maia. This is dangerous."

 "No" Maia kept her tone low and almost crooning. "She's coming to us. She's feeling threatened, and
any movement on your part will have her running away. Just stay calm and don't move." As she spoke,
Maia knelt and patted the patio beside her.

 Nearly belly to the ground, the cat inched its way to her, using a freeze-frame stalking motion, never
taking its gaze from the men. The cat crouched rather than stretched out, presenting its left side to the
veterinarian, but obviously ready to spring away quickly should there be need. Maia put her hand on the
cat's back, fingers sliding into the rich far.

 Cole pressed one hand to his heart and slid the other down to his calf, where his gun was stashed.

 Maia allowed the images from the mountain lion to crowd into her mind. Something moving through the
air, nearly over the top of her. A loud noise that had the cat snarling. Men and horses. The scent of man
invading her territory. The sting in her side that spread pain through her body and slowed her down,
accompanied by the sound of the rifle.
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 "She's been shot," she said quietly.

  

 chapter 9
 Mai a took a deep slow breath. "It isn't as if I can keep her from going against her natural instincts. If
you are going to watch this, please don't turn your back on her and don't stare directly into her eyes. I
sometimes look them in the eyes, but I have some strange affinity for wild animals." She kept her voice
crooning, as if talking to the cat.

 "The wound is in her shoulder which is a good thing. I'm going to give her both Rompom and Ketamine
to knock her out. Jase, it's always much harder with exotics, particularly large cats. Normally you have to
dart them, and the problem is, they are very hard to dart down because there is no set dosage even if
they're the same age and height, the normal criteria for dosing an animal or even a human. It's different
with them because their adrenaline is pumping very fast. It's rareto take a large cat down with one dart."
As she spoke she was preparing the shot.

 "Maia." Cole didn't like her in such close proximity, yet she was moving with confidence.

 "Please don't talk. This is very hard on her. She trusts me, but not you. You have to look at the body
language of a cat to know what's going on inside of them." She set the dose of Ketamine aside and
withdrew a second syringe. "This is yohimbe, Jase. Youalways have it ready when you're working with
exotics. The danger is, they'll fight the drug until they finally drop, but then, as they relax, they can go into
cardiac arrest. I think she'll be fine, she isn't fighting it, but we have to be ready. Yohimbe reverses the
Ketamine. I'm giving the injection in the muscle and it will sting, so expect a reaction and don't move.
Once she's out, you can get close to her."

 Cole kept the gun hidden along his thigh. His heart was pounding in fear, and his mouth was dry, not for
himself, or even Jase, but because the sight of Maia so close to the wild animal was terrifying.

 Maia caught the head of the cat in her hands and leaned forward nose to nose, her face inches from the
cat's teeth. She seemed to exchange breath with the animal, obviously communicating in some way, but
Cole's fingers tightened around the gun. It took a tremendous effort to keep from aiming it at the animal.
Maia put her hand on the cat's heart as if matching her own heartbeat with the mountain lion.

 Maia pulled back to pick up the syringe. The cat yowled as she administered it. "I know, baby," she said
softly, "it stings, doesn't it? Just go with it and get sleepy for me." She glanced over her shoulder. "I need
to work fast, this won't keep her under for long."

 "Can we help?" Cole asked, shoving the gun back into his holster.

 "Remember how I mixed the Betadine and saline? You can do that while I give her fluid. It's going to
balloon up at the site, Jase, but the lump will dissipate as the fluid is absorbed in the cat's body. I'm giving
her a sub queue of lactated Ringer's solution for dehydration. It's hard to find a vein on the big cats, but
they absorb liquid under the skin. I'm putting in the fluids right here in this area."

 "Do you want me to put this in a syringe like we did for the horse?" Jase asked. He crouched quite close
to Maia, almost nudging her out of the way.
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 "Yes. Use it to flush the wound site. The wound is on the trapezoid muscle, but it looks like the bullet
just sliced it rather than penetrated." Maia turned her head toward Jase.

 Cole could see they were nearly nose to nose. For some reason it put a lump in his throat. Something
deep inside him shifted. Moved. Melted. He saw his young half brother, so starved for love and attention,
turning to Maia. She seemed so willing to give the boy the things he needed. It came naturally to her. She
imparted knowledge casually, and Jase soaked it up.

 "You lavage it, and I'll debride the area. We want it sterile, just like with Wally."

 "She's so big," Jase observed. "I've never seen a mountain lion other than in pictures before." There was
awe in Jase's voice. Unable to help himself, just as curious as Jase, Cole crowded closer to see what
they were doing.

 "They're solitary animals, Jase," Maia explained. "The females are smaller than the males. This one
probably weighs in around ninety-five pounds and most are somewhere between seventy-five to one
hundred and twenty-five pounds, so she's average and healthy. A female will keep her cubs with her
about year to a year and half. This one is still young, maybe two years old."

 "Can I touch her?" Jase was already reaching out, his expression lit up with excitement Cole had never
seen him as fascinated or intrigued with anything. The boy moved even closer, actually bending over
Maia to peer at what she was doing. She didn't seem to mind in the least, showing him what she was
doing next.

 "Sure, it's safe. She's out. Her eyes are open, but she's out." Maia squeezed ointment into the cat's eyes
to prevent them from drying out. "She can't blink lite this, so we have to do it for her."

 "I've heard them scream before," Jase said. "It was like something out of a scary movie."

 "Mountain lions purr, rather than roar like the other big cats do, and yes, they have a phenomenal
scream," Maia said, guiding Jase's hand along the cat's back.

 Cole watched the way her hands moved through the mountain lion's fur. He tasted envy in his mouth.
Need. How did he become a part of such a thing?

 Maia glanced at Cole over her shoulder. "You don't hunt them on this ranch, do you?"

 "It's legal here in Wyoming," he said. His voice was strangling around the lump in his throat. "But since
I've been here we certainly don't hunt them, and we wouldn't unless they went after our horses or cattle.
Most stay in the high country." Forcing his mind to concentrate on details, he studied the cat, trying to
determine, from the lacerated muscle, the angle the shooter had shot from. "How old is mat wound?"

 "It's fresh. Maybe twenty-four hours, a little longer, but not by much. Damn hunters. It's makes me so
mad, they wound an animal and leave it to suffer."

 "You're saying she was shot on this ranch yesterday or the day before?" Cole's body touched hers, as he
bent over her to get a closer look at the wound.

 Maia glanced at him, recognizing the edge in his voice, the sudden alert interest. "She definitely was shot
somewhere on the ranch."

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


 "There was no one here but Al and me," Jase said. "I didn't hear a shot."

 "It was probably miles from the ranch house," Cole said.

 "I'm going to give her an injection of antibiotics, then we'll put them in her food and try to keep her here
over the next few days," Maia deliberately changed the subject when she realized Jase was becoming
agitated. She sent Cole a warning glance.

 Cole shook his head. "Maia, this is a working ranch. You have any idea how dangerous that is? If you
feed her, and you'll have to, she might want to come around here. And then we're going to have to shoot
her anyway."

 "I'll make certain she knows to stay in the high country."

 He stepped even closer. "Fine. If I have to have it here, I want to pet it too." He felt stupid asking, but it
was the chance of a lifetime. There was breathtaking beauty in the animal and a sense of raw power. The
moment his fingers sank into the fur, he felt connected to it, and in some strange way, the mountain lion
solidified his connection to Jase and Maia. He dropped his other hand on Maia's shoulder, needing to
touch her as he took the unique opportunity to get close to a live mountain lion. Jase beamed at him.
They exchanged a small grin. Maia was magic and mystery, and it was becoming difficult for Cole to
focus his mind on anything else.

 Maia's hand covered Cole's as he petted the cat's deep far.

 "Amazing. I've never had an experience like this." There was wonder in his voice, a boyish excitement,
much like Jase's, yet there was that underlying dark sensuality he couldn't suppress. Seeing Maia with the
cat, getting so close with Jase, just being herself seemed to bring it out in him.

 Reluctantly, Maia pulled her hand away to reach for the needle. She had to avoid looking at Cole.
Sharing the experience with him was a fantasy she'd always kept secret, sharing her love of exotic cats
with a man she… Abruptly she pulled her mind away from the thought. "I'm suturing the wound, Jase,"
Maia continued. "If it were any older, there would be too much bacteria in it, but I'll leave a drain and use
dissolving sutures. Hopefully we can keep as much air getting to it as possible."

 "How'd you learn all this?" Jase asked eagerly. "This is what I want to do."

 "I specialized in exotics as well as smaller animals. I actually interned in both Africa and Indochina,"
Maia said. "I may go back to specializing, but for the time being, the mobile clinic works for me."

 Jase looked up at his brother, a grin on his face. "I know I could do this, Cole."

 "I know you could too, Jase," Cole encouraged. Because Jase was so excited, the boy didn't even
notice he was shaking with cold.

 "Large cats can't be treated lightly, Jase," Maia said as she worked. "You always have to be aware that
they are wild creatures, even the 'domesticated exotics.' You have to pay attention to body language all
the time. And you have to be aware of what 'zone' they're in. I have a five-zone gauge I use to determine
the risks of working with a wild animal. Things like bad weather, such as we have now, high winds,
tornadoes, and such will drop them into the zone, and we're very much at risk. As she comes out from
under the ketamine shell be at her most dangerous because she'll be dopey and fearful. We don't want to
be around for that."
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 "Where do you want to put her, Doc?" Cole asked, trying to be practical, trying to find a way to help, to
be a part of what she was.

 "Somewhere she'll be safe out of the storm and fairly warm, where I can easily check on her and feed
her."

 "We have the toolshed," Jase said. "It has heating coils in the floor although we never use them. We
could lock her in there."

 "You two get it ready while I finish up here. I wish I had a Fentanyl patch for pain, that would be the
best, but I don't carry that with me. I'll have to use a combination of morphine and Valium instead. Hurry,
she's going to start waking up, and she won't be a happy kitty."

 Cole frowned. "I don't like you carrying any of those drugs around with you. It's too dangerous." He
couldn't resist petting the cat a second time.

 Jase and Maia exchanged a quick grin behind Cole's back, Maia rolling her eyes at his warning. She
made no comment, knowing it was useless to argue with his protective bristling. She was a vet and
needed the drugs. "Any ideas on how we're going to move her?" she asked.

 "I can carry her," Cole said. "But she'd better not wake up and bite my face off."

 "She won't. Let's go then. Is it far?"

 "No. We'll use the main walkway, then have to use the cable to get to the shed, but it's only a few feet."
Cole hesitated as he crouched beside the big mountain lion. "You're sure she's under?"

 Maia took one last listen to the cat's heart and lungs. "Yes, let's go."

 Cole would be lifting a deadweight and trudging a distance, part of it in deep snow. Maia didn't have to
like it, but she couldn't think of any other way to transport the animal.

 Using the covered walkway was easy enough, but Cole struggled a bit in the deep snow. Jase hurried
ahead to get the shed ready and to kick on the heating coils. He snagged a couple of blankets from the
barn and came running back with them as Cole staggered through the door.

 "I feel her moving," he announced.

 "Lay her down," Maia instructed, "and back off. We'll just let her be. You have something for water for
her?"

 "I have this old bucket," Jase said, and held it up.

 "Good, we'll use that then. Come on, she's definitely coming around." Maia backed out and closed the
door, leaving the mountain lion to wake up on its own.

 She stretched tiredly. "I'm suddenly freezing."

 "So is Jase," Cole said. "Let's get back to the house."

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


 Cole stayed behind Maia, crowding her close as she followed Jase through the snow and the walkway
back to the patio, where she collected her equipment. They entered the mudroom to remove jackets,
mittens, and shoes. "I don't know about encouraging these wild animals to come around. What if that
cougar decides Watty's an easy meal?"

 "She won't," Maia said, trying to keep her teeth from chattering.

 "That's the coolest thing I've ever seen," Jase said.

 "I'd prefer you didn't mention it to anyone," Maia said.

 "There sure is a lot of cool stuff I can't tell anyone" Jase groused.

 She was shivering so much Cole pulled her against the warmth of his body and began to run his hands up
and down her arms. "What are we going to feed her?"

 "I'mgoing to need ten to fifteen pounds of beef or chicken for her daily. They eat bones and all, and
they'realways hungry. Jase, don't you go near her. She's a wild animal and injured, so she's
unpredictable. I'll put her antibiotics in her food."

 "What do you know about mountain lions, Cole?" Jase asked. "Do we have a lot of them around here?"

 "We have our share, but honestly, I don't know that much about them at all."

 "They are the second largest cat in the Western Hemisphere," Maia said, "and they're also the fastest.
Unfortunately, they tire easily because their hearts don't match their size. They lose stamina in a long run
and generally miss their kill nine out of ten times, which means a lot of hunting for them."

 Cole stooped to pull off her boots. "I couldn't believe how powerful the animal felt to me. Just being in
its presence was intense."

 "Big cats are at the top of the food chain, so they have an 'arrogance' and mantle of power they wear
like a second skin." Maia grinned at Cole. "Those of us who are drawn to them are often accused of
being the same way."

 "Great, are you saying I'm a predator? Or that you are?"

 "Maybe parts of you are. You definitely have power, and you know it." Her smile widened. "I know I
do."

 "I was drawn to it too," Jase reminded, tossing his boots aside. "And I don't have any power at all."

 "Sure you do. And there are people who believe animals come to you to give you messages. A mountain
lion crossing your path is a sign you have power, and maybe it's time you should learn about yourself,
strengthen and sharpen your own powers. That could be the message to you." Maia tried to get across to
the boy that if he knew and could read the mountain lion, he could understand Cole and maybe himself a
little better.

 "Do you believe in that?" Cole asked.

 Maia shrugged. "Cats fascinate and repel and inspire fear all at the same time in most people. Because of
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that, exotics are often labeled as magic or mystical."

 "Don't you think people are fearful because they're in the presence of a predator, a natural killer?" Cole
asked.

 "Sure, subconsciously I'm sure they are, but it's that very energy that attracts people to the cats and gives
them the mystique."

 Cole opened the door to the kitchen and waved them through. "Does this kind of thing happen to you
everywhere you go? Wild animals appearing out of nowhere?"

 "Just about," Maia admitted with a small secret smile. She had turned a corner in the restaurant and run
right into the Steele brothers. To her, they weren't that much different from the mountain lion. She rubbed
at her arms in an effort to get warm. "I think my blood has turned to ice."

 "Come on, let's get that fire built," Cole said, pulling her into the living room.

 "Jase, would you get the doc a blanket? She's freezing."

 Jase hesitated only a moment, clearly not wanting to miss anything, before he hurried off, taking the stairs
two at a time.

 "Cole," Maia waited until he turned to face her. He knelt in front of the massive fireplace, a log in his
hand, his hair spilling across his forehead, and her stomach gave a curious flutter. "You don't have to do
that."

 "Actually I do. You're right, you know. It's silly not to use a fireplace just because the old man could be
cruel. I'm hoping it gives the room a completely different atmosphere. Mostly I'm hoping Jase will like it."

 "Someone should have done something about that man." Her voice was tight. She couldn't imagine how
Brett Steele had gotten away with his vicious behavior for so long. How could the ranch hands and
housekeeper look the other way?

 "Someone did." Cole turned back to building a fire.

 Maia studied him in silence, rubbing her chin on her knee as she watched him. His movements were all
efficient, graceful. There were sharp edges to Cole's personality but none to his physical movements. He
reminded her of the mountain lion, moving with fluid, sure strength. She loved just looking at him.

 Jase hurried in with a down comforter she recognized from her bed. He tucked it around her, flicking a
quick glance at the fireplace. Flames crackled brightly, casting shadows on the wall and window. Outside
the glass, the light flickered across the snow so that flames leapt and sparkled in a strange, beautiful
illusion. "Wow. Did you know it did that?"

 Cole sat back staring out the glass at the phenomenon.

 "No. The architect must have designed it that way." He scooted back until his back was pressed against
the couch, close to Maia's legs. "It is amazing."

 "Breathtaking," Maia agreed. "You know, we could easily cut some branches and make a wreath for the
fireplace and door. That would bring in the smell of Christmas. I looked in the freezer, and there is a
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turkey. If we take it out now, we could thaw it in the refrigerator and cook it."

 "You're planning on cooking it, right?" Jase said. "Because the thought of Cole cooking a turkey is
scary."

 "What exactly do you do in the kitchen, Steele?" Maia asked.

 "He set off the smoke alarms three times already," Jase said. "And the food…"

 Cole moved so fast he seemed a blur, dragging Jase to the floor in a wrestling move. Jase stiffened,
letting out a squeak of terror in spite of the fact that Cole cushioned his fall. Cole froze. Maia launched
herself from the couch, blanket and all, landing on Cole's back. "Jase, pin him! Pin him! You've got to get
him in a headlock!"

 "No fair double-teaming me," Cole protested, reaching up to hook Maia around the waist. "You're on
time-out with that scalp wound."

 "You're just afraid," Maia taunted. "You don't want to get beat up by a woman."

 Cole rolled her in the comforter, careful not to flip Jase off him when the teenager did his best to put him
in a headlock and hang on as Cole wrestled with Maia. She was like an eel and believed in using her
skills, even in playing. She had no intention of surrendering easily, and what had started out as aid to Jase
in learning to play turned into a challenge. She called out instructions to the boy, and he readily threw
himself into the game, trying to get a lock on Cole's legs to prevent him from getting leverage.

 Maia laughed so hard she couldn't get a good grip on Cole and found herself lying on her back, staring
up into his blue eyes. Jase slipped off Cole's back to land beside her, laughing with her. Cole stretched
across the two of them. "Consider yourselves officially pinned."

 "You cheated," Maia accused. She turned her head to laugh with Jase. "He tickled me. In wrestling,
there's no tickling."

 "I had to end it fast. You shouldn't be playing around with your head banged up." Cole tried to use his
toughest voice, but Jase and Maia only laughed harder, shoving at him, their eyes bright with fun. He
found himself lying in a heap on the floor, his arms around the two of them with something hard deep
inside of him slowly melting away. It had started when he saw Maia and Jase together with the mountain
lion and now, playing in the living room with them, a dam seemed to be bursting inside of him. It was a
frightening feeling, one he wasn't ready for.

 "My head's just fine. It was just a little cut."

 "Still, it's better for you to take it easy for a few days." His voice was gruff.

 Maia's fingers tangled in his hair, and he felt a surge of electricity rushing from her to him. His body
reacted, and he immediately slid away from the two of them. What had possessed him to start a game of
wrestling with Jase? He sat back, eyeing Maia as if she were some kind of sorceress. He knew he was
looking wild and crazy but he couldn't help it. She destroyed his control.

 "What is it, Cole?" She sat up too, pushing her tumbling hair out of her eyes and looking up at him with
concern. "Did I hurt you?"
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 "Not yet," he said before he could censor himself.

 Jase sat up slowly, looking from his older brother to Maia, his smile widening as he did so.

 Cole glared at him. "Don't say a word."

 Jase held up both hands. "I wasn't going to say a word." He exchanged a slow smile with Maia before
turning his attention to his mother's treasures.

 For the next hour they examined the contents of the box, putting the ornaments aside and unfolding the
obviously old quilt.

 Maia took a shower and washed her hair, coming down once more dressed in Jase's clothes. They
checked the horses together in the evening, and Maia frowned a bit over Wally, concerned he might be
getting an infection. When she went to feed and water the mountain lion, Cole insisted on standing by
with a gun. He had long since sent Jase to bed and stood guard over her by himself.

 As they walked back to the house he shook his head. "This is crazy, Maia, you know that don't you?
Having a mountain lion locked up in the toolshed on a horse and cattle ranch. We'll have to watch Jase
every minute. He's likely to try to sneak another peek at that animal."

 "She's trying to be good. She's wants to leave," Maia admitted, "but she'll stay a couple of days. I'd like
a good seven days with her before she takes off, but I'm not going to get it."

 "They really talk to you?" He pushed open the door for her and waited while she hung up her jacket and
pulled off her boots. "Because after watching you with that animal, I think I'm ready to believe anything."

 "It's not actually talking. More like images."

 "You're frowning."

 "It's just that I'm very concerned about what the animals keep showing me." Maia was reluctant to admit
it for obvious reasons. "I feel silly telling you, but if I don't, and something happens, I'd blame myself."
She sighed and moved away from him to go into the kitchen. The making of tea was a soothing ritual, and
in any case, she needed to take the turkey from the freezer. "You already know I pick up images from
animals, so there's no reason to pretend it isn't happening."

 Cole followed, aware it was difficult for her. "I'd like to know."

 "It's just that there's always violence involved. Wally and the deer are the only animals that revealed to
me the violence toward Jase. The rest of the animals are showing me things that are happening away from
the ranch house."

 He toed a chair around and straddled it in the middle of the kitchen, watching as she filled the teakettle
and set it on the stove. "What kinds of things?"

 "Something flying above their heads. Men and horses moving on the ground. Rifle flashes in the night. I
get bits and pieces, nothing concrete, but I think some men may have had a fight and someone was killed
here on the ranch." She pulled open the freezer to remove the turkey, setting it in the refrigerator without
looking at him. "I could be way off base, but something traumatic happened here sometime ago, and I
think something happened here again very recently."
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 Silence stretched out between them.

 She didn't want to see his face, to know he thought she was crazy. Why had she said anything? Would
she ever learn? She was falling in love with him, and it was far too soon. Love wasn't supposed to
happen so fast, rushing at her like an avalanche. She knew better. She spooned loose-leaf tea into the
teapot, thankful the kitchen was a chef's delight and so well stocked with everything. Once again she was
blowing her chances with a man she could care about because she admitted her affinity with animals.

 Maia spun around. "You know what? I don't care if you believe me or not. This is who I am, and I'm not
going to apologize for it." She pushed her hand through her hair in agitation. "I like animals better than
people anyway."

 His eyebrow shot up. "You don't like them better than you like me."

 "Yes I do. I don't know what I was thinking." She glared at him, angry at herself for being so vulnerable
to whatever he might think of her.

 "You were thinking the animals might be warning us about something, and it was important." He tried his
hand at teasing her. " Has anyone ever called you Dr. Doolittle?"

 "No! And they'd better never do it either."

 His blue eyes moved over her face with cool amusement. "You have a temper." Obviously he wasn't that
good at teasing, but he liked her reaction.

 "No, I don't. Well," she hedged. "Okay, maybe I do. But the fact is, I don't care whether you believe me
or not." She couldn't tell if he was making fun of her or whether he really meant what he said—that he
was worried the animals were warning them. It didn't seem possible that he could believe her.

 "Yes you do."

 His voice was low, a seduction of her senses that she felt all the way through her body. "I hate that
you're so good at flirting, Steele. You've been a playboy for so long, you don't know when to stop."

 He stood up, an act of aggression, and she recognized it as such, stepping back until she was pressed
tightly against the sink, one hand up to stop him. "I'm tired of you calling me insulting names, Maia."

 "I wasn't insulting you, I was stating a fact. You're too experienced, and you know it and you use it, and
I just want to kick you for it," she defended.

 He walked right up to her, his chest pressing into her palm until it was the only thing between them. She
could feel his muscles beneath the thin shirt, the rise and fall of his breath, the steady beat of his heart. His
skin radiated heat. "Back off, Steele."

 "I'm about to apologize again. I seem to do that a lot nowadays."

 There was genuine amusement in his voice. Real laughter even if his mouth didn't curve into a smile. It
was in his eyes, in his voice. She felt it in his chest.She had given him that gift, and she knew it. There was
seduction in the knowledge. She stared, fascinated at the warmth that replaced the ice in his eyes. He
lowered his head until his lips were inches from hers. Until his breath was warm against her mouth.

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


 He kissed her hard, taking her breath, devouring her rather than coaxing her. His arms swept around
her, pulled her to him, fitting her body into his.

 Maia melted into him, her body going pliant, her mouth answering with a ravenous hunger of her own.
Her arms slipped around his neck, fingers tangled in his hair, and she gave herself up to his kiss. His hand
slid up her back inside her shirt, fingers splayed wide to take in as much bare skin as possible. Heat
spread, heat and hunger and need. His kiss deepened, and his hand closed possessively over her breast.

 Maia gasped and arched into his palm. His mouth left hers, blazed across her chin, down her neck to
nuzzle at her breast until she moaned a soft protest, her arms cradling his head to her. "Stop. We have to
stop."

 "Actually, I'd rather not." He kissed his way back up to her mouth, settled there with long, persuading
kisses.

 Maia kissed him right back but kept a hand wedged between them. "I'm not quite ready for this."

 He groaned and rested his forehead against hers. "I am."

 "Yes, well now I'm the one apologizing," Maia said. "I have to be certain of what I'm doing and what I'm
getting into. I'm sorry, Cole. I'm just made that way."

 "I like the way you're made, Maia, but dammit all, I want you in my bed."

 "I do rather like the way you apologize," Maia said, touching her fingertips to her mouth, a faint smile
appearing as he swore. She could still feel him burning on her lips. Could still feel his hands on her skin.
She ached, her body tight and full and edged with need. She had to go upstairs, right away, or she was
going to take her clothes off right there in the kitchen and give him more than he ever bargained for.

 "Good. I have the feeling I'm going to have spend a lot of time apologizing to you."

 "You're probably right." She removed the teakettle from the heat. "I'm going to bed now. Alone. It's the
only safe thing to do."

 "You're certain I can't change your mind?"

 "No, that's why I'm leaving now before it's too late." She slipped past him and hurried away, leaving him
standing in the kitchen with a rueful expression on his face. She was fairly certain it was a good thing he
couldn't read her mind.

  

 chapter 10
 "Come on, Jase, Doc, bundle up, and let's go looking for a tree. We have a couple hours of break in the
storm, and this might be the best opportunity we have."

 "What did the weather report say?" Maia asked.
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 Cole gave her a sharp glance. "Don't think you're escaping when you've got a mountain lion penned up in
my shed and a horse in the barn and a teenage boy looking for a huge meal. I don't have the time to clear
the road and let you out even if I were so inclined, which I'm not."

 "You'll do anything to get out of cooking, won't you?" Maia said, her grin as contagious as always. She
slipped into her jacket and pulled on gloves. "I'm definitely going with you. I'm very particular about
trees."

 Jase and Cole exchanged a long, amused look, then groaned in union. "You would be," Cole said. "We'll
take the snowmobiles and head out toward the upper ridge. The fir trees are thick there, and we can top
one of them."

 "Why are we just taking the top of the tree?" Jase asked.

 "We don't want to kill the tree," Cole said. "I like our trees. You can never have enough trees."

 Jase looked out the window toward the tree-covered mountain. "Guess not. We'd have such a shortage
if we took the whole tree." He exchanged a grin with Maia.

 "I did notice the trees on the ranch were getting thin from all the Christmas celebrations going on around
here," Maia teased.

 Cole opened the door to the mudroom and waved them through. "I can't believe how funny the two of
you are. I let you spend a little time together taking care of that horse, and you develop a comedy
routine."

 Maia leaned in close to Jase, her arm slipping around his shoulders. "He's grouchy this morning."

 "Yeah, it's the one cup of coffee syndrome. I've seen it before," Jase replied. "No one talks to him
before the first cup of coffee, or he bites off their head. After the first cup of coffee he growls at
everyone, but there's no biting."

 Cole caught Maia around the waist, bringing her to a halt, his teeth scraping back and forth at the nape
of her neck. "I bite after the first cup of coffee if you deserve it," he warned. His teeth nipped a little
harder, sending chills down her back. His tongue swirled over the sting right before he pressed a kiss
against it.

 "Bite Jase if you're going to bite someone," Maia admonished, shoving at him.

 "Ugg. That's sick, Doc," Jase protested. "Totally sick. Cole, don't you even try biting my neck."

 A slow, mischievous grin curved Cole's mouth very slowly, giving him a young, boyish look. Maia's
breath caught in her throat. Jase backed away from him, laughing, holding out a hand to stop his older
brother's purposeful advance.

 "Back off!" He dashed out into the snow.

 Deliberately, Cole pelted his brother with several snow-balls, packing the white flakes into round balls
and heaving the missiles on the run. Maia sided with Jase, just as Cole knew she would, throwing
snowballs with good aim, scoring several hits. She threw hard and accurate so he was forced to turn
away from his intended victim to protect himself. To his astonishment, Jase tackled him from behind,
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throwing him into the snow and leaping off, running, his laughter carried away by the wind.

 The sound stirred some long-forgotten emotion in Cole. He had to fight back a lump in his throat and
blink to clear what had to be tears from his burning eyes. He got up slowly, keeping his back to the two
of them, shaking with the tidal wave of intense feelings Jase and Maia roused in him. A dam really had
burst somewhere deep inside of him, blown open by the happiness spilling over from a simple snowball
war.

 Or maybe it was so much more than that. Maybe it was all the things in his life he had now that he'd
never had, never trusted, and never thought he wanted.

 He watched Maia chase Jase through the snow. Her cheeks were red and her eyes filled with merriment,
with happiness. He had all but forgotten those things until he found her. The boy was throwing missiles as
fast as he could, but Maia clearly had him on the run. Cole could only stare at her, flooded with the
knowledge that the intensity of the emotions she brought to him was the very thing he had feared from
her. He loved her. It was too fast and too insane for someone like him to even consider, but he knew he
needed her. And Jase needed her too.

 Jase turned and streaked past Cole, skidding to a halt behind him so that a snowball landed with a splat
on Cole's chest. The snow was dazzling white, nearly bunding him. He pushed sunglasses on his nose and
settled them in place just as Maia plowed into him. Catching her in his arms, he fell backward, Maia
landing on top of him. He rolled, pinning her beneath him.

 Time seemed to stop, and he felt his heart somersault, his stomach tighten. She was so damned beautiful
lying beneath him with her eyes so full of life.

 Cole bent his head and kissed her. Hard. Hungry. Hot. Meaning it.

 Maia stared up at him a long moment, the only sound their mingled breathing. She felt her heart stuttering
hard in her chest. Little butterflies fluttered in her stomach. She was falling hard. Fast. She didn't even
know if Cole was capable of loving her. It was frightening to think how much she cared when she didn't
have the slightest idea of his real feelings. Needing space, she scooped up a handful of snow and
plastered it against the side of his head. "Cool off, Slick, we're hunting for a tree."

 Cole studied her face, the way she suddenly withdrew from him. He had to let her go, with Jase standing
over them, but he didn't want to. He wanted to hold her to him. Instead, he made himself wipe at the wet
snow trickling down his face. He raised his eyebrow. "You take all the fun out of things."

 "I do my best." She shoved at his chest. "And we're getting that tree today. All the kisses in the world
aren't going to change my mind."

 Cole got to his feet, pulling Maia up with him. Jase sat in the snow staring at them as if they'd both grown
new heads. "You going to sit there all day?" Cole asked.

 "I just might," Jase said, and took the hand Cole extended to help him up. He was grinning from ear to
ear, and Cole resisted the urge to drop him back in the snow.

 Jase moved ahead of them, bounding like a frisky colt through the snow to the garage housing the
snowmobiles. Cole paused just outside the door, staring up at the second garage looming taller right
alongside the first building.
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 "What is it?" Maia asked.

 "I don't know exactly." But he suddenly wished he were alone, able to conduct an investigation.

 "What's in there?"

 "The helicopter and a small plane."

 "Really? You have your own helicopter? Do you fly it?"

 "Yes. I can fly both the plane and the helicopter. I was in the service for a while. It was the best way to
get away from the ranch and have enough money to live. The old man could have destroyed or bought
any company I chose to work for, but he couldn't exactly make the Air Force disappear."

 "The things I'm learning about you are fascinating." She took a step toward the larger garage but stopped
when Cole put a hand on her shoulder. He was looking around the countryside, his eyes flat and hard
and ice-cold. She froze, taking her cue from him.

 Cole caught the brief glint of light reflected from a ridge up above the house. He didn't make the mistake
of staring into it, but a chill went down his back. It could have been a scope, but more likely it was
binoculars. Deliberately he glanced up at the sky. "We'd better find that tree before the next storm hits."

 Jase eagerly shoved open the garage doors to reveal several snowmobiles. "Come on, Doc, I'll race
you!"

 Maia felt Cole's hand on her shoulder guiding her toward the snowmobiles so she went with him. "What
is it?"

 Cole was grateful she was always so alert and kept her voice low. She never seemed to panic. "I don't
know yet. All these strange things the animals have been showing you, the things you've described to me,
do you believe they're trying to convey something to you?"

 "Absolutely," Maia said firmly.

 "Keep Jase occupied for a few minutes."

 "Don't do anything crazy."

 Cole slipped into the shadows of the building, encouraging Jase and Maia to follow him inside. If
someone were lying up along the ridge with a scope or binoculars, they wouldn't be able to see him go
through the door of the covered walkway leading back to the house.

 "I forgot something, Jase. We need a couple of tools. You check out the snowmobiles, make certain we
have plenty of gas and they're running fine, while I go back and get what we need."

 "Sure," Jase agreed.

 Maia was silent, watching him with fear in her eyes. He couldn't help brushing a brief, reassuring kiss
over her mouth as he passed by her. "Keep him in the garage," he whispered as he moved into the
walkway.
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 He sprinted along the covered path, forced to take a roundabout route to keep from exposing himself to
the ridge, but he made it back to the house certain he hadn't been spotted. Up in his room, he retrieved a
rifle with a scope and binoculars. With the white sheet wrapped around him, he scooted on his belly onto
the balcony, rolling into position.

 He raised the binoculars to his eyes, scanning the ridge for activity, keeping his own movement to a
minimum. It took a moment to spot his quarry. Fred Johanston, Al's brother-in-law, lay on the ridge,
watching the activity in the garage through a pair of binoculars. Cole lowered his glasses and scooted
back into the house, carefully sliding the balcony door closed, not wanting to give away his position.

 Fred Johanston was up to something, but what? There was no way he'd inherit the ranch should both
Jase and Cole die. He had no hope of being Jase's guardian. What was he up to? Cole didn't have much
time. He didn't want to tip off Fred that he was on to him. Hurrying through the house, back outside, he
took even more care to keep out of sight of the ridge, but he took several weapons with him.

 He'd already committed to taking Jase and Maia on a hunt for a Christmas tree, and if he abruptly
changed plans it could alert Fred that Cole was on to him. Better to act as if nothing were wrong and
figure things out the way he always did, methodically, slowly, putting the pieces of the puzzle together
until they fit perfectly. Now that he knew they were under surveillance, he could take the appropriate
steps to keep them safe.

 Maia looked up as he hurried in through the side door, his weapons stashed safely in a small toolbox.
"Everything all right?"

 "The snowmobiles are gassed up and ready to go," Jase said.

 "Well, put on your gloves and pull down your hat over your face. The doc and I are going to race you."

 "No we're not," Maia said.

 "Awesome," Jase said. "I'm the king on a snowmobile."

 "The rules are, we go out the door full throttle, head for Moose Creek, and you have tozigzag through
every open field or you're disqualified."

 "Piece of cake," Jase said. "You'll never catch me."

 "Don't be so cocky, kid," Cole reached over to zip the boy's jacket to his neck. "You're also disqualified
if you take a spill."

 "Hello! I don't suppose you heard me say no way," Maia said, tugging at Cole's arm. "We arenot
racing."

 "I can't believe you'd be afraid of a little speed, Maia," Cole said. A mischievous almost grin slid over his
face.

 Maia glared at him with suspicion. "If I thought you could do that on purpose…"

 "What?" He sank down onto the snowmobile and patted the seat behind him. "Climb aboard, and let's
go get that tree."
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 Maia slid behind him and wrapped her arms around his waist. "You aren't going to tell me what's going
on, are you?"

 "I don't know yet," he said truthfully, "but we're going to be very careful."

 The ride through the snow was wild and exhilarating. The two snowmobiles flew over the snow. A few
flakes fell from the clouds, reminding them they didn't have much time, but they still played, Jase and Cole
racing across the pristine fields toward Moose Creek. Maia's laughter rang in Cole's ears and found its
way into his heart. She rested her head against his back and urged him on when Jase was inching ahead
of them.

 All the while, Cole made every effort to keep trees and slopes between them and the ridge. He
encouraged Jase to play, deliberately forcing the boy to zigzag through every open field so it would be
nearly impossible to get off an accurate shot should Fred have the desire. Cole hadn't seen a rifle, but
he'd seen the saddle and blanket and the scabbard, and he was certain it had been Fred who'd taken the
horse out. And it must have been Fred who shot the mountain lion the same day he'd run Wally into the
fence. But why? What possible reason could he have? He certainly couldn't expect to get his job back
that way. Revenge? Could it be that simple?

 Jase brought his snowmobile to a halt in front of a particularly tall fir tree, pointing. The branches were
full and the tree's needles were thick. "This one's a beaut! What do you think, Doc?"

 "He would ask you," Cole said, helping her off the machine. In the thick of the trees they were well
protected. Snow was beginning to fall again, and the wind was picking up. He glanced up at the sky. "I
think this one's going to have to be it, Jase. We've just about run out of time. The storm's coming in fast."

 There was a lot of laughter and just as much argument as Cole and Jase decided what was the best way
to top the tree. Maia stood back watching, laughing at them, but all the while she could see that Cole was
extremely alert, his eyes restless, constantly moving. He was wary, extremely so, and he exuded a
powerful aura of danger. He was hunting, she knew, but had no idea what he was looking for.

 The tree was tied to a sled and secured behind Jase's machine. That told Maia Cole wanted to be
mobile or he would never have risked allowing Jase to pull the tree. They made their way back at a much
more cautious and sedate pace. It was far colder with the snow flying at their faces in spite of their warm
coats. The snow fell steadily, a sign that they were in for another long storm.

 Maia was happy to see the inside of the house. It was warm and felt welcoming with the fire in the
fireplace and Jase's mother's quilt along the back of the couch. She'd put cider on the stove to simmer,
and the fragrance wafted through the rooms. "Much better," she said and smiled at the teenager.

 He was too busy struggling to get the tree inside the house, maneuvering it with Cole giving orders and
both staggering and tripping until Maia nearly fell over laughing. "I wish I had a camera. You two are not
very good at this."

 Cole glared at her. "I don't see you helping, and this was your idea."

 "I'm suffering the effects of my scalp wound from yesterday," Maia said.

 "You were able to wrestle yesterday." He walked his end of the tree around, keeping away from the
windows, always conscious of the watcher on the ridge. He glanced outside. The snow was relentless,
falling steadily in a soft, silent monotonous way that packed on feet rather than inches. Cole seriously

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


doubted if anyone could be out in the whiteout. The tension immediately drained from his body.

 "Fine," Maia said. She took the toolbox Cole had insisted on carrying along with the tree. "I'll find the
perfect position for you. The two of you just hold on to it while I study the situation."

 "Study the situation?" Jase yelped in protest. "This isheavy ."

 "Yes, well," Maia waved a dismissing hand and settled herself on the couch, the toolbox at her feet while
she examined every angle of the room.

 "Oh, for God's sake," Cole said, exasperated. He shoved on his end until Jase went with him, standing
the tree dead center in front of the window. "Right here. The damned thing is going right here, and we're
not moving it."

 In the end they moved it four times, Maia going from one end of the room to the other to study the
positioning from every angle. Jase threw himself on the floor twice, laughing at his older brother's
expression and pointing to him until Cole threatened to throw him out in the storm.

 "That's perfect. Now we need wire and those pincher cutter things," Maia said. "We'll make a wreath."

 "I thought we were going to eat, woman," Cole objected. "You have to feed men if you want them
cooperative."

 "You just ate," Maia protested.

 "That was hours ago," Jase said. "Sorry, Doc, but I'm with Cole on this. I'm on empty."

 "You two are bottomless pits! Fine, I need to make popcorn anyway."

 "I love popcorn. Make the buttery kind," Jase said.

 "Notto eat." Maia put her hands on her hips. "We string it and make a garland to wrap around the tree."

 Jase and Cole exchanged a long look. "I think that knock on the head did more damage than we
suspected," Cole told his younger brother. "We're not wasting the popcorn on the tree, Doc."

 Jase shook his head. "What part ofstarving don't you understand?"

 "Oh for heaven's sake. We'll make sandwiches, and you can eat them and leave the decorations alone,"
Maia said.

 "I like the part about the sandwiches," Jase said, and took off for the kitchen.

 As soon as she and Cole were alone, Maia caught Cole's arm. "What is going on? I know something is,
so don't pretend you don't know what I mean."

 "I'm not sure what's going on, other than I want us all to stick together," Cole said. "When I figure it out,
I promise, you'll be the first to know."

 "Is there something I can do to help?"
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 He framed her face. "You're doing enough already. There's no way to make it up to you, the things
you're doing for Jase."

 Her heart did a silly flutter as the pad of his thumb slid back and forth over her lower lip. She was
beginning to think of various ways he could repay her if he really insisted on it. Maia knew she was
incredibly susceptible to him. Jase was her savior, whether he was aware of it or not. She would never
be able to hold out against Cole if the boy wasn't with them almost constantly, and once she gave herself
to him, she knew it would be forever. It was a terrible realization that she'd fallen so deeply for a man she
had known for only a few days.

 She couldn't look into his eyes. There was need there and hunger and something so compelling she
would never be able to resist. He was doing all the things he knew would cause him nightmares in order
to give his younger brother a chance at a normal life. She was hurting him. She ached inside knowing she
was the cause. Yet because he was a willing participant, she was falling deeper and deeper in love with
him.

 "I'm enjoying myself, Cole. This has been fun." Her voice was so husky with her awareness of him she
was embarrassed. If his thumb touched her lower lip another minute, she was going to bite him.

 "Maia." He bent his head.

 She groaned, knew she was lost as she moved into the heat of his body. Her arms stole around his neck,
and she instantly became a part of him. Skin to skin. Breath to breath. His hair felt like silk between her
fingertips. And his mouth was a haven of fire and hunger that matched her own. She sank into him, his
kiss sweeping her away just as she knew it would. She was just as demanding as he, matching fire for
fire, hungry, almost greedy in her response.

 His arms tightened around her, and his kiss was possessive, a man starved, claiming her, and she
claimed him right back, pushing so close they didn't need the clothes separating them.

 "Get a hotel room," Jase said. "Geez, this place is getting to be X-rated." He leaned against the wall, a
cold piece of pizza in his hand, chewing as he regarded them with feigned disgust. His eyes were bright
with happiness, and neither could fail to recognize the hope on his face.

 Maia pulled her mouth away from Cole's, pressing her forehead against his chest, trying to find a way to
breathe when her lungs felt starved for air. "He's getting hard to resist, Jase. I think we need to put some
kind of warning label on him."

 "You're just tired, Doc," Cole said, catching her chin, forcing her to look at him.

 A woman could definitely get trapped in his blue eyes. She sighed. "That must be it, but just in case, kiss
me again."

 He didn't wait for a second invitation. He lowered his head to hers, his hand sliding around her neck,
holding her still for his kiss.

 "I could kiss you forever," she murmured.

 Jase rolled his eyes. "Well don't. Think food instead."

 Maia blushed, shocked she'd admitted it aloud. "He mesmerized me, Jase, it isn't my fault."
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 "That's not how it looked to me," Jase said. "You were definitely doing the kissing."

 Maia pulled out of Cole's arms. "I'm going to go check the horse and the cat in that order."

 "You're running," Cole informed her.

 That intriguing trace of amusement flashed momentarily in his eyes. She had to look away from
temptation. "Yes, I am, but don't go thinking it's because of your studly self. I'm running from having to
cook. I'll make the popcorn, but the two of you are bottomless pits, and if I'm the one putting together
Christmas dinnerand baking…"

 "Cookies," Jase interrupted. "Lots of cookies. And pies." He poked his brother. "She just zapped you,
bro, put you right in your place."

 "I thought you wanted to let that cat rest. Stop avoiding me and come into the kitchen. I'll do the
cooking, and you do your strange thing with the popcorn." Cole took her hand and drew her into the
kitchen. "I started on the wood carving by the way. I've actually found a couple of pieces of wood that
might be perfect for a couple of them."

 "I've never seen anyone carve before. Will you teach me?"

 His gaze moved over her face. Dark. Brooding. Sexy. Maia backed into the table. "Maybe not." She
waved at him. "Get started on your cooking."

 "I'm making progress."

 "Youwere making progress, but I've come to my senses again." She turned her back on him, rummaging
through cupboards to find the popcorn. "Jase, find me a needle and thread please."

 "Did you really go to Africa and Indochina, Doc?" Jase asked, stuffing potato chips into his mouth.

 "Yes. It was beautiful. I loved it, but you have to be prepared for a lot of bugs."

 "I'm going to do that someday," Jase said. "What you did for Wally was so great, but I couldn't believe
how it felt to touch that mountain lion." He leaned both elbows on the table, chin in hand and studied her
with his bright eyes. "Ihave to do that again."

 "There's something incredible about a wild cat. Tigers and lions and leopards, all the exotics. You look
them in the eye, and you just know we need to find a way to share our space with them. They're
incredible."

 "Do you want to go back there?" Cole asked, his voice tight.

 There was a sudden silence in the room. Maia knew the Steele brothers were watching her closely. She
turned her head, meeting Cole's gaze. Her stomach did a crazy flip. It wasn't often she could read his
expression, but he was tense, expecting a blow. She forced a casual shrug. "If I want to work with
exotics again, most likely I'd find a zoo somewhere. I'm a fill-in vet, so I can make enough money to start
my own practice."

 "Why don't you take over the one here?" Jase asked.
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 "Money, honey. I've got some saved, but not enough."

 Popcorn began to sound off, a rapid gunfire of miniexplosions.

 "Smells good," Jase said.

 "I think you'd eat anything if it didn't move," Maia observed, laughing at him. "Leave my popcorn alone.
And I'm putting you to work stringing it while Cole makes dinner." She tossed him the small sewing kit
containing needles and thread. "Come on, help out, shark tooth."

  

 chapter 11
 Three a.m. The small alarm clock beside Maia's bed blazoned the time in bright glowing numbers. It
seemed she was always awake at 3:00 a.m. in this house. She wasn't used to the creaks and strange
noises, although, she had to admit with a great deal of satisfaction, the aura of the house was undergoing
a change.

 She shifted restlessly in the bed, sighed, giving up on sleep, and threw back the covers. Cole had
participated in decorating the tree, but he'd been thinking of something else. She'd watched him closely.
He had made a dozen excuses to go outside. He'd checked the windows and doors in the house, and for
the first time since she'd been there, he'd turned on a security alarm, after first changing the code. And
that told her something. Cole was worried about an intruder other than the ghost of his father.

 She was falling madly in love with him. She hadn't expected it, and the depth of the emotion was
terrifying. She needed to get off the ranch. To go far away. She couldn't stop thinking about Cole. She
dreamt of him. Longed to touch him, to take away the shadows always present in his eyes. She'd known
from the first moment she'd laid eyes on him that she wouldn't walk away unscathed, but she hadn't
counted on the intense attraction she felt for him. He never said a word to her about his real feelings. He
never said a word about love or indicated that when she left he wouldn't be happy or even that he might
want to see her again.

 A sound penetrated through the walls, echoed down the hall. A cry of despair. A tortured protest Maia
stood for a moment, her hand to her throat, hearing the tormented groan of despair. If she went to him,
she knew she would never be able to resist giving him what he needed, yet making love to him would
only make leaving more difficult for her. She heard a string of curses. Unable to resist his terrible need,
she hurried out of her room.

 Cole's door was closed, but she pushed it open to see him raking his hands through his hair. His body
still shuddered with the aftereffects of his nightmare. As she entered, he swept a gun from under the
pillow, pointing it straight at her heart.

 "Damn, Maia." He pushed the gun out of sight, struggling to slow his heart rate. "I told you it was
dangerous to come downstairs when I'm like this. You think it's any safer in my bedroom?" Cole sat up.
The sheets were tangled around his legs and hips, covering part of him but leaving his thigh bare. He
knew it looked as if he'd fought a battle and lost.

 "I don't care." She crossed the room to his side, pushing the hair from his forehead, her fingertips
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lingering on his face, tracing a path to his mouth. "I don't want you to be alone tonight, Cole." She knelt
on the bed, the light from the snow spilling through the window to bathe her in silver.

 Cole's breath caught in his throat, his lungs burned, and he could only stare as her hands went to the
buttons of the soft flannel shirt covering her body. She slid each one open. Slowly. One by one. He
caught brief glimpses of her body. A soft expanse of skin he ached to touch.

 His fingers curled into two tight fists. "Not like this, Maia. You don't have to come to me feeling sorry for
me because I had a damned nightmare." What the hell was he saying? He wanted her. Ached for her. His
body was so damned hard, he was afraid he might shatter. "I don't want you like this." It was a total lie.
He wanted her any way he could have her.

 Maia flashed her killer smile, the one that sent his body into overdrive and caused him to turn into a
jealous idiot if any other man was within several hundred feet of her. His breath left his lungs in a rush
when she allowed the flannel shirt to slide from her shoulders to trie mattress. The silvery light played
over her body, caressing it lovingly. She looked like a temptress there, kneeling on his bed, her hair
tumbling around her face, her eyes enormous and sexy and looking at him with hunger. Her body's
feminine curves invited his touch.

 "You're killing me."

 She leaned forward, her tongue swirling over his chest. "I hope so."

 The action exposed the enticing curve of her hip and buttocks. His hands trembled as he reached to cup
her bottom, sliding his palms over her smooth skin. She did that to him, made him ache and tremble with
the intensity of his hunger for her. He burned from the inside out, a rush of fire that engulfed his body and
heightened his senses until he was afraid of losing his control.

 Her tongue licking so delicately at his body nearly drove him out of his mind. She pushed the sheets
away from him, exposing him to the cool air, but it only hardened his body more so that he was thick and
bulging with his desire for her. Maia murmured something against his chest, her tongue tracing a path to
his belly. Every muscle in his body contracted. His heart shuddered in anticipation.

 "Maia, what the hell do you think you're doing?" His voice was strangled as his lungs labored for air.

 "Exactly what I want to do," she said, and wrapped her fingers around his erection.

 A groan exploded from his throat. He'd had too many erotic dreams of Maia in his bed, his hands on her
satin skin. "You'd better know this is what you really want," he warned. Because he wanted her more
than he wanted the sun to come up in the morning.

 "I always know what I want." Her breath was warm and moist, and his heart stopped beating for one
moment, then began to slam with alarming force in his chest. She did the same delicate licking that had
driven him wild. Now it was beyond his imagination. He was going to implode if she didn't stop. Just
when he was certain he couldn't take it anymore, her mouth closed over him, tight and hot and moist,
drawing the relentless ache to a fever pitch.

 His hands fisted in her hair, his hips coming off the sheets, thrusting in a rhythmic slide. He swore, the
words tumbling out in an animalistic growl. His control was nearly shattered. His muscles clenched so
tight he thought his jaw would break.
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 Maia lifted her head and smiled at him, satisfaction evident "Are you thinking of me yet? Of my body?
Because I want you to know who's in bed with you."

 "I know damned well who I'm with, Maia." He pushed her backward until she tumbled onto the bed, her
legs sprawled, her body open to him. "I knowexactly who you are. I feel like I've waited a lifetime for
you."

 His hands pressed into her hips, locking her there, pushing her thighs wider apart for him. "Every time I
look at you, I think about what I'd really like to be doing. I want to feel you coming apart for me, Maia."

 Before she could respond, he lowered his head as he brought her hips to him. His tongue slid over her
heated center, teased and tasted before probing deeply. Maia writhed beneath his hungry mouth,
bunching the sheet in her fists, sounds she couldn't prevent escaping, which only fed his voracious need to
show her she belonged with him. He didn't have the words, so he used his body to prove it to her. His
tongue stroked and thrust and cleverly pulsed until she was consumed with wave after wave of orgasm
ripping through her. He sank his fingers deep, and she exploded again, crying out his name.

 Cole lifted his head, kissed his way up her body to the underside of her breasts. The cool air was nearly
Maia's undoing after his hot mouth. She ached, and still the pressure was relentless in spite of her
orgasms.

 "What are you doing?" she demanded.

 "Making sure you know who you're in bed with. I don't want you ever to be satisfied with any other
man." His teeth scraped back and forth on the sensitive flesh. Tiny little bites that drove her insane. "I
want you to belong to me. All of you, Maia, not just your body." His mouth closed over her breast,
tongue flicking her nipple, teeth teasing until she couldn't tell if the pleasure was so great it was painful.

 He rose over her, pushing against her entrance, so that her body, so slick and hot reacted with a slow
giving of way for his penetration. He paused for one slight moment, their mingled breathing the only
sound, and then he thrust hard, driving the full length of him as deep into her as he could go. He
discovered he loved her cries as much as her laugh. He thrust again, over and over, hard and fast, long,
deep strokes, driving her higher and higher until she was clutching at his forearms, crying his name.

 Sensation after sensation rocked her body, heat seared her until she thought she would have to scream
for him to relieve the terrible ache. More. She wanted more. Everything he had, everything he was. She
gave herself up to him, surrendering completely, her hips rising to meet the brutal thrust of his, every bit as
hard, desperate for him to fill up every empty space.

 "Maia, you're so damned tight," Cole's voice was husky, the words torn from his rigid throat. "Hot and
tight and dammit all, you belong to me. Like this, baby, just like this." He plunged into her again and
again, groaning with pleasure as her muscles pulsed and throbbed around him even more. Until her
control was shattered and she burst into fragments, her body convulsing around his, tightening and
squeezing and milking him dry so that he called her name aloud, his voice rough with sensuality.

 Maia stared up into his face. The harsh lines were gone, the horror of his nightmares replaced with
satisfaction. He looked like a well-sated lover, his body relaxed and his piercing blue eyes soft with
contentment.

 Cole propped himself up on his elbows, looking down into her face, still trying to get his breathing under
control. He could feel her body still rippling with aftershocks around his. "You'reso beautiful you takemy
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breath away."

 Her laughter was soft, musical, tightening his body all over again. "That's not what took your breath
away. And you lie so wonderfully. I'm ordinary-looking, but I don't mind if you want to delude yourself."
Her hands slid over his body, traced his sculpted buttocks and hips. She could see a brand burned into
his flesh on the back of his thigh. Her fingertips smoothed over the ridges with a small caress.

 "I probably should sneak back to my room," she added.

 He stiffened. "This is not a one-night stand, Maia. I told you that."

 "You did not. I forget your exact words, but…"

 He caught her hands, stretched them above her head, pinning her wrists to the mattress so he could bend
his head and take possession of her lips. He sank his tongue into the velvet darkness of her mouth, his
tongue tangling with hers, exploring, commanding a response. He bit lightly at her lower lip, her chin,
blazed a path of fire from her throat to breasts.

 For a moment he breathed in the sight of her bathed in the silvery light as it spilled across her breasts.
Her nipples were peaked and hard, already roused. Her soft mounds were rising and falling with every
breath she took, jutting upward toward his mouth. His body stirred to life, deep inside of hers, hardening
impossibly. He bent to the offering, flicking her nipple with his tongue, feeling her response, the way her
hips thrust upward and her body convulsed around his. He drew her breast into his hot mouth, suckling
strongly, his tongue teasing her nipple, teeth scraping gently.

 Maia gasped and moaned, her body tensing, her breasts swelling with the attention. His body began to
move, long slow strokes that left her moaning and lifting her hips in an attempt to control the rhythm. Cole
held her beneath him, pressing kisses between her breasts, nibbling at her chin and lower lip, using his
mouth to bring her to another climax while his body kept a slow, lazy tempo.

 "Cole." It was a protest. A plea.

 He smiled. A genuine smile. He felt it welling up out of nowhere. Cole could make her want him, plead
with him, make her body come apart. She didn't try to hide the way she felt such an urgent need of him,
and that was more of an aphrodisiac than anything else ever could have been.

 "Cole what?" he whispered against her mouth. Her muscles were already suckling at him, so tight and
hot he wasn't certain he could keep the slow, languid pace he was setting. "What do you want, Maia?"
The pleasure kept building and building inside of him, starting somewhere in the region of his toes,
becoming an excruciating pleasure/pain in his groin and belly. There was fire in her tight sheath, her skin
soft and inviting, her breasts thrusting up toward him with her arms stretched out above her head. An
offering to him. Maia gave herself to him completely, and there was so much seduction in that knowledge.

 "Hurry up. Nowyou're killingme ." She lifted her hips again, deliberately tightening her muscles around
him.

 With a groan, Cole gave in, plunging deep and hard, unable to resist the hot furnace of her body. He
couldn't resist kissing her, sucking on her lower lip. How often had he found himself staring, enthralled by
the soft curve of her mouth? His tongue plunged into her mouth with the same urgency his hips drove into
her. It could never be enough with Maia and he knew he never wanted it to be.
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 Stretched out under him as she was, helpless under the pounding force of his body, she still tried to
reach him, to lift herself to meet him. Cole felt her body stretching to accommodate him as with each
thrust he seemed to grow thicker and harder, nearly bursting with the pleasure she brought him. He held
them there, on the edge of a great precipice for what seemed forever, then both went over, climaxing
together, the force of it leaving them shuddering and limp, a fine sheen glossing their bodies.

 Cole groaned softly and rolled his weight off of her when he could, but he kept his hand on her ribs, just
under her breast, wanting to keep her in his room. "Just stay," he ordered softly. "I need you to stay."

 It took Maia longer to catch her breath, to gather her scattered thoughts. "I've never felt that way before,
Cole."

 He turned his head to look at her. "That's a damned good thing, Maia. I'm looking to be number one in
your life. Being a fantastic lover is one of the requirements."

 She laughed, just like he knew she would. "Is it? I had no idea. Well, you definitely passed that test."
She glanced at the door. "I hope I didn't scream. Please tell me I didn't."

 "Unless Jase has a nightmare, he sleeps deeply, and his room is way down at the other end of the floor.
We wanted to give one another a lot of space when we first moved in together."

 "He's a good kid."

 "Yeah, he is. All along I've been so worried that Jase might have killed the old man. I wouldn't have
blamed him for it, but I didn't want him to have done it. I couldn't find a way to prove him innocent and
even in some of our conversations, little things he said made me wonder."

 "How awful for you both," Maia sympathized. She reached for his hand, twining her fingers through his.
"Jase isn't naturally violent, Cole. If he killed his father, he would have done it in self-defense. And to be
honest, I don't think he could have. He was too afraid of him. And it isn't in him to kill anyone."

 "No, it isn't." Cole turned over, his arm sliding around her waist. "But it is in me, isn't?"

 The sadness in his voice shook her. Sadness. Distaste. A note of fear. Maia framed his face with her
hands, shifting so she could rise above him to look directly into his eyes. "You'renothing like that man,
Cole. You're strong and yes, you could be violent if the circumstances called for it, but you're nothing at
all like him."

 "You don't know that, Maia."

 "Yes I do. I saw your face when you touched the mountain lion, when I worked on the horse. I watch
you with Jase, how careful you are. Even when you're trying to get him to play, you protect his falls.
There's nothing in you that is cruel. Your father reveled in being cruel. It isn't in your nature, or in Jase's
nature. You like to be the boss, but you're not out to control everyone. You encourage Jase to speak his
mind and make decisions. That's not wanting control."

 Cole slid his hands up her rib cage, cupped her breasts in his palms and leaned forward to rest his head
against her soft flesh. Maia immediately cradled his head to her. "I read people, just as I read animals,
Cole. I would never have allowed myself to become involved with you and Jase if for one moment I
thought either of you was cruel to humans or animals. I have too much respect for myself."
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 She smiled. "I have a little bit of violence in me as well, and a great deal of self-preservation."

 His arms tightened around her. "I see him in myself sometimes, Maia."

 "He had strength of will, Cole, and he passed that to you. He must have had a way with women, and
you have that attraction as well. Not everything about him was bad. Some of his traits are useful and,
hopefully, both you and Jase have them."

 He lifted his head, his blue eyes moving over her face, studying her features inch by inch. "You're a
damned miracle, you know that?"

 "Of course I do. Temper and all." She laughed, the sound happy and warm, filling the large bedroom.

 Cole felt her laughter all the way to his bones. She had the power to shake him with that simple
lighthearted sound. Her body was soft and warm and welcoming, but she was so much more to him.She
would always be so much more to him . The revelation was no longer a shock. Maia seemed as much
a part of him as breathing. She was the joy that had been missing from his heart. When he woke in
darkness, she brought light to him. She brought out things in him he hadn't known were a part of him.

 How could he tell her these things when they'd only been together so short a time? She wouldn't believe
him. How could she? His arms tightened until she stirred in protest.

 "You're going to break me in half, Cole," Maia said. "What's wrong?"

 He forced himself to let his arms slide away from her, to lie back and lace his fingers behind his head. "I
know you've told me about the images the animals have shown you several times, but would you go over
it again in detail. Everything you can remember."

 "Why?"

 "You ought to be over being uncomfortable about it with me," Cole said. There was a soft growl in his
voice, a deep note that seemed to vibrate right through her skin. "I'm just thinking about all the images the
animals have been conveying to you, and I'm trying to put it together. Maybe the answer to the mystery
of what's going on at this ranch is in those images."

 Maia sat back, her hand on his chest, right over his heart. She knew he hadn't told her what had put the
shadows back in his eyes, but if he wasn't ready to tell her, she wasn't going to force a confidence. "I'm
going to let you get away with that just because I know you're worried about something happening on the
ranch, and I want to be filled in, but I know that's not what you were worried about."

 Maia waited, but Cole didn't respond. "Fine. The owl was very vague. Impressions of dangers,
something flying overhead. Flashes of light. Horses moving. I couldn't get a very good take on it because
the images seemed faded and far away." She shrugged. "I know that sounds dumb."

 "The deer then."

 "Blood on the grass and rocks. Fists hitting flesh. More impressions of danger."

 "Were the images as vague?"

 "Distant. And the wolves were even more so. Something overhead. Blood on the ground. The one I
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treated was injured sometime ago."

 "Someone shot it?"

 "No, I think it was kicked by a horse or trampled. The bone was out of the socket, but I'm not certain
how the injury actually occurred or how long ago. The poor thing had really suffered."

 "All this time I thought my father's death had something to do with his fortune or the ranch or Jase. I
couldn't figure out why he was murdered and how anyone other than my uncle would profit and only if he
was named guardian, which he wouldn't be. Besides, he wouldn't want the responsibility."

 "So if your father wasn't murdered for the inheritance, what was the reason?"

 He shrugged, a small sigh escaping. "I'm not actually certain, but I think your animals were trying to tell
you something. I'm working on a time line. Tell me how preposterous this sounds. I think your cat, the
owl, and the wolves were showing you something that happened a while ago."

 "Maybe. It was vague."

 "Exactly. The memory wasn't fresh."

 Excitement flared. "You're right. When Wally showed me the images of Jase as a boy being beaten, the
memories weren't nearly as vivid as when he showed me how he was driven into the fence. I had a very
difficult time making out the images from the owl and the wolves, but the mountain lion's images were
much clearer."

 "You're certain she was shot the day Wally was injured?"

 "The wound would have been infected if more time had gone by. Yes, it was definitely fresh."

 "Could she have been shot from someone in a helicopter?"

 Maia shook her head. "No, she was above the shooter, at least that's the way the angle of the wound
appeared to me."

 Satisfaction edged his expression. "That's what I thought too. So the event in which the helicopter was
flying overhead could have taken place when my father was still alive."

 "Well, of course there's no way of knowing for certain, but it's a realistic possibility," Maia said. "I'm lost,
Cole. You obviously have an idea where all of this is leading, but I haven't a clue."

 He kissed her, a brief hard kiss, his eyes alive with excitement. "That's because you don't think a like a
criminal."

 "I suppose that's a compliment. You have such a sweet tongue on you."

 He showed her he did, kissing her again and making a thorough job of it.

 Maia caught his shoulders and pushed him back down to the bed. "Talk. Explain."

 "I think my father brought something onto the ranch, most likely something illegal. Some of the ranch
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hands were probably involved. They would have had to be. Most people didn't know it, but the old man
could fly a helicopter. He employed a full-time pilot, but only because he liked to feel superior to
everyone and give orders. He thought flying was a menial task."

 Maia reached for his hand again. Cole didn't seem to realize how agitated he became when he talked
about his father. It wasn't overt, but more a subtle tension rising, building and building until she felt he
might explode with the force of a volcano. "I'm not certain I understand."

 "Suppose he brought in something worth a fortune, and some of the hands were in on it and expected to
get a share. The old man goes out with his pilot and moves it from wherever it was originally stashed."

 "You're thinking of a shipment of drugs."

 "I always think in terms of drugs or weapons. It's my job. But yes, suppose the old man was running
drugs out here. He has a few thousand acres. The ranch backs up to a national forest. Parts of our ranch
are on the border. He could bring in drugs, and no one would be the wiser. Or diamonds. Anything. An
illegal shipment worth a fortune."

 "The horses and packs. The helicopter overhead. Maybe. It's a stretch."

 "Not that big a stretch if you knew him. He would revel in working outside the law. He thought he was
smarter and more cunning than anyone. I could easily see it. And if some of the hands were in on it and
knew he had the shipment and he suddenly announced he was cutting them out, it would be a damned
good reason for someone to kill him."

 "Why would he do that?"

 "Because he could. You would have had to know him. He liked the power of it all. Suppose he went
with his pilot and moved the shipment somewhere the hands wouldn't know about it, and then he killed
the pilot and left him behind with the stash."

 Maia shook her head. "It doesn't make sense."

 "You said someone was killed. I checked, Maia. The pilot went missing a few weeks before the old man
was murdered. He was actually considered a suspect. No one's heard from him. The rumor was, he and
the old man had a falling out, and he quit."

 "So your father killed the pilot, but why?"

 "Because the old man moved his stash, and the pilot knew where, so he had to die. Then he told the
ranch hands he was cutting them out of the deal. He knew they couldn't go to the police, and they
wouldn't want to lose their jobs, so he felt very safe. But one or more of them decided they didn't want to
take orders from him. So they killed him in his office and went out to pick up the stash, only it wasn't
there anymore."

 "Because he'd moved it before he cut them out of the deal."

 "I think that's what's going on, Maia. They didn't care who was named guardian because we didn't know
about the stash. They could look around the ranch for it, and we'd never know."

 "Until you fired them."
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 "That's right. I fired them, and I'd be very suspicious if they began hanging around the ranch. Jase told
me some maps disappeared from the office. I didn't really give it all that much thought, but it makes
sense. They're looking for whatever the old man hid."

 "So they wanted you out of here at least long enough to do a thorough search of the ranch. That's why
the rumors, to get you to take Jase and leave."

 "And that's why the accidents. They knew the storm was coming. Jase was supposed to go into town
with me that day, but he decided he wanted to hang out with Al. So they tried to injure him just enough
so Al would have to drive him into town, and they could poke around. That didn't work, so they drove
Wally into the fence thinking Al would trailer the horse into town. The storm was breaking too fast, and I
opted to bring you home with me."

 "Why push it? Why didn't they just wait?"

 "Maybe they have a buyer, or they're getting anxious. Whatever it is, one of my horses was ridden the
day Wally was hurt. I think while Al and Jase were tied up looking after him, Fred took the horse and
went looking. That's probably when he shot the mountain lion."

 "This is all speculation."

 "Yes," Cole admitted. "But Fred was watching us when we went to get the tree yesterday. And I've got
this gut feeling. I've never been wrong when I've had that feeling before."

 "So why the ice on the walkway?"

 "To get us out of here. If you or Jase or even I were injured, we'd have go into town to the hospital, and
they'd be able to search without interruption."

 "In a blizzard?"

 "Four separate storms, Maia. It wasn't supposed to be this bad. And if we were trapped on the other
side, the road wouldn't be cleared, and we'd have a hard time getting home."

 "So how do you prove it?"

 "I'm working on it." He reached out to cup her breasts again, thumbs caressing her nipples into hard
peaks. "I'll think better in the morning. Right now, I want to spend the rest of the night getting to know
every inch of your body intimately."

 She felt her body respond immediately. "Sounds like a good plan to me."

  

 chapter 12
 "Tomorrow's Christmas Eve, Cole, and I haven't had a nightmare since we ran into Maia in the
restaurant." Jase shoveled scrambled eggs onto his plate and scooped up bacon to go along with it. "If
the doc is a vegetarian, why is she all gung ho to cook us a turkey?"
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 "You'll have to ask her that."

 "Have you had nightmares since we met Maia?"

 Cole nodded. "Yeah. But they don't last long."

 Jase paused in his frantic eating to look up at his brother. "If the tree really bothers you, Cole, I'll help
you take it down. The doc will understand."

 "No, the tree stays up. I can get through the night, Jase. I like the tree."

 "I do too," the boy said, relieved. "I kind of like the whole Christmas thing. The doc makes it feel
different I'm not sure why, but she makes everything so fun."

 "On Christmases past, I always felt an outsider looking in," Cole said.

 Jase bunked and swallowed quickly. "That's it! That's how I always felt Sometimes you're smart, Cole."

 "Thanks, Jase." A trace of humor showed in Cole's eyes.

 "You're welcome." Jase leaned his chin into his palm as he thoughtfully chewed a mouthful of food. "I've
been giving a lot of thought to this, Cole. I think we should keep her. We need to keep the doc."

 Cole's mouth twitched in an odd approximation of a smile. "Keep her? As in lock her up? I don't know
that she'd be too happy with that, Jase."

 Jase flashed an exasperated frown. "Do I have to spell it out for you? You need a wife. You really do.
And I need a mom, and the doc is perfect for us, so ask her to marry you."

 "You've been thinking about this for all of what? Five minutes? What exactly are we offering her, Jase?"

 "Money. We've got lots of money. She likes the house, and she really likes kissing you, so maybe you
should step up that part of it. I think she'll go for it."

 Cole shook his head. "You need to do a little more thinking, Jase. You know we can't just buy her.
Maia isn't like that. And I don't have all that much to offer her, but I'm working on it."

 Jase's face brightened. "You are? I really want her to stay with us, Cole. She makes us feel like we
belong."

 "We do belong. Whether or not I can get her to stay, we're always going to be family."

 "Good morning!" Maia entered the kitchen, her smile wide as she took in the sight of the two brothers
eating breakfast. "You're up before me this morning."

 Cole was not going to allow her to get away with putting distance between them. He'd made it damn
clear last night he was making love to her, not having sex. And this wasn't going to be a one-night stand.
Jase might have had the right idea. He needed to step things up.

 Cole snagged her around the waist and pulled her into his arms, settling his mouth over hers firmly.
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Staking a claim as blatantly as he could. His hand curved around the nape of her neck, held her still while
his teeth tugged at her lower lip and his tongue teased at the seam until she opened for him. Her body
softened, seemed to melt right into his as he kissed her thoroughly. At once he pulled her tight against
him, losing himself in her heat, in the rising tide of intense desire she brought with her.

 Jase cleared his throat. "See? I told you she likes kissing you. Are you two going to be doing that all the
time, because it's okay with me if you are, just not in the kitchen."

 "Yes," Cole said decisively.

 "No," Maia assured at the same time. They exchanged a long look. She laughed and rubbed Cole's jaw.
"You're looking all serious and stubborn this morning, Steele. I was planning on making gingerbread for a
gingerbread house and using the gumdrops in the cupboard for trees. No one can be serious when we
bake for Christmas."

 "Hey! Those aremy gumdrops! I made Cole buy them for me, and I'm not giving them up."

 "We need them for the gingerbread house. It's part of decorating for Christmas," Maia explained
patiently. "We have to use whatever is available and gumdrops work."

 Jase held up his hand. "We're not going toeat the gingerbread?"

 "No, I'm going to make a really cute house and decorate it with frosting and whatever else I can find."

 He shook his head. "She's crazy, Cole. You can't bake bread and not expect us to eat it. You're going
too far, Doc. I can do without the cute house, but the stomach demands food and baked goods."

 "You aren't getting into the spirit of the season, Jase," Maia pointed out.

 "Yeah, and I'm not going to either if you deny me food." He stuffed more toast into his mouth. "And stay
away from my gumdrops."

 "Don't talk with your mouth full."

 Cole poured Maia tea from the teapot he had steeping under a small towel. "Before you start baking
gingerbread for houses, would you mind going out to the stable and checking out the horses. See if any of
them pass on any memories to you."

 Her heart gave a curious flutter. He'd made her tea the exact way she liked it, even adding a small
amount of milk. "What are you planning?" She set the teacup on the counter, a slight frown on her face.

 There was anxiety in her turquoise eyes. Cole caught her hand, holding it against his side. "It's no big
deal if you can't find out any more details," he assured her. "I'm going to shake things up a little regardless
and see what happens. I checked, and we've got a short window of opportunity. The weather should
clear for Christmas Eve."

 "I don't like the sound of that" Maia said. "Opportunity for what? And what are you shaking up?" She
tightened her fingers around his. "You aren't going to do anything crazy, are you?"

 She looked so afraid for him he bent down to brush the top of her head with a kiss. It was an amazing
feeling to have someone worry about him. "I just want you to see if you can give us a little dearer picture,
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that's all."

 "Clearer picture of what?" Jase asked, his eyes bright with curiosity.

 Maia expected Cole to hedge, but he didn't He let go of Maia, to sit across the table from the boy. She
picked up her tea and followed.

 "I'm beginning to think all these accidents, with the horse, with you, Maia and the ice, even the old man's
murder, are all connected. We promised one another we'd be honest. You're not a baby, and I don't
intend to hide anything from you. I may be completely off base, but if I'm not, we have a problem on our
hands."

 Jase went very still. "You think it's Al?"

 Cole drummed his fingers on the tabletop. "I don't know about Al. I hope not. He pulled you away from
the fence that was giving way, and he's done a good job with the crew and given his best to the ranch."

 "He's helped me a lot," Jase said, his voice tight. "No one ever took the time to work with me. I've
learned about the horses and cattle, the hay, even repairing fences. He always answers my questions, and
he never makes me feel stupid."

 "I like the man too, Jase," Cole said. "I honestly don't know one way or the other, but if I'm right about
all this, I don't think he could be in on it. If I'm right, his brother-in-law is the perp, and he tried to get you
and Al off the ranch."

 "I never liked Fred." Jase ducked his head. "I was sometimes afraid it was you, Cole." He confessed it in
a soft rush of words. "I'm sorry. I tried not ever to think it, but I can't seem to trust anyone very much."

 Cole's smile held no humor. "If anyone can understand, Jase, it's definitely me. I was having the same
problem worrying about you. We'll make it through this and whatever else is thrown at us. Together.
Maia's right. We can make our own traditions and become a family right here. We've come a long way
just by taking back the house."

 Jase nodded. "That's true. And it looks great. The doc threw a bunch of pillows on all the furniture in the
living room, and it looks completely different. With the tree and Mom's quilt, I feel like the house is really
ours."

 Maia set her teacup on the table and stood up. "I'm glad you like it, Jase. I'd better get to work if you
want me to check the horses in the stable too. I'll see to Wally first, check the horses, then feed the
mountain lion. I don't want her scent on me when I'm around the horses."

 "I didn't think about that," Jase said.

 "You've always got to remember what you're doing around exotics, Jase. You can never become
complacent. You can't ever turn your back on them. People have no business owning them and trying to
turn them into pets. I've heard of a tiger being kept in an apartment building. It was rescued, but then
what do you do with it? Zoos have little funding, and the rescue sanctuaries are full. It leaves euthanasia
as the only choice. It makes me angry."

 Her gaze met Cole's piercing blue eyes, and she shrugged. "I told you I have a bad temper. Anything to
do with the mistreatment of animals brings out the worst in me. It takes so much to run the rescue
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sanctuaries, and half the time they don't have the funding they need to feed and shelter and provide
veterinarian care for exotics."

 "Why is it so much, Doc?" Jase asked. "You'd think people would pay to see the animals, and that
would provide the money for their care."

 "It would be nice if it were that simple, but it isn't. You need licensed people who know what they're
doing, an enormous area, and all exotics have special needs. You can't return them to the wild like a lot
of people mistakenly want you to do." Maia realized her voice was rising, and she blushed, holding up
her hands in surrender. "I'll stop, it's the only safe thing to do."

 Cole leaned over to brush her mouth with his. "I like you all fired up. I can see we aren't going to have
any hunting on this property anytime soon."

 She looked flustered, indignant, a little wary. Maia pulled away from him, glancing at Jase, who was
grinning. "Is the weather really going to give us a break tomorrow?"

 Immediately the smile left the boy's face. "Not that much of a break, right Cole? Not enough to get into
town."

 Cole's expression shut down completely. His shoulders tightened. He drummed his fingers on the table,
watching Maia closely. "We could probably get you out if you really wanted to leave before Christmas,
Maia. I don't want you to go, and neither does Jase, but if you have somewhere important to go, we'll do
our best to get you there."

 Jase shook his head hard, his lips pressed tightly together. Maia caught the glitter of tears in his eyes as
he turned away from her. The room was suddenly filled with terrible tension.

 "Somehow I can't see the two of you taking care of the mountain lion without me." She tried to keep her
voice teasing to lighten the situation. Her heart was breaking for them both. A man and boy struggling to
be normal when they didn't even know what normal was. She didn't need the pretense from them, and
she didn't want it. Deliberately she poked Jase in the ribs. "You'd get eaten, although if Cole doesn't feed
you every five minutes, the cat might be in danger."

 "It would depend on how hungry I am," Jase said.

 "Are you saying you would eat a cat?" Cole lifted his eyebrow, but inside he could feel the tight knots in
his stomach beginning to loosen. She wasn't going to leave them. He had a reprieve.

 "Ugg, you're a sick, sick man, bro. I wouldn't really."

 Maia stood up, pushing back her chair. "I'm off to work; you both behave while I'm gone."

 "Actually, we're coming with you," Cole said decisively.

 Maia shrugged and picked up her bag. Frankly, she'd feel far better if they did come with her. If Cole
was right, and his father had hidden something on the ranch that people felt was worth killing for, she
didn't want to run into someone looking for it.

 Wally looked much better, and there was no sign of infection. His temperature was normal, and he was
moving around the enclosure much more comfortably. Maia fed him his antibiotics with his grain and hay
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while Jase talked to him at great length.

 "He's a natural with animals," she told Cole, seeing the pride on his face as he watched his brother. "If he
wants to be a veterinarian, he'll be a good one."

 "He's a great kid," Cole agreed, leaning one hand against the wall near her head, effectively caging her
between the wall and his body. "And he's smart, Maia. The old man was a complete bastard, but he had
brains. Jase is serious about hitting the books. He hasn't gone to a regular school, but he's had the best of
tutors. Brett Steele didn't want idiots for sons, and he made certain we were well educated."

 "You don't have to convince me, Cole, I can see Jase is smart." She was fairly certain Cole had no idea
how proud of his brother he sounded.

 "I wanted to thank you, for saying you'll stay through Christmas. He really needs you here." Cole
hesitated a moment. He could hear his own heartbeat. "I do too." Had he really said it aloud? Damn, he
sounded pathetic. He stood there, blocking her way so she couldn't walk away from him, terrified of
losing her when he didn't really have her. When had his feelings changed from wanting to go to bed with
her to needing her in his life? How had she wrapped herself inside of him?

 Maia stroked a hand down his chest. There were shadows in his eyes, a set to his mouth she didn't quite
understand, and she was trained and always alert to read subtleties. More and more he reminded her of
the mountain lion, wary, dangerous, in need but ready to strike out if threatened. "I want to stay," she
admitted softly.

 Desire mingled with relief flared in his eyes. It hit her then. Cole Steele, the invincible, the man always
aloof and uncaring, the man with supreme confidence, had very little where she was concerned. She went
up on her toes and pressed a kiss onto his chin. "I really wanted to stay and not just because of the cat."

 "Or Jase. You're very fond of Jase," he prompted, needing to hear her admission.

 She laughed, her eyes warming into a brilliant blue-green. It was all he could do not to sweep her up into
his arms and carry her off. Who would have thought one person could impact his life this way, make
something he thought he lacked come alive deep inside of him and thrive and grow into such intense
emotions.

 "You're such a baby. I'mvery fond of Jase."

 He waited. When she didn't continue he stepped closer until her soft breasts pushed against his chest
and his hips aligned perfectly with her, pressing against her body. "That's not very nice."

 There was a growl to his voice, a sensuality that sent fire zinging through her veins. It was impossible to
resist him and she didn't even try. She moved her hips suggestively, a slight feminine enticement, her body
soft and welcoming. "I wanted to stay to be with you."

 "Was that so hard?" He lowered his lips to hers mostly because he had to, because if he didn't he might
really lose his mind and carry her off. The shape of her mouth was incredibly sexy, especially when she
flashed her dynamite smile. He was drowning in lust, but more terrifying than that, he could feel love and
it was overwhelming. So much so that he dared not examine the emotion too closely.

 Maia's arms encircled his neck, her fingers tangling in his hair. "You know it was," she murmured into his
hot mouth. She loved kissing him. Loved touching him. She had no idea where it would lead, if anywhere.
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Her job kept her traveling constantly and Cole Steele wasn't exactly the settling-down type. She had left
herself open for a tremendous amount of pain, and worse, she'd known it before she'd ever gone to his
bedroom. It had been her choice. She'd made it willingly, hoping she would think her time with him had
been worth it when she had to go.

 For a moment she leaned against him, into him, wanting to cling to his strength. All the while he was
kissing her, making it impossible to think straight. And she didn't really want to, she wanted the fire
flashing through her veins and over her skin. And she wanted the warmth in her heart, filling her until she
ached with it.

 Jase banged Wally's stall gate closed with a little extra force to remind them he was still in the barn. Maia
glanced at him to find him grinning from ear to ear. He shook his head at her.

 "I know. He's just irresistible, but we won't mention it because he's already so arrogant we can't take it."

 "Speak for yourself, Doc," Jase protested. "He doesn't do a thing for me."

 "Come on, you two," Cole said. "I'm letting you clean out the stalls while I feed the horses just for that,
Jase," he added.

 Jase put his hand on his back and began groaning loudly as he followed them along the covered
walkway to the stable.

 Cole and Jase fed and watered the horses while Maia wandered around the stable, taking her time,
trying to get a feel of the place. It was a beautiful structure, well lit and functional. The horse stalls were
roomy, and each led to the wide ring in the center of the building where the horses could be exercised
and worked in any kind of weather. Like everything else, the builders had spared no expense, and the
setup was as good as it could get.

 Maia leaned against the gate of a stall and talked softly to the occupant, waiting for the horse to come to
her. She loved horses, loved the way they moved and the way they pressed their velvet noses into her
palm when she murmured to them. They were always responsive. Most of the horses had memories of
packing bundles along a mountain pathway to one of the larger buildings on the ranch. Two had
memories of a young boy being beaten. The horse in the corner stall had vivid memories of being ridden
hard, quartering the ground back and forth up in a mountainous area. A shudder ran through the horse
when it recalled the sight of a mountain lion perched on a branch a distance away, the rifle burst, and the
cat leaping to the ground and disappearing into heavy foliage.

 "Are you picking up anything?" Cole asked curiously.

 Maia nodded. "But I'm not certain what you're looking for."

 "Landmarks, something I can use to identify the area they were in, rock formations, the type of trees, a
mountainous area versus a valley or a meadow. We have a couple of thousand acres, and if we include
the state and federal lands, we're looking for a needle in a haystack."

 "I'll try again, but I can't direct them. I'm sort of a receiver." She felt she was failing him. The information
was obviously important.

 Cole's hand curled around the nape of her neck, his thumb sliding along her jaw. "Whatever you give me
is more than I had to start with."
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 "Give me a little more time with this one." She indicated the horse in the corner stall.

 Cole watched as she brushed the animal and spoke softly to it, spending another fifteen minutes lavishing
attention on it. He waited to ask her about the images until after she had fed the mountain lion and
checked it over thoroughly. She was mostly worried about infection. The cat stared at Cole and Jase the
entire time, and they kept a good distance away at Maia's insistence, but behind her back, Cole had a
weapon out and ready if the animal made one wrong move toward Maia.

 "I'm telling her," Jase whispered, a grin on his face.

 Cole shrugged. "She can learn to live with it," he said, his jaw set in a stubborn line. "Someone has to
look out for her."

 Maia stroked a hand through the cat's fur before leaving it to rest, backing out of the shed. "The two of
you look as if you're up to some deep dark conspiracy." The truth was, the lines etched so deep in Cole's
face were softening, and every once in a while a faint smile would appear. There were times he actually
appeared at peace. Even Jase seemed more relaxed and laughed often.

 Her heart gave a funny little lurch. She felt a part of them, as if they were all connected in some strange
way. As if she belonged. Maia had to look away, tears burning in her eyes. It was ridiculous to be so
involved so fast. She could only put it down to the intensity of the Steele brothers' needs. The thought of
leaving them was breaking her heart, so she just couldn't think about it. She would have Christmas with
them, and that would have to be enough.

 "Whatever you're thinking about, stop," Cole instructed, his arm curving around her waist to draw her
beneath his shoulder. "You looked so sad." He put his other arm around Jase's shoulders, pulling him
closer as well. "I want you to help Maia inside with her baking. I'm expecting you to look after her, Jase."

 Maia glanced up at his face quickly. He was moving them both back toward the house at a brisk pace.
A small spurt of fear burst through her. "What are you going to be doing?"

 "Just looking around a little more. I need for you to tell me if you have any other details for me." He
reached past her to open the door to the mudroom.

 Maia waited until they were back in the kitchen and she had control of her frantically beating heart. He
wasn't going to go looking around a little; he was going to bait a trap for a killer. She feared he was the
bait.

 "You're shaking your head." His tone was very gentle. "Does that mean you don't have anything for me?"

 "No, it means I don't want you to do this. Go to the police."

 "I am the police."

 Maia sank into a chair. "I know, but you don't have anyone to help you."

 "Maia, I would never go into a situation without backup. I'm good at what I do. I trusted you with the
mountain lion and the wolves. You'll have to trust me with this."

 She flashed him a faint smile. "Should I stand out in the yard with a gun?"
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 "No, you can stay in here and have faith that I'm really not a nice guy at all." He sat down across from
her. "What did you see that could help me?" He glanced at his brother, who was leaning against the
counter, his face pale. "I'll need you to listen to her, Jase, and help me figure this out."

 The boy took a deep breath and nodded, dropping into the chair next to Maia.

 Beneath the table, Maia slipped her hand into the teenager's. "I didn't get much that made sense to me,
but I can describe the area fairly well. It's definitely up in the mountains, where there are lots of trees.
There are huge rocks and a formation that looks as if it's a fortress. I had the impression of a series of
caves."

 "Yeah, I've been there," Jase said. "I went one time when the old man was gone on a business trip. I
snuck away from the men watching me and got lost. I found a trail off of the streambed, just past where
the waterfall is. I followed it because the trail was a little wider than a deer trail and my horse had almost
automatically turned on it, as if he'd been there before. I was pretty certain I could find my way back,
and eventually I did."

 "I remember those old caves. You didn't go into them, did you?"

 "No, I was only about nine at the time and pretty scared of all the stories the hands told about bears and
mountain lions."

 "Which are true," Cole pointed out. He stood up and pushed back his chair. "I'm going to take the
snowmobile out while the weather is holding." He glanced at his watch. "I've got about an hour and a half
before the next storm breaks."

 "I don't like you going out alone," Maia objected, shaking her head adamantly. "Let's just call the police
and let them investigate."

 "I agree, Cole," Jase said, trying to sound adult and firm. "I don't want anything to happen to you."

 "I'm just going to take a look around," Cole said. "Nothing's going to happen to me. You both have to
remember, the old man owned this town. The police, the school officials, even the counselors were afraid
of him. They needed his money, and he had too much political clout to fight him. I don't know who at the
police department I can trust. And if he was smuggling something, especially drugs, he's been doing it for
years and getting away with it. That means corruption somewhere."

 Maia put her arm around Jase. "An hour and a half, Cole. Give me a number to call, someone you trust,
if you don't come back."

 He studied her face, set in a determined expression, for a moment before scribbling a number on a tablet
beside the phone. "Give me two hours, Maia. I'll be back, I promise."

 "You'd better be," she answered.

  

 chapter 13
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 The snow had been falling for hours. Maia stared out at the white, silent world. It had seemed so
beautiful, a sparkling crystal world, and now it appeared hostile and suffocating. The world outside her
window was so white; even though it was nighttime, it appeared light. Through the swirl of flakes she
could see the trees and shrubbery encased in ice. Long icicles hung from the overhang of the walkways
and decorated the outbuildings. The corrals had layers of snow topping each rail. There was no
movement, the world was silent and still as if locked in a frozen time frame.

 Cole had come back from his snowmobile ride on time, but his entire demeanor had changed. He hadn't
discussed anything with either Jase or her. He'd glanced at their baking project, an elaborate gingerbread
house, nodded without really listening to them, and disappeared into an office to spend the rest of the
evening on the phone. He was distant and almost frightening, his features expressionless, his eyes hard.
He seemed so remote from her, almost as if he were a different person.

 "Maia?"

 She whirled around, her heart pounding, her hand going protectively to her throat. There'd been no
sound to give him away, but Cole stood in the middle of her bedroom wearing only a soft pair of jeans.
His face was in the shadows, and he looked intimidating, a man possessing raw power, filling the room
with his muscular build and the force of his personality.

 "You aren't afraid of me, are you?"

 Maia took a deep breath and let it out slowly. She knew wild animals, had been around them in various
environments, and she was well aware that Cole's instincts were those of a trapped animal. She could
almost smell the danger emanating from him.

 "You've put on your DEA persona, the one you use to stay alive," she stated, her gaze meeting his
steadily. "Poor Jase was frightened, and, yes, so was I. You become a different person, one neither of us
is familiar with."

 "Dammit, Maia."

 She sent him a feint smile. "If it keeps you alive, Cole, it's all right with both of us. Whatever it takes to
do your job, just do it and don't worry about us being a little uncomfortable with it Jase told me you were
this way when he first met you. I don't blame him for being intimidated."

 "What do I do?"

 "You put distance between yourself and everyone else, and you shut down your emotions."

 "I work undercover, Maia. I can't be showing my emotions to the world, and if I discuss anything with
anyone, someone might overhear me or be an enemy. That's the world I live in."

 "It's the world you'vealways lived in. As an adult, you simply went out and found the environment most
comfortable for you, the one you were familiar with, where you knew all the rules."

 He pushed a hand through his hair, his only sign of agitation. "Am I going to lose you because you finally
figured out who I really am?"

 She smiled, her lips curving into a soft, amused smile that lit up her face. "I've always known who you
are, Cole. I knew there was this side of you. It comes out at unexpected times, and it's disconcerting and
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intimidating, but it isn't anything I can't handle." She shrugged. "You don't know me very well. Most
things don't throw me all that easily. I was raised to be my own person, to think for myself and follow my
instincts. I can be afraidfor you and not be afraidof you."

 "Come here to me."

 "You need to talk to Jase. He's too young to understand why you need to withdraw from him." She
crossed the distance because she couldn't resist the dark sensuality of his voice. There was something in
him she couldn't help but respond to, and tonight he wore that dark intensity she found so compelling.

 "I will, Maia," he promised, drawing her into his arms. "I didn't like not having you in my bed."

 "I've only been in your bed once, Cole," she pointed out.

 "You were there all night. I've never wanted anyone in bed with me all night. I can't sleep because I'm
always on edge and feel I have to be alert just in case. I didn't feel that way with you. I wrapped my arms
around you and fell asleep. It felt right."

 "You didn't do much sleeping."

 His hand cupped her face, his thumb sliding over her soft skin. "I'm planning on not sleeping much tonight
either."

 "Oh really?" She slid her arms around his neck and pressed her body against his. "That's a good thing.
Are you going to tell me what you're up to with the snowmobile and phone calls?"

 "Later. I'll tell you later." His teeth tugged gently at her ear. "Much later." He slid his hands under the hem
of the soft flannel shirt she wore to find bare skin. His hands cupped her bottom, and lifted her to bring
her more in line with his own body, holding her there for a moment, savoring the way she fit against him.
Her soft body stilled the pounding in his head and tamed the roaring of his nightmares, the terrible
memories he could never quite push into oblivion.

 Her hands skimmed over his chest, her lips sliding over his neck, his jaw, her teeth nibbling on his lip until
he was kissing her, losing himself in her heat. He drank her in, devoured her, needing to be closer to her
to keep the demons at bay. "I have too many clothes on," he whispered into her hot mouth.

 "Yes you do," she agreed, her hands dropping to the waistband of his jeans.

 He felt the brush of her knuckles against his belly, over his hard arousal. Every thought went out of his
head but his need to feel her body surrounding his. Heat and flame danced over his skin and invaded his
veins, spread through his muscles. Whatever roaring beasts had threatened to consume him with rage and
hatred fell quiet under the caress of her stroking fingers, under the assault of her hot mouth gliding over
his chest. He was harder than he'd ever been in his life, more in need, his mind crowded with erotic
images, with hunger and need that left no room for nightmares.

 His hands slid over the curves of her hips, along her thighs, his fingers dipping into the moist heat of her
body. He loved the way she responded to him, the way she gave herself so generously to him. She made
it clear she wanted to touch him, needed to feel and taste him with the same urgency he felt for her. He
slid the flannel shirt from her body and dropped it onto the floor before catching her up in his arms and
carrying her to the bed.
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 "I'm not going to let you go, Maia," he warned, wanting to be honest, hating to be so damned vulnerable.
"I can't let you just walk away from me."

 Her fingers skimmed his face, caressed his shoulders, and moved down his back. "Who said anything
about going anywhere, Cole? A little action would be appreciated."

 "You want action?" His eyebrow shot up, his face darkly sensual.

 Maia arched up to press her aching breasts against his chest, to rub the tips of her nipples across his skin
while her teeth nipped at his chin. "I'm on fire here."

 He felt it then, a wild rush of excitement coursing hotly through his body. She tightened every muscle,
brought every nerve ending alive. He wanted to pound into her, drive so deep she could never get him
out.Brand her . At once he stiffened. Pulled away from her, sitting up on the bed and wiping his face.

 Maia sat up, her arms sliding around his waist "What is it?"

 He shook his head. "You shouldn't be here with me. The things I think about are wrong. There's too
much violence in me. I don't want you to get hurt, Maia, not you."

 "Do I look fragile to you? I want you just the way you are, Cole. I know what you are and who you are.
You just have to figure out I'm quite capable of handling anything you can throw my way. You think
you're rough with me, but you're not. You're strong, and the way your body is so frantic for mine only
makes me want you more."

 "Do you think I don't see the bruises on your skin from my gripping you too tight? Dammit, Maia, I
thought I could find some way to be normal with you."

 She laughed. "That's just silly. I have bruises every day from the work I do. I'd rather you put them there
when you're giving me so much pleasure you're driving me out of my mind."

 He should have known she would laugh. He turned his head and met her eyes. Desire, hot and intense
and filled with some emotion he shied away from trying to identify. He couldn't stop himself from having
her, not when she was so hungry for him. Cole spread her across the bed, coming down on top of her,
his hands sliding over silken skin as his mouth settled over hers.

 Her thighs tightened and she shifted her hips, aligning her body more perfectly to rub against him in
temptation, a siren's call. His palm stroked over her breast, captured it to roll her nipple between his
thumb and finger. Her breath caught in her throat, and she arched back, open to him, wanting him. His
mouth left hers at the invitation, and he kissed his way over the creamy mound to settle there, fingers
stroking and massaging while she cried out, unable to prevent the sound of pleasure from escaping.

 "I need you, Maia," he whispered softly.

 Maia trembled, shuddering with arousal, lifting herself almost desperately into his mouth. "I need you
too." Her hands skimmed over his back, caught at his hips to guide him into her.

 His knee nudged her thighs wider apart so that he could easily settle there, pushing into her slowly,
penetrating with a deep, long stroke that pushed through velvet-soft petals, forcing her tight muscles to
open for him. Immediately he was bathed in tight, hot-silken heat. The breath left his body in a rush, and
fire streaked from his toes to the top of his head. She did that. Maia. She did things with her body he still
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couldn't comprehend.

 His hands pinned her hips, holding her firmly, giving him the ability to set the pace and control the ride.
He needed that, needed to allow his own driving violence towell up slowly, to mingle with the passion
and emotion he felt for her. He began to move harder, deeper, until he was plunging into her over and
over as her breathless cries urged him on. Her fingers biting into his buttocks nearly drove him wild. He
held on to his sanity as long as he could, pushing her higher and higher, holding off her release until she
was writhing beneath him, every bit as desperate as he felt.

 When it came, their release was shattering, her body gripping his so tight he thought he'd explode as they
came together. They stared into one another's eyes for a long time, then he was kissing her over and
over, greedy for the taste of her, needing her sweetness, afraid of saying or not saying the right words to
her.

 He held her to him, his hand stroking through her hair, aching to say something, anything to make her feel
what he was feeling. "Maia?" His heart pounded in a kind of terror. His mouth went dry.

 She turned her head and smiled at him. "I'm here."

 Her smile always affected him. He dreamt of her smile now. Just as he dreamt of her body open and soft
for him, a haven, a refuge he never wanted to give up.

 He tried to say the words women needed. He wanted to tell her to stay forever. What did he have to
offer her? He was consumed with rage at times. At those times he needed the rush of working
undercover. He was driven to find and arrest men who thought themselves above the law, more clever
and superior to all others. There were parts of him he was afraid of. A violence he sometimes dealt with
by beating a boxing bag for hours, or racing a horse over a mountain trail. So many things he held in little
compartments in his mind, deep where no one saw.

 Until Maia. She looked through the emptiness in his eyes, somewhere beyond the shadows, and she
seemed just to accept him. It was terrifying to think he could be wrong. And if he asked her and she
turned away from him, he'd be lost.

 Cole sighed. "I found the old man's stash," he confessed. He turned on his side, rising above her to prop
himself up on his elbow. He could hear the regret in his voice and knew she would think it was because
of his father. "I didn't want to know anything more about him. And I didn't want to have to tell Jase."

 "Jase has you now, Cole," Maia said, placing her palm over his heart to comfort him. If anyone needed
comfort it was Cole. He just didn't recognize it.

 "It wasn't all that hard to find it. When I was a kid I used to go up to that large rock formation, and there
was a series of caves. One of them was very small, but when you accessed it, if you crawled to the back,
there was a larger chamber. I couldn't find it and I knew immediately the old man had covered it up. I
knew approximately where it was, so it didn't take long."

 "It was a shipment of drugs?"

 "A large shipment. The remains of the pilot were propped up in the back against the wall of the cave like
some macabre pirate skeleton left to guard the bundles. I should have known having oil wells, natural gas
reserves, and a thriving cattle business wouldn't be enough for the old man. He needed to feel superior.
He needed the rush of pitting his brains against law enforcement."
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 "Maybe you did know what he was doing, or suspected on some level as a child, Cole. You became a
DEA agent. Subconsciously you may have been trying to find a way to separate and define yourself."

 He bent his head to kiss her. "You say the nicest things, Maia. I don't know how you always think of the
exactly the right thing to say to make me feel better when I'm feeling low, but you manage it."

 She nibbled her way across his jaw to tease at his mouth with her teeth. "I say what I think, which isn't
always a good thing, Cole."

 "I have to go, honey. I checked with the weather service, and I've only got a few hours to pull this off.
Follow me down to the kitchen. I want to show you how to set the alarm." He brushed backed her hair,
kissing her again and again as if he might not stop, then pulled abruptly away.

 Maia followed him to his room and sat on his bed. She sat up, watched him dress, clutching the sheet to
her as if that might protect her from the sudden fear she was trying to suppress. He was dragging
weapons out of every conceivable hiding place and shoving them into holsters, taping them to his back
until she could only stare in horror.

 He tossed her his own flannel shirt wishing he could stick around and enjoy her in it. "Come on, Maia. I
have to go now." He couldn't look at her much longer and not feel the choking fear of losing her. Facing
gunfire and possible death was nothing compared to the terror of being so vulnerable to another human
being.

 Maia followed him down the stairs, buttoning buttons as she went, trying to look casual and calm,
wondering if Cole had felt the same way when she had attended the mountain lion. She listened dutifully
to all his instructions, but when he turned away from her she caught his hand and tugged him back,
reluctant to let him go.

 "You're coming back."

 "Of course." Cole kissed Maia hard. "Turn on the security alarm the moment I leave. All the doors and
windows will lock automatically. You know where the safety rooms are. One upstairs and one down.
Use them if you have to."

 She clutched his fingers, holding him to her. "Don't do anything stupid."

 "I'm never stupid, Maia, and I never forget details. Take care of Jase. There's paperwork in the top
desk drawer in case of emergencies. My boss has copies. I faxed them to him last night."

 "Don't tell me that. Tell me you're going to come back to me all in one piece."

 Cole leaned down to kiss her again. "Stay out of trouble and keep Jase occupied. I don't want either
one of you to get any ideas about being a hero. When I'm out there, I'm going to treat everyone as the
enemy. I can't be worried that you or Jase will get it in your heads to try to help. I might end up shooting
one of you."

 "I'm not stupid, Cole," Maia assured him. "I'll take care of Jase, but he's not going to like that you snuck
out so early."

 "He'd want to come, and I don't have a lot of time to spend arguing with him," he glanced at his watch.
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"The weather will be closing in faster than anticipated. I have maybe three or four hours at the most, then
the storm will break again."

 "You mean you don't have a lot of time to spend reassuring him," Maia corrected. She let him go
because she had no choice. Cole Steele couldn't be anything other than who he was, any more than she
could be. "Then I'll see you in three or four hours."

 He slipped out the kitchen door into the mudroom to pull on the clothes he'd prepared and slung his
pack and rifle over his shoulder before going outside. He wanted to be seen, but look like he was being
cautious, wary of anyone who might be watching. He was a man with something to hide. The minute he
set foot outside of the mudroom, he became that person, walking with deliberate stealthy intent, casting
glances back toward the house as if someone might catch him leaving. He moved in stops and starts,
hurrying across open space, stopping in the shadows and behind buildings and trees to look around. It
wasn't until he was by the garage housing the snowmobiles that he was certain he was being watched.

 The air was cold and dry, the wind coming at him in gusts. He pulled his knitted cap over his face to
keep from being burned or frostbitten as he burst out of the garage, the snowmobile swaying wildly, then
catching traction to skim over the snow. Maia was right, he realized, as he flew over the snow toward the
trail leading into the higher mountains. He should have talked to Jase. If something did happen, this could
look bad. He was deliberately setting it up to make others think he was taking the drugs for himself and
selling the shipment to the highest bidder.

 He shook his head, a frown on his face. That was straight from Maia's mind to his. She was even making
him think like her. He had never thought to let anyone into his life to such an extent, but there was no
keeping Maia out. She had managed to twist herself deep inside of him until he didn't want her out. She
brought him alive in a way he'd never been before.

 Cole scanned the surrounding areas, openly using binoculars, wanting those watching him to be aware he
was leery. He was a man doing something illegal, and he knew it. He felt an itch between his shoulder
blades and sent up a silent prayer it wasn't the scope of a rifle trained on him. He was counting on the
fact that Fred and his people had murdered Brett Steelebefore they realized he'd moved the shipment,
and they wanted Cole to lead them to it. He'd never had so much to lose before, and the thought of the
danger didn't give him quite the same rush it always had.

 He glanced at the sky before setting off again. The clouds were heavy and dark, but the weather was
holding. He could have moved the stuff closer to the house, but it might have endangered Maia and Jase.
This way, if anyone wanted to take the shipment from him, they had to follow him away from the ranch
house, but with the weather so dicey, it was touch-and-go whether he was going to pull the entire thing
off and make it back before the next storm hit.

 He was able to maneuver the snowmobile up the trail through the rock formation because the snow was
so deep. It enabled him to move the sled he was dragging into position at the front of the cave before
rolling back the rocks blocking the entrance. He had to use a pry bar as leverage to remove the boulders
before crawling inside. This was the most dangerous part. While loading the snowmobile, he would be
vulnerable. He was inside the cave and would have to crawl in places to drag out the bundles to stack
onto the snowmobile. He wouldn't be able to see or hear an approaching enemy.

 Cole worked steadily, sweating as he did so, aware of the least little noise, every moment feeling as
though it might be his last. They didn't need him to bring out the shipment, only to lead them to it. He tried
to keep his exposure down, keeping as much of the bare foliage between him and open spaces when he
came out of the cave to add to the burden on the sled.
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 When they came, they came like wolves, slinking out of the forest to surround him, guns drawn, Fred
leading the pack. He grinned at Cole. "Like father, like son. But I'm afraid that's my dope you're trying to
steal."

 "It belongs to you?" Cole asked, straightening slowly as he tied off the last bundle. "I don't think so. I
don't see your name on it anywhere."

 Fred held up his gun. "This is my claim, Steele. Keep your hands where I can see them."

 "How'd you know about it?" Cole said, sounding disgusted.

 "I helped bring it in before your old man got greedy and moved it. We did it all the time. I have the
connections, Steele, you don't. I've got everything in place; you'd just lose it all. You should thank me."
He laughed and cocked his gun, pointing it straight at Cole's heart. "You can go join your daddy in hell."

 "Hold it, Fred!" The voice came from above them. Al lay stretched out in the snow, the rifle trained on
his brother-in-law. "I'm not going to let you kill him, Fred. I don't know what this is all about; but I saw
you watching him, sneaking after him, and you're not going to kill him."

 "What are you going to do, Al?" Fred snarled. "Choose your almighty boss over your own family? Has
he promised you a share if you side with him?"

 Cole looked anxiously toward Al. He knew a couple of Fred's buddies were circling around trying to get
position on him. The last thing he wanted was his foreman to get killed. "What are you planning, Fred?
We can make a deal."

 "I had a deal with your old man. He double-crossed us. He sat there in his stinking office surrounded by
enough money for a hundred men, but he was so damned greedy. He laughed at me, laughed at all of us.
He dared us to go to the police."

 "So you put a bullet in his brain."

 "You should have seen his face when I pulled the trigger. He was good at killing, but he didn't want to
die. I should know, I did enough of it for him."

 "But you did it too soon, didn't you, Fred? You didn't know he'd moved the shipment."

 Fred shrugged, glanced up toward Al, obviously waiting for his men to pick off his brother-in-law. He
scowled, angry they were taking so long and Al still had the rifle rock steady on him. "I thought I'd have
time to find it, but you fired us all."

 Cole smiled at him. "Smart of me, wasn't it? How long were you killing and running drugs for the old
man? You the one who killed Jase's mother?"

 "She kept trying to take the kid. He wasn't going to let her do that. She should have known better."

 "So you arranged the accident? How'd you manage all this time to get away with it?" Cole made a small
movement toward the snowmobile.

 Fred brought his gun up. "Don't be stupid, Steele."
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 "Don't you be stupid, Fred," Al said.

 "I've been getting away with things a long time. You just need a few key people in your pocket," Fred
bragged. "Put the rifle down, Al, or my sister is going to be a widow. Do it now."

 "You're under arrest. All of you. Put your guns down " Cole said. "Right now you're surrounded by
federal marksmen with rifles trained on every one of you. Drop your weapons now." Cole sent Fred a
grim smile. "I'm with drug enforcement."

 "What the hell are you talking about?" Fred whipped his head around wildly looking for his crew. He
caught a glimpse of several of his men down on the ground, others clothed in all white standing over them
and holding rifles to the backs of their necks. "You've been in jail. What are you, a snitch?"

 Cole walked across the scant feet of snow separating them and removed the gun from Fred's hand.
"You bought a cover story, Fred." He pushed the man toward one of the officers. Flakes of snow were
already drifting from the skies.

 Al stood up slowly, rifle at his side. "This is going to kill my wife. I'm sorry, Mr. Steele. I had no idea
what he was up to."

 "He wanted you to think I drove that horse into the fence. It was to get you and Jase off the ranch so he
could search it."

 "I figured that out. He was watching you all the time. I didn't ever consider drugs might be a part of it. I
just thought he was mad over losing his job."

 "Thanks for coming after me."

  

 Jase sat white-faced at the table as Cole told him about the drug shipment, the murder of the pilot and
the boy's mother. The teenager went very still, tension and anger radiating from him. Abruptly he rose
and without a word, ran out of the kitchen into the mudroom. They could hear him stamping into his
boots.

 Cole sighed and stood up. "I'd better follow him."

 He looked tired and strained. Maia went to him, put her arms around him. "At least you both know what
really happened to Brett. You don't have to wonder about it anymore. And neither of you has to worry
about the other's having been involved in that violent act."

 His hand slipped over her silky hair, but Cole didn't answer. There was no way to tell her how deep
rage could go. How it could consume one and eat away every good thing until there was only nightmares
and demons left in the world. Jase had to fight it the same way he did.

 Maia watched him go before sinking down into the chair Jase had vacated, hands over her face,
weeping for both of them. She cried for a long while, and, when they didn't return, she washed her face
and went after them. It was instinct more than anything else that led her in the right direction. Before she
reached the barn she could hear the rhythmic pounding of flesh against something solid.
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 "Jase!" Maia stopped in the doorway of the barn staring at him with horror. "What are you doing to
yourself?"

 Jase slammed his bloodied hands into the heavy bag repeatedly. "I hate him. He's taken everything from
me.Everything !"

 "Jase." There was a wealth of warning in Cole's voice.

 Maia glanced at Cole, saw the misery and despair in his eyes as he crouched against the wall, watching
his little brother rage at things neither of them could control.

 "Stop it right this minute!" She used her most authoritative voice. It startled both men so that Jase
dropped his arms to his sides and stood breathing heavily, small droplets of blood trickling down his
knuckles to the floor. She moved into the barn, marched straight over to Jase, and took his hands in hers
to prevent further action.

 "He took your mother, and he took your childhood, Jase. You have a right to be angry about that," she
said, turning his bloodied, swollen hands over to examine them much more closely. "But doing this to
yourself is just plain stupid."

 "Yeah, well you don't have a father who murdered and ran drugs and abused animals and every other
thing he could get his hands on," Jase snapped, snatching his hands away. "He didn't beat you and brand
you and humiliate you, and he didn't kill your mother."

 Cole stood up, a flow of strength and power, instantly protective of Maia.

 She didn't look at him as she stepped closer to them. "Jase," she kept her voice low and even. "You
persist in thinking Brett Steele was normal. He was ill. I don't know if something made him that way, or
whether he just deteriorated into his sickness. Power can corrupt. He was a genius. You both know that,
and you inherited his brains and his strengths. He wasn't all bad. There were good traits in him. He can
only destroy your life if you let him."

 "What if I'm like him? I could be like him," Jase said.

 Of course he would have the same fears as Cole. She glanced at the older man, and he immediately put
his hand on Jase's shoulder.

 "I thought the same thing, Jase," Cole admitted. "About me, about you. Hell, we share the same genetics.
But you're nothing like him, even less so than I am. Look how good you are with animals. And you hit the
books instead of turning out to be the resident bad boy. I'd put your sanity and your character ahead of
those of anyone I know."

 "What he did is no reflection whatsoever on you as a human being, Jase. You have your own life and
your own responsibility to live your life in the best way that you can. Of course your childhood will
impact your adult life, but you're aware of it and can take steps to counter any demons that arise. You're
strong and you're smart and you can handle anything that comes your way."

 Jase shook his head, tears glittering in his eyes, spilling over to run down his cheeks. His chest heaved,
and his shoulders shook. "I don't think I can ever be okay again, Maia."

 She garnered him into her arms, pressing his face into her shoulder while she held him. The teenager
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sobbed as if his heart was breaking. She looked desperately up at Cole.

 Cole swept his arms around both of them. "We're going to make it, Jase," he reassured, rubbing the
boy's neck, crowding dose so Jase would feel his determination and strength. "We're going to be all right
together."

  

 chapter 14
 "It's midnight, officially Christmas," Maia announced. She rubbed the top of Jase's head as she set a tall
glass of cider on the coffee table in front of him. "Merry Christmas."

 Jase was much calmer, sitting in the living room and staring at the tall tree. His mother's ornaments
adorned the tree, and he stared at the alligator. Maia twisted the tail and watched the jaws open and
close around a strand of popcorn. She was rewarded with a faint smile from Jase.

 "When do we get to open gifts?" he asked. His voice was gruff, husky with leftover tears, but he had his
emotions back under control.

 "Usually Christmas morning," Maia answered, curling up on the couch beside Cole. "Although some
people open them on Christmas Eve." She leaned over to check the ice packs she'd placed on his hands.
"Keep those there. It's a wonder you didn't break all your bones."

 "I can't exactly drink my cider if I've got this stuff wrapped around my hands," Jase pointed out. There
was a flash of a smile in the look he exchanged with Cole.

 "Then you can just stare at the cider," Maia said, "but you keep your hands in those wraps. You're lucky
I didn't chase you around the house with a needle to give you a tetanus shot at the very least."

 "You did," Jase reminded her. "Cole had to save me. You threatened to numb my knuckles too or
something equally scary." He looked at his older brother. "Do you do that a lot? Go undercover and have
guns pointed at you?"

 "Yes." Cole refused to lie or gloss over his job to Jase.

 "Have you ever been shot?"

 "Twice, and I was stabbed a couple of times. Just like when Maia works with the animals, she has to
watch herself, never forget even for a moment what she's doing; my job is the same. I can never get
careless."

 "How did you get all those agents here?"

 "It wasn't easy. I couldn't go to the local police because I didn't know who was dirty or who could be
trusted. I called my boss, and we set the trap fast."

 "You took a big risk," Maia said. Cole had been away from them for the four hours he'd indicated he
would be, and the agents had spent several more hours trying to get the prisoners and the shipment of
drugs off the ranch. The storm had moved in slowly, and with Al and Cole working together, they'd
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finally managed to get everyone out safely. Maia had spent hours wanting to be alone with Cole, needing
to touch him, to reassure herself that he was unharmed, but then Jase had broken down completely, and
they had spent the remainder of the time consoling him.

 "The weather was closing in, and it worried me that Fred was getting anxious. I didn't want either of you
caught in the middle. And remember, I didn't know whose side Al was on. I'm glad it was ours."

 "Are you going to go away, Cole?" Jase finally voiced the question that was preying on his mind.

 For the first time, Cole hesitated. Maia and Jase regarded him with wide, fearful eyes. Cole leaned over
the table toward his brother, avoiding looking at Maia. "Jase, I want to tell you I'm always going to be
here, but that would be a lie. I have to work sometimes. I won't be working as much, but every now and
then, I need to work." It was the adrenaline rush. It was the rage that swirled too dose to the surface that
was never going to go completely away. He hoped he wouldn't need it as much, but he knew he'd never
be utterly free of his demons, and if Maia was going to agree to be in his life, he needed both Jase and
her to know he would have times he couldn't help but leave them.

 "You have money. You can have my money," Jase burst out.

 "That's not what he means," Maia said gently. "He means when things are really bad tor him, working
undercover is a way of sorting it out."

 Jase just stared at her, hurt and fear mingling together in his eyes.

 "Like you pounding the bag," she added. "He goes undercover and becomes someone else for a while.
Does that make sense?"

 Cole wanted to protest, but she was right It was a world he was familiar with. lies and deceit and never
getting too dose. A world of violence, where explosive rage often had a legitimate target He was going to
lose here. He could see the handwriting on the wall, and it was killing him.

 Jase subsided, shrinking back into the chair, making himself very small as he turned to Cole. "Are you
planning on putting me in a boarding school so you can go back to the drug enforcement work?"

 "No! Absolutely not. Why would you think that Jase? I want you to attend a regular school, but not a
boarding school." Cole shoved both hands through his hair. "This is crazy. My work has nothing to do
with you going to school. If I have to leave on an assignment, I'll have someone who you trust stay here
with you. Someone I trust that we're both comfortable with. I'm not going anywhere until that happens."

 Jase took the ice packs off his hands and grabbed a handful of cookies. "Well, I'm not going to worry
about it then. It's not like we have anyone else."

 "I told you, we're getting a housekeeper. I just haven't found one yet." There was a warning note in
Cole's voice.

 Jase shrugged. "You scare everyone, Cole. I don't have to worry about anyone coming here to work in
the house unless she's after your money."

 Maia hastily covered her mouth with her hand and looked away from them. They sounded more and
more like brothers every day.
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 "Don't encourage him, Maia," Cole said.

 She didn't even wince at the hard edge to his voice. Her smothered laughter rang out from behind her
hand before she could stop it. "I'm sorry, really I am, but you so deserved that one. You need to practice
smiling in the mirror, Cole. It will help you win over the ladies."

 "He doesn't have to smile at women," Jase reminded with a wicked grin.

 "Put the ice packs back on your hands and stop eating so many cookies," Cole said. He reached under
the coffee table and pulled out a small object. "Here's your Christmas present." His voice turned gruff and
it embarrassed him, but he persisted with a dogged determination. "I don't know exactly how this is done,
and I didn't wrap it, but I made this for you, Jase." His fingers remained wrapped around it, concealing
the object. "You know I'll get you something nice from town once we can get out of here, but I wanted
you to have something on Christmas morning."

 "Let me see it," Jase said eagerly, holding out his swollen hand.

 Cole placed the wood carving in his brother's hand. A snarling mountain lion was crouched protectively
over a small alligator. The carving was intricate, each curve and line smooth and etched deep so that the
figures seemed to be alive. Jase turned it over and saw the date carved into the bottom.

 "It's the two of you, isn't it?" Maia asked, taking the carving out of Jase's hand to stroke her finger down
the cat's back. "You and Jase. That's what it represents."

 "It's all of us," Jase corrected. "You, me, my mom, and Cole."

 Maia handed the carving back to him. "It's beautiful, Cole. You're an unbelievable artist. I had no idea."

 "It looks so real," Jase said. "Thanks, Cole."

 Cole let his breath out slowly, a small smile somewhere inside of him. Jase understood what he was
trying to say with the carving, and more than anything else, that mattered.

 "I have something for you too, Jase," Maia said. "It's not nearly as nice as what Cole made for you, but
you might be able to use it" She pulled a book out from under the cushions of the couch. "It's a book on
animal behavior. I learned a lot from it, and as you can see, it's been well used, but I thought if you were
really interested in becoming a vet, you'd enjoy it."

 Cole put his arms around Maia. He'd never heard her sound quite so vulnerable, her words spilling out
too fast. The book had to have meant a great deal to her, and she wanted Jase to feel the same way.

 Jase opened it, read what she had written, and smiled. "We did share a journey, didn't we, Maia? Look
at this, Cole. Maia's mother gave this to her."

 "I was about ten," she admitted. "All I could think about were animals. My poor parents had to put up
with me constantly bringing home hurt things."

 "You still do that," Cole said, "or maybe they just gravitate to you."

 "Thanks, Maia." Jase nudged his brother.

Generated by ABC Amber LIT Converter, http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html

http://www.processtext.com/abclit.html


 "Jase and I have a present for you," Cole said. He pulled an envelope from his pocket and held it out to
her.

 Maia opened the seal slowly and took out the card. She blinked several times trying to make sense of
the lettering. "I don't understand." Her heart was pounding out of control. She swallowed several times,
before raising her gaze to Cole's.

 "You own the clinic," Jase said eagerly. "It belongs to you. You don't have to go away now."

 Cole gazed at her steadily, not blinking or looking away, compelling her toward the unknown. Maia
blinked rapidly to break the spell. He was so deep inside of her she could hardly breathe without him.
The feeling was too strong, too fast, and she didn't entirely trust it.

 "But I can't take this. I can't possibly accept this." Maia shoved the card back into Cole's hand. "You
know I won't, Cole."

 "You have to accept it," Jase said. "If you don't, you'll ruin the rest of it."

 "The rest of what? There can't possibly be anything more. Are you two crazy? You can't go buying a
clinic for me. I love you both dearly for the gesture, but I'm not going to accept it."

 Cole sat there, staring into her eyes, his face hard and etched with lines of suffering. "The part where we
ask you to stay. The part where I ask you to marry me."

 Her heart sounded like thunder in her ears. For a moment she thought she might actually faint. He looked
so alone, so prepared for her refusal of him that she ached with a need to give herself to him. She didn't
dare look at Jase, but she knew he would have a similar expression of need on his face.

 "Why, Cole?" She moistened dry lips with the tip of her tongue. "So when you need to go away you'll
have someone you trust here with Jase?" It didn't matter that she loved him so much. She couldn't live
with him knowing he didn't return her feelings. She knew she could love Jase always, be a good mother
or sister and friend to him, but she didn't want to be a convenience. She had far more respect for herself
than that.

 Cole groaned inwardly. He should have known it would look like that to her. Maybe it was part of it,
maybe it was all wrapped up in needs and hunger and longing for a home and a family. He took her hand,
his rough fingers sliding over her soft skin, his thumb caressing her ring finger. "I don't want to be without
you."

 "How can you possibly know whether you do or you don't, Cole?" Maia was going to cry. She hated
crying, and her reaction was generally to strike out at whoever managed to cause the tears.

 Cole felt her trembling. "I know because I know the difference between living in hell, and being alive in
paradise. I don't want to lose what you've given me. Ifeel all the time when I'm with you. The entire range
of emotions. Happiness, sadness, exasperation, even anger. All of it. I've never had that before. I want
you to be happy, Maia. I watch every single expression that crosses your face. I watch you with Jase,
with the animals. I think about you day and night. I want to go to bed at night with you beside me, and I
want to wake up with you in my arms. I've never felt that way about anything or anyone before."

 "You can't leave us, Maia," Jase burst out.
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 "Jase needs you almost as much as I do," Cole added, feeling on the verge of desperation. She was
bunking back tears, and he had the feeling she was going to pull away from him at any moment. He slid a
ring from his pocket, a circle of brilliant diamonds to slide on her ring finger. "Jase found the perfect
Christmas present for me, and gave it to me ahead of time. I want to give it to you."

 "Cole," she warned, shaking her head, looking down at the ring. She'd never seen anything like it, and it
had to be worth a fortune. "Where in the world did you get this, Jase?"

 "It was in the box with my mother's things," Jase said in a low voice.

 "Oh, my God, you cannot give this to me. You have to keep it for the woman you marry," Maia said,
turning her head to look at him.

 It was a mistake. The boy had tears in his eyes. He immediately reached out, putting his hand over hers
and Cole's. "I gave it to Cole because it was all I had to give him. He needs you. He's different around
you. Relaxed and happy, and he smiles. I'd never seen him smile until you came to be with us. And I
need you too. Don't leave us, Maia."

 She took a deep breath. It was overwhelming to be caught between the two of them, their dark secrets
and their dawning hope. "There's more to being married and relationships than need. If I stayed, and it
wasn't right, eventually it would all fall apart. You both know that." She wanted love. She deserved love.
As much as she loved them both, she would not be cheated.

 "Maia." Cole caught her chin and forced her to look at him. "I'll be the first to admit I don't have a lot of
pretty words to make this right. I don't know the first thing about how to tell a woman she's my entire
world, but that's what you are to me. You're not someone I want as a housekeeper for Jase, but if I
could choose a woman to be a mother figure, a sister, a friend for him, then it would be you."

 "What do you want for yourself?"

 "I want a woman who loves me in spite of all my failings. A woman who understands when I have
nightmares and do things she might be afraid of. I want you, Maia. I don't even know when I fell in love
with you. I just know that I am in love with you."

 For a moment she could hardly believe he'd said the words. She'd wanted to hear them so badly, she
was afraid it was a trick of her imagination. The wild pounding in her heart began to subside and she
could feel peace stealing into her. "Funny thing, Steele," she said, "I feelexactly the same way about you."

 Cole sat in shocked silence, afraid to move or speak. Afraid of breaking the spell. Someone, a long time
ago, told him miracles happened on Christmas. He was terrified of believing it.

 "I'm very much in love with you."

 Jase hissed out a breath between his teeth. "You two are making me want to pull out my hair! Cole, you
should have told her you loved her right away. Maia just say yes, so I can breathe again. I'm having an
asthma attack and trying not to die while you two figure it out."

 "Yes," Maia said.

 Cole dragged her into his arms and kissed her. She fit there, fit him. Understood him. He had no idea
how it had happened, but the how and why didn't matter, only that she loved him.
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 A noise drew his attention and he turned to find Jase waving his arms, wheezing, desperate to breathe.

 "You weren't joking," Cole said. "Where's your inhaler?" He searched through the pockets of Jase's
shirt. Jase pointed frantically toward the kitchen, and Cole sprinted away.

 "Calm down, Jase," Maia added, taking his hand. "It's going to be all right. We're all going to be fine."

 Cole was back, handing the boy the inhaler and watching with a slight frown on his face as Jase used it.
"Next time, don't be fixing my problems until you're safe, Jase. I should have been watching you more
carefully."

 Jase took a deep breath and smiled at his brother. "Someone has to look after you and Maia. You're
really not all that good with the women, Cole. I know more than you do about romance. And you'd
better smile at hera lot ."

 Maia laughed. The sound filled Cole with joy. He looked around the house. His home. It belonged to
them now. Maia, Jase, and Cole. It was their home. The fire burned brightly and filled the room with
warmth and comfort. The Christmas tree filled it with fragrance.

 "You know, Jase," Cole said. "I think Christmas is going to be our favorite holiday."

 "I think you're right," Jase said with complete satisfaction.

 The two brothers looked at Maia, and she threw her arms around them. "I knew you'd see it my way,"
she said happily.

  

 epilogue

 FOUR YEARS LATER

 Cole sat in his parked truck watching the people hurry along the streets, carrying brightly wrapped
packages and waving cheerfully to one another. The stores were heavily decorated, as were the
streetlights and even one or two of the trees in front of the shops. The tall fir in front of the veterinarian
clinic was a masterpiece, with lights and ornaments and a blazing star on the top, courtesy of Maia.

 He could hear music blaring out of the dink, a wild rendition of "Jingle Bells." That was so like Maia. The
clinic was closed, but people were going in and out carrying boxes of food and presents to cars. As
always, she headed up the drive to take dinners and gifts to the less fortunate, and she'd managed to rally
quite a crew to help her.

 He couldn't wait to see her, to watch the way her eyes lit up when she first saw him, to see her smile
blossom and hear her laughter. He ached to hold her, to feel her skin against his and he could already
taste her kiss. Sometimes, when he was away from her, he woke up with the taste of her in his mouth.
He'd been gone two months this time. It was the longest they'd ever been apart, and he'd felt every
second of the separation. He'd never stay away that long again. He needed his family far more than he
needed the outlet of his undercover work. He would still continue it, but he would not take a job where
he would be separated from them for so long. He'd learned, in his long absence, that they were his
balance and sanity.
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 A part of him was afraid of his welcome. Afraid that smile, the light in Maia's eyes wouldn't be there for
him this time. His hands gripped the steering wheel, thinking about losing her, losing what he had because
he could never quite rid himself of the demons that plagued him his entire life.

 He heard laughter and turned his head to see the two little girls running up the street, clutching at Jase's
hands, dragging him toward the clinic. Their dark hair, so like his, was shiny and bobbed as they ran. His
three-year-old twin daughters had Maia's deep blue-green eyes and her smile. He loved the sound of
their laughter. He still couldn't believe he had daughters. Beautiful twins who climbed all over him and
kissed him every chance they got. Maia had given him that gift.

 Observing Jase with his daughters brought a lump to his throat. His brother had grown into everything
he'd hoped. He was tall and strong, his gangly frame filled out. He carried himself with confidence. The
shadows that had always been present in his eyes were replaced with contentment. He had friends and
did extraordinarily well in school. Maia had managed that as well. She'd had him working daily in the
clinic with her, taking him on ranch calls and teaching him her craft, encouraging him in school and, more
importantly, bringing him a sense of family.

 Cole slid from the truck, knowing he was going to have to go in and face his fate. Unlike Jase, he knew
he would never be rid of the past. He would awaken in a cold sweat, Maia in his arms, her voice
soothing, her body soft and inviting, always ready to take away the nightmares. He loved her so much he
ached with it, yet he couldn't always stay. No matter how hard he tried to hide it, Maia always saw the
demons growing in him.

 It was always Maia who put her arms around him and told him to go. "It's okay," she would whisper,
kissing her way up his back to the nape of his neck. "Do what you have to do and come back to us." She
never cried, and she never chastised him or made him feel guilty. She was Maia, offering him freedom
with love in her eyes. And he always returned because he couldn't live without her.

 But as he opened the door to the clinic, his heart pounded with fear. If she rejected him, his life was
over. He knew that, knew he needed her more than most men needed their wife and lover. She gave him
acceptance and understanding when he didn't have it himself. She taught her daughters that same
acceptance and understanding of his shortcomings, and she'd taught it to Jase.

 The music greeted him as the door swung open. Someone bumped into him, laughed, and called out a
merry Christmas. He just kept walking through the outer office, down the decorated hall to the back
room, where the operation of fining boxes was taking place. Dread was growing, a dark ugly feeling he
couldn't stop. All around him were the signs of Christmas, of happiness overflowing. He walked with
confidence, but deep inside, where no one saw, he was screaming inside.

 "Daddy!" Ashley screamed his name and rushed him, a small dynamo, throwing her arms around one
leg, effectively stopping him.

 Mary cried out and followed her twin, twining her arms around the other leg.

 Cole reached down for them, his heart nearly bursting as he picked the girls up and settled them on his
hips, kissing them over and over, but all the time his attention was on her. On Maia. He heard Jase's
greeting. Felt the boy clap him on the back, and he returned the awkward hug. But it was Maia he
watched. Maia he waited for.

 She turned slowly, as if she were afraid to believe it was true. Her gaze settled on his face. He held his
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breath. There it was. That slow smile of joy that lit up her eyes, brightened her face. Tears shimmered.
The tears that were never there when he left but always there when he returned.

 "You're home."

 He handed the twins to Jase. "I'm home." He gathered her into his arms and found her mouth with his.
She fit dose to him, her arms winding tightly around his neck, her mouth every bit as demanding as his.
He tasted her sweetness. He tasted acceptance. Desire. Most of all he tasted love. He felt weak with
joy, with relief. Maia was his rock, his foundation. His very life.

 "Get a room." Jase and the twins chimed in together, something they did often around Maia and Cole.

 Maia laughed, resting her head on Cole's chest. "You made it home for Christmas."

 "I'd never miss Christmas. Did you put up the tree already?" He held his breath again. It was silly to want
to choose the tree, not when there were only three days left.

 "We never break tradition," Jase answered. "It wouldn't be the same without you."

 Maia just burrowed closer to him, her arms sliding around his waist. Cole looked at his brother over her
head, and they smiled. They had a home. A family. And they had love. If that wasn't a Christmas miracle,
nothing was.
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