                        An Infection Connection

Though arthritis other than infectious arthritis is typically

not thought of as an infectious process, recent evidence 
indicates that infection may play a key role in many cases 
of rheumatoid arthritis and osteoarthritis. Doxycycline, 
minocycline, and tetracycline have been shown to provide 
improvement for many patients treated early in the 
disease process - within the first year of disease onset.  
One theory is that these antibiotics specifically inhibit 
metalloproteinase enzymes involved in the breakdown of 
cartilage, so characteristic of osteoarthritis.

Another popular hypothesis is that infection with 
Chlamydia pneumoniae, mycoplasma and L-form 
variants can somehow elicit a hypersensitivity reaction 
that may be a closer look at the actual cause of 
rheumatoid disease. Yet another alternative theory of 
“molecular mimicry” suggests that Proteus or Klebsiella 
from the intestine enter the bloodstream to elicit an 
immune response, which via “mistaken identity,” mounts 
an attack on the synovial tissues as well. If research 
currently underway by the NIH, among other entities, 
validates any of these theories, the whole idea of 
controlling the symptoms of rheumatoid diseases with 
anti-inflammatory steroids and NSAIDs may prove to be 
far more harmful than beneficial.
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