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'1I'his is a primary discourse on 
basic Radionics so only a small 
amount of ground can be cov­
ered to whet the appetite for 
further study of this beautiful 
healing art. Radionics can un­
leash the potential held by the 
human mind and our human 
power to heal mental and physi­
cal disease on all levels. The 
limits of the infinite possibilities 
are bounded only by the knowl­
edge, depth and quality of 
awareness of the practitioner. 

A human being is simply an 
energy or magnetic unit display­
ing certain types of energy and 
energy fields. ALL matter, or­
ganic or inorganic, vibrates con­
stantly on its own predeter­
mined wavelength. Any vari­
ation from this pattern in an 
organism results in dis-har­
monyand thus dis-ease. 

The body's electrical energies 
are .measured by orthodox 
medicine using ECG's and 
EMG's, etc. It is unfortunate that 
the medical profession has 
failed to understand the work of 
many eminent physicians in the 
field of radionics and has been 
unaware of the significance to 
health and disease of the 
changes in bio-energy. fields 
around us. 

The Radionics practitioner 
can register on instruments any 
selected organ, body system, 
chakra, mineral, vitamin or 
hormone balance (to name just a 
few). Disease or deficiencies (or 
over-abundance) can be regis­
tered on a predetermined scale 
by the same instrumentation. 

The total radionics system is 
completely portable, fits neatly 
into a business case and meas­
ures bjo-energy differences on 
an ammeter measuring in mi­
cro-amperes. It has a series of 
knobs each with 11 positions 
encompassing the organs and 
functions of the human body 
and a further series covering the 
major diseases and problems. 

The practitioner can 'place' 
an infinite number of body parts 
and functions in the machine for 
analysis. The procedure is sim­
plicity itself and the possibilities 
and combinations are endless. 
On the other hand the results 
require intelligent interpreta­
tion and here the practitioner's 
diagnostic expertise and knowl­
edge of anatomy, physiology 
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and pathology come to the fore. 
Not only must he decide the area 
to be treated but the most effec­
tive method to be used. 
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Since homoeopathy is a most ef­
fective healing method and radi­
onics has an incredible affinity 
for homoeopathic philosophy, 
the two modalities combine well 
in treatment - the suitability of 
the homoeopathic preparation, 
its potency and dosage can all be 
checked against a patient, elimi­
nating guesswork. During the 
course of treatment a person's 
progress can be monitored as 
often as necessary. Any desired 
adjustments can be made as 
healing progresses and symp­
toms change. 
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The patient provides a 'wit­
ness' in the form of a small lock 
ofhair ora small spot of saliva on 
specially prepared neutral pa­
per. Once this is available the ra­
dionics practitioner is able, if 
necessary, to diagnose and treat 
the patient without them actu­
ally being present. 

Treatment is effected by plac­
ing a remedy in the radionics 
machineand 'projecting' it to the 
patient, the effect being the same 
as if the remedy had been taken 
by mouth. The remedy will con­
tinue to be rect?ived as long as 
the 'witness' and the remedy 
remain in the machine. 

Not only homoeopathic 
remedies may be prescribed and 
taken (or projected) but a wide 
spectrum of remedies and treat­
ments may be utilised. The list is 
by no means exhaustive, but 
might include tissue cell salts, 
Bach Flower remedies, or­
ganotherapy, colour therapy, 
gem remedies, chakra treat­
ment, hormones and allergies 
etc. § llJIB31fILJB 
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lRadionic diagnosis and subse­
quent treatment enables a prac­
titioner to determine factors in 
the mental and astral bodies, as 
the etheric form modifyies and, 
distorts the chakral energy flow. 
For instance, the patient's RNA 
state may be ascertained ini­
tially. If this in a negative situ­
ation the prescribing of RNA 
orally can redress the imbalance 
in seconds, allOWing the next 
stage of treatment (the establish­
ment of endocrine integrity) to 
proceed. 

When RNA (a complicated 
protein molecule essential to'iife 
processes) is in a low state, the 
body's polarity is reversed. This 
is corrected as outlined above, 
releasing positive healing en­
ergy. 

It would seem the electrohar­
monies or frequencies emitted 
by RNA help 'unjam the body's 
computer'. Homoeopathic 
preparations, minerals, vita­
mins, herbs etc all have their 
own unique electromagnetic 
frequency and these frequencies 
are picked up and acted upon 
through the nervous system by 
the brain. 

The electromagnetic fre­
quency /vibratory/radiation/ 
bio-energy theory was well 
understood by the Chinese 
some 3,000 years ago in explain­
ing the actions of ginseng; it was 
not the raw material that pro­
vided the profound healing ef­
fect on the human organism, but 
rather the 'vibrations' released 
following assimilation of gfn­
seng. 
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~adionics  exhibits a scientific 
method of approaching a ra­
tional, organised system for 
analysing subtle energy fields of 
the human organism. It points 
the way to treatment and gov­
erns the treatment itself. Few 
other healing modalities, ortho­
dox or complementary, can 
claim its degree ofdepth and ac­
curacy in the hands of a trained 
practitioner, or claim to pene­
trate and reveal the prime cause 
of disease. 
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The majority of healing meth­
ods attempt to diagnose observ­
able manifestations of a deep­
seated problem and tend to treat 
these physical end-of-the-line 
symptoms, without under­

standing or attempting to dis­
cover their source. Radionics 
analysis enables a skilled practi­
tioner to arrive at the point of a 
matter and treat it as the basis of 
the visible, discemable problem 
or problems. 

It has been said by the piO­
neers of radionics that it is the 
medidne of the future, the way 
and hope for medicine in the 21 st 
century. Since orthodoxy has 
demonstrably failed in the treat­
ment of chronic disease (per­
haps misunderstanding of the 
true nature of disease), it must 
sooner or later own up to its de­
ficiencies and, indeed, abject 
failures. 

The true nature and cause of 
ill-health as propounded by 
complementary medicine cries 
out to be recognised and should 
be accepted by all who would 
call themselves healers. Non­
orthodox practitioners believe 
within two decades this change 
will come about with the science 
of radionics well in the fore­
ground. 

One cannot decry the superb 
pioneering work of restorative 
surgery nor orthodox emer­
gency procedures which are ir­
replaceably valid in modem 
medicine - we are, of course, far 
better off for having them. What 
we must have is a non-drug­
ging, non-disease-producing 
system available to all. 

Radionics already provides 
this service. The fact that it com­
bines in total harmony with 
other methods can only further 
enhance its position in the heal­
ing arts.oo 

by a radionics practitione·r 
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