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I N T R O D U C T I O N

RELIGIOUS PLURALISM TODAY

IN 2007 A GROUP OF MUSLIMS presented the Christian world with
a message titled ‘‘A Common Word between Us and You.’’ This

message, an expression of interreligious solidarity at a time of religious
tension, spoke of a shared Christian-Muslim commitment to love of
God and love of neighbor. Since then a number of meetings have been
convened to discuss the document, which has received encouragement
at the highest levels of religious authority and political power. There
has also been caution, including a call to recognize the basic differences
as well as the commonalities.

It is not surprising to find common ground between Christianity and
Islam, which, along with Judaism, look to Abraham as proto-monothe-
ist, friend of God, and father of the covenant between God and his
people. At the same time religions make unique claims. Indeed, the
very concept of religion may differ from one tradition to another. The
common ground will always be contested. This is something for believ-
ers to take up in forging their own sense of religious purpose in today’s
highly pluralistic world. Unique claims will be affirmed, but there is
also space to include others under the umbrella of a single truth. The
2000 declaration of the Congregation for the Propagation of the Faith,
Dominus Iesus, promulgated under the prefecture of Joseph Cardinal
Ratzinger, now Pope Benedict XVI, invites theologians of the Church
‘‘to explore if and in what ways the historical and positive elements of
. . . [other] religions may fall within the divine plan of salvation.’’ In-
deed, article 841 of the Catholic Catechism states that God’s plan of
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2 INTRODUCT ION

salvation includes Muslims who ‘‘acknowledge the Creator . . . [and]
profess to hold the faith of Abraham.’’ Quite straightforwardly, a verse
in the Qur’an (10:99) says that if God had wanted, all peoples would
have believed together. The point, as drawn by many a Muslim thinker
over the centuries, is that religious pluralism is part of the divine plan.

In principle, the study of Christianity and Islam through a single
albeit refracted lens should include Judaism. Every insight in this book
can be enriched by bringing in the Jewish perspective. In a way, Judaism
stands at the heart of both Christianity and Islam. It has a strong sense
of the messianic promise and a strong commitment to religious ethics.
The common ground is ultimately tripartite. However, every study has
its limits. Here, in light of the Common Word initiative, the focus is
Christianity and Islam. It is hoped that others with greater expertise in
Judaism will build on the initiative and offer further ideas on the various
streams that flow from the figure of Abraham. The study of religious
pluralism is by nature a work in progress.

There is a good deal of skepticism about religious pluralism, much
of it healthy. Why cram different traditions into a single box? They
may use the same language (scripture, grace, and so on) but often mean
very different things. When religious communities live side by side,
they often share common cultural values. Christians living amidst a
Muslim majority often take on various aspects of the Islamic heritage,
and the same is true of Muslims living amidst a Christian majority. But,
in the end, adaptation always takes place in reference to a recognized set
of truths that do not change.

There are unique truth claims, but there is also some sense of study-
ing one religion in light of another. Scholarly inquiry is never un-
touched by the wider debates of the day. There is much public
discussion about Islam. Is it a religion of peace? Is it a religion of vio-
lence? Insight into possible common ground between Christianity and
Islam will offer direction for the wider discussion. The study of religious
pluralism, then, does not aim to cram different religions into a single
box but seeks to reach greater understanding of religion. Indeed, it can
force us to be more precise when we use religious terminology, such as
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scripture and grace. What do we really mean by words like these and
do they apply in the same way from one tradition to the next?

The study of religious pluralism can take up all religions, but one
must have ample familiarity with the religions in question. Superficial
comparison is always a danger. As a scholar of Islam, I am interested in
a better understanding of Islam. I also have had considerable exposure
to the study of Christianity as well as firsthand experience of both tradi-
tions. Where are the two alike and where are they different and how
does that tell us something about each?

The goal here is not to review the history of Christian-Muslim rela-
tions but to seek insight into Christian-Muslim thinking. Christians
and Muslims have interacted on many levels through the centuries. One
can even speak of a degree of cross-fertilization: Muslims thinking
about Islam in light of what Christians say and Christians thinking
about Christianity in light of what Muslims say. One could, of course,
focus on particular instances of Christian-Muslim interaction through
the centuries, both positive and negative. The specific realities of the
day do matter. For example, a community in a society where the major-
ity does not share its beliefs may emphasize different elements of the
tradition than it would if the roles were reversed. As a minority a com-
munity might speak of patience in the hope of a divinely sustained
victory in an unspecified future, but as a majority it might call for some
signal of God’s victory in public life. There is, however, more to reli-
gious pluralism than historical circumstances. We do speak of religious
traditions that endure from one historical moment to another. For
Christians the way to God will always include the cross. For Muslims
the Qur’an will always direct the faithful to him.

Still, because of the continuity of religious claims through the centu-
ries, it becomes possible to think about different traditions within a
single arena of religious thinking. Christians and Muslims do have the
other in mind when speaking of God. What is the point of religious
pluralism? What can we say about the existence of multiple religions?
What are they doing together in the world? And what language best
captures this? The goal here is not to offer final definitions but rather
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to invite reflection on religious thinking pluralistically. I do refer to
specific cases but also recognize that religious traditions have their own
intellectual integrity that others too can grasp.

This book began as a series of lectures delivered in the spring of 2007

at John Carroll University in Cleveland through the funding of the
Walter and Mary Tuohy Chair in Interreligious Studies. A Fulbright
grant to Morocco in 2008–2009, where I taught courses on religious
pluralism, helped refine my thinking. However, the project’s origins run
much deeper. I am a Christian (Roman Catholic) who for close to two
decades has been deeply engaged with Muslim society. The goal has
been to study Islam, but friendships have also formed alongside schol-
arly pursuits. I have been struck by similarities and differences, but I
have also been struck by the common drive for meaning in light of the
one God. I have done a lot of listening, but I have also offered perspec-
tive. Christianity remains Christianity and Islam remains Islam: There
are insurmountable differences. But there are also ways for believers of
diverse faiths to enlighten one another. This has marked my own
Christian relation to Islam.

Still, a book of this kind is not about personal experience. All schol-
ars of religion develop a subjective relation to the object of their studies,
but this does not make them biased observers. My readings over the
years have noted common dynamics that I believe other scholars with
expertise in Christianity and Islam would also notice. To be sure, my
own journey may make me more sensitive to common points, but that
does not mean that such commonality is not there. Indeed, a book of
this kind could be written by someone without religious commitments
but only competence in the two religions.

When I was delivering the Tuohy lectures, a member of the audience
suggested that I might be a Gnostic. He thought I was treating two
distinct religions as simply two manifestations of a single truth larger
than both of them. I was, in his view, stripping Christianity and Islam
of their unique truth claims. In a similar vein, one of my students in
Morocco asked me whether Christians believe in God. She said this
after a lecture in which I suggested that the first followers of Jesus saw
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the cross as God’s way of guaranteeing his pledge to be with his people
and, moreover, that they would not have been able to recognize this
apart from the Israelite heritage to which they belonged. In her view, I
had limited God’s power to a set of human circumstances in which the
first Christians lived. God’s will, she maintained, does not depend on a
set of historically limited circumstances whereby people might be able
to grasp his purposes.

Religions do have their own unique claims and perspectives. Indeed,
one may be true and all the others false, or they may share common
ground alongside unique truths. But such a judgment can only be made
in light of real knowledge. This is the role that scholars have to play in
the Common Word initiative. Is the talk of common ground substanti-
ated by serious study of religious pluralism? Does the study of religious
pluralism suggest that Christians and Muslims have a common purpose
in the ways they have interpreted and responded to the truths they hold
across a broad range of issues: spiritual, ethical, political? There is
plenty of uncommon ground, but the evidence, I argue, tilts in the
direction of commonality amidst diversity. We are not, then, arguing
for the creation of a common ground but instead suggesting its long-
standing existence.

Amidst all of this I also challenge how we think about religion. The
tendency is to think of religion in terms of identity. It is not wrong to
speak about believers in terms of their distinct beliefs and practices, but
it often works to keep them at a distance—those people with that iden-
tity. In fact, notwithstanding the differences it is religion as opposed to
other factors that explains why Muslims today have much in common
with Christians. By thinking of religion in terms of identity, we actually
blind ourselves to the way it unfolds across a broad range of categories
that several species of religion share. The question, then, is how to
obtain a fuller knowledge of religion in light of the fact that no religion
is reducible to a set identity. The study of religious pluralism is one way
to get at the subjectivity of religious actors beyond so-called objective
definitions of their identity. To consider Islam alongside Christianity,
then, is to attempt to overcome the tendency to limit Islam to identity
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classification. In that way, we can understand it more fully. A pluralistic
horizon asks what Islam shares with other traditions. Islam, in this
sense, is not simply an object to be identified as a separate species from
other objects but now a subject sharing a measure of character traits
with other subjects, such as Christianity. Religions are not objects for
zoological classification but dynamic actors in their own right.

The study of religious pluralism, then, can help us see that religions
actually resist final definitions. The religious landscape offers us hori-
zons, but we cannot define all its contours with precision. There is,
then, an open-ended side to religion. Believers are not simply objects
to label but moral agents. Thinking about religion in terms of common
ground is one way to articulate this reality: Religion is not a concept
that can be captured in distinct cages of identity.

In what follows, six chapters explore topics of central importance to
Islam with reference to commonality in Christianity. The first two deal
with the mechanics of revelation: concepts of prophecy and doubts
about prophecy. The second two deal with ethics: the face of God and
the existence of evil. The final two deal with politics: democracy and
human rights. My conclusions support the idea of common ground but
also recognize its fragility. Common ground is not immediately obvi-
ous. It requires sustained reflection on the ways beliefs are constructed
and pursued even within a single tradition. Meanings and morals as
advanced by religious traditions get shaped and reshaped even if general
horizons are not completely malleable. The common ground may be
there one moment and gone the next. But it is still there, potentially if
not always actually. And, I argue, this common ground is not only for
religious communities to consider and affirm or deny. It is also exciting
ground for scholars to pursue in the effort to understand the nature and
purpose of religion.



C H A P T E R O N E

DOES THE QUR’AN BELONG
IN THE BIBLE?

OUR STORY BEGINS at the court of Rayy, a city not far from Teh-
ran, where in the tenth century a famous debate about prophecy

took place. Abu Hatim argued for the truth of prophecy and Abu Bakr
denied it. Both were natives of Rayy and therefore shared the surname
al-Razi. Abu Hatim al-Razi, an intellectual associated with the Isma‘ili
branch of Islam, recorded the debate, so it is no surprise that he came
out on top and that Abu Bakr al-Razi looked the fool.1 Abu Bakr,
referred to throughout as the atheist, was actually quite learned.2 He
held that the human mind is all one needs to know the truth of exis-
tence and to live well. In his view, because religion requires obedience
to revealed precepts, it belittles the mind. It is therefore foolish to fol-
low the directives of a prophet. He thus condemned all religions as
tools the powerful use to dominate others.

To show the folly of prophecy, Abu Bakr noted the contradictions
between religions. How could any of them be true? The Gospel claims
that Jesus is the son of God and was crucified for the sins of those who
believe in him, whereas the Qur’an insists, first, that he is not the son
of God but a prophet, no different from other prophets, and, second,
that he only appeared to be crucified when in fact he was not killed but
raised up to God. In his place, the Qur’an says, another person resem-
bling him was put to death. Thus, Abu Bakr argued, given that there is
no evidence apart from scripture to vindicate one claim over the other,
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8 CHAPTER ONE

the only intelligent thing to do is to suspend judgment and give the
matter no further thought. Alas, he lamented, people do not do this.
Bereft of rational arguments, believers turn to violence to vindicate their
claims. In the end, religion leads only to strife and bloodshed.

The existence of multiple religions does challenge the idea of a single
truth, and Muslim scholars claim in response that scripture before the
Qur’an is distorted. The Bible would support the truths of the Qur’an
had Jewish and Christian leaders not changed its content to serve their
interests. However, in this case, Abu Bakr dismissed all prophecy—
Jewish, Christian, and Muslim alike. Abu Hatim was thus forced to
defend the credibility of prophecy in general, putting him in the odd
position of defending the truth of non-Muslim scripture. Would he be
able to do this without prejudicing the truth of Islam?

Abu Hatim first acknowledged that the wordings of scripture do
indeed differ from one religion to the next. Still, he insisted, they share
a common meaning. The problem lies not in scriptural divergences but
in the failure to interpret them properly. He argued, for example, that
Jesus did claim to be the son of God in the Gospels but that Christians
have erred in taking this claim literally. In fact, Jesus spoke in parable.
A father loves his child and prefers him over others, and this, Abu
Hatim claimed, served Jesus as a metaphor for his relation with God.
In calling himself son of God, he meant only to indicate a special rela-
tion with God. Christians are led astray by taking the parable literally.
The wording may say son of God, but the meaning, Abu Hatim con-
cluded, is friend of God, a concept that indicates closeness to God and
is consistent with the Muslim view of prophets as specially chosen by
God.

A similar argument was made for the crucifixion. Jesus was in fact
crucified—an extraordinary concession for a Muslim to make. But this,
Abu Hatim claimed, does not contradict the Qur’an. The Qur’an does
not say that they did not kill him but that they did not kill him for
certain (4:157). This means that they did not kill that part of him that
represents his true reality, namely his spirit, which God raised to him-
self. Abu Hatim bolstered his argument by referring to other verses in
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the Qur’an that speak of those killed in the way of God. Believers are
exhorted to consider them not as dead but alive, enjoying a heavenly
reward for the boldness of their piety. The point, then, is not that they
did not kill his body but that they did not kill his spirit. He is still alive,
as all those killed in the way of God, and is with God in spirit. Once
again, Abu Hatim prevailed. Apparent contradictions exist only at the
level of words. If Abu Bakr the atheist were to ponder the matter, he
would see the harmony of all scripture at the deeper level of meaning.
The problem, again, is not the scriptures but the failure to go beyond
literal wordings.

What can we learn from this millennium-old debate? We like the
idea of a single truth at the core of all religions. Perhaps too often we
hear the statement that all religions are simply different paths to a single
truth. The message of all faiths is to love God and to love your neigh-
bor, is it not? All believers do desire to be close to God, to be in har-
mony with him, and to live a life pleasing to him. And yet believers are
not ready to cede the literal wordings of scripture. For Christians, Jesus
Christ is the son of God, not literally in the biological sense but also
not metaphorically as friend of God in the sense Abu Hatim suggested.
He represents God’s unique word to humanity and in that sense,
though human, discloses the truth of God, making him inseparable
from God. Similarly, for Muslims, the Qur’an means what it says. It is
the great criterion (furqan) that separates good from evil, the guided
from the misguided, and the grateful from the ungrateful. It too origi-
nates in God as his final word for humankind—not the ink and paper
on which it is written but the message communicated in Arabic. The
words of the Qur’an are God’s words, literally, in contrast to the words
of the Bible, which do play a central role in Christian life but ultimately
point to Jesus as God’s message to humanity. Despite rich traditions of
interpretation in both religions, we have two claims for uniqueness: the
Christian one for Jesus and the Muslim one for the Qur’an. There is
no person like Jesus. And there is no book like the Qur’an.

Christians and Muslims, though eager for interreligious harmony,
are not about to discard plainly stated beliefs for hidden meanings. If
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scripture is about hidden meanings, we can make it say whatever we
want apart from any clear message from God. If this is the case, why
not do away with religion entirely, as Abu Bakr suggested, and rely
solely on the mind as guide to life?

It is difficult to speak of common ground when it comes to the
unique claims of Christian and Muslim revelation. Either we cede the
message of revelation, putting the religion itself at risk, or are left to
squabble about the truth of one revealed message over another. The
result is either suspicion of the beliefs of others or reservation about the
truth claims of all religions. This is particularly true for Christians and
Muslims when it comes to the person of Jesus Christ. Yes, he is the son
of God. No, he is not. Yes, he was crucified. No, he was not. The
discord goes beyond descriptions. More profoundly, the two views of
Jesus reflect distinct notions about the workings of prophecy.

At a basic level, Christians and Muslims see prophecy as the disclo-
sure of three things: God, God’s will, and the consequences of failing
to live up to God’s will. Prophets call people to piety and devotion to
God as ground of all existence. However, in Christianity, and in Juda-
ism, prophecy is never far from priesthood. Prophets call people to right
living, to bind themselves to God, but also to correct worship of him,
which in the Bible involves sacrificial offerings in the temple by priests
on behalf of the community. The concept of sacrificial offering is not
at all foreign to Islam. The sacrifice of an animal for the expiation of
sins is a central feature of the pilgrimage to Mecca. But in Islam there
is no priesthood. In ancient Israel, by contrast, the temple where sacri-
fice was offered stood at the heart of the community’s covenant with
God. It was the place where the people encountered the presence of
God in a special way, and it was the task of the temple priests to offer
sacrifices to ensure the integrity of the relation between God and his
people. However, the destruction of the temple by the Babylonians in
the sixth century BCE changed all that, raising questions about the
nature of the covenant in the absence of the temple. To be sure, the
Israelites could continue their ethical commitments as known in the
Mosaic Law. These gave them a distinct identity as a people. But where
would sacrifice be offered? How would God be encountered?
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Some hoped for the restoration of the temple and the outpouring of
a new spirit. The Israelites would devote themselves fully to the ways
of God and cease from offending him. It was God’s anger at the way-
wardness of his people and especially their leaders, some supposed, that
caused the destruction of the temple and exile to Babylon. Yet, once
rebuilt, the temple never regained its former status as inviolable site of
the presence of God.3 Indeed, an important scene in the book of Eze-
kiel shows the glory of God taking leave of the temple (10:18–22). As a
result of the temple’s desecration, a new vision began to take shape.
Instead of the temple, the body of the prophet, the holy man of God,
would ensure the integrity of the covenant. In this sense, the prophet’s
bodily suffering, in place of the temple sacrifice, would restore the com-
munity’s standing before God. This role is noticeable already with
Ezekiel, prophet and priest of the sixth century BCE, whose bodily
suffering functions to restore the integrity of the community’s relation
with God in the absence of the temple (4:4–6). It also features promi-
nently in the book of Isaiah, with the expectation that God will raise
up his suffering servant as his chosen means of redeeming his people.
For Christians, this idea reaches its unique expression in the person of
Jesus Christ, whose body becomes the new temple, the site where peo-
ple encounter the presence of God.4 His sacrifice allows people to stand
in the presence of God. They are still accountable for their sins, but the
cross becomes a sign of hope that nothing will deprive them of the
presence and love of God. It is the great sacrifice to which the church
is heir.

For Christians, then, prophecy is not enough. The prophets of old
proclaimed God’s desire to be with his people, and this promise was
fulfilled in the person of Jesus Christ. It is thus one thing to have a
prophecy about God and another thing for it to be fulfilled. This is true
for Muslims too. The Qur’an speaks of God, and Muslims find great
solace in living according to his ways. But what holds out hope that the
prophecy is actually being fulfilled by the community? Muhammad Ibn
‘Abd al-Wahhab (died 1792), the eighteenth-century reformist who ini-
tiated the powerful movement in contemporary Islam known as Wah-
habism, condemned the bulk of Muslims as infidels. This may have
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been extreme, but the question stands. How does the community know
that its relation with God is sound and that it has not been deprived of
the presence of God that prophecy makes known but does not itself
bring into being? In one sense, God is merciful to those who turn to
Him. An individual might repent of waywardness and return to the
path of God, content that he is leading a life pleasing to God. As for
other Muslims who may not be so pious, they can hope for the mercy
of God in the life to come but risk punishment on judgment day for
their religious shortcomings. Islam says that they may need to spend
time in hell before admission to paradise and full enjoyment of the
presence of God. But what can be said about the Muslim community
as a whole, here and now? What is the evidence that the prophecy is
being fulfilled and that God is present to his people? It is one thing to
hope for the fulfillment of prophecy in the life to come but another
thing to show its effectiveness in this world. What would be the point
of having a word from God without some sign that it is being realized
in the life of the community?

A ninth-century figure by the name of al-Muhasibi gave much
thought to this question. He earned his name, which means the ac-
countant, from his interest not in financial accounts but spiritual ones.
How to account for the failings of a community that has possession of
God’s final word to humanity? To answer this question, he turned to
the interior life of the soul. He wanted to know not only what the
religion says humans should do but also and more profoundly the mo-
tives behind religious actions. What prompts Muslims to do the things
they do, especially the things that God commands—prayer, fasting,
generosity? What was troubling for al-Muhasibi was religious hypoc-
risy, Muslims who pursue religion not for God and a desire for the
world to come but for communal approval. What motivated them in
his view was not the presence of God in and of itself but favorable
standing in the eyes of the world, a situation that worked against ful-
fillment of the prophetic message. Were Muslims ultimately about this
world or the next? And if their actions, especially their religious prac-
tices, were implicitly worldly in orientation, what did that say about the
presence of God in their lives?
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The ninth century was a spiritually ambiguous time in Islam. The
caliphate was at the height of its splendor, signaling the worldly success
of a religion that had come to prevail over vast regions of the earth from
Andalusia to India, known collectively as the abode of Islam. Religious
fulfillment, however, remained elusive. As suggested, Muslims dis-
agreed about the religion itself, and it was not just so-called atheists
such as Abu Bakr al-Razi. Those who accepted the prophecy were also
not in full agreement. There were different Sunni schools. The Shi‘a
too were divided into subbranches, such as the Isma‘ilis. A host of sects
too numerous to mention here are recorded in Islam’s early literature.
The prediction of the prophet Muhammad that his community would
divide into seventy-two sects, only one of which would be saved,
seemed to have come to pass. All others were heretics. The dilemma
for piety-minded people such as al-Muhasibi was to locate the saved
sect. As he noted in his Testimonies, he felt adrift amidst a sea of differ-
ences where many drown and only a few reach shore safely.5

His report of how he found the saved sect was actually a way for him
to discuss more urgent issues that in his view threatened the standing
of the Muslim community (umma) before God. He was deeply troubled
by the sectarian differences within the umma, differences that encour-
aged skepticism about the existence of a single truth, catastrophically
leading to indifference toward one’s religious duties. Why go to all the
trouble to perform them if not clearly true? It was this that most dis-
tressed al-Muhasibi because it threw the community’s account with
God out of balance. God has the right to be worshipped as embodied
in specific religious duties—daily prayer, fasting during Ramadan,
almsgiving, pilgrimage to the house of God in Mecca, and so on. Fail-
ing to meet God’s rights would jeopardize the religious integrity of the
umma.

The problem in al-Muhasibi’s view was that Muslims are enamored
with the world, preferring the pursuit of money over religious duties.
Even the religious scholars, the so-called guides of the community, had
become captivated by worldly prestige. The debt to God had increased
so much that al-Muhasibi nearly despaired of finding piety to offset it
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and warned of God unleashing his wrath on the Muslim community for
its failure to satisfy his rights. Here, then, the salvation to be obtained is
salvation from God, which is achievable only by exact performance of
religious duties. And yet perfect fulfillment of the conditions set by the
prophetic message for harmonious relation with God was—and is—no
easy matter. What could be done? How would the price be paid? As it
turns out, it was not to be accomplished by crucifixion. It did, however,
involve particularly pious persons who had earned God’s favor. In the
language of al-Muhasibi, they were God’s beloved ones, his chosen
ones, indeed his vicegerents on earth. They could intercede on behalf
of a community with a religious account clearly in the red.

The thought that someone should undergo death to satisfy God may
have occurred to al-Muhasibi. A prophetic saying (hadith) tells of a
man who had committed adultery. Fearful of his standing before God,
he goes to the prophet and asks him to apply the punishment, namely,
death by stoning, to restore his good standing before God. The prophet
sends him away, telling him to seek the forgiveness of God, but the man
keeps coming back, insisting that only by submitting to the prescribed
punishment will he be reconciled to God. Finally, the prophet relents
and orders him to be stoned but not without remarking that his repen-
tance is so sincere that it encompasses the Muslim community entire.
In other words, his self-appointed death, intended to make himself
pleasing to God so as to have access to God’s presence, is evidence of
pure-hearted piety. Even if represented in a single individual, it shows
that the religion is at work within the community, proof that it contin-
ues to enjoy a measure of divine favor.

But al-Muhasibi did not go this way. The work of making the com-
munity pleasing to God was to be accomplished by exemplars of piety.
These did not need to undergo death on behalf of the community but
did have a role in ensuring the soundness of the community’s relation
with God. What made them pleasing to God, and through them the
community, was their high level of piety as witnessed by their perfect
devotion to the other world over this one. They not only performed
their duties to God without flaw but had also overcome the worldly
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inclinations of the soul—inner urges and selfish whims that suggest a
lack of full orientation to the presence of God.

It was this exclusively otherworldly orientation that preserved them
from the religious hypocrisy that marked, in al-Muhasibi’s view, the
majority of Muslims. That he may have considered—and then dis-
missed—the idea of someone undergoing death to reconcile the com-
munity to God is suggested in his citation of another hadith, in which
the prophet Muhammad says, ‘‘Those who cling to my precedent (i.e.,
model of righteous behavior) amidst the corruption of the day will have
the reward of a hundred martyrs.’’6 Death for God, at least in the literal
sense, would not be necessary. Sincere piety, al-Muhasibi concluded, is
more effective than the blood of the martyr. Still, the prophetic message
alone is not enough. Also necessary were living figures whose lives visi-
bly witnessed, and therefore mediated, a sense of sanctity. This, al-
Muhasibi argued, comes about by perfect adherence to the example of
the prophet who was, and is, undeniably pleasing to God. After all,
God had chosen him to be his messenger, purifying him in advance for
this noble mission.

As al-Muhasibi saw it, such figures rendered the community pleas-
ing to God, staying God’s wrath. In this sense, they shared in the
prophet’s power to intercede for the community before God. The idea
that special figures might intercede in such fashion is a highly contro-
versial but still widespread idea in Islam. It is often associated with
Sufism, a long-standing part of Islam that some reformist movements,
such as Wahhabism, violently reject. And today, within different circles
of Sufism, reformist currents see the pious figure not as intercessor be-
fore God but spiritual guide. For al-Muhasibi, they were the saved sect
the prophet had predicted. They performed their religious duties with
no regard for this world. They also avoided the satanic trap of theologi-
cal disputes and the religious paralysis it inevitably produced. He
thought of them as religious scholars of a certain kind. What they knew
was much more than the duties of religion that even the worldly
minded could study and teach. The religious scholars he had in mind
are figures who could claim to know not just the teachings of God but
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God himself (‘ulama’ bi-llah).7 He therefore called them friends of God
(awliya’ allah), exemplars of piety (dala’il al-taqwa) that protect the
community from God’s wrath, making them more than mere purveyors
of religious knowledge. For al-Muhasibi, the community’s righteous-
ness (salah al-umma) depends on the righteousness of these figures
(salah al-‘ulama’). They offer visible evidence that all is not lost: The
community is not cut off from God. For this reason, al-Muhasibi calls
them the mercy of God for the community (ula’ika rahmat allah ‘ala
l-umma), that is, human agents of God’s mercy.

In Islam, the idea that persons, not books, offer the final measure of
a community’s worth goes back to the prophet Muhammad, who is
described in the Qur’an as a mercy for the universe (rahma lil-‘alamin)
and who is known among Muslims as the beloved of God (habib allah).
Born, it is reported, in the year 570 into the tribe of Quraysh, at the
time a powerful clan of the Arabian peninsula, Muhammad received a
call from God, beginning in 610, to remind humanity of his truth. This
message Muhammad disclosed gradually, as revealed to him by the
angel Gabriel, over the course of nearly a quarter century until his death
in 632. In the face of significant opposition in Mecca from powerful
elements of his own tribe, he persevered, gathering a core band of com-
panions. With them, he would eventually emigrate to Medina at the
invitation of its leading factions to arbitrate community disputes. There
he continued to preach judgment day but also set down laws for his
community. In this fashion he sowed the seeds for a polity that would
eventually dominate the Arabian peninsula. After his death his succes-
sors, the first Muslims, would spread Islam by conquests from North
Africa and the Iberian peninsula in the west to Iran and the gates of
India in the east. The point of the conquests was neither slaughter nor
even conversion (indeed, the first Muslims set up garrison towns sepa-
rate from the local people and did not proselytize) but rather to bring
just rule to the world according to the ways of God.

For Muslims, a key moment in the life of the prophet Muhammad
was his ascension to heaven on the back of the winged steed Buraq. In
the company of the angel Gabriel, he traversed the seven heavens,



DOES THE QUR’AN BELONG IN THE BIBLE? 17

where he met past prophets and led them in prayer, finally reaching the
throne of God. From God, he received the key teachings of Islam,
especially the five core practices (the testimony of God’s oneness and of
Muhammad as his messenger, daily prayer, fasting during Ramadan,
almsgiving, and, if one is financially and physically able, pilgrimage to
Mecca once in a lifetime) and the five core beliefs (belief in the one
God, all his angels, all his messengers from Adam to Muhammad, all
the scriptures he sent, and the judgment day to come). He also received
from God divine truths (haqa’iq), which refer to the mysteries of Islam’s
spiritual life.

Muhammad’s main task, then, was to convey the Qur’an, the final
and decisive version of God’s message to humanity. The purpose of his
mission was not to establish a new religion but to restore the religion
of Abraham that had been conveyed to previous communities, Jews and
Christians, but that their leaders had distorted for the sake of their own
interests. Although Muhammad is a prophet, having conveyed God’s
message, he has another role that is very dear to Muslims. He will
intercede for them on judgment day.

This does not make him the bearer of sins or redeemer of the world
who offsets the disordered state of the human soul. Christians too rec-
ognize that believers are accountable for their actions even in light of
the good news of salvation. The Christian message of salvation does
not relieve Christians of responsibility but rather of the effects of origi-
nal sin, thereby ensuring that they are not cut off from the love of God
even when in a sinful state: Repentance is always possible. Islam has no
doctrine of original sin. Humans are susceptible to the seductions of
Satan but not in any permanent or irrefutable way. The Qur’an makes
clear what humans are to do. If one falls from the straight path, one is
simply to repent and start again with confidence in God’s mercy. That,
however, is not easily accomplished without assistance. Once one has
repented, how is one certain of being on the straight path, body and
soul? Divine favor would be in question were it not for the favor Mu-
hammad has earned with God. He can intercede for his community on
judgment day, turning the wrath of God to mercy. His body is not
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necessarily the site where believers encounter the presence of God, but
he nevertheless offers great comfort to Muslims as guarantor of the
community’s relation with God.

In this sense Muhammad is not only the bearer of a divinely revealed
book. His life also exemplifies fulfillment of its message. A hadith re-
ports that the moral character of the prophet is the Qur’an itself. In
other words, the life of the prophet is a perfect realization of the proph-
ecy, modeling for the community the message of the Qur’an. Without
him it would be impossible to understand the Qur’an fully. It is for this
reason that reports of his sayings and deeds have been collected as
model (sunna) of the Muslim way of life.

In some ways the role of Muhammad in Islam echoes that of Mary
in Christianity. There is great controversy over these two figures within
the respective traditions. Some Muslims claim that the prophet, though
human, also carries within him a divine light. In this sense, he has
always existed with God even if he appeared in history at a particular
moment in time.8 For others, such a notion is a reprehensible innova-
tion. The prophet brought the message of God, modeled it during his
lifetime, and will intercede for his community on judgment day, but
one should not exaggerate his nature the way Christians do with Jesus.
These Muslims strongly criticize those who celebrate the birthday of
the prophet Muhammad, accusing them of associating the prophet to
the godhead. Similarly, some Christians show great reverence for Mary,
seeing her to be the greatest of prophets for bearing God’s unique word
in her womb. This also makes her the greatest of intercessors for many
Christians, sharing in the redemptive work of her son. But many others
detest this devotion to Mary, seeing it as a kind of paganism. Whatever
the case, Muhammad, like Mary, birthed the message of God to the
world. Like her, he is considered immaculate, that is, without sin, and
capable of interceding for believers, helping them to stand before God
even when their actions do not merit it. Muhammad, like Mary for
Christians, helps Muslims feel close to God.

The possibility of intercession does not relieve believers of their reli-
gious obligations. Nevertheless, the prophet, even if dead in his grave
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in Medina, remains alive, caring for his community, guiding them, in-
spiring them, visiting them in their dreams or even, for the spiritually
advanced, when awake. At the same time, it has long been recognized
that certain individuals share in the mission of the prophet. By embody-
ing the character of the prophet, they, in turn, become, like him, pleas-
ing to God. They are not—no more than the prophet—associated
with the godhead but are agents of God’s purpose for humanity. They
too are intercessors for the community, by visibly witnessing the effec-
tive presence of God amidst the community. They are not mere con-
veyors of religious knowledge but instead signs that its stipulations are
fulfilled.

For al-Muhasibi, a seminal thinker in early Islam, the character of
the prophet can be represented by Muslims, at least the spiritual elite
among them, who model their lives after his, becoming, like him, a
mercy for the community. The representation of divine mercy is a pe-
rennial task. Every generation of Muslims looks for tangible signs of
piety amidst the community as evidence of its religious integrity. Mar-
tyrdom, death for God, became one way to display one’s piety, but
it received limited approval among the religious scholars, because the
intention that led martyrs to seek death could never be determined,
making the status of this form of piety highly ambiguous. Moreover, it
was never clear what spiritual benefit martyrdom offered the commu-
nity. In contrast, the case of the friends of God was straightforward.
Their holiness could be seen and measured by the impact it had on
their devotees.

With al-Muhasibi we have an early example of what would later
become a central idea in Islam, that the prophetic message is not
enough. Living proof of its fulfillment is also needed. The prophecy
speaks of God and his qualities, especially his mercy, but does not make
concord with God a forgone conclusion even for the community that
accepts it. This is left to persons of extraordinary charisma whose lives
radiate the truth of God. Such figures sharpen communal awareness of
God’s presence, encouraging greater commitment to his ways. Proph-
ecy (nubuwwa) is the necessary point of departure because it discloses
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the existence of God, but it is pointless if not fulfilled in friendship
(walaya) with God, which, for al-Muhasibi, was achieved by perfect
worship (‘ibada) free of worldly calculations.

It has been suggested that the history of Islam is one massive under-
taking to be close to God.9 Some excelled at it and modeled the experi-
ence for others. The friends of God, offering assurance that the
community is not cut off from God, have long been a spiritual consola-
tion to the community. Their piety demonstrates that divine favor re-
mains intact, visibly so. Yes, the saved sect can be known, not by
scriptural citation or theological dispute but by eyewitness, the living
exemplars of piety.

A well-known hadith states that in every generation someone will
come to renew the religion of Islam. Among the different ways of con-
ceiving this process of renewal, sainthood has been particularly promi-
nent. Until recently it was widely thought that not having a saintly
figure as focal point of one’s religious devotion was to risk eternal perdi-
tion. The idea that holiness is mediated through particular persons con-
tinues to be influential across the Muslim world, but it has been hotly
contested by reformist currents that make the individual—and individ-
ual reading of scripture—the vehicle of salvation rather than the saint.
It is now felt in many circles that holiness is a matter of personal effort.
What is the point of a spiritual intermediary? Particularly controversial
is the idea that one might make a request (material or spiritual) of the
dead saint in his tomb, awarding powers to the dead that belong only
to God.

What might seem like a healthy development to many, the rejection
of the saint’s spiritual authority, has actually been a mixed blessing for
Islam. It may grant the individual believer final authority over his reli-
gious destiny, but it can also have a destabilizing effect on Muslim
society. If the saint is rejected as guarantor of the religious integrity of
the community, the individual, every individual, becomes responsible
for the piety of Islam. Yet all are not up to the task. The printing
press, universal education, and now the Internet have made religious
knowledge widely available, but do all have the spiritual maturity to
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know how to deploy it according to God’s purposes? To be sure, the
rejection of the saint is not unwarranted. Muslims have known many a
false saint who made a business of swindling the masses by pretending
to perform miracles. Through the ages, though, even the great religious
scholars, experts in determining correct behavior, would visit the saints.
What did they find in the charisma of sainthood that they could not
find in knowledge of the prophetic heritage alone?

There have been a wide variety of saints throughout the ages, and
here it will be enough to mention one, Zindapir of Pakistan, who even
after his death in 1998 remains the centerpiece of a transnational net-
work of sanctity with thousands of devotees from all stations of life.10

For his followers, it was enough when he was alive to touch his garment
or catch sight of him and now, in his death, to receive his blessing at
his graveside or bask in the sanctity embodied in the shrine complex at
Ghamkol Sharif, to which thousands flock every year, especially at the
time of the feast day commemorating Zindapir’s death, referred to as
his marriage (‘urs) or full communion with God. It is Zindapir who
intercedes for his devotees on judgment day. It is Zindapir who saves
them because it is his holy character that attracts them to God and thus
allows them, like him, to be in the presence of God.

In this age of reformist religiosity many Muslims have come to view
this kind of devotion as deviation from Islam’s affirmation of one God
who has no partners, no helpers, who is Creator, Lord, and Judge of
all. Claims to holiness can be hollow and can be used to deceive and
abuse others. At the same time, it is historically myopic to reject a
special kind of friendship with God as violation of Islam’s monotheism.
As seen with al-Muhasibi, the idea of the friends of God—support for
which exists in the Qur’an—arose not to contest the godhead but to
offer a visible sign that the community’s relation with the one God
remained intact. This characterizes the dynamic between Zindapir and
his followers. Zindapir’s very person is a public manifestation and vivid
expression of a life that elevates the word of God above all, making
awareness of such a life available to others.

The voice of God, that is, recitation of the Qur’an, resounds
throughout the shrine complex, but again, the presence of scripture,
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though necessary, is not enough for the fulfillment of prophecy. It is
the presence of the friend of God that draws out the spiritual essences
hidden in the depths of people’s souls. People can recite scripture all
they like, but they are only making noise, voices without authority, until
the spiritual essences dormant within them are awakened, a process that
the saint makes possible. His spirituality is fully operative as displayed
in his character, and this animates the spirituality of others and inspires
them to live according to the spirit and not the body alone. In other
words, those whose inner life is still worldly in some way risk perform-
ing religious acts hypocritically. The saint, however, whose spiritual
essences are fully alive, the result of his total orientation to the other
world, brings about the spiritual transformation of those who enter his
presence. They see in him what they are to live and embody. His exis-
tence brings to life their spiritual essences, allowing them not only to
hear the divine voice of the Qur’an but also to receive it into the depths
of their souls and so more effectively live out its message in their lives.

Participation in the sanctity made possible by Zindapir is most no-
ticeable in the communal meal, a vast production that feeds thousands
of visitors to the shrine, including many poor; a year-round labor of
love organized by voluntary donations of grain and livestock as well as
time and effort. In short, it is a sacrificial meal, operating by altruistic
contribution. It offers a concrete way to participate in sanctity, a life for
God, a way to live what the saint lives. The meal, which the saint
mediates, represents a collective offering to God, service to God, a way
to experience a life in which worldly calculations are put aside. The
saint’s presence ensures that such work is more than the action of do-
gooders but a lived experience of sanctification through sacrifice. The
acts of self-sacrifice involved in the preparation of the meal take on
greater meaning in the presence of the saint, endowing them with a
quality of sanctity that they would not normally have.

In all this Zindapir is able to accomplish what religious scholars
cannot. They may have the expertise to inform Muslims of correct stan-
dards of behavior but do not necessarily inspire them to journey to God.
Absorbed in God, pleasing to God, Zindapir’s person is so imbued with
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the characteristics of godliness that his presence calls attention not to
himself but to the shadows of the names of God that reside in persons,
assigned in pre-existence and forgotten as a result of birth into this
imperfect world. A mystery (sirr) therefore exists at the depths of the
human soul, from the time of Adam whom God taught all names,
including God’s own. The task for Muslims is to realize their own
sanctity, a process that begins with the Qur’an’s revelation of the God
who created humans to bear his names (i.e., attributes) and ends in a
life of closeness to God.

Love for the saint therefore means identification with his body, not
simply as body but as visible manifestation of sanctity. This, it should
be mentioned, differs from Christian contemplation of the body of
Christ. In Islam, the saintly body may bear the marks of self-denial and
asceticism but not those of suffering. The reason, of course, is that the
prophetic heritage of Islam is not associated with priestly sacrifice, as
noted earlier. Thus the human body of the saint whose life is a fulfill-
ment of the prophetic heritage of Islam is not the site of sacrificial
offering. This is not Christian sainthood. The point is to reflect the
body of Muhammad and not that of Christ. All the same, the devotee’s
love for the saint’s spiritually marked body triggers recollection of the
true character at the core of his being. From love of the saint, who
embodies the character of the prophet, the devotee in turn is led to
identify with the prophet, engendering love for him and his body, for
it is in the body of the prophet that the purpose of the Qur’an is most
visibly manifest. From this vantage point, finally, one is in a position to
behold God, to be in his presence, with the saints and prophets. The
prophetic message proclaimed by the Qur’an initiates a process of re-
minding people of the truth of God that comes to fulfillment in saint-
hood, that is, the bodily representation of sanctity. It is for this reason
that a close associate of Zindapir can say, ‘‘Zindapir is religion. Zindapir
is Islam.’’11

This is not to exaggerate sainthood in Islam. Muslims have a sense
of being in the presence of God when performing basic religious duties.
One can attain awareness of God without a saintly model. Still, the
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saint continues to play a vital function in the community as perfect
model of holiness. As such, he or she is the best measure of sanctity
that one might not be able to realize by one’s own religious efforts.
Exemplifying a life wholly for God, the saint offers insight into the
reality of God, thereby encouraging heightened consciousness of God.
In this sense, the saint complements the basic religious duties of Islam
and models for others what they too are meant to realize.

Saints have long acted as standards of communal piety, but this is
not to say that Muslims are paralyzed by their religious shortcomings.
There are many ways to connect with God even if saints offer the best
model. Various rituals function to expiate sin (kaffara ‘an al-dhunub)
such as purity ablutions, prayer, and animal sacrifice at the close of the
pilgrimage to Mecca. Performance of these basic religious duties is the
way Muslims become pleasing to God and draw close to him. Many
Muslims do not read the Qur’an, at least not regularly, but do hear it
recited in public places. More diffusely, then, recitation of the Qur’an
in Muslim society engenders awareness of God, at funerals and mar-
riages, on the radio, amidst the buzz of business in the bazaar. The
Qur’an—divine speech—is working subtly yet pervasively to bring
about a sense of sanctification of entire communities and not only of
individuals.

The Qur’an, Islam’s scripture, exists not to be critically analyzed,
though that is important, but to be recited. It is, then, the liturgical
aspect of the Qur’an that introduces prophecy into Muslim life and
allows Muslims to orient themselves to it and to the God it reveals and
his attributes as disclosed by the Qur’an: Merciful, Forgiving, Wise,
Mighty, All-Knowing, All-Powerful, Generous, Judge, Destroyer (of
evil), and so on—ninety-nine names that describe God and that one
can identify with by recalling them in daily life. Ultimately, the goal is
identification with the God besides whom there is no other, Allah,
the name of God announced by the Qur’an as central mark of human
existence.

This can happen in quite ordinary fashion. For example, the daily
language of rural Moroccans includes frequent reference to the name of
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God, endowing all they do with an aura of sanctity.12 Every action—
eating, drinking, rising, sitting, sleeping, walking, plowing, harvesting,
buying, and selling—is initiated by invoking the name of God (bismil-
lah), signaling reliance on God, entrusting oneself and all that one does
to God, consecrating one’s life in this world to God as goal of the next.
Invoking the name of God also signals hope for God’s blessing on all
one does: material prosperity, health, contentment, and goodness. The
community aspires to a life graced by the presence of God as heralded
by his name, which can be invoked in unfamiliar and eerie places or in
the face of temptation. The power of the divine name can, then, protect
against evil—both the evil of others and of oneself. Recollection of his
name is a way to remind oneself of the purpose of existence and in turn
to be exhorted to live by it.

Other expressions imprint Muslim life with the divine name: for
example, a formula praising God, al-hamdu lillah, uttered in all condi-
tions, good and bad, joy and sorrow, as a sign of surrender to God’s
will, his divine decree, at every moment and circumstance. This is not
to suggest fatalism. Muslims do their best to achieve goals. However,
whatever the results may be, praise is due to God, whose will cannot be
opposed but must be unconditionally accepted as wise and just even
if at times obscure to human comprehension. There is a theological
conundrum here, a kind of theodicy whereby all that happens, including
apparently bad things, potentially receive the status of divine wisdom
and justice. The concern of these rural Moroccans, however, is not
theological consistency but simply acknowledgment of their created
status in a world ultimately in the hands of God.

Still other expressions impregnate Muslim life with the name of
God: petitions of forgiveness (istaghfir allah) and of protection from the
seductions of Satan (‘awzu billah min al-shaytan al-rajim), as well as
supplications to God (du‘a lillah) and imprecations against others (la‘nat
allah). Supplications accompany life’s various rites of passage—birth,
circumcision, marriage, and death—as a way to seek a blessing, the
good, from God. Imprecations act to call down a curse on others as
justly deserved punishment for transgressions suffered at their hands.
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Such formulae, though not devoid of self-serving interests, point to a
deep sense that all that is desired, and feared, in the end passes through
divine channels.

Interestingly, the majority of these Muslims do not perform the five
daily prayers prescribed by Islam. They apparently do not even frequent
the local mosque on a regular basis. There may be reasons for this. In
general, many Moroccans tie their piety to family rituals and annual
festivals more than to regular visits to the mosque. Moreover, in rural
life, it is not easy to make the demands of farming conform to the
schedule of prescribed prayers. Additionally, the rural populace of Mo-
rocco is generally illiterate and has not had the opportunity to memorize
verses from the Qur’an that constitute an integral part of the ritual
prayers. Finally, the egalitarian outlook of the Qur’an does not over-
come the deeply rooted human tendency to rank people according to
social status, even in the mosque and even during the congregational
prayer on Friday and feast days. People, however pious, will forgo reli-
gious duties that call attention to their lowly status in society. These
people, however, are successful in living piously, inscribing the scriptur-
ally enshrined name of God into their lives through various formulae.
They are thus able to color their lives with the sanctity of God perhaps
no less effectively than they would if they perfectly performed all pre-
scribed prayers. By calling on the name of God in informal but tangible
ways, these people attain salvation, that is, a life sanctified by the name
of God and a sense of being in the presence of God.

There has always been a Muslim drive for deeper awareness of God.
Over the centuries Muslims have turned directly to the Qur’an and the
names of God it discloses as a way to identify body and soul with God.
The great, perhaps greatest, scholar of Islam, an eleventh-century figure
by the name of Ghazali (died 1111), wrote about this subject. The Forty
Bases of Religion, a summary of his magnum opus, The Revival of the
Religious Sciences, treats two topics back-to-back: recitation of the
Qur’an and ceaseless recollection of God’s names.13 In discussing the
recollection of God (dhikr allah), Ghazali spoke of different levels of
attainment. The first is recollection of God on the tongue. The second
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is recollection of God in the heart, which makes recollection of God
true but may not come naturally at first, requiring a bit of effort and
concentration. The highest level is achieved when one has become so
habituated to recalling God in one’s heart that it comes naturally and
effortlessly, so much so that the act of recollection is itself no more and
all that remains in the recesses of the soul, occupying one’s heart en-
tirely, is the name of the One being recalled—namely, God. One is
cognizant only of one’s Lord, preoccupied with nothing save him. This
produces detachment from worldly concerns—a state where nothing
but God is the object of one’s longing, love, and attention. This is
possible, Ghazali avowed, because the heart is the gateway to the heav-
enly realm, constituting the site where divine lights descend on humans.
Through the heart, by its absorption in the name of God, one goes to
God and then exists in God. It is the heart, then, that becomes im-
printed by the heavenly realm (wa-ntaba‘a lahu naqsh al-malakut), and
it is in the heart that the sanctity of divinity is manifest (wa-tajalla lahu
quds al-lahut). In this graced state, one emulates only what the world
of sanctity (‘alam al-quds) makes manifest as represented by prophets,
angels, and holy spirits (al-arwah al-muqaddasa)—all this disclosed to
the heart as the fruit of ceaseless recollection of God’s name.

When it comes to religion in general, Ghazali said that recitation of
the Qur’an is the best way to imbue one’s character with the virtues of
religion. But for those who want to go to God, that is, to the world of
sanctity, ceaseless recollection of his name is best. This could be called
an intensely concentrated form of reciting the Qur’an, because, after all,
the core of the Qur’an, its quintessence as Ghazali calls it, is knowledge
of the One whose speech it is, namely God. For Ghazali, the best litany
for recalling God is ‘‘There is no god but Allah, the Living and Self-
Subsistent’’ (la ilaha illa llah al-hayyu l-qayyum).

However, for most, the transformation that such practices offer is
blocked by impurities of the heart and body as well as intellectual
doubts and excessive scruples with the external practices of the reli-
gion—its ritual and moral norms. Alas, the sanctifying illumination
offered by the Qur’an remains veiled to humanity in general. Those
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preoccupied with worldly concerns are unable to identify emotionally—
physically and spiritually—with the verses of the Qur’an. Thus, to iden-
tify with the names of God, Ghazali suggested certain techniques.
When reciting verses pertaining to divine mercy and forgiveness, one
should feel one’s heart fly with joy, and when the verses pertain to
divine wrath, one should feel faint as if dying of fright, and when men-
tion is made of God’s greatness, one should incline the head humbly,
as if beholding his majesty.

In other words, the process of encountering God is not esoteric. The
word of God is not a metaphor but real. Thus the Qur’an can have no
impact on the soul as a set of ideas about God but requires emotional
formation—schooling in spiritual affect as guided by the verbal expres-
sions (i.e., literal wordings) of prophecy. One is not sanctified by assent-
ing to the idea of the existence of God: Ghazali’s approach is not a
rational process, though neither is it irrational. Rather, sanctification
comes by joining bodily movement and emotional affect with divine
speech. The only way to have one’s character informed by divine and
not simply human wisdom is to integrate the Qur’an into one’s limbs,
one’s feelings and sentiments, one’s gut. Only through this communion
of body and soul with divine speech can one be shaped by it and so be
able to represent it in word and deed for others to see. This is Ghazali
at his best—limbs in unison with the heart, action conforming to
knowledge of God, which for Muslims is above all the soul-illuminat-
ing knowledge of the Qur’an. The path set by Ghazali, with its empha-
sis on frequent recitation of the Qur’an and recollection of the names
of God, is one that many Muslims follow today in their desire to live
in God’s presence body and soul.

All of this resonates with Christians, who seek to be with God not
simply as an idea, but viscerally, bodily, in communion with God
through the Eucharist, the body of Christ that Christians receive in
spiritual substance (not physical form). There are, of course, various
ways to experience communion with God. For Pentecostal Christians,
a direct reception of the Holy Spirit, which is the result of a personal
engagement with scripture and can result in the gift of speaking in
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tongues, is a powerful way to realize fulfillment of the Christian mes-
sage.14 This baptism in the Holy Spirit seeks to reenact in our days
what Christ’s disciples experienced at Pentecost after their last physical
encounter with Jesus. It is not, however, separate from the work of
Christ but is the fruit of Christ’s work on earth, his suffering, death,
and resurrection.

Thus, for all Christians, Jesus is the fulfillment of prophecy, making
the true presence of God known in a way that the prophets of old could
point to but not actually bring about. Knowledge of the name of God
as disclosed in the person of Jesus, called the Christ, enables Christian
awareness of the spiritual mystery they carry within their bodies that
makes them worthy to be called children of God. It is this that for
Christians reveals the true identity of God as loving father. Of course,
the basic characteristics of God’s way of dealing with humankind had
long been known before the coming of Christ. The Israelites knew him
as creator, savior, and guiding companion, but Christians believe that
the triune nature of the God of Israel was fully expressed in the work
of Jesus, a human person who also fully revealed the truth about God.
However important the Bible might be as record of the history of God’s
relation with his people, it is ultimately not the Bible but the body of
Christ that decisively mediates the Christian experience of God, though
some Christians do tend to make the Bible the primary means of living
in the presence of God. For Christians, then, it is the work of God in
Christ that fulfills the eternal covenant God made with Abraham and
through him with all peoples.

What does it mean when Christians speak of Jesus as the full expres-
sion of the triune nature of the God of Israel? At the end of the Gospel
of Matthew, Jesus commissions his disciples to go forth to all nations
to baptize in the name of the Father, Son, and Holy Spirit. The word
trinity does not occur in the Bible, but the historical experience of
God’s people, Christians believe, long made known God’s way of relat-
ing with humanity, especially as creator, savior, and guiding compan-
ion, aspects of God’s nature that were already known at the time of the
Exodus from Egypt. Speaking of God as triune, then, is not to speak
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of a plurality of gods but of a plurality in God’s eternal and essential
nature. This is a point that Muslims have trouble accepting. It is not
always easy for Christians to grasp. Is Jesus God? He was born of
human flesh and lived as other humans but was also born of God,
realizing a divinely initiated call towards his thirty-third year on earth.
His unprecedented authority, as recorded in the New Testament, at-
tracted people to him. At the core of his message was his announcement
of the kingdom of God, a reality he gradually disclosed in his own
person, culminating in his own death and resurrection as the first sign
of eternal life with God. He arose from the dead not to die again but
to be with God as his beloved son. Christians see in Christ the divine
message that they too are born for God and thus the hope that they too
will rise to be with God. Jesus, then, is human but he fully revealed the
essential will of God, and so Christians cannot understand him apart
from God or God apart from him.

Is the achievement of Christ similar to the role that saints have tradi-
tionally played in Islam? There are some fine theological distinctions to
be made. The saints of Islam, like Jesus, are agents of God’s purposes,
working to mediate the presence of God for the world. They help bring
about its salvation. However, saints come and go in every generation,
working to renew the religion. Saints in Christianity have played a simi-
lar role. But the work of Jesus is unique fulfillment of the ancient cove-
nant, sealing it once and for all by revealing God as love. Even if
Christians are entrusted with the task of continuing the work of Christ,
there is nothing more to be done to ensure the fruits of the covenant.
The cross is the guarantee of God’s eternal presence amidst his people.
The achievement of Christ eliminated once and for all the fear of hu-
miliating this relation, staining it with the disordered state of the
human soul, and bringing on the community the wrath of God, though
there are some Christians who continue to make much of the wrath of
God in explaining human misery. In this sense, Jesus Christ is God’s
unique word and therefore worthy of being called son of God.

But there is some resonance. The prophets of ancient Israel alluded
to the inability of the old covenant (i.e., the Mosaic Law) to sanctify
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the people. They also realized that all nations, not only the tribes of
Israel, were subject to God. A new dispensation was anticipated where
the laws that were meant to sanctify but invariably fell short of doing
so were to be inscribed on the hearts not only of Israelites but also of
all peoples. By introducing God’s word into the core of humanity, the
sanctity to which the Mosaic Law pointed could be achieved. Christians
see the fulfillment of this promise in Jesus Christ.

Similarly, sainthood in Islam, the idea of being close to God, so close
that he is closer than one’s own jugular vein, originates in the Qur’an.
The friend of God fulfills the promise (wa‘d) of God and wards off his
threat (wa‘id ). In imitation of the prophet, bearer of God’s final word
to humanity, the friend of God displays the piety that the Qur’an advo-
cates. In this sense, too, Islam is the fulfillment of the friendship that
God made with Abraham and through him all peoples who submit to
God. Those who walk in the way of Abraham, a person with whom
Muslims closely identify while on pilgrimage to Mecca, have no fear,
as the Qur’an says, and do not sorrow (la khawfa ‘alayhim wa-la
yahzanun).

As sainthood in Islam flows from the Qur’an, so in Christianity it
proceeds from Jesus Christ as the ongoing representation of his spirit
at work in the world. Sainthood has long been integral to Christianity,
and saints are cosaviors with Christ, working to continue what he initi-
ated. The idea that those who serve the word of God are corulers with
Christ in his heavenly kingdom is as old as the book of Revelation,
which speaks of the early martyrs as ruling with Christ in his heavenly
realm.15 Some branches of Christianity, though describing the living
members of the believing community as saints, see reverence of past
saints as a pagan practice. But to devotees, the saint, though certainly
not God, continues to disclose something about God even in death.
Christians do not remember the dead saint as word of God but do see
him or her as servant of God’s word in a very dynamic way, sharing in
its agency. The body of Christ may have restored the eternal covenant
with God that original sin had marred, but need for visible witness to
the body of Christ remains. Saints in Christianity are not simply models
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of human virtue but embody the presence of Christ, just as saints in
Islam reproduce the ethical character of the prophet Muhammad.
Through the centuries, the saints have made the spirit of Christ visible
in their own bodies for those who did not see Christ in the flesh of
Jesus. Francis of Assisi is a striking example of this, actually represent-
ing in his body the wounds of Christ as sign of salvation. Padre Pio of
Italy is a more recent example. Indeed, Jesus is reported to have said to
his disciples that those who wish to rule with him in his heavenly king-
dom will have to drink from the same cup as he. Also, as noted earlier,
some groups, such as the Pentecostals, see bodily representation of the
Holy Spirit as the work of every believer. The body of all Christians
becomes receptacle of sanctity.

In Islam, Jesus does fulfill God’s purposes but not in a unique sense.
Like other prophets, Jesus is not son but true servant of God. He does
open the door of sanctity, not as savior but as prophet who calls people
to worship of the one God alone and not of himself. Christians, of
course, do not revere Jesus as God in the sense of an independent deity,
distinct and separate from God. There are not two or three gods in
Christianity but one, that is, the one God. Rather, the divinity of Jesus
comes from his being word of God, originating in God and making the
presence of God eternally available to humankind by his sacrifice. For
Muslims, God’s word is revealed by a book, and the idea of God’s
presence being made available by the sacrifice of his son sounds odd to
Muslims for whom God’s word is revealed through books, that is, the
books brought by the prophets, above all the book brought by the
prophet Muhammad. However, for Christians, a historical witness, re-
corded in the Bible, precedes the mission of Christ. It is only in light
of this historical witness, which Muslims do not accept, that Christians
see the cross as God’s means of communicating his desire of eternal life
for humankind. In this sense, the work of Christ on the cross is the
fullest expression of God’s will. The ancient Byzantine liturgy, followed
today by many Christian Arabs, especially in Syria, speaks of God
‘‘trampling death by means of death’’ (bi-l-mawt wati’ta l-mawt). The
cross, then, is the means by which God embraces death and raises it to
himself, eliminating its hold on humanity.
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Despite varied understanding of the way in which God’s word is
revealed, Christians and Muslims alike recognize the word of God as
highest priority, preferring it over their own will. This is not to say that
Christians and Muslims never fail to live up to this ideal, but it is a
shared aspiration. They recognize that truth comes ultimately from
God. Is that enough to say they stand on common religious ground?
Do Christians and Muslims share a single will for the elevation of
God’s word above all? If so, they could not be heretics to one another.
This is possible, but honesty requires recognition of different teachings:
Jesus as unique claim for Christians and the Qur’an as unique claim for
Muslims. Christians and Muslims may share a will for truth originating
in God, but is it the same truth? Are their respective teachings so differ-
ent as to raise questions about the commonality of the truth to which
they respectively aspire? Is it possible to have a common will for truth
when the teachings about that truth are significantly different? Chris-
tians and Muslims both speak of prophecy and its fulfillment, but in
Christianity, prophecy is valid insofar as it speaks of God’s desire to
save his people. Is this also the mark of prophecy in Islam?

To be sure, neither Christians nor Muslims see themselves as rebels
against God—or at least not against the knowledge of God confirmed
by the respective traditions. This knowledge is surely not the same, but
does it share enough substance that we can speak of a common truth?
Neither Jesus nor Muhammad claimed to found a new religion. Are the
respective revelations of God so different as to nullify common ground?
They both claim to share a common end, life in God. How is this life
understood?

Such questions will be explored in the chapters that follow. The
question here is whether these two religions complement or challenge
one another. Muslims revere Jesus Christ but do not award him unique
status. That would make it difficult to introduce Muhammad into the
prophetic heritage on equal footing with all prophets. The Qur’an is
clear that no distinction is to be made between the prophets of God.
Muhammad is like Abraham . . . is like Moses . . . is like Jesus. They
collectively make up the brotherhood of prophecy with Muhammad as
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seal and the Qur’an as God’s incomparable communiqué to humanity.
The Qur’an speaks more of Jesus and Mary than of Muhammad,
though less than of Abraham and Moses. Jesus in the Qur’an is a sign
for humans and a mercy—high-ranked (wajih) in this world and the
next. He is called God’s word cast into Mary, and he is God’s spirit
blown into her to effect Jesus’s fatherless conception. Jesus, the Qur’an
says, is divinely sustained by the Holy Spirit (ruh al-qudus) and is a
wonder-worker, healing the sick and raising the dead. It also says, at
3:55, that God will put Jesus to death and then raise him to heaven. In
Islam, not Jesus but instead someone resembling him died on the cross
as Jesus was raised up to God. Jesus is destined to return to inaugurate
the end of history. Thus, it is only after battling the Antichrist that
Jesus will die and then be raised to God a second time in accordance
with the qur’anic verse.

This, however, does not make Jesus unique. The Qur’an calls him
the Christ (al-masih)—not as son of God but as son of Mary. His virgin
birth was not so different from the birth of Adam, whom God also
brought into being by blowing his spirit into his human image as fash-
ioned from clay. This equation of Adam with Christ may be why the
Qur’an makes Adam the figure to whom angels prostrate instead of
Jesus, as indicated in the opening chapter of the letter to the Hebrews.
The Qur’an is clear that God is not the Christ, Jesus son of Mary. This
would make God one of three, along with Jesus and Mary, not singular.
The point is that Jesus and Mary are pure (a hadith says that they alone
were born without sin) but are not gods—not partners with God in the
work of bringing history to its final climax, which the Qur’an, like the
New Testament, suggests is imminent. In short, the depiction of Jesus
in the Qur’an is not redeemer but prophet who calls people to the
worship of the one God as means to divine favor.

That the Qur’an speaks at all of Jesus makes it a gospel in a certain
sense even if not squaring with Christian belief.16 There were gospels
other than the four that made it into the New Testament, and Chris-
tians over the centuries have variously represented Jesus, sometimes in
ways that go well beyond the New Testament. Even the four canonical
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gospels do not convey a single depiction of Jesus Christ. Only in the
Gospel of John is he called God—and, again, not as God the Creator
but as the one who makes God fully known and undeniably present.
There are many references in the New Testament to Jesus Christ as son
of God, a title the Qur’an strongly denies. But David, anointed king of
the Israelites, was in his day called both messiah and son of God. The
title, son of God, need not suggest metaphysical stature but rather con-
notes agent of God’s plan for humanity, namely salvation. In the case
of David, this was understood in a political sense, as savior of his people
from their enemies, whereas in the case of Jesus, it took on a spiritual
sense, as savior from sin in the sense of all that separates the human
from life with God. The Gospel of Mark uses the title in this sense.
This is how the relation of Islam’s saints to God is understood, not as
God’s associates, which would be a potential threat to the singularity of
the godhead, nor as saviors, because there is no original sin in Islam,
but as agents of God’s will, making them God’s representatives, God’s
beloved.

The point is that Christianity and Islam, along with Judaism, are
about a revealed message but no less so about the possibility of fulfilling
it. There are key differences in beliefs but also commonality of purpose.
Are Christians to reject Islam simply because it appeared after Chris-
tianity, even though it shares Christianity’s ultimate purposes?17 The
book of Revelation is one example of prophecy after the coming of
Christ that made it into Christian scripture. Like John, author of Reve-
lation, Muhammad was visited by an angel and instructed to convey a
message of repentance and exhort believers to hold firm in anticipation
of the impending judgment day when belief would be vindicated and
unbelief cast down. This is not to overlook content—the Christ of the
Qur’an is not the Christ of the book of Revelation—but rather to note
that Christian communities have always been open to new reception of
the word of God even after its fulfillment in Christ. A key question, of
course, is whether Muslims can acknowledge the Christian understand-
ing of Christ without prejudice to the depiction of Christianity in the
Qur’an. This is a complicated question. It has been suggested that the
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Christians described in the Qur’an represent the beliefs of a deviant sect
at the time of the prophet Muhammad that interpreted the trinity as
three separate Gods. This sect, then, cannot be said to represent the
beliefs of all Christians at all times. As a result, it would not be right
for Muslims to take the qur’anic depiction of Christianity as warrant to
classify Christians today as polytheists.18

This is the point. Christianity and Islam have never limited them-
selves to the texts of scripture. These texts, rather, are points of depar-
ture for something much more dynamic. God’s message is about literal
wordings but also about human responses to the possibilities these
wordings hold out. Christianity and Islam are not locked in a theologi-
cal duel, as if one is to be compared with another and judged to be
better or worse by a set of criteria that invariably favors one over the
other. To compare and contrast is not the final purpose of prophecy and
may even mask its final purpose—namely, reception of the word of God
in the human heart. There is, then, some sense in looking at these two
religions through a single but refracted lens of religious plurality.

It is possible to speak of Christianity and Islam, along with rabbini-
cal Judaism, as distinct commentaries on the biblical heritage. Both
Christianity and Islam, in this sense, can be rooted in the book of
Isaiah. There, God is proclaimed to be unique, not simply one of many,
but singular, the one who alone creates and thus the one who alone is
able to save, in contrast to idols, which are not creators but themselves
created and thus unable to save on judgment day when all nations, not
just Israel, will be held to account. It is this strand of the prophetic
heritage that Islam intends to fulfill—the call to worshipful and grateful
submission to the God who is alone God, none other. By emphasizing
this strand of the biblical heritage, Islam does not rule out the impor-
tance of ritual sacrifice, but it is decidedly secondary in Muslim liturgi-
cal life, featuring chiefly at the annual feast commemorating Abraham’s
near sacrifice of his son. Rather, what stands out in Islam is prayer.
Bowing down in prayerful submission to worship the one God is the
ritual action par excellence of Islam, as modeled from Abraham to
Muhammad.
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The idea of a suffering servant, crucified on a cross as expression of
God’s will, does not make sense as the fulfillment of prophecy, at least
in terms of the strand of the biblical heritage that Islam emphasizes.
Holy people, prophets and saints, do not come into the world to be
sacrificed for the sake of expiating human sin but rather to point to
divinity as object of prayerful submission.19 They are humans, specially
chosen, who call people to God. Thus Hallaj, a controversial figure of
the ninth century who claimed to embody divine truth and was subse-
quently crucified, in his view to expiate the sins of Muslims, was not
accepted as a liturgical model—that is, a focal point of communal
prayer—in Islam. His life and death did not reflect the part of the
prophetic heritage that Islam emphasizes, prayerful worship of the
unique Creator and Lord. In Islam, there are prophets but not priests.
There are saints, whose bodies model sanctity, but not priests who of-
ficiate over a divine sacrifice as focal point of Christian worship. Be-
cause ritual sacrifice is not integral to worship in Islam, Muslims, who,
like Christians, do conceive of themselves as a worshipful people, a
people striving always to be grateful and faithful to God, nevertheless,
unlike Christians, do not describe themselves as a priestly people.

The book of Isaiah contains another strand—the suffering servant
who represents God’s chosen means of redeeming his people. He will
suffer. As agent of God’s plan to redeem his people, however, he is
divinely exalted (52:13). For the first Christians, their experience of Jesus
was prefigured in the suffering servant mentioned in Isaiah. The various
accoutrements of the old covenant—land, temple, law—all seemed to
be despoiled by foreign rule of one kind or another. It was up to God
to preserve the covenant for the sake of his holy name, and Christianity
became fulfillment of God’s promise of redeeming his people by means
of his suffering servant. It is in this sense that the crucifixion has mean-
ing for Christians as fulfillment of prophecy. Jesus is not fulfillment of
prophecy in the general sense of calling people to worship God but in
the particular sense of completing the ritual sacrifice that had failed its
purposes. This, as noted by prophets of ancient Israel such as Malachi,
only brought God’s curse on the community, risking its standing before
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God. As fulfillment of prophecy in this unique sense, Jesus Christ for
Christians is also sacrifice, fulfillment of temple sacrifice. His crucifix-
ion, as agent of sanctity, hence fulfillment of prophecy, is therefore
consistent with the biblical heritage as read by Christians.

The variant depictions of Jesus Christ in the New Testament and the
Qur’an should therefore not be taken as theological deficiency or doc-
trinal deviance, accusations that Christians and Muslims have cast at
each other over the centuries. Christians and Muslims both have a
sound biblical understanding of God as Creator and Lord of all and the
one who is mercifully present to his peoples. He is not tribal deity or
ancestral spirit within a pantheon of deities, but the one apart from
whom there is no other. However, in emphasizing different strands
of the prophetic heritage, Christianity and Islam end with different
depictions of Jesus. In both, he is agent of sanctity in his work of fulfill-
ing prophecy. But Christians do not view him simply as fulfillment of
prophecy in the sense of sainthood in Islam, that is, perfect worship of
God and corresponding manifestation of his attributes as disclosed by
the prophecy of Islam. Christians see Jesus more specifically as fulfill-
ment of biblical prophecy that calls for correct sacrifice as means of
attaining sanctity, reconciling the community to God. This makes his
crucified body, as the new temple, the focal point of worship. In Islam,
prophecy is understood not as a call to perfection of temple sacrifice but
to worship of the one God, who in the Qur’an as in the book of Isaiah
is fully proclaimed not as deity of a particular people but as the one and
only God, Creator and Lord of all, before whom submission is right
and just, exclusively, apart from any other being, and who alone can
sustain. In this sense, Jesus Christ in the Qur’an becomes a prophet like
other prophets. He calls people to worship of the one God but does not
offer his life on behalf of their sins, making it superfluous and unreason-
able to envision him as priestly victim who fulfills the laws of ritual
sacrifice.

Do the different teachings about Jesus, reflecting different concep-
tions of prophethood, make Christians and Muslims heretics to one
another? Christian and Muslim teachings, as just noted, both have a
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biblical basis, resonating with different strands of the book of Isaiah.
Thus, despite different teachings, Christians and Muslims are oriented
to the same God. This is a point noted by the Second Vatican Council
in the document titled Nostra aetate. They share a common openness
to truth that comes from the same God. They have different ways of
proceeding, different teachings, and different understandings of the
way in which truth is fulfilled, but there is common openness to truth
as revealed by the one God of Abraham.

Moreover, differences in the depiction of Jesus notwithstanding,
Christianity and Islam do operate according to similar mechanics. Both
see the biblical heritage as ongoing cycle of prophecy and sanctity: the
first a message revealing God to the people, and the second fulfillment
of the message in the community. Religion is an initiative that for both
traditions begins and ends in the one God. The point in thinking of
the pluralistic nature of the biblical heritage is not to compare Bible
and Qur’an in the hopes of finding—or teasing out—consistencies or
inconsistencies. Christians and Muslims do not understand compara-
tive exegesis as the central point of scripture. Rather, scripture, written
record of the prophetic heritage, invites believers into relation with
God. Revelation as such exists not for debate about the nature of God
but rather to open a way to be in his presence. Christians and Muslims
alike strive for this goal. Does religion as divine initiative, set in motion
by prophecy and fulfilled in sanctity, leave any room for human nature,
for human thinking, for human questions and queries, even doubts,
about the message of prophecy and teachings of the tradition? That is
the topic for the next chapter. For now, it is enough to say that proph-
ecy, recorded in scripture, is the point of departure for a life with God.
In that, the hearts of Christians and Muslims are similarly moved.

There will always be Christian-Muslim dissonance when it comes to
the literal wordings of religion, but Christians and Muslims both seek
to listen to—and be moved by—the word of God, a word that is divine
and has therefore always existed with God even before it is disclosed by
prophecy. Christians and Muslims understand the word of God to be
larger than what scripture records—it is unlimited and knows no
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bounds.20 The Qur’an, for example, declares that the sea, even if it were
ink, would not exhaust God’s words (18:109). Christians and Muslims
can therefore seek to listen to the word of God together on common
ground, even in search of a common word, but both traditions have a
preliminary condition for doing so. One must understand oneself to be
in the presence of God to hope to hear his word clearly. The word of
God may have always existed with God, but humans need prophecy to
know it, and not only prophecy but also the fulfillment of prophecy as
sign of God’s presence amidst his people. In other words, prophecy is
not the end point but rather the necessary starting point, setting in
motion a process by which humans can comprehend the ultimate reality
of God. And this process includes both communication of a message
and its fulfillment in humans (i.e., in the believing community). Posses-
sion of the message is not enough. People are needed whose piety shows
that the message engenders sanctity, demonstrating its credibility as
heavenly sent. It is this piety, humanly embodied, that mediates holi-
ness to the community, orienting it to the presence of God and thus
enabling its ongoing reception of the unbounded word of God.

Christians and Muslims have unique ways of going about this. They
have different prophetic heritages and different traditions of teachings,
but there is a common will to be in the divine presence to listen more
attentively to the inexhaustible word of God—that was, and is, and
always will be. Even if recognizing unique manifestations of God’s mes-
sage in history, Christians and Muslims do not limit the word of God
to a single time or place. It is in that idea—and not in the historical
manifestations of God’s message to the two communities—that Chris-
tians and Muslims share ground. But the common ground is not solid.
There are different understandings of the way God’s word has moved
through history. Christians and Muslims will not reach a common word
when it comes to scripture, that is, the sacred narrative each community
affirms, but can do so when it comes to the ultimate point of scripture,
that is, its fulfillment in human lives. Both communities are open to
the truth of God even if in unique ways. The question, of course, is
whether Christians and Muslims, in light of their unique claims, are
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bound to undertake this process only within the limits of their respec-
tive communities or whether in fact they share enough common ground
to witness life in God for one another as well.
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not understood to reveal the identity of God. For Shi‘ism, history got derailed from
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Daniel A. Madigan, ‘‘Saving Dominus Iesus,’’ in Learned Ignorance: An Investigation
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by James Heft, Reuven Firestone, and Omid Safi, in press.
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CAN WE TAKE?

A2007 SURVEY by the Pew Forum on Religion & Public Life in
the United States noted the increasing importance of those with

no religious membership, roughly 16 percent of the population. Inter-
estingly, most of them, 12 percent of Americans, believe in God but do
not identify with a particular religious community. It is common to
hear people claim to be spiritual but not religious. Americans have long
been independent when it comes to their personal beliefs. No outside
authority—governmental, ecclesiastical, or intellectual—should deter-
mine one’s faith outlook. But, historically, Americans have identified
with particular traditions. Why at this juncture in history is there no-
ticeable doubt about religion? John Paul II took up this issue in his 1993
encyclical, The Splendor of Truth, especially in relation to moral life:
How are we to know the truth and live by it in an age that exalts
individual freedom? Similarly, in the Muslim world, there is discussion
about some prophetic teachings that do not reflect the spirit of the age,
especially regarding the role of women in society. Does this mean that
the prophetic message as a whole is unreliable?1 In a pluralistic age,
marked by fierce battles between secularists and fundamentalists over
the nature of human existence, the question of religious doubt is part
of the rough religious terrain shared by Christians and Muslims. It is
worth mentioning, too, the serious doubts today about the secular proj-
ect, the idea that the world fares better without God. Here, however,
our inquiry will focus on religious doubt.

43
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Although we usually do not associate doubt with religion, it has
always been vital to the welfare of religion. Ultimately, doubt ensures
that religion not become reduced to a set of definitions but remain
essentially a relation—known but still mysterious. Doubt about reli-
gious teachings has existed at all times and places and in all cultures but
becomes more pronounced under certain conditions. The existence of
multiple religions, for example, challenges the idea of a single truth.
Additionally, the association of religion with violence or, alternatively,
the religious rejection of scientific discoveries can contribute to religious
skepticism. Indeed, the possibility of verifying the truth claims of reli-
gion is itself elusive. Is the message true? If we cannot respond with
certainty, why should we commit ourselves to it? People do often act
without clear knowledge. They take risks in business and policymaking.
They are ready to trust others even if they do not know them fully. But
it is also true that doubt can paralyze us, leaving us unable to act deci-
sively in the name of truth. This is true in all spheres of life but espe-
cially when it comes to action for God. We cannot see God. We can
neither prove nor disprove his existence. Do we have conclusive evi-
dence that the revelation is truly a message from him, disclosing who
he is and what he wants? We might have hopes but we also have reser-
vations. If it is not clearly true, why submit to its obligations or act on
its behalf ?

To some extent, the Qur’an can be read as a response to this kind of
doubt. Muhammad’s audience in seventh-century Arabia was diverse.
It included devotees of tribal gods whom the Qur’an called to the wor-
ship of the one God. Jews and Christians were also a targeted audience,
charged with beliefs that fell short of true monotheism.2 Evidence in
the Qur’an suggests that they hesitated to heed Muhammad’s message.
They lived happily, worshipping as their forefathers had before them.
They had their own prophetic message, namely the book, that is, the
Bible. What was the point of another? There were apparently debates
among these monotheistic Arabs about the resurrection of the body,
the existence of the hereafter, and the judgment day to come; such
themes feature prominently in the Qur’an, as if to quell doubts. These
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Jews and Christians, the Qur’an suggests, both claimed to be the saved
community, exclusively, a kind of intramonotheistic rivalry. Still, what
more was there to say about God and his ways? Muhammad would
have to produce a great sign if he hoped to be accepted.

This is exactly what Muhammad chose not to do. Because of the
Jewish and Christian skepticism about the appearance of a new message
from God, Muhammad made it clear that his was not a new message
but the true message in pristine version that had once been given to
Jews and Christians. The message of God to Moses, Jesus, and Mu-
hammad was one, the very same message given to Abraham, who, the
Qur’an notes, was neither Jew nor Christian. In response to the skep-
tics, the Qur’an claimed that the Bible had been distorted (tahrif ). Jew-
ish and Christian leaders had doctored the texts to support their
interests and authority. A clear revelation was needed to end all divi-
sions, but Muhammad was no soothsayer. He did not dabble in the
occult and was not about to make a book miraculously descend from
heaven in one piece. The truth of his message, he avowed, was plain
for all to see. Just look, the Qur’an exhorts, at the alternation of day
and night, the rain that comes down to renew the land, the nations of
the earth that come to power, decline, and fade into oblivion. Could all
this be anything but the work of a single all-powerful creator? And if
so, what would save you from him if you failed to follow his directives?
Why cry out to any other being for support and sustenance? Your idols
have no power either to harm or benefit. They will not rescue you. Your
prophets of the past were not saviors, sons of God as you claim, but only
called you to worship of the one God. Yet you distorted this message by
associating partners with God, claiming they would intercede for you,
when in fact you alone will face the consequences of your actions on
judgment day. Believe in God with gratitude!

That monotheism was not new posed a challenge for the Qur’an.
The Qur’an not infrequently mentions past messengers who had
brought word of the one God, associating Muhammad with this pro-
phetic lineage. The problem, the Qur’an notes, is that people, even if
accepting monotheism, have failed to live up to its implication—perfect
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submission to the will of the one God. Instead, they place their hopes
in figures, associated with the one God, whom they presume will pro-
tect them from his wrath. But the Qur’an is clear that God’s mercy
extends to those who repent and believe. Others risk perdition, and, the
Qur’an says, the Bible itself says so. The people in the time of Noah
were wiped out for not listening to him. Pharaoh met his fate for not
heeding the message of Moses. What further evidence was needed?
The Qur’an only confirms this. It was therefore necessary to set forth
the message once more, indeed once and for all, decisively, so that
people would live up to it, unlike the other monotheists of the day.
What is the point of the Bible if no one lives out its demands? Muham-
mad is but a warner, as the Qur’an notes, to those who ignore the
message and a herald of good news to those who give ear. It was not
for him to judge. All accounts would be settled on judgment day. He
had been sent only to convey good counsel.

This responsibility of living in acknowledgment of the one God as
Lord is a tremendous responsibility. Indeed, the Qur’an claims, when
God offered his covenant to creation, even the mountains refused to
bear it. Only the human being, foolishly, agreed to assume it. Muslims
are therefore those who shoulder the responsibility of living up to the
will of God. This idea might have applied to the first Muslims who
chose to be Muslims, but what of Muslims today born into their reli-
gion? Do they also have this responsibility? And if they do not live up
to it, are they no longer Muslim?

In 2006 the influential Muslim leader Yusuf Qaradawi caused a stir
in Morocco, a nation where the head of state is a descendant of the
prophet Muhammad and Islam is the official religion as specified in the
constitution. Qaradawi ruled that Moroccans could follow non-Muslim
(i.e., foreign) financial practices because they do not live in a country
where Islam is properly observed. In essence, he condemned an entire
nation for failing Islam and the directives of the one all-powerful God
whom none escapes on judgment day. But what happens when the
message is no longer compelling? The pious would attribute this to
people’s failure to listen to the message in full faith, preferring the al-
lurements of this world. But times change and sentiments do, too.
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God’s directives may seem reasonable at one time but not so at another.
Is one to adhere to the way of God simply because it is his command?
One need only look at the book of Deuteronomy in the Bible. Some of
its laws seem primitive and even bizarre. Are we to accept them simply
because they were revealed by God to Moses? But if we do not, do we
risk the wrath of God? Moreover, the gate of prophecy has been closed.
The prophet Muhammad is the seal. There will be no other prophets
to update the message, a belief that has caused significant problems in
Muslim relations with the Baha’i and Ahmadi communities, both of
which emerged from Islam in the nineteenth century with the claim of
new prophecy in synch with the age.

The religious tradition itself, when it grows too large, may make it
difficult to believe. Over the years, issues arise that were not treated in
the original revelation, but this does not mean they stand outside the
scope of God’s judgment. Specialists within the community study the
matter and determine a ruling believed to reflect the divine will. In
Islam, for example, photography is permitted, but some have deemed
it to be forbidden. This is also the case with dancing. Seafood can be
eaten, but some have said it is reprehensible to do so. What about
organ transplant? Gradually, God’s directives are enlarged to cover life’s
minute details. In the end, however, it becomes impossible to fulfill
them all, especially when the issues that engendered the rulings in the
first place no longer exist. Is the community at risk of losing divine
favor even when it desires to please God but cannot do so in the face
of the endless rulings associated with his will?

One option, as discussed in chapter 1, is the saintly intercessor whose
perfect piety renders the community pleasing to God. Today, however,
when democratic sentiment has left its mark on religion, there is a
strong sense that individuals are responsible for their own standing be-
fore God. This is one reason behind Qaradawi’s condemnation of Mo-
rocco, which has a long tradition of sainthood. The belief in a hierarchy
of saints, protecting the nation, remains strong in many places, but
the reformist mindset objects. There are those in Morocco who, like
Qaradawi, feel that for the nation to be credibly Muslim, the laws that
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shape its practices must be manifestly religious, not foreign. All citizens
must truly live by Islam for the nation to be Muslim. It is not enough
to rest on the laurels of saintly protectors. What happens, then, when
those who embrace the message of the Qur’an do not live up to its
teachings? The Qur’an defends itself in light of the failure of past
monotheists to live up to the demands of the Bible. And now, it would
seem, Muslims are no better. Were the suspicions of Muhammad’s au-
dience well founded? Even after the disclosure of the Qur’an, it would
appear that people are still unable to lead lives pleasing to God.

This, of course, has not been the Muslim conclusion. A well-known
hadith states that the religion will be renewed in every generation. Key
leaders, renewers, will work this out in light of new developments. The
religious heritage might be pared down, not the clear rulings of scrip-
ture, such as the prohibition of alcohol and pork or the command to
pray, but the various rulings that past specialists had derived in response
to the demands of their day but that now no longer make sense.
Abridging the heritage is one way to make it easier for Muslims to
follow the will of God and remain on his straight path. Muslims will,
once again, be able to hope for the mercy of God, reassured that they
are not humiliating the religion by failing to meet its demands.

Such a process is unfolding today, even if moving in different direc-
tions. It can cause confusion about what is incumbent on Muslims. But
the point is that new needs have cast doubt on past rulings. Can a
Muslim woman travel without male accompaniment? Can she initiate
divorce proceedings? Should a daughter receive only half her brother’s
share of the family inheritance? Can Muslims live in non-Muslim soci-
ety? Can a Muslim take out an interest-based mortgage to purchase a
home if no other means of finance are available? Is democracy appro-
priate for Muslim society even when elected officials hand down legisla-
tion at odds with Islam? Can believers shake hands with members of
the opposite sex? Can a Muslim woman marry a non-Muslim man who
is favorably disposed to Islam but has no intention of converting? These
and many other issues are under scrutiny today when the role of women
is not as it once was, when males and females mix and mingle in public
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places unregulated, when the state claims authority to define the moral
life of the nation, when Muslims and non-Muslims interact with
greater frequency and sometimes fall in love. A new era might not
require a new religion, but if religion is to be relevant, it will need to be
renewed in some fashion.

Such issues are moral quandaries—not theological ones such as the
existence of God, the immortality of the soul, or a judgment day to
come. We might assume that doubts over core doctrines pose a greater
threat to a religion, but the real challenge lies in doubts about its moral
teachings that embody the way it is concretely lived. It is actual prac-
tices, perhaps more so than creedal statements, that are the real agents
of piety, orienting the soul to God and making palpable what the doc-
trines set forth only as ideas. Doubts about practices, then, raise ques-
tions about the credibility of the religion as a whole. Pope Paul VI
issued a papal letter in 1968, Humanae vitae, that affirmed the church’s
rejection of artificial methods of birth control. It was not at the time
presented as infallible truth, though John Paul II would seem to have
raised it to such a status, but it did usher in a crisis of faith for the
church. And a crisis of faith cannot be addressed by a simple appeal to
traditions. The traditions must make sense before they are accepted as
true. Pope Benedict XVI would surely argue that Humanae vitae makes
sense to the mind but he also notes that ‘‘if traditions are all we have,
then truth has been lost. And sooner or later we will ask what in fact
traditions are for. And in that case a revolt against tradition is well
founded.’’3

One can speak of a revolt against tradition in Islam today. Why live
as Muslims of the past if it no longer makes sense to do so? Although
some think that the only way to be true to Islam is by imitating the
first Muslims, including outward forms of clothing and behavior, most
Muslims live according to the realities of contemporary life, reasonably
but with little clear relation to Islam. Are Muslims who deposit their
money in interest-bearing bank accounts sinners? Do the ethics of
Islam still make sense?

Yusuf Qaradawi is an influential voice in Sunni Islam today. An
Egyptian based in Qatar, he tries to make religion easy for Muslims
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(taysir). A parallel in Shi‘i Islam might be Muhammad Hussein Fadlul-
lah of Lebanon. Qaradawi is also controversial. Some years back, he
issued a statement recognizing the legitimacy of suicide attacks against
Israeli civilians. In October 2008 he precipitated a Sunni-Shi‘i war over
the Internet by denouncing Shi‘i missionary efforts in Sunni societies.
Also in October 2008, he vigorously condemned the attacks against the
Christians of Iraq, calling on Muslims to protect their Christian breth-
ren, who, he added, are full members of the abode of Islam with the
same rights and duties as Muslims. In short, he has two major goals:
the stability and independence of Arab lands under Muslim rule, and
adaptation of Islam to the realities in which Muslims live today. Mo-
rocco, to return to the country whose religious integrity Qaradawi ques-
tioned, is certainly in search of a vision that combines the values of the
past with the realities of the present.

In a recent book, Study of the Purposes of Shari‘a: Between Universal
Principles and Particular Texts, Qaradawi argues for balance: The partic-
ular teachings of Islam should not be blindly followed without under-
standing their rationales and purposes.4 He rejects a literal reading of
religion but also seeks to preserve a distinctly Muslim way of life. He is
conservative but recognizes the challenge of making religion relevant
today. Qaradawi claims that every ruling has a rationale. When the
rationale that inspired the ruling in the first place no longer holds, it is
right to reconsider the teaching. He criticizes literalists but also Mus-
lims who too easily take on non-Muslim ways of life.

For example, he defends the ruling that awards a daughter half of
what her brother receives of the family inheritance. This is reasonable,
he claims, though some might disagree, because the daughter receives
a dower when she marries whereas her brother will have to pay one,
offsetting the difference. In contrast, the ruling prohibiting women
from traveling without male accompaniment is no longer reasonable
because the rationale behind it no longer holds. When the ruling was
given, travel by camel was risky in strange lands where bandits were
ready to pounce. It would have been foolish to allow women to travel
alone. Today, modern means of travel reduce such safety concerns. A
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woman who travels alone to visit friends or relatives abroad has not
offended God.

One could ask whether Qaradawi has understood the rationale that
originally inspired the ruling in this last case, namely, concern for a
woman’s sexual propriety. But that is beside the point. He wants to
make it easy to be Muslim in today’s world without all the complicated
rulings of the past. This is especially true for Muslims living in non-
Muslim society. Qaradawi has argued for special allowance for Muslim
minorities to live according to non-Muslim ways, at least until things
change and it is possible to live according to Muslim ways once again.
So, for example, he teaches that Muslims in Europe can take out
interest-based mortgages to purchase their homes.

Some hold that Muslims should not even live in non-Muslim soci-
ety, basing themselves on a prophetic saying in which Muhammad ab-
solves himself of responsibility for Muslims living among non-
Muslims. This, Qaradawi contends, does not imply that Muslims are
not to live in a land where Islam does not prevail. It is important to
consider the historical context of the report—a state of war when Mus-
lims who chose to reside in enemy territory needlessly put their lives at
risk. In that day, Qaradawi argues, Muslim leaders were obliged to
compensate for the unnecessary loss of Muslim lives under their com-
mand. The rationale is not to prohibit Muslims from living in non-
Muslim society but to limit unnecessary loss of Muslim life. There is
no moral dilemma for Muslims to immigrate to non-Muslim lands at
peace with Islam—for study, to earn a living, and even to take up per-
manent residence.

All this suggests the importance of thinking more deeply about the
historical factors driving doubt about religion. Of course, today, even
aside from religion, there is doubt that the human mind can know truth
of any kind. When it comes to religion, it is often thought that one
either accepts the religion and its teachings or one does not. Indeed,
many assume that religion requires one to toe a fundamentalist life—
unquestioned adherence to the truth claims of scripture apart from what
the mind might conclude to be reasonable or unreasonable. As a result,
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those unwilling to be fundamentalist conclude that religion is not for
them, given that it requires them to deny the workings of the mind.
Hence, they opt for spirituality or a set of philosophical principles
around which to structure their life. This can be very enriching, of
course, but it can also be historically myopic. It is not a question of
doubting or not doubting, believing or not believing. Doubts, as we will
see, actually form an integral part of religion. They do not, however,
appear out of nowhere, simple products of the rational mind, but are
closely intertwined with historical developments.

For example, doubts about the literal wording of the Bible were
raised in the period leading up to the U.S. Civil War.5 It was not the
case, however, that people suddenly decided that it is unreasonable to
believe in a book claiming to represent the word of God. Rather, histor-
ical factors were at work: The increasing distaste for slavery—at least
for abolitionists—made it difficult to accept the Bible’s apparently pro-
slavery material, raising questions about its authority overall. Doubt,
then, cannot be separated from historical realities. It is not only a ques-
tion of whether the teachings of religion are believable but whether
they are believable within a particular society and its attitudes to a host
of ethical questions. Why people doubt is therefore a question for social
scientists no less than for theologians and philosophers.

There are, of course, serious struggles for the truth of religion, and
these struggles have political consequences. Many insights of modern
science, particularly the theory of evolution, have posed a serious chal-
lenge not so much to Christianity but to those branches of it that tie
religious truth wholly to a literal reading of the Bible.6 Such a reading
would suggest that the world is several thousand years old, not several
billion as science shows, or that the human being is the direct product
of divine creation without intervening (and less dignified) stages prior
to our current status as homo sapiens.

The Darwinian challenge to the truth claims of religion is real, but
battles over the teaching of evolution in U.S. public schools, ever since
the famous Scopes trial of 1925, have been as much about preserving
local control over education and its attendant values as defending reli-
gious truth per se.7 In this sense, in very American fashion, the Bible
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shields a community from outside claims to superior authority, whether
political or intellectual. Indeed, the First Amendment to the U.S. Con-
stitution that deprives the state of religious authority is not so much
a secular innovation as the will of religious communities, particularly
Baptists. Prior to independence, the persecution they experienced at the
hands of state-aligned powers, both political and ecclesiastical, led them
to embrace religious freedom as a core Christian belief to protect their
way of life from outside interference.8

Although biblically based religion can protect communities from tyr-
anny, the commitment to the inerrancy of the Bible, which took a
harder line in some Christian communities in response to the chal-
lenges of modern science, has fed into odd attempts at defending reli-
gious truth. A certain brand of Anglo-American Christianity displays a
deep yearning for the end of the world, the rapture, partly out of a need
to demonstrate the truth of the Bible. If all texts of the Bible are literally
true, including prophecies about the end of the world, it becomes vital
to realize them in history, exactly as narrated, as proof of the credibility
of the religion.

Such logic follows from a reading of ancient passages that speak of a
final battle between a righteous remnant of believers and the forces of
Satan as prelude to the return of Christ. It is a selective reading, patch-
ing together passages from books as distant in time as Ezekiel and
Revelation. In fact, a reading that pays attention to the historical and
cultural context in which these passages were formulated would con-
clude that the intent of the author is to encourage believers to trust in
the promise of God to be with them amidst the hardships they face.
Instead, a literal reading produces a militant Christianity that seeks to
encourage the modern state of Israel to battle its enemies, not out of a
concern for the Jewish people but rather as a theater on which to enact
the hoped-for Armageddon.9 By limiting religious truth to the Bible,
some Christians thus lock themselves into a choice between doubt over
the literal reading of what they view as the singular source of religious
truth and the need to find a political stage on which to enact some of
its more obscure passages—all this to demonstrate the Bible’s veracity
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in the face of modern science. The question of religious doubt, poten-
tially healthful, thus becomes perverted into a political project with po-
tentially harmful consequences. A similar process can be noted in some
circles of Islam, as discussed in chapter 4.

However, religious doubt need not beget a militant piety that would
battle all forces that question a literal reading of ancient and obscure
passages of the Bible. It also does not generally lead people to abandon
religion but rather to revise their understanding of it. Dogmatism is
challenged. The purported facts of religion are thrown into doubt. This
may encourage fideism—the acceptance of religious teachings apart
from questions the mind might raise. In general, however, skepticism
pushes believers to reconsider faith. It is not, then, simply a matter of
updating the moral teachings of religion, as noted. Indeed, this can
create new doubts about religion. The logic is as follows: If religious
teachings are acceptable only insofar as they make sense to the minds
of believers within the historical conditions in which they live, does this
not make reason the final arbiter of religious teachings, at least when it
comes to morals if not also beliefs about the world to come? Are we
not back to the position of Abu Bakr al-Razi, discussed in chapter 1,
who saw no tangible benefit in religion? If the mind determines how
we are to lead our lives, then, however much people might pray, partici-
pate in rituals, and believe in God, they still end by following the dic-
tates of their conscience in determining life’s issues. Is religion up for
grabs? If some things can change, cannot all? And if the religion itself
recognizes the role of individual conscience, does the religion have any
enduring value of its own? Religion can sometimes find itself in a
Catch-22. If it adapts to new realities, doubts are raised about the eter-
nal truth of its teachings, but if it does not adapt, doubts are raised
about its relevance.

The key question, then, is whether beliefs matter for lived reality.
Or are they only ideas that the mind either assents to or denies? And if
they only exist in the abstract, what worth do they have? Again, skepti-
cism is not just skepticism but a device for challenging the nature of
religion. This is noticeable in one of the great controversies of modern
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Christianity that pit Jesuits against Jansenists, both vigorous move-
ments within Catholicism. Skepticism had moved to the forefront of
European intellectual life beginning especially in the fifteenth and six-
teenth centuries. A significant factor was the formalization of Christian
plurality with the appearance of Protestantism. This confessional plu-
rality may have been intellectually enriching but also raised doubts
about Christian truth and the criterion for determining it—the author-
ity of the church or the authority of scripture? Where was Christian
truth to be found and, much more significantly, what set of rituals em-
bodied it? The import of the Eucharist, pillar of Christian life, was at
stake. Protestant-Catholic polemics, to say nothing of armed conflict,
were the order of the day. There was also a spike in martyrdom, death
for God, deployed as proof of one’s creed. One’s beliefs must be true if
one was willing to die for them, no? And yet people were willing to die
for different sets of beliefs. Death alone, it was concluded, was not
enough to determine religious truth.10 How, then, did religion work?
This question split seventeenth-century Catholicism along Jesuit-
Jansenist lines.

Jansenists, including the brilliant Blaise Pascal, responded to the
skeptical sentiments of the day by arguing for an understanding of reli-
gion wholly dependent on grace as divinely revealed. Human nature
had no merit in itself and thus no role in the mechanics of salvation.
The problem was not the religious tradition but the fickleness of the
human mind. One should have doubts not about religion but about the
ability of the human mind to discover truth, let alone determine it. One
either accepted the teachings or one did not, the implication being that
one was either predestined for salvation or one was not. Because reli-
gious truth was seen not as something that emerged from within the
human soul but wholly external to it (i.e., grace apart from nature), one
simply had to conform to what scripture revealed and church authorities
taught. Because human nature added nothing to religion, it was con-
cluded that those who believed were predestined to do so by God just
as those who did not were predestined for unbelief. There was no way
to work at it.
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The Jesuits, by contrast, were more optimistic about the ability of
human nature to participate in the work of redeeming grace. There was
something in the human soul, even the soul of pagans, that oriented
them to God—a longing to be in a relation with God. This longing,
once realized, would effectively counter the widespread doubts of the
day.11 In other words, there was something godly about human nature
that led one to God and was completed by one’s baptism in Christian
life. This was the position of the Council of Trent (1545–1563), which
countered the Reformation, affirming that human nature, though weak,
is by no means entirely corrupt. As a result, the state of grace is not
fixed for those whom God has chosen, but increases or decreases in
accordance with the works one performs. Is it the grace of God or the
human conscience that leads one to the good and true? The Council of
Trent implied that both have religious worth.

Jesuits and Jansenists alike sought to face the skepticism engendered
by the confessional diversity within Christianity along with the rise of
scientific thinking and the discovery and promulgation of the key skep-
tical texts of ancient Greece.12 However, in facing this skepticism, they
arrived at two very different understandings of religion. For Jansenists,
doubts were dispelled only by an uncompromising stance toward the
world and a pessimistic attitude toward human nature. Truth could be
found only in the faith and had nothing to do with the human condi-
tion. Jesuits also sought to establish certainty—not, however, by re-
course to externals alone but also to internals. They hoped to help
people discover the element within the depths of their soul—a divine
light—that would lead them to turn willingly, even longingly, to God
and religious life.

Jesuits, as a result, were much readier to compromise with the world,
more lax, some would say casuistical, when it came to moral teachings.
They saw obsession with moral probity as problematic. It could result
in irresolvable anxieties over whether one’s life was pleasing to God. It
also caused people to focus on externals alone. Anxiety over whether
the externals of one’s life conformed to religious teaching might make
one seem pious but could also blind one to the purpose of religion,
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namely, one’s own internal godliness, the divine spark within human
nature that resolves the dilemma of determining whether one is pleas-
ing to God. How could human nature not be pleasing to God if it
contained something of God? Human nature may be completed by the
grace of God but cannot be defined in opposition to it. Attention to
this inner jewel, embedded in the human soul, would animate a fully
moral life, so it was argued, where moral decision making would take on
a character at once both rational and spiritual—the human’s response to
its own godly inclinations. Are you saved and do you have anything to
do with it? Jesuits would say, as a matter of fact, yes.13

A similar story unfolded in Islam. Ghazali, the eleventh-century
scholar mentioned in chapter 1, had the lead role, but others paved the
way. The ninth and tenth centuries were a dynamic time in the history
of Islam. The Greco-Hellenistic philosophical heritage had been trans-
lated into Arabic, making the civilization of Islam heir to Aristotle no
less than to Muhammad but also challenging religion with an alterna-
tive source of knowledge. There were also divergent understandings of
Islam. Public disputation was in vogue but often ended as rhetorical
contest—sophistry, not serious discussion of religious truth. Some
countered with the claim that human reason has no place in religion
because, they avowed, it invariably leads to doubt. Only by submitting
to the literal wordings of scripture and tradition could one be a Muslim.
After all, Islam is nothing if not a lived reality—tangible piety, not
perplexing debate. Others argued that religion is not about this world
at all. They claimed that those preoccupied with moral probity as de-
fined by Islam were horribly deceived about the nature of religion. Rea-
son is sufficient guide when it comes to morals in this world.
Revelation, for its part, informs us of the immortality of the soul and
its final destiny in the next world but does not impose on us moral
burdens that do not square with reason—as if a perverse way for God
to test our obedience. The controversy raged intensely for two centuries
and still echoes in the umma today, as does the Jesuit-Jansenist contro-
versy in contemporary Christianity.

The expansion of Islam during its first centuries also contributed to
the dilemma. Muslims now lived alongside a range of peoples, diverse
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in morals and beliefs.14 These people seemed to lead reasonably virtuous
lives even without Islam. Where, then, was truth to be located? Differ-
ent solutions to the question were offered. For a tenth-century philoso-
pher by the name of Farabi, all religions were acceptable if they met
rational criteria. People cannot live by philosophical abstracts but need
particular ways of life, and religion offered that. But all religions in his
view were credible insofar as they squared with the dictates of reason.
If they met this criterion, religions other than Islam could also be legiti-
mate. This was troubling to many who saw Islam as the sole religion of
God. Moreover, his ideas ended by making philosophical reflection,
not divine revelation, the final arbiter of truth.

This line was avidly picked up by a small but influential group, the
Brethren of Purity, whose ideas caused considerable alarm in the tenth
and eleventh centuries. They felt that religious practices themselves
were antithetical to religion. Those obsessed with religiously defined
morality made the body the focus of religion—what one could or could
not do with one’s body, how one was to move it during prayer, and
specific guidelines for cleaning oneself after defecating and purifying
oneself after sexual relations or menstruation, to say nothing of norms
for commerce and finance. For the Brethren of Purity, this made a
mockery of religion, which in their view was not about the necessities
of the body or even the needs of society but instead about the elevation
of the soul to God. Religion pointed to a realm beyond this material
one, and no words, not even divine speech, could adequately represent
true reality, which is something spiritual and thus incapable of being
represented by a set of moral teachings to guide the human body. Di-
vine speech existed not for its literal wordings but to be interpreted
allegorically, to find in it a hidden meaning that would enable the soul
to return to its true spiritual origin.

The strong challenge notwithstanding, philosophy and philosophi-
cally minded spirituality could not dethrone religion entirely. But phi-
losophy did set the expectation that religion be intelligible. Attempts
were made to reconcile philosophical inquiry and religious teachings. A
little-known thinker of the tenth century, ‘Amiri, did recognize ascent



HOW MUCH GOOD NEWS CAN WE TAKE? 59

to God as the final goal of religion, but this goal, he claimed, could
be accomplished only by adhering to the teachings of shari‘a, not by
abandoning them as a distraction.15 ‘Amiri felt that the esoteric ideas of
the Brethren of Purity posed a danger to Muslim society, because it was
the moral teachings of shari‘a and not the abstract ideas of philosophy
that held society together. This did not mean that religion was to be
followed blindly but rather that it was more valuable to the welfare of
society than philosophy. Furthermore, he argued, Islam did a better job
at guiding society to happiness than other religions. ‘Amiri did much
to set the stage for Ghazali by arguing that shari‘a not only defined the
Muslim way of life but also contributed to the rational purposes of
human society, namely public order. Ghazali, we will see, went further.

The subplot to all this was a concern that Islam was not working
effectively. Muslims were not living up to the divine mandate. Even
religious leaders were corruptible, interested more in prestige at court
and influence among the populace and less in ensuring the piety of
Muslim society. The caliphate was itself ineffective, a puppet in the
hands of various warlords, unable to fulfill its role as leader of the abode
of Islam. Ghazali’s teacher, a determined theologian by the name of
Juwayni, went so far as to call for the end of the caliphate. In its place,
the sultanate, the real holder of power, should be invested with religious
authority to coerce Muslims—by persuasion or the sword—to live up
to their covenant with God. Only by political force could Muslims be
stopped from bringing humiliation on Islam by failing to live up to the
heavy responsibility that acceptance of the Qur’an had placed on them.

Ghazali was too wise to hope for a political solution to the religious
crisis of his day. But if it was not politics that would hold Muslims
together in a visible whole, what would? The city of this world had to
be abandoned for the city of heaven. Religion was not to be guaranteed
by worldly means, that is, politics. Yet Muslims still lived in this world.
Even if politics was not the answer, Ghazali was no esotericist.
Islam—if it was to be worth anything—had to be visibly manifest in
the ethical character of the community. Or were Muslims now under
the same indictment that the Qur’an had made against Jews and Chris-
tians—possessing a revealed book but not heeding it?
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Ghazali was a prolific writer. His thought is rich and complex. His
chief aim was to root the Muslim community in the heavenly city over
and above the worldly one, and so he put great emphasis on the interior
life. At the same time, he was a strong backer of the moral teachings of
Islam. His attention to the spiritual realm was in no way an abandon-
ment of lived religion, but he did realize that obsession with externals
alone could blind one to the purpose of religion. Religion, for him, was
not a metaphor to be allegorically interpreted without actually being
lived or even believed in its literal aspect, but he was equally adamant
that it could not be reduced to externals.

In his magnum opus, The Revival of the Religious Sciences, in a section
titled ‘‘Blame of Deception’’ (dhamm al-ghurur), he lists various groups
of Muslims who in his view think they are performing religion to the
fullest but have actually missed the point. He singles out two groups in
particular. First are the jurists, who spend their time issuing rulings on
one aspect or another of worldly life. People come to them for a fatwa
to resolve a trade dispute or to determine what is permitted and prohib-
ited when it comes to marriage, divorce, inheritance, and so on. The
jurists think they are working for religion by ensuring the welfare of
this world but fail to see that issuing fatwas on worldly affairs is not the
point of religion—the ultimate goal is knowledge of God. Ironically,
their preoccupation with the teachings of Islam apart from its final
purpose raises a veil between them and God.

Ghazali next berates theologians who spend their time debating the
finer points of Islam’s creeds. They exert every effort to find contradic-
tions in the positions of their sectarian opponents. They too think they
are working for religion. What could be more praiseworthy than expos-
ing the innovations of heretics and defending true doctrine? They too
miss the point. Religion is not simply eloquence of the tongue, no mat-
ter how effective in countering heresy. In the end, if not lived in the
heart, it is nothing. Whereas the jurists are obsessed with rulings on
permissible and impermissible practices, the theologians are consumed
with the wordings of faith, that is, accurate definitions of the creeds of
Islam. Both groups, then, are preoccupied with externals and fail to see
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that focus on practices and creeds without cultivation of the interior life
poses a grave danger to one’s religious welfare. It is not simply a ques-
tion of hypocrisy, going through the motions with one’s body and utter-
ing the articles of faith on one’s tongue without conviction in the heart.
Ghazali’s key concern was that the reduction of religion to factual
definitions (what he termed al-zahir, the apparent) opens the door to
doubt, given that, in the end, religious truth can never be satisfactorily
encompassed in definitions, whether legal or theological. Here is where
the skepticism of the day became part and parcel of religion, pushing
thinkers like Ghazali to see that religion is not reducible to a factual
definition. Again, he did not throw moral teachings and doctrines to
the wind but sought to reassert the importance of relation with the
divine over definition of it as the only effective antidote to skepticism.

Ghazali’s goal was ultimately pastoral. He wanted to make religion
easy, even attractive, rather than burdensome. The final goal was to get
Muslims to live the religious life, ensuring that the message of Islam
had not been sent in vain. He knew, however, that he had to get Islam
into people’s hearts for it to be embraced with enthusiasm rather than
grudgingly. To do so, to define the heart as the place where religion is
played out, he had to admit that human nature has a divine element to
it. Ghazali defended Islam as divine initiative but one in which the
human soul had a vital role and was not set aside for the simple work-
ings of God’s divine enterprise. Divine sovereignty did not contradict
human nature—or the workings of the human mind.

Reservations about religion were to be countered by the recognition
that the human spirit was divine. To be sure, it was not equal to God.
But it was divine in that it had been created by God and implanted by
him in humans as a mechanism to ensure their orientation to him.
Making the human spirit the focus of religion could effectively counter
doubt. How could humans doubt something integral to their nature?
Ghazali called this godly element of the human spirit the rational soul;
it shared in the rationality of the universe that God had created and
therefore distinguished humans from beasts, making them worthy to
be in the presence of God as capable hearers of divine speech.
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This, however, does not happen without effort. Humans have to
prepare themselves. The divine essence of the soul, Ghazali claimed,
gets cluttered with worldly concerns and attachments. All this needs to
be cleared away to ensure that the word of God not remain at the
apparent level (i.e., sayings and deeds) but penetrate to the heart. A
twofold process is necessary: first, intellectual demonstration that God
is indeed the human being’s greatest good; and, second, ascetical and
spiritual discipline to purge the soul of its worldly ambitions and false
desires until all that remains is a desire for the face of God.

Such things were hardly new in Islam. Muslim circles of piety had
long aspired to this kind of saintliness, as discussed in chapter 1. Gha-
zali, however, wanted to make this inner-oriented religiosity more
widely available by grafting it to the basic duties of Muslim life. In a
section of The Revival of the Religious Sciences titled ‘‘Wonders of the
Heart’’ (‘aja’ib al-qalb), Ghazali sums up his thinking by citing a hadith:
‘‘If it were not for the demons hovering over human hearts, people
would behold the kingdom of God.’’16 In other words, Ghazali wanted
to make sure that Muslims orient themselves to the kingdom of God
in all they do. It was for this reason that he reorganized all the branches
of religion under what he called the science of the other world (‘ilm al-
akhira), to which the heart alone has access, not the physical senses. He
thus instructed Muslims, when undertaking religious duties, to imagine
the mysteries these duties represent, so as to combine religious practice
with heavenly truths. In this way, he wanted religion to take root in the
heart.

For example, the duty to pray can be fulfilled by motions of the body
and movements of the tongue, but this is potentially hypocritical, de-
void of conviction, and thus nonsense. Ghazali taught that such exter-
nals should be accompanied by corresponding movements of the heart.
The duty to undergo ritual purification in preparation for prayer should
similarly not be confined to the parts of the body that are wiped and
washed (head, hands, feet)—one should simultaneously purify the
heart. Pilgrimage, also, is more than simply travel to Mecca so that one
might boast of performing the ultimate religious duty—that is, visiting
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the house of God. Travel must be accompanied by a heart occupied by
nothing other than the thought of being in God’s presence. Ghazali
thus emphasized the two sides of the faith: external and internal, bodily
actions and movements of the heart. Life with God was initiated by
God, by the workings of grace in external practices revealed by God
(that is, religious practices). But they would be meaningless, not only
hypocritical but also susceptible to doubts about the truth they repre-
sent, if unaccompanied by godly stirrings within.

Ghazali ceaselessly called attention to the causal relation between
the morals and beliefs of Islam and the transformative impact they have
on the soul. He referred to this as the descent of divine lights onto the
human heart, illumination of the soul, a concept beyond the ken of
both those who limit truth to God’s grace apart from human nature
and those who limit it to human nature apart from graced insight. The
one thinks only of the dictates of grace and not the human response to
it, and the other, limiting existence to material reality, loses the ability
to wonder. Ghazali’s recognition that the essence of the heart contains
a godly element means that human nature has place in religion no less
than a divinely instituted set of norms and creeds. Religion is not just
duties but also the performance of duties whereby the heart experiences
the hidden realm of the other world, beholding heavenly truths as the
prophets and saints did. This would dispel, once and for all, doubts
about truth or scruples over one’s standing before God. The evidence
needed exists in the depths of one’s soul, the door opening to the mys-
tery of relation with God.

Because the human soul contains something of God, human ratio-
nality merits a legitimate role in the religious arena. In this way, Gha-
zali brought Islam into partnership with philosophical reflection. This
did not reduce Islam to human rationality but did mean that Islam
could not be unintelligible to the human mind. For Ghazali, God’s
directives—to fast, to pray, to follow certain norms of marriage and
commerce—did not exist as test of blind obedience. They have a pur-
pose and embody a recognizable good that the human mind can dis-
cover if not wholly determine. Reason was not to be feared as
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something that would inevitably lead to doubt. Recourse to human
standards of judgment would not distort God’s will or cause people to
abandon the prophetic venture because it was demonstrable that the
rational soul—indeed the logic of the universe—is oriented to God no
less than the prophetic message of the Qur’an. In short, rationality is
no less relevant to Islam than prophecy.

This insight has tremendous import today. When it comes to reli-
gion, it is often assumed that one is either a fundamentalist or a skeptic,
that there is no third option. For Ghazali, reason no less than revelation
was religious food for the soul. He certainly did not expect Muslims
to be philosophers. In his opinion, only an elite group should pursue
philosophy. Rather, he wanted to show that the teachings of Islam are
not obscure but instead stand in harmony with universal truths and
verifiable certainties. This does recall the ideas of Farabi and the Breth-
ren of Purity, as well as other Muslim philosophers, such as Avicenna,
but it differs in one crucial respect. Ghazali did recognize the integrity
of reason, but in contrast to the philosophers he claimed that it could
not function fully apart from revelation. Such a view bears some resem-
blance to the ideas of John Paul II as spelled out in his 1998 encyclical
on the religious life of the mind, Fides et ratio. Reason is at its fullest
when it wonders, and it is religion that opens the mind to wonder.
In this sense, the conscience does not exist merely for individual self-
expression but also to be attracted to a truth greater than itself. The
heritage of Islam would happily concur.17

In various places in his magnum opus, Ghazali showed a pastoral
concern for the everyday Muslim who would have been exposed to
aspects of the intellectual conundrums of the day but would not have
possessed the scholarly expertise to respond to doubts about the credi-
bility of the prophetic message or the reliability of its transmission from
Muhammad. Perhaps it had all been made up! How could Muslims
know for certain that what was taught as Islam had actually issued from
the mouth of the prophet? Ghazali realized that study alone is not
capable of dispelling doubts, that indeed it could add to them. Knowl-
edge of the religious heritage is not enough, because, as noted, it could
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be oriented to worldly concerns. He would classify the study of shari‘a,
usually considered the heart of the religion, as a worldly rather than
otherworldly science, given that it in fact applies to the actions of be-
lievers in this world and not to the spiritual realities of the next. Also,
in his view, by identifying religion too closely with the study of religion,
people were distracted from its heavenly purpose, and this put Islam in
jeopardy. The problem was not the Muslim failure to live up to its
teachings, casting suspicion on why it had been sent in the first place.
The issue was not the revealed message, but rather that Muslims did
not perform religious duties with the otherworldly orientation that the
Qur’an had made the criterion of true religion.

Humans, to be sure, were not to save themselves. But there had
to be something in humans that enabled them to orient themselves
willingly—with the help of revealed teachings—to the other world.
Ghazali claimed that this divine mystery at the core of humans made
them worthy to receive the divine lights of sanctity (anwar ilahiyya) as
the purpose for which they had been created. Such a purpose could not
be realized if there was not something about human nature that actually
shared in heavenly being.

Ghazali, first of all, put great confidence in the rational faculty with
which humans had been endowed. The mind—if open to reasonable
discourse—begins the process of orienting the soul to a world beyond
this one. To demonstrate this, Ghazali occasionally modeled arguments
with skeptics, those who sow doubt by claiming that death is a mere
nothing (‘adam mahd).18 This, for him, was the crux of the matter. If
there is no hereafter, what is the point of religion? As noted, the science
of the next world is queen in Ghazali’s reframing of the various
branches of religious knowledge; thus shari‘a is not the purpose of reli-
gious study but simply the departure point. Awareness of the next world
is the final goal. In this schema, the mind has a key role to play, for it
brings skeptics to admit at least the possibility of the life to come. This
gives the mind a claim on Muslim obedience, because it is by the power
of the mind that people admit that what is truly of lasting value is
manifestly not something of this world; deniers of the next world could
be shown the contradictions of their own doubts.
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Ghazali asked his skeptical interlocutors a number of questions: Had
they understood something that all the prophets, saints, and sages of
the past had overlooked? Did they have proof for their denial of the
next world? Or were they only following the fashionable thinking of
the day? Did they indeed have knowledge they had independently veri-
fied or were they simply parroting things they had heard on the author-
ity of others, pseudo-philosophers, not people with real authority? Was
their denial of the eternity of the soul certain knowledge, akin to the
statement that two is greater than one? If not, if they could not irrefut-
ably demonstrate that the next world did not exist, it was wiser, indeed
logically incumbent on them, if they were intellectually honest, to give
thought to their ultimate fate. After all, even happiness in this world
requires knowledge and action, and one would not abandon efforts to
attain success in this world even if it were not certain but only possible.
Had the prophets and saints lied about what they claimed to witness?
If they were not liars, then they were truthful, making religious life a
rational option once again. Our minds direct us to avoid dangers in this
life, even when such dangers are only possible and not quite certain.
Why should the same not be true in our estimation of the things of the
next world? Indeed, if one obeys the rational faculty rather than the
baser passions of human nature, one is led to the conclusion that prepa-
ration for the next world is a truth manifestly evident to the intellect.

Because the intellect has such significance for Ghazali’s project,
demonstrating the rationality of the truth of the next world, he awarded
it religious authority. He thus permitted a measure of metaphorical
interpretation of revealed texts that would otherwise violate human ra-
tionality: for example, the verse of the Qur’an that says that God has a
hand, that is, a bodily limit, or the hadith that says that the prophet
Muhammad saw paradise on a wall. The reference to God’s hand is
merely symbolic of his might and when Muhammad said he saw para-
dise on a wall, he didn’t mean paradise literally but instead an image of
paradise he had formed in his mind. However, things in scripture that
do not violate human logic cannot be read metaphorically. Thus, be-
cause people read scripture in different ways, depending on intellectual
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acumen, it is necessary, Ghazali argued in one of his last works, to
recognize the validity of several approaches.19 For some, a literal reading
is convincing, but for others, a more intellectual reading might be in
order. A Muslim who did not attest to the literal truth of the tradition
in all its details should not, then, be threatened by takfir (condemnation
as an infidel), putting his life and property in jeopardy. To ensure
against intracommunal strife, Ghazali formulated a simple criterion for
determining fidelity to Islam. One only had to affirm that the prophet
Muhammad was not a liar, that he was truthful at some level of inter-
pretation. Those who declare that he was not a liar are safely Muslims.

Ghazali thus laid out a framework for the reconciliation of the differ-
ent sects and schools within Islam, to put a stop to the destructive
practice of takfir that threatened to tear the community apart. He too
had been object of attack. More important, in creating a framework in
which diverse readings of the Qur’an all had legitimacy, he hoped to
undercut the perception of religious division in Islam—a plurality of
contesting truths that were so serious as to cast doubts on the integrity
of the religion, leaving believers so dazed as to throw in the towel
altogether.

The divine core of the soul therefore embraces the rational faculty,
which Ghazali referred to as a light. However, this light is fully illumi-
nated (properly functioning) only when it receives the divine lights of
grace, which Ghazali called light upon light.20 In the end, all that re-
mains is the soul in communion with its divine friend, the thing to
which it is truly attracted, and for that reason Ghazali classified the
love of God as highest virtue, a love that will make performance of
religion—practices and all—effortless endeavor, even attractive, because
these practices now constitute the forum for intimacy with the divine
beloved. Love for Ghazali was not a philosophical virtue, but a mystical
one, only realizable with and in God, through the heart’s mystical ap-
propriation of divine speech, as noted in the previous chapter, especially
the names of God as disclosed by prophecy.21

In short, Ghazali was saying to Muslims, ‘‘If you want to know the
truth, model your life after the prophet.’’ The prophet not only estab-
lished Islam’s way of life but also perfectly oriented his soul to the
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next world, that is, eternity. His soul surely was detached from worldly
ambitions and thus fully capable of receiving revelation without doubts
or scruples. And the Qur’an did descend onto his heart, illuminating
his life for others to see and witness and so be convinced of the rightness
of the worship of the one God, Creator and Lord of all. The process of
dispelling doubts thus includes the human soul, the interior working of
the heart. The heart is content in its Lord when it recreates the experi-
ence of the prophet who for Muslims is known as the beloved of God,
whose soul is in intimate communion with God, and who not only
knew but also perfectly lived the way of God—shari‘a. By doing what
the prophet did, by living as he did, by embracing prophecy in all its
details, Muslims realize what he realized and see what he saw—the
divine mysteries descending into one’s heart.22

One might not be convinced of divine truth by the academic study
of religion or the various theological arguments deployed in its defense,
but how can one argue with the stirrings of the heart? The heart is the
mirror of divine mysteries. It is there that the rational soul is to enter-
tain knowledge of God—in synch with what most closely corresponds
to its true essence. Thus, in modeling oneself after the book of God,
one is fully rational, fully following the dictates of the rational faculty,
which, Ghazali noted, is the only thing that distinguishes humans from
beasts: ‘‘Those who shed from their skins their base passion and arm
themselves with the shield of shari‘a will have their hearts gladdened
by the light of divinity and their faith kindled by the light of God’s
unity.’’23

Ghazali’s final purpose was to show a necessary connection between
what Muslims did outwardly in their particular practices and what they
experienced inwardly in their deepest convictions, giving shari‘a a
meaning much more profound than mere injunction, not simply word-
ings of the law but realities of the soul, mysteries at work in the heart
and not only rulings to regulate conduct of the body. Conjoining spiri-
tual insight to the everyday ethics of Islam, Ghazali advanced a concep-
tion of shari‘a that made it attraction of the heart and not simply
obligation of the body. In this way he sought to increase the faith of
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Muslims in troubling times. By recasting shari‘a so that it operated at
both external and internal levels, he broadened the ethics of Islam.
Shari‘a included the actions entailed by religious practices: prayer, puri-
fication, pilgrimage, as well as rulings for commerce, crime, and a host
of other things. But it also touched the heart and mind, the very soul
of the human, and thus could only be true. In sum, Ghazali integrated
the two realms of Islam, the outer and the inner, more systematically
than had previously been done.

Ghazali shows us how doubt can be a fruitful part of religion. What
appears as a threat to its teachings can actually offer a way to embrace
them at a more profound—and reasonable—level. Indeed, his intellec-
tual project aimed to preserve shari‘a as the visible side of Islam and to
convince people of its truth as a worthy guide for human action. More
significantly, his appreciation for human rationality as the lynchpin of
belief made it integral to the religious project. The details of shari‘a are
not something one might come up with on one’s own, but, with Gha-
zali, there could be nothing that violated the dictates of reason. He
thus made it possible, even necessary, to introduce philosophy into the
religious sphere, even while respecting the bounds of each. He equated
the moral character of the prophet Muhammad with the four cardinal
virtues known from Greek philosophy: wisdom, courage, temperance,
and justice. How could those who claimed to be wise doubt the message
of Islam if the prophet’s character reflected the best insights of
philosophy?

This was not a clever way to reduce the ethics of Islam to philosophi-
cal ideas. For Ghazali, religion instilled an ethics beyond anything phi-
losophy might offer. For example, love is a religious, even mystical,
virtue. It thus requires the prompting of divine revelation to be fully
realized. However, that religion has more to offer than philosophy does
not mean that the teachings of Islam can violate virtues universally
acknowledged by all peoples. The rational soul may not be able to gen-
erate all truth but must be able to grasp it when it sees it: Truth is divine
but is still to be weighed in the balance of the mind. This, Ghazali
claimed, is no less true of shari‘a. Building on his intellectual predeces-
sors, Ghazali claimed that shari‘a is not simply a matter of tradition and
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precedent, to be followed whether it makes sense to the mind. He was
certainly not against the idea of precedents if backed by a rationale. It
is not enough to apply shari‘a. It must be applied with justice, that is,
reasonably and not arbitrarily. In a discussion too complex to spell out
here, Ghazali argued that there were reasons why God had given shari‘a
to Muslims. These reasons he summed up in a set of universal princi-
ples that all humans recognize as true. In other words, shari‘a in all its
details has to be sensible. It cannot be reduced to a divine test of human
obedience and cannot violate principles that the human mind recog-
nizes as true. Islam, in this view, aims to fulfill a rational purpose for
this world.

In this, Ghazali did not turn Islam into a set of abstract ideas; tangi-
ble practices served as signposts on the way to God. Rather, he aimed
to show the harmony of shari‘a with universally recognized truths. He
formulated a list of universal principles that continues to inform shari‘a
reasoning and called them the five necessities: preservation of religion,
life, progeny, intellect, and property. They are called necessities because
without them society would plunge into chaos. Thus a precedent that
opposes one of these principles poses a threat to the welfare of society,
thereby contradicting the purposes of shari‘a, making it right to over-
turn it. For example, a ruling that prohibits selling goods before actually
having them in one’s possession can be tabled if it causes hardship for
the trade of goods that are normally bought and sold before actual
production, such as fruit and vegetables. As guarantor of the common
good of Muslim society, shari‘a cannot undermine development, in-
cluding effective trade. It has been given for a purpose, the welfare of
Muslim society, and cannot be applied in a way that undermines that
purpose.

The history of doubt in both Christianity and Islam is vast and
greatly understudied. Every generation of believers has to face its
doubts. The question is how. The rise of modernity has led some Chris-
tians and Muslims to cling to literals—clear definitions of belief and
behavior—without rational inquiry into their meaning. The fear that
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doubt about the visible components of religion will lead to the aban-
donment of religion entirely tags doubt as enemy of religion. The con-
clusion is that reason has no place when it comes to the pursuit of
religion. Its application to the religious heritage will only undermine it.
The covenant with God will be something that humans define rather
than God—the warning of the Qur’an to the monotheists of its day.
Yet Ghazali—and the Jesuits after him—showed that doubt can in fact
enrich the faith without jeopardizing its core practice and beliefs, call-
ing Muslims and Christians to the wonders of the interior life through
traditional rituals. The idea of faith as a ritual activity is something the
modern mind has trouble grasping, because it is accustomed to think of
faith as assent in the mind and rituals as hollow by nature.

What do believers do with doubt? This is a central part of the com-
mon ground that Christians and Muslims share in the skeptical age in
which we live. Some place emphasis on what the religion has always
taught as fundamental to the covenant of God—for Muslims this is the
set of core practices, beliefs, and spiritual teachings that Muhammad
received during his night journey to God. Others speak of broader prin-
ciples that the Qur’an contains and that reason affirms: monotheism,
development of human civilization, and peace. Most, however, find
they need both. Whatever definition of religion individuals reach, and
today more than ever religion is the choice of individuals as much as a
tradition of ancient truths, doubt will be central to the process. The
respective Christian and Muslim response to doubt, either in fear and
trembling or in wonder and joy, will greatly influence the ongoing rele-
vancy of religion in the world. It has never been clear whether religion
is necessary for determining human welfare and the moral order neces-
sary to promote it, but it does provide people with great hope for a life
to come, and that, ironically, holds tremendous value for this world, as
we see in chapter 3.

In the end, then, the mind has a place in religion, and doubt in the
mind is not the enemy of God. The mind does not determine what the
religion is—only God can do that. In Islam, the realities that the mind
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is called to contemplate are not the abstract truths of philosophy but
the divine names the Qur’an discloses and believers can behold beyond
the material appearances of this world. For Christians, the object of
contemplation is the kingdom of God as revealed by Jesus Christ. It is
a point of human orientation and not an empirical fact to be demon-
strated in a laboratory. In this sense, religious experience is a matter of
both heart and head. That is, the religious practices that orient the
heart to God need not be seen to detract from the power of the human
mind. But to reach such a conclusion, one may have to start with
doubts, serious doubts, about religion itself, doubts that may lead one
either away from religion or to a deeper appreciation of its nature at the
core of one’s being. In the end, what can be said is that for Muslims
and for Christians, piety is not irrational. It is possible to be both devout
and thoughtful, both believer and intellectual. To be fully intellectual,
one should be entranced by what God has revealed to humankind. To
be a full believer, the workings of the mind should be completely opera-
tive. This, significantly, does not mean reducing religion to esoteric
ideas. In this, Ghazali’s musings have import for questions of religion
and reason in our own day. Doubt is integral to religion. It can chal-
lenge it to refine its message in response to shifts in society. More
significantly, it shows that religion is not properly a set of definitions,
legal or theological, because such definitions are never completely satis-
fying, but is more exactly understood as a deposit of relations that are
revealed but never fully describable in words or deeds, even if those too
are part of it.
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C H A P T E R T H R E E

THE FACE OF GOD

A Social Good?

HEAVEN AND HELL have long featured in the Christian-Muslim
imagination. Satan is no less real than God. However, although

religious teachings are meant to guide one to a happy outcome in the
hereafter, there are reservations about making final statements on the
status of souls in the life to come. The church does on occasion declare
someone a saint. In addition, some Christians maintain that they alone
are saved, a matter that God has determined in advance. Some Muslims
avow that Islam has a monopoly on salvation, leaving non-Muslims
outside God’s mercy. In general, however, Christians and Muslims
admit that such matters lie beyond human control. It is God who
judges. But it is also God who loves his creation and regards it with
mercy. In the end, Christians and Muslims recognize that the fate of
souls, including sinners, is not ours to decide.

Still, there are clear teachings about wrong and right. There is, of
course, diversity and disagreement, but there are also long-standing po-
sitions on marriage, care for the poor, and norms of worship, to name
only a handful of issues. Is God’s revelation solely about laws, to follow
or disobey? And what determines the truth of God’s ways? For Chris-
tians, there is the Bible, but there is also natural law. For Muslims,
there is the Qur’an, but scripture alone does not determine the appro-
priate ruling for every situation. For that, a host of other jurisprudential
tools exist, including the precedent of the prophet, the consensus of the
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community, local custom, and even what religious scholars deem best
in a given context. Indeed, for every clear ruling there is also a dispensa-
tion if the situation warrants it. A pregnant woman is dispensed from
the obligation to fast during Ramadan, and Muslims are permitted to
eat carrion (i.e., the flesh of dead animals) in time of famine. In other
words, reality is also a factor in determining the will of God.

In the end, a greater ethic lies beyond all the teachings. Christians
aim to live in the love of God, Muslims in the mercy of God. This does
not mean that believers are relieved of moral responsibilities toward
fellow creatures and toward society in general. Rather, the love and
mercy of God point to the purpose of religious teachings, namely, en-
counter with the face of God.

Does this encounter have a contribution to make to the welfare of
society or does it apply only to the world to come when believers behold
God in his full glory? When it comes to prosperity in this world, we
look to politics and economics to explain how things work and how
they might be improved. The face of God, for some, represents an
artistic possibility, an icon disclosing divine transcendence in familiar
form. Others see it as a focal point for religious contemplation, a way
to draw closer to God. But we do not take it into account when consid-
ering matters of this world.

Does the face of God have ethical import that might make it relevant
for the sustainability of human societies? We often assume that the way
we interact with others in society (right and wrong, including punish-
ments for transgressing the rights of others) is the state’s to define. The
state exists to keep the peace; it has a role in regulating the economy if
not actually intervening in it; it has a monopoly on the legitimate use
of force, because the results are invariably disastrous when individuals
take the law into their own hands. Some claim that the state also has a
religious purpose, a matter considered in chapter 5. Here the question
is one of ethics, that is, the values by which a society exists. What is the
source of our ethics? If we say it is the state, we are assuming that a
nation’s prosperity, including its ethics, is the work of political institu-
tions alone. Moreover, making the state the source of our ethics also
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affects the way we view ourselves. It suggests that all authority, and
therefore all meaning, is secular in origin.

That all ethics is not secular (i.e., cannot be handed over to the state)
does not mean that religion is to fill the gap, especially in pluralistic
societies. Awarding the state the authority to define the ethics of society
can be dangerous, however. It risks reducing the core of our being to a
political definition, namely citizenship; the human spirit is too complex
to be reduced to a set of definitions to be translated into state policies
governing society. There is always something about the human being,
both good and bad, that cannot be so reduced, cannot be made the
object of state law. In other words, the human being is part mystery.
This might be called the inner life, which, depending on its quality, can
lead people to do things their conscience tells them are wrong but that
the state has not explicitly prohibited, just as it can lead them to do
things for the sake of others, acts of kindness, that the state does not
require of them. By relying too much on the state to monitor the ethics
of society, we lose sight of this fundamental part of our human
constitution.

Moreover, by leaving ethics to the state to define, because, after all,
it represents us, we assume that care for society is not our responsibility.
Why aren’t they doing more about poverty? Why have they so misman-
aged our relations with other nations? To be sure, watchdog groups,
including the press, keep political authorities honest. But another mat-
ter is in play. We are easily seduced into thinking that we are not bound
by ethical limits in areas not regulated by the state. This type of think-
ing is disastrous for societies and economies. Indeed, it lies behind the
current financial crisis with roots in a host of banking practices, such as
subprime (or predatory) lending, that are ultimately parasitical. Such
practices, however, are not the work of hardened criminals but of repu-
table bankers and many others who break no laws—and therefore, in
their minds, operate ethically—but are still led by a greed that has re-
cently devastated the national and international economy.

The point is that legal definitions and laws are not enough because
they are easily twisted for self-serving purposes at odds with the intent
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of the law, which is to protect the common good. Reducing the human
condition to a set of state-regulated definitions causes us to forget that
we are not primarily about definitions but about relations—with oth-
ers—and that these relations have claims over us irrespective of society’s
laws. The state is not enough to ensure the welfare of society—
character is also needed. Our conscience tells us what is right and
wrong. We are not moral imbeciles by nature, and yet we fail to do right
and choose to do wrong, sometimes with little remorse. The corporate
scandals of recent years bear this out, Enron being only the most cele-
brated of many cases. Well-educated men and women with tremendous
resources of their own thought nothing of destroying the lives of others.

Thus, though the democratic state effectively ensures a people’s aspi-
rations and vital needs, other elements go into the ethics and welfare of
society. Christianity and Islam both affirm this, especially in the atten-
tion they pay to the character of the human soul alongside legal norms.
Character is understood as the fruit not merely of keeping to the law
but of one’s inner life. Spirituality therefore has import for the ethics of
society, helping bring about harmonious relations with others, whether
human or divine—or even animal or mineral.

There are different kinds of spirituality, some nontheist. To speak of
spirituality as an encounter with the face of God is to speak of only one
kind of spirituality, based on God’s revelation of himself and therefore
common to Christians and Muslims. All spirituality, if true, speaks of
harmonious relations with others and with the universe entire. More-
over, secular spirituality is not entirely unlike its theistic counterpart but
also requires a critical and questioning detachment from the world and
its ways.1 Spirituality, though, is never in the end a wholly secular con-
cept. A spiritual way of life can be achieved without revelation of a
kingdom to come, but revelation does set the bar in refusing to take
this world as final end in preference for transcendental meaning. There
is much reflection to be done if we hope to consider spirituality in a
world that contains not only the spirituality of theists of varied stripes
but also of equally diverse nontheists. William James, pioneer in the
psychology of religion, saw ethics as the fruit of the religious experience,
and that will guide our discussion of the face of God here.
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Does awareness of God in the human psyche have an impact on our
ethical horizons? All cultures, history suggests, have equal amounts of
good and bad. The ethical fruit that comes from encounter with the
face of God may be as much possibility as reality. But the troubling
absence of ethical sensibility in public life, from leaders on down, com-
pels us to look beyond this world in the hope of finding ethical mean-
ing. Some call it the kingdom of God. Indeed, that is the heart of
Jesus’s teachings, especially in the Gospel of Matthew. It is a kingdom
that is not of this world and yet, ironically, exists in our midst. There
have been many interpretations of the heavenly kingdom and many
thoughts about how to make it visible in this world—through prayer
and missionary work, by serving the weakest members of society, by
looking at catastrophes, whether natural or manmade, as signs of the
end times and God’s millennial rule. Of the many parables Jesus uses
to describe the kingdom of God, one of the most compelling is that of
the mustard seed, which is the smallest of seeds but has the potential
to grow into a large bush. In other words, the cultivation of ethical
dispositions in the depths of the soul, even if not apparent to others,
can bear much fruit in our interactions with others. The good of society,
then, is staked not merely on the existence of standards of right and
wrong but also on the possession of enough character to adhere to
them.

To be sure, all states of the soul are not the same. The encounter
with God can lead some to disdain or even terrorize others. Theological
definitions are therefore necessary to ensure that the spirit at work in
one’s religious life is truly godly. But whether a believer’s comportment
is consistent with religious teachings, the ethical agent is not knowledge
of the law but awareness of God in the psyche. For Christians and
Muslims, this spiritual awareness, if properly cultivated, generates an
expansive ethics that embraces not only those dear to us (family, friends,
fellow believers) but all we meet, including those we do business with
and even those we despise.

Spirituality, in this sense, can contribute to the sustainability of soci-
ety in allowing us to be with others in ethically harmonious ways. Is
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this merely a nice idea? A series of conversations I had in 2008 with
members of the Butshishiyya, a spiritual brotherhood based in Mo-
rocco, suggests that spirituality does have practical import for society.
As a leading member of the brotherhood put it, spirituality teaches you
humility.2 It reduces egoism, which facilitates your ability to enjoy good
relations with your neighbor and with all people. Because you live for
the face of God, he explained, you do not feel resentment toward oth-
ers, and this reduces conflict in society. Indeed, it makes you more
aware and tolerant of others, regardless of creed. That all have their
origin in God makes it possible to embrace them even while committed
to the specific teachings of Islam. Another member noted that he had
never been able to live up to Islam’s teachings until he joined the broth-
erhood and took on its spiritual way.3 Employed in Morocco’s judicial
system, he mentioned that this spirituality gave him peace of soul,
allowing him to detach from the world’s temptations. Although fully in
the world, including circles of government, he is not tempted to take
advantage of a situation for his own interest. He does not live for him-
self. And this, he concluded, has had great benefit in his family life and
in his relations with others. Spirituality, in this sense, fosters a detach-
ment from the ways of the world but, ironically, allows for richer en-
gagement with it.

Spirituality, then, does not necessarily add to standards of right and
wrong but can encourage inner dispositions that make it less difficult
to adhere to them. It is not enough to know a system of ethics. One
must find a way to live it. A society in which self-regard is the norm
risks extinction. Can spirituality play a positive role in commerce and
business? Material interests stand at the heart of business, and hard
decisions are sometimes made, but business breaks down without the
trust that others hold to a system of ethics and do not simply maximize
short-term gains at all costs. This is not only a matter of adhering to
the norms of a contract but also of doing right by others even in areas
not mentioned in the contract. Without a sense of decency, a city, no
matter its resources, has no future. Spirituality is not a call to live in
isolation but rather to live in the world with a measure of freedom from
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it. It can therefore encourage us to limit or even forgo our own interests
for the sake of honest and ultimately prosperous relations with others.

We do not need revelation to know right from wrong, but it may
expand our ethical horizons beyond what the state requires or even
beyond what our mind determines on its own. The prophet Micah of
ancient Israel spoke of acting justly, loving mercy, and walking humbly
with God (6:8). This requires knowledge and awareness of God. The
perception of the transcendent can engender a healthy freedom from
the standards of this world. Such detachment from possessions, pres-
tige, and power does not mean suspension of worldly activities, but
instead sacrifice of one’s attachment to them for the sake of a positive
relation with God.

Do Christians and Muslims pray to the same God? The Second
Vatican Council, in a document known as Nostra aetate, suggests that
they do. But do they conceive of God in the same way with the same
characteristics? In one sense, the question is beyond verification. De-
spite theological definitions within the respective traditions, it is impos-
sible to define with precision the way Christians and Muslims each
encounter the face of God. Such is the nature of spirituality. Notwith-
standing potential differences in the Christian-Muslim image of God,
it is still to be asked: Does the encounter with the face of God bear
similar ethical fruit, namely, enhanced capacity to act justly, love mercy,
and walk humbly with God?

In contrast to the state, religion questions not only the actions and
intent of the wrongdoer but also the state of his soul. In this sense,
wrongdoing is viewed not only as infraction of the law but more pro-
foundly as a failure to trust in God entirely as ultimate source of well-
being. From this viewpoint, religion would say that because the pres-
ence of God is unlimited, we should be oriented to God at all times,
and this unrestricted consciousness of God bears ethical fruit: humility,
self-control if not self-denial, and the freedom to give from our want as
well as from our bounty. This awareness of the presence of God at all
times begets a shift in attitude from self-regard to altruistic attentive-
ness to others.
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Such an outcome is not guaranteed and depends on a host of other
factors. People, Christians and Muslims, have taken the presence of
God in their midst as warrant to attack others judged to be God’s ene-
mies. This makes it all the more urgent to understand the theological
dimension of religious experience. What is the theological outlook that
makes encounter with the transcendent a source of violence? We con-
sider that question in chapter 4. Here, spiritual awareness suggests a
human purpose in living for God and not for one’s own standing, repu-
tation, possessions, and pride; one willingly sacrifices such things for
the face of God. From a psychological viewpoint, the ego may need to
be nurtured as part of the process of human development, but from the
spiritual viewpoint, it is ultimately to be overcome and transcended as
by-product of belief in God. This, in turn, transforms the way we view
and deal with others. We are willing to make sacrifices for the sake of a
heavenly reward, which can be experienced in this life no less than the
next. It is, ironically, the poor who are custodians of blessings that the
rich receive in caring for them. By sacrificing for others, we express a
love for God. This is captured in Jesus’s teaching that what we do for
others, especially the least among us, we actually do for him. It is also
captured in the words of a fourteenth-century Muslim scholar, Ibn
Qayyim al-Jawziyya, who understood sacrifice as patient adherence to
the will of God. His point is that believers sacrifice for the sake of a
relation with God. This idea in Islam has its origins in the prophet
Muhammad who, though maligned and attacked by the tribal leaders
of Mecca, displayed a willingness to forgo a just retribution for the sake
of peace in society. Was this simply an astute strategy to win over his
adversaries or the mark of a man whose character was formed by a deep
awareness of the presence of God?

Spirituality has import for the welfare of society because it reduces
greed—greed for prestige and property, which generates conflict and
endangers society, to say nothing of increasing the desire for revenge.
The deleterious impact of greed on society has been noticed as far back
as ancient Greece.4 We are familiar with the concept of secondhand
smoke. Billions of dollars have been handed over by tobacco companies
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to nonsmokers. We are not yet familiar with the concept of secondhand
greed. Banks recklessly extended lines of credit, allowing people to live
beyond their means. The accumulated debt hurts the fiscal health of
the nation, adversely affecting those who live within their means. Is it
not reasonable to oblige banks to hand over billions of dollars for harm-
ing the welfare of those who live moderately but have suffered from
secondhand greed?

The link between spirituality and ethics is made in the Sermon on
the Mount, in which Jesus, herald of God’s presence, exhorts his listen-
ers to something beyond simple adherence to the law. It was not his
intention to abolish the law but to point to an ethics of the spirit that
could enhance understanding of it. The human soul, aware of being in
the divine presence, will refrain not merely from murder and divorce
but even from anger and lust. This idea is found in a well-known hadith
in which the prophet Muhammad says, when asked about the essence
of Islam, ‘‘Don’t become angry [and, the exegetes add, paradise is
yours].’’ How else might one endure attacks against one’s standing in
this world with equanimity if not by cleaving one’s whole life to God
in the hope of encountering him in a life to come? Restraining anger
here is not a matter of stoic indifference, that is, the mind’s conquest of
the soul’s baser passions, but readiness to sacrifice worldly inclinations,
counted as little next to the face of God as object of one’s true desire.
As the Qur’an notes, ‘‘You will not attain righteousness until you sacri-
fice what you love’’ (3:92). Ethics here is not simply about everyone
getting their due but unique by-product of living in the presence of
God.

How does one live in the presence of God? What is the image of
God that makes it possible to live in his presence? The Bible at times
talks of God’s wrath and his displeasure with his chosen people but also
of his loving kindness and unshakeable commitment to his covenant
with them. They may go astray, risking his anger, but he always seeks
them out, enticing them back to him. For Christians, this notion was
fulfilled in the person of Jesus Christ who, as Paul says in his letter to
the Colossians, reconciled all creation to God by the blood of the cross.
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This gives Christians the confidence that they will never be deprived of
the presence of God, but it does not do away with the need to repent
for wrongdoing—confession, penance, making amends, and so on.
Christianity may say that hell has no hold on humanity but has not
done away with the idea altogether. The fate of sinners on judgment
day looms large in Christian art of the past even if less so now.

God is described in the Qur’an as having ascended his throne. He is
positioned to command right and forbid wrong, that is, to promulgate
his way of life, shari‘a, for those who submit to him. The Qur’an also
mentions the face of God: majestic, ennobling, and omnipresent.
Wherever one turns, there is the face of God. Indeed, it is the sole
reality—all perishes save the face of God. It is also closely associated
with acts of giving and sacrifice—feeding the poor for the face of God,
enduring patiently out of a desire for the face of God. Here, giving is
not merely a charitable stratagem but an act of mercy performed for
God. Does the face of God as depicted in the Qur’an correspond to the
divine countenance that Christians behold in Jesus Christ—merciful
and kind, self-sacrificing, edifying, consoling, transformative, loving?

Muslims do not speak of God as father.5 Some might conclude from
this that they do not have a sense of being in God’s presence that the
image of a loving father would trigger. It is certainly human to feel
guilty at times. Do Muslims experience God as source of guilt? All
kinds of believers do at times, and nonbelievers are by no means free of
feelings of guilt. Do Muslims feel beloved by God, totally and deci-
sively? Does their image of God evoke a sense of being beloved by him?
Or do they feel they always come up short in the effort to please him?
They may not speak of God as father, and some Muslim leaders may
be more inclined to speak of humans loving God rather than God lov-
ing humans, but Muslims do have the religious resources not only to
stand in the presence of God but also to feel touched by his love. Is this
unconditional love? Or does it depend on perfect obedience to his will?
Do certain persons act as objects of God’s loving gaze on behalf of the
rest of the community—akin to what Christians see in Jesus Christ?
Indeed, there is one person, the prophet Muhammad. He is not God’s
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son, but Muslims do call him God’s beloved (habib allah). Does he,
then, model for Muslims what it means to be so beloved?

Some Muslims, though experiencing God’s presence, would like a
clearer definition of that presence in terms of love. In a meeting be-
tween Muslims and Catholics in Rome in November 2008, Muslim
participants noted that God’s love, originating principle of the universe,
precedes the love humans have for him. They also cited a hadith that
God’s merciful love for humanity is greater than a mother’s love for her
child.

God for Muslims is no abstract concept but is known by ninety-nine
names, descriptors of his divinity as revealed by the Qur’an: Kind, Just,
Wise, Affectionate, Creator, Compeller, Destroyer, Strong, Knowing,
Living, Self-Subsistent, the One who gives life, who puts to death, and
who will raise humans to life again on judgment day, and so on. Despite
the fact that loving (muhibb) is not one of the ninety-nine names, Mus-
lims, as noted, would associate it with his primary quality as merciful.
The most common name given to God is in fact merciful (rahman),
functioning almost as his proper name. God, the Qur’an attests, has
ordained mercy for himself (6:12, 6:54), and one of the most common
double-descriptions of God in the Qur’an is forgiving compassionate
(ghafur rahim). Muslims do not know God as distant or merely tran-
scendent but, through his names, tangibly close—a face at once majestic
and beautiful. This diversely described face of God, poking into history
through the Qur’an, is meant to attract the attention of Muslims at all
times and places. God’s names evoke an unmistakable, palpable sense
of being in his presence, and this is reinforced by a well-known hadith:
‘‘Worship God as if you see him, and if you do not see him, know that
he sees you.’’

Ghazali, the eleventh-century Muslim scholar mentioned in earlier
chapters, includes a section on the love of God in his magnum opus,
The Revival of the Religious Sciences. In speaking of the love of God
(mahabbat allah), he means both the love of humans for God and God’s
love for them. He does not point to a decisive act of love on God’s part
as Christians see in the cross but rather focuses on the idea of loving
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God as the greatest of human pleasures and the beauty of God as the
basis of all beauty.

This recalls the thought of Bernard of Clairvaux, the twelfth-century
monk and doctor of the church. In his famous commentary on the Song
of Songs, Bernard characterized all human love, above all the love of
married couples, as a metaphor for real love—namely, the love between
the soul and its divine lover. Human love, then, which seems real, is
actually the metaphor and divine love the reality. For Ghazali too, God
was the only reality and therefore the only object worthy of our love.
And so knowledge of God, if it is true, inevitably leads to love of him.
He is beautiful and all beauty is only a reflection of his beauty. A parallel
to this theological view of beauty in contemporary Islam is evident in
the writings of Farid al-Ansari of Morocco. It is this that attracts the
human soul to him—godly beauty—as embodied in the character of
prophets, saints, and the righteous, who enkindle in others a desire to
be similarly godly.

Ghazali’s point is that we love others for their inner character and
the relation it bears to God’s character. We see them as kind (muhsin),
and we are drawn to their kindness, even if not recipient of it, because
it is beautiful in itself. This idea of kindness (ihsan), it should be noted,
is self-consciously acknowledged by Muslims as the peak of Islam’s
ethical system and perfection of its morality. In Christianity, it is the
third of the theological virtues, along with faith and hope. Kindness,
then, in both Islam and Christianity, is that virtue achieved only
through awareness of God, unlike other virtues, such as justice, which
humans know apart from the revelation of God’s face. This, of course,
does not mean that only believers can be kind, but rather that the dis-
closure of a world to come makes kindness in this one a divine mandate.

Ghazali, though speaking of the beauty of kindness as witnessed in
others, affirms that this kindness originates in God as the final cause of
all kindness. And so it is through the expression of kindness by crea-
tures in this world that we can know God and be drawn to him in the
other world as the origin of all kindness. What we believe to be attrac-
tion to the kindness we see in the character of others is actually attrac-
tion to God. Ghazali even went so far as to criticize those who love
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God out of hope for paradise or fear of hell. God is sufficiently attrac-
tive, even perfectly so, without such incentives. Those who realize this
are able to see God in this world indirectly (i.e., through creatures
whose character traits reflect his attributes) and will behold God di-
rectly in the next world. These are the pure-hearted, whose faces will
manifest divine truth (haqq) on judgment day, or, as Paul wrote in his
second letter to the Corinthians, ‘‘with faces unveiled, we all reflect the
image of the Lord’s glory as in a mirror.’’

All of this assumes that one has conformed oneself to God and his
ways. Does this differ from the Christian notion that God comes to
humans, even before compliance with his ways, clothing himself in hu-
manity so as to be with humanity without prior condition? The Qur’an
says that God took Abraham as his friend, that is, God initiated the
relation of affection. Christians and Muslims both affirm religious prac-
tices as a way to open the mind to the presence of God. There must be
awareness of God’s self-revelation for God to do what he intends to do,
that is, be with humanity. This is where Ghazali shifts to God’s love
for humans. God, he says, calls people to companionship with him and
hastens to love them. Indeed, God implanted his light in the hearts of
those who long for him, creating the necessary condition in them by
which they might turn to him and he come to them.

To be sure, Ghazali was thinking of spiritual masters. This is also
true of the ninth-century figure, al-Muhasibi, who wrote a short work,
Aiming to Return to God, in which he stated that evidence of God’s love
for humans can be found in those figures whose entire lives are ordered
by the presence of God. To Ghazali it made sense that some are closer
to God, not in physical location but in spiritual character. They are
more aware of God’s presence and more fully conform to it. This spiri-
tual hierarchy notwithstanding, God has created something in all
human hearts that longs for his favor, making humans worthy object of
God’s love and delight, such that God might gaze on them, Ghazali
wrote, as a tender compassionate mother (walida shafiqa rafiqa)—in
echo of the hadith that God’s mercy is greater than a mother’s compas-
sion for her child. The world, then, is part of God’s merciful self-
contemplation, and the human constitutes a focal point of his gaze.
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This dynamic may be fully realized only after humans attain a character
that adequately reflects God’s gaze, but the point is that God’s gaze is
there and humans are its object. God, then, is the originator of love.
He entices humans by the pleasure of intimacy with him, occasionally
lifting the veil between them and him, disclosing knowledge of himself
to attract their attention. God’s love for his servants is expressed in his
drawing them close to himself, which, Ghazali claims, he does by driv-
ing away their worldly preoccupations, purifying their interior state
from the muddiness of this world, and lifting the veil from their heart,
so that they might see him.

The omnipresence of God’s face means that the ethics of Islam is
not limited to the dictates of law but expands to include kindness to all
(ihsan). How could one be anything but kind to others if aware of being
in the presence of God at all times? And this is echoed in the Qur’an’s
description of the prophet Muhammad as a mercy for the universe
(rahma lil-‘alamin). But what does God think about sinners? Does he
not hate them? Are they not objects of his wrath? Or does he love
them too, as Christians understand God to love sinners no less than
the righteous? The Qur’an describes God as loving the kind, pure, just,
and patient, and not loving transgressors, wrongdoers, the proud and
arrogant, unbelievers, the wasteful, and those who sow corruption on
earth. It would seem that God’s love is partial and conditional. Still,
the Christian notion of God’s love for sinners is meant as a spur to
their conversion and not encouragement to persist in sin. Given that,
as Muslim theologians maintain, God is not affected by human sin, it
might be best to take the references to his not loving the sinful not as a
limitation of his mercy but as inducement to repent. And God is him-
self ready to initiate the process of repentance, as signaled in the de-
scription of God in the Qur’an as the one who in his compassion turns
to humans (tawwab rahim), ‘‘Thus did God turn to them so that they
might repent. Indeed God is oft-turning and merciful’’ (9:118).

It is common to think of Islam in terms of laws and punishment
for transgressing them—shari‘a justice. For many Muslims, Islam is
about personal devotions, communal prayer, fasting during Ramadan,
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pilgrimage to Mecca, celebrations on feast days, and certain rites at
marriage and death. But religion is also about the ability to endure,
sacrifice, even suffer, for the sake of God, even to the point where the
concept of enemy is no longer a reality and all is viewed through a
single lens of kindness: ‘‘Don’t become angry (and paradise is yours).’’
The Qur’an calls for kindly dealing with one’s enemies (60:7). Similarly,
the Sermon on the Mount in the Gospel of Matthew expands the goal
of religion beyond mere justice to include the endurance of sufferings
of every kind for the sake of Jesus, the Christian face of God. Is one
willing to suffer for the sake of the good and beautiful?

A spiritually enhanced ethics does not do away with the basic teach-
ings of the faith. Jesus came to fulfill the law, not do away with it. In
Islam, the basic system of morality could be described as a tightly regu-
lated economy of rights (huquq) owed to others, to God, and even to
oneself. God has the right to be worshipped, as embodied in various
ritual duties, but has also revealed sanctions against theft, adultery, false
accusation of adultery, alcohol consumption, and brigandage. Believers
who commit such crimes will have to pay the penalty either in this
world or the next. There is also the possibility that God will cover over
(satr) people’s sins in his mercy (rahma). Members of society also have
duties to one another, and God has forbidden Muslims from transgress-
ing the life, property, and dignity of others unless there is right cause
(e.g., if the person is a murderer and is judged to deserve death or an
unrepentant blasphemer who wages war against society). Spouses have
duties to one another and to their children. The community as a whole
has a duty to care for the weak and poor, and relations between individ-
uals are to be guided by justice, that is, everyone getting their due,
especially when it comes to commercial relations. Islam therefore places
great emphasis on keeping promises and fulfilling contracts. When ob-
ligations are not met, justice is to be served, but the aggrieved can act
mercifully toward others in imitation of the prophet. Rulers are to be
obeyed so long as they do not transgress the rights of God and his
servants (human beings). This could imply just rule or rule that does
not offend the morality of Islam or, at a minimum, rule that does not
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prevent believers from performing their ritual duties (i.e., praying, fast-
ing, and so on).

To be sure, the legal norms cannot be ignored, but neither can the
idea of character (akhlaq) or, more specifically, nobility of character
(makarim al-akhlaq), which in Muslim parlance amounts to selflessness.
In a well-known hadith, the prophet says that he was sent to perfect
nobility of character so as to model it for others. The laws, shari‘a, are
there, but so is the possibility of perfecting them in the form of kindness
to all creatures—ihsan.

Ethics here has two interrelated dimensions—communalistic and
universalistic. The first works through the particulars of religious prac-
tice, rituals and laws (what could be called the identity of the religion)
but is to bear fruit in universally recognized character traits—humility,
generosity, magnanimity, love, kindness, and the like. The communal-
istic side of ethics in Islam is expressed in the teachings of shari‘a. But
these teachings are a means to something greater. The goal is to live in
the mercy of God, a state that encourages nobility of character in one’s
relations with all. Islam would not be Islam without its particular reli-
gious forms and norms, but it also would not be Islam without the
kindness to strangers and guests for which Muslim society is so well
known.

A problem arises when the communalistic side—the particulars of a
religion—is seen as a singularly valid form of human existence. The
particulars are never abandoned, but when limited to its particulars,
religion ceases to be a way of life and becomes exclusive identity. Its
final purpose gets lost in favor of the elements that constitute its partic-
ular identity. When shorn of its universal perspective, a religion has
trouble embracing all life beyond the confines of the believing commu-
nity. Does possession of the religion of God (din allah) require good-
ness only to fellow believers or to all?

A widely used term today, identity—ethnic, political, religious, and
so on—sets a person or group of people apart from others, creating
boundaries that supposedly define their existence. Is this term fairly
applied to religion? Religion defies boundaries as much as it conforms
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to them, unfolding across cultures, nations, and other categories of
human existence. In the end, it is difficult to say where religion ends
and nonreligion begins. Some Muslims, like some Christians, have
latched onto the idea of religion as exclusive identity distinguishing
them from all else—culture, nation, other faiths. This is partly a reac-
tion to the perception that the world seeks to eradicate Islam. Neverthe-
less, it ends by limiting piety to a set of particular laws (i.e., identity) to
be implemented as a political project, locally and globally. This trend is
considered in chapter 5. For our purposes here, it is enough to note that
this development, the reduction of Islam to worldly identity, reflects
attempts over the course of the last century to strip the ethics of Islam
of its spiritual outlook. Once shorn of the sense of being in the presence
of God, religion becomes a worldly project like any other, easily exploit-
able for political and even terrorist purposes. Indeed, when religion is
limited to group identity apart from consciousness of the unlimited
transcendence of God, it can turn into a quest for group supremacy
rather than an ethics of love over hate, kindness over vengefulness, re-
gardless of creedal boundaries.

Muslims are not about to set aside the norms of shari‘a but do recog-
nize that they exist within a wider religious vision. In Islam, norms
apply to ritual prayer, finance, marriage, and a host of other concerns.
Muslims have different opinions about these norms, however. Some see
Islamic banking as a way to shield the investments of Muslims from
corporate greed. For others, it is a way to hide shady dealings behind
the cloak of religion. Some see the laws of inheritance as a way to keep
family bonds intact, given that estates are distributed by a complex set
of norms that takes into account the extended as well as the nuclear
family. For others, it is unjust to adhere to these norms because they
can favor unfamiliar relatives over one’s own children, especially daugh-
ters, in an age when the nuclear family is increasingly the norm.

When thinking about Islam, inordinate attention is given to shari‘a
by Muslims and non-Muslims alike, making it seem that Islam is about
shari‘a and nothing else. This, in turn, makes God in Islam seem angry,
vengeful, and unforgiving. He lays down laws and then gets angry when
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people fail to obey them, forcing him to want to punish them. In dis-
cussions about Muslim society, the focus, almost obsession, is on the
very infrequent cases of stoning adulterers and executing apostates. This
is not to make light of such human rights violations, which I consider
in chapter 6. We cannot, however, judge Muslim society entirely on
such cases when in fact Muslim society is more about neighborliness
and mutual support. This myopia is compounded by the assumption
that Islam is oppressive to women. Concealed behind veils, their sole
reason for existing, it is believed, is to bear children. Moreover, it is
often asked, is it not the husband, even an abusive husband, who alone
initiates divorce at will and takes additional wives as he wishes? What
kind of religion would allow this?

In response to charges that Islam is at odds with modern liberalism,
some Muslims respond that the welfare of human society is more effec-
tively preserved by Islam than by modernity. They point to the break-
down of the family in the West, the high rate of divorce, the prevalence
of unwed mothers and fatherless children, the unabashed delight in
gross forms of substance abuse and intoxication, the ease with which
people enter into sexual relations with others they hardly know and may
never see again, and the absence of any credible deterrence to crime,
whether by gangs or white-collar executives. Yes, they admit, the pun-
ishments of Islam are harsh, but the modern world needs them, if only
to survive.6 The argument is also made that Islam is better for women,
requiring the man to support her and her children, relieving her of
financial worries that would force her to work and limit her ability to
care for her children, exposing her and them to exploitation by potent
as well as not so potent men.

The relation between sacred teachings and human freedom, not to
mention human dignity, is complex. This complexity was captured at
the UN summit for interreligious dialogue in November 2008. Mus-
lim representatives called for international commitment to respect for
the sacred symbols of all religions, reflecting Muslim sensitivities
about insults directed at the prophet. The political chiefs of Europe,
with no religious figures among them, balked at this, defending free-
dom of expression even at the expense of religious sentiment. Finally,
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George W. Bush stated that he had been led in his policymaking,
including his war-making, by a desire to defend the freedom to
change one’s religion. One was left with a sense of three different
viewpoints about the nature of religion with little hope of mutual
understanding or reconciliation.

To put it generally, Muslims seek respect for their religion in the
eyes of the world. Europeans worry that the growing presence of Islam
in Europe threatens their right to be unencumbered by religion. Ameri-
cans see individual freedom as the very essence of religion. We are faced
with a quandary that could lead to a clash of identities. To earn respect
for their traditions, some Muslims assert them over the rest of the
world. Some secular liberals, to demonstrate their tradition of unhin-
dered freedom of expression, create art offensive to believers. Do Mus-
lims have the ethical resources to be kind to others in a world that does
not understand them? Do secular liberals have the resources to be kind
to others even when the law gives them the right to insult them? Is our
behavior limited by our laws? We live in a highly pluralistic world and
cultural values diverge in radical ways. People are not going to give up
these values and the identities they embody, but if we are about nothing
more than our identities, then perennial clash is the likely outcome of
the human condition. The question is whether the various traditions of
the world offer something in addition to identity, whereby people can
meet others harmoniously even when differing from them in profound
ways.

It is impossible to encompass all Muslim societies in a simple de-
scription. One can find polygamous marriages in Islam, formed at the
discretion of the male whether or not the state in question permits it,
but most marriages are monogamous and do not end in divorce. There
have been highly celebrated cases of adultery and apostasy in places as
varied as Nigeria, Pakistan, Saudi Arabia, and the Sudan, but the death
sentence has not always been carried out. Even in these cases, the prob-
lem is not Islam per se. The tradition, to be sure, has effect. There are
rulings that call for the death of the adulterer and the apostate, but
there are also controls to ensure that they are not pursued for political
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ends, as is invariably the case today, when Islam has become a political
football rather than, as in the past, a source of moral stability for society.

The point is that the religious tradition itself is broader than shari‘a.
This is true for other systems. U.S. law calls for punishment of murder,
theft, the sale and use of drugs, and, in some states until recently, sod-
omy. Most Americans, however, do not spend their days thinking about
such things. The daily ethics of American life is about waving to one’s
neighbor, acting kindly to those one meets, patiently enduring the day’s
trials, inviting friends to dinner even if one is not going to be thrown
into jail for not doing so. This is also the case for Muslims, who do not
spend the day thinking about crime and punishment à la shari‘a. In-
deed, despite perceptions, the bulk of shari‘a is devoted not to crime
and punishment but to ritual practices. Muslim lives are shaped by a
religious heritage that calls for justice but also encourages people to get
along with others. This makes it necessary to reconsider the ethics that
Muslims find most meaningful.

Those who travel or live in Muslim society are often struck at the
welcome they receive and the spirit of hospitality and generosity. Cer-
tainly, no society is free of anger, violence, or corruption, but in all
societies values help preserve harmony. In Islam, this is known as nobil-
ity of character (makarim al-akhlaq), working in tandem with state law
for the welfare of society. This is not to suggest that Muslims have a
nobler character than non-Muslims. Every individual, Muslim and
non-Muslim, is to be judged on personal merit. Rather, the point is
that the ethics of Islam is much broader than questions of crime and
punishment. At heart, it is about the cultivation of interior dispositions
that ultimately depend on recognition of the merciful face of God as
ground of existence. For the sake of God, one remembers to be kind.
For the sake of God, one remembers to be clement. For the sake of
God, one is willing to sacrifice for others. This is the mark of ethics in
Islam, much more so than shari‘a, or at least not the impoverished view
of shari‘a as identity marker.

In what follows, we consider some of the different formulations of
this tradition of ethics in Islam. It is worth emphasizing that the ethics
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of religious traditions are not simply theory, but affect the way people
think about day-to-day realities. An article in Nursing Science Quarterly
suggests that in our willingness to relinquish what we treasure, we for-
tify our relations with others and affirm who we are before God. Inter-
views with patients disclosed ‘‘stories of sacrificing something important
in the name of friendship and connecting with the divine. In each case,
a cherished something was reluctantly offered in the hopes of strength-
ening a connection with another.’’7 Although originating in a Christian
heritage, this insight recalls the dictum in the Qur’an to have no love
for anything like your love for God. Spirituality in this sense offers the
possibility of transcending self and self-attachment in one’s relations.
More effectively than the power of reason alone, orientation to the face
of God as ultimate relation, for the sake of which all else can be sacri-
ficed, mitigates, if it does not wholly eliminate, the egoistic inclinations
of our souls—inclinations that are themselves the by-product of our
fears of losing our most prized possessions.

A certain historical myopia exists today among some Muslims, who
feel that enthroning Islam as master of the state is key to restoring the
glory of Islam. The idea that Islam has been eclipsed by the so-called
West raises anxieties about divine favor. Why is God favoring the West
if his chosen religion is Islam? What can Muslims do to regain God’s
pleasure, restoring the glory of Islam? Some, arguing that Muslims have
humiliated Islam, respond to this anxiety by calling for a fuller imple-
mentation of shari‘a as state law at the expense of all other considera-
tions. However, it was never shari‘a alone that made Islam great but
rather nobility of character (makarim al-akhlaq). It was always a willing-
ness to forgo brazen self-interest for the face of God that created envi-
ronments of trust as necessary precondition for a healthy society. In
other words, a precondition for success, even individual success, in busi-
ness, in education, in all spheres of life, is trust—trust that what one
does makes sense and that one’s efforts are not meaningless. A society
that encourages lying, cheating, and bribery over truthfulness, promise-
keeping, and merit-based competition will face a crisis not only of legit-
imacy but also of prosperity.
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This is not simply a nice theory. The Gülen movement, a global
network of Turkish Muslims, recognizes that a simple implementation
of shari‘a at the state level will not guarantee the success of Islam. They
do not seek control of politics, which would be only a superficial solu-
tion to the problems of corruption that have plagued Turkish society in
recent decades. Rather, they aspire to reinvigorate the ethical life of
the nation on the basis of what one scholar has called pre-contractual
solidarity, the trust and moral decency necessary for activity to make
sense.8 As a result, the Gülen movement, which oversees a variety of
projects, notably schools and interreligious initiatives as well as confer-
ences that aim to heal secular-religious animosities in Turkish society,
operates through an ever-expanding network of shared ethical expecta-
tions that offer an alternative to a life based on self-regard. To be sure,
followers of this movement are known for a keen sense of competitive-
ness—in business, in education, in all spheres of life. But the shared
commitment to a common ethics not only fortifies relations between
people, both inside and outside the movement, but also establishes the
preconditions for the success of the movement’s activities. It is worth
making sacrifices for the face of God when those whose society you
share also take seriously the notion of a life devoted to the face of God
as highest good. And this goodwill pays off by inspiring people to do
great things. Sacrifice for the sake of divine favor and prosperity can go
hand in hand. The model of the Gülen movement therefore differs
significantly from Max Weber’s analysis of the spirit of capitalism.
Wealth is not evidence of salvation. Rather, it is an ethics-based solidar-
ity. Through self-sacrifice for God, wealth is generated in unexpected
ways.

Despite the politicization of Islam in recent decades, a strong com-
mitment to nobility of character (makarim al-akhlaq) as key element
in facing today’s troubling world remains. A recent work, available in
bookstores from Casablanca to Damascus, speaks to this Muslim desire
for an ethical vision beyond politics. The Character of the Muslim: His
Relation to Society, written by Wahba Zuhayli, a prominent member of
the Sunni establishment in Syria, does not treat shari‘a per se, even if
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assuming it, but argues that the ethics of Islam is primarily altruistic
concern for others.9 Zuhayli writes about shari‘a elsewhere but here
focuses on everyday ethics as the actual arena where commitment to
God is affirmed or denied. Over the course of 464 pages, Zuhayli pur-
sues his stated goal: ‘‘refinement of the human being, elevation of his
sentiments, and encouragement to be good throughout life entire, to be
constructive, and ethically upright.’’10 He notes a potential contradic-
tion of Muslim life. It is easy to declare beliefs and perform rituals at
appointed times, but these beliefs and rituals become hollow if they do
not bear ethical fruit in one’s private and public conduct, that is, visibly
impact Muslim character. This, Zuhayli writes, is the touchstone of
Islam’s credibility. Indeed, what would be the worth of religion if be-
lievers were cheaters, liars, and backstabbers?

In chapter after chapter, the underlying theme is the need to recreate
an atmosphere of trust in Muslim society. The author opens with great
emphasis on truthfulness (sidq), seeing its antithesis, lying (kidhb), as
the greatest enemy of Muslim society. All action that shows altruistic
concern for others is considered a kind of divine worship: removing a
stone or thorn from the road, giving water to a thirsty dog, presenting
neighbors and friends with the occasional gift to eliminate unspoken
animosities, bearing a pleasant countenance, smiling and optimistic
rather than mean-spirited and frowning. The details are at times over-
whelming. When saying farewell to others, one should exhort them to
piety and good conduct. On holidays, one should help the needy, visit
family and friends, exhibit affection and joy. In eating, one should begin
by invoking God and end by praising him. When invited to dinner, one
should show appreciation for the food and refrain from sitting arro-
gantly as if a master to be served. One should recognize the social rights
of others, seeking to reduce conflict by acting gently and tolerantly and
with pity and mercy toward the needy, for a hadith has it that ‘‘whosever
does not act with mercy will not be treated with mercy.’’ One should
always return another’s greetings, visit the sick, attend a fellow Mus-
lim’s funeral, bless someone who has sneezed, offer helpful advice to
others, and support victims of injustice. In echo of a prominent idea in
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early Christianity, that movement away from evil is a movement toward
God,11 a hadith is cited that says that those who cannot do good should
at least not do evil because there is heavenly merit (sadaqa) in refraining
from evil (tark al-sharr).

Zuhayli’s goal is to make human solidarity the hallmark of Muslim
society, where injustice is absent, anxieties lifted, unintended mistakes
overlooked, and there is no deceit and deception, no betrayal, dishonor-
ing of others, lying, extortion, or deal-making that serves personal in-
terests rather than the common good. There will be no defense for the
unjust on judgment day, including not only those who exploit public
office for personal gain but also those who harm the property and repu-
tation of others and transgress their rights or break good faith with
them, dishonoring promises or breaking contracts. An important con-
clusion is that the believer acts justly because he relies on God and
trusts in him for his sustenance, whereas the unbeliever in his heart
fears not God but poverty, leading him to covet wealth and possessions
even at the risk of his ethical integrity. Again, in echo of early Christian
thought, the goal of ethics here is not punishment for transgressing
laws but formation of character, known in Islam as refinement of the
soul (tazkiyat al-nafs), to reflect the likeness of God.

Drawing on prophetic teachings and the example of the first Mus-
lims, Zuhayli has advanced a notion of Muslim life where a person is
evaluated by his righteousness and goodness towards others and his
readiness to meet the needs of others. For this he will be compensated
with a heavenly reward. In other words, the revelation of another world,
a kingdom to come, means that you can suffer in this world, endure
hardship and deprivation for the sake of the values of the next one,
engendering a broader ethical framework where you are both just and
kind not because you expect it in return or hope for a benefit here and
now but because of divine favor anticipated in paradise.

Is it all pious niceties? Do Zuhayli’s exhortations have any relevance
for this world? What is it that holds a society together, especially an
urban society of multitudes with no blood ties to bind them, with noth-
ing in common but proximity? Evangelical Christianity acted as cohe-
sive force for the American republic in its infancy.12 It was not state
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institutions or even laws but networks of people who willingly sacrificed
for one another, whose ethics were imprinted with a desire for both
liberty and virtue, and who thereby established common expectations
of behavior by which people were made to feel part of a single nation.
Religion in the case of the early republic was democratic in its assess-
ment of tyranny as demonic but also expected citizens to be virtuous.
Religion can play a significant role in creating a shared national culture
in which people willingly invest body and soul.

This is Zuhayli’s point when he writes of ‘‘a love that expects nothing
in return and is not motivated by personal interest.’’ Many countries in
the Middle East, which has a historically rich civilization, are today
desperate for ethical renewal of the type that the Gülen movement has
initiated in Turkey. Corruption, driven by the interests of the ruling
class, is pervasive, eroding the social fabric of entire nations and deci-
mating the will to live of peoples who are by nature spirited and intelli-
gent. The greatest victim of this ethical breakdown is the economy of
the Middle East, which in many places suffers because there is little
sense of investing oneself in it if one cannot trust in society, hope for
decency, and see one’s interests not in isolation but as part of the good
of the whole. Zuhayli’s aim, then, is not simply to make believers good
believers, but to reinvigorate the spirituality of Muslim souls, compel-
ling them by their own accord to be truthful, upright, and prosperous,
renewing a national culture so that activity, especially economic activity,
might make sense. To this end, he quotes a hadith in which the prophet
says, ‘‘By him in whose hand is my soul [i.e., God], you do not enter
paradise until you believe, and you do not believe until you love one
another. Shall I guide you to something that will allow you to love one
another? Spread peace among yourselves.’’

This kind of thinking is hardly new in Muslim society. A tenth-
century work by Ibn Abi al-Dunya, Nobility of Character, includes re-
ports about the first Muslims, suggesting that they saw Islam as build-
ing on and perfecting the ethical heritage of Arabia.13 The early
Christians thought similarly of Christian ethics as building on and
completing the ethical heritage of Greece and Rome.
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At the same time there was good reason for the first Muslims to
define their values as religious rather than tribal, despite their tribal
heritage. The beginnings of Islam, even if embedded in the tribal con-
text of seventh-century Arabia, were primarily urban, and the call to
faith was accompanied by a call to leave tribal life, tribal kith and kin,
for citied life, first in Medina, for a new way of relating with others
based not on blood ties and tribal alliances but on faith and piety. The
values of tribal Arabia—generosity, magnanimity, clemency, endur-
ance, and fortitude—were adopted by Islam but reoriented to the face
of God rather than to personal and tribal reputation. Ethics was now
to have a religious purpose, namely, heavenly reward, informing rela-
tions with all peoples regardless of affiliation. If Islam was to succeed
as ethical venture, it had to broaden the scope of ethics beyond the
prevailing tribal assumptions of the day. Thus Islam nurtured a system
of universal kindness based on notions of neighborliness and friendship
and driven by a longing for the face of God, that is, a heavenly reward
above and beyond strategies and calculations for maximizing tribal
standing and personal reputation. Sacrifice for God, not pride in oneself
and one’s clan, was to become the central mark of Islam’s ethics.

A social system in which cohesion is based on shared faith rather
than blood ties or tribal alliances means that one’s relations with God
will be reflected in one’s relations with others. God, after all, is no tribal
deity in the possession of a single clan but Creator and Lord of all. The
awareness of the one God expanded the ethical horizon of Arabian
society. The demand of God for exclusive devotion apart from any part-
ners means that wherever one turns, there indeed is the face of God,
combining in a single religious formula worship of the one God and
ethical dispositions necessarily universal in scope.

Rightful relations with others are protected by shari‘a, encompassing
both God’s rights to be worshipped and the rights of fellow humans to
justice. But mutual relationships, epitomized in kindness, are the lynch-
pin in a sliding dynamic between the encounter of the merciful God
and merciful encounter of others. Ibn Abi al-Dunya begins his work
with a hadith stating that ‘‘a man’s generosity is his religion, his virility
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his intellect, and his stature his ethical character.’’ Another hadith de-
scribes God as ‘‘generous and loving generosity, magnanimous and lov-
ing magnanimity.’’ In short, the Qur’an’s disclosure of God—besides
whom there is no other—initiated a new criterion of action where self-
denial made sense in light of one’s final destiny in God. As one hadith
puts it, ‘‘Strive for truthfulness—even when it seems to lead to destruc-
tion, it brings salvation. Put aside lying—even when it seems to lead to
salvation, it brings destruction.’’

Islam, then, decisively rejected the idea that one’s position in this
world is the final measure of success, and this gave a new grounding to
the soul in its relation to the world and the things of it, as noted by the
statement that Ibn Abi al-Dunya attributes to one of the first Muslims:
‘‘The believer is not content to see his neighbor injured or a relation in
need but is rich-hearted without possessing anything in this world. He
is not misled in his religion or deceived. For him, this world is no
compensation for the next, nor miserliness for magnanimity.’’ Gradu-
ally yet perceptibly, the ethical norms expected from tribal relations
were redirected toward other believers and potentially towards all. To
this end, Ibn Abi al-Dunya marshals forth the following hadith: ‘‘Who-
soever believes in God and judgment day should honor his neighbor.
No believer is full while his neighbor goes hungry.’’ His point is that
this ethical disposition, made possible by the exclusive monotheism of
Islam, is predicated on interior freedom that looks beyond worldly no-
tions of gain or loss, as epitomized in the hadith that ‘‘a believer will
not attain purity of faith until he repairs relations with those who shun
him [cut him off], gives to those who have deprived him, excuses those
who have wronged him, forgives those who have insulted him, and acts
kindly to those who have harmed him.’’

Ibn Abi al-Dunya goes on to record the top-ten list of ethics in
Islam as passed down by ‘A’isha, beloved wife of the prophet and lead-
ing figure in early Islam. ‘‘Honest speech, sincere fortitude in obeying
God, giving to the suppliant, repaying good deeds, strengthening family
ties, keeping faith, acting honorably to neighbors, acting nobly to
friends, extending hospitality to guests, and chief of all is modesty
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(haya’).’’ Modesty, which is better translated here as humility, is the
result of the experience of standing before God and giving him his due
as Creator and Lord of all. It assumes the presence of God—a spiritual
orientation that transforms dispositions in the heart towards others.
Another hadith equates lack of humility with unbelief (kufr). Humility
is described as a kind of forbearance and clemency, even chastity, that
is, modesty in one’s dealings with others as opposed to immodesty and
greed—traits that undermine society, as signaled in another hadith:
‘‘Ask God for relief [from greed] . . . and so [be free] of discord, enmity,
covetousness, and spite; be servants of God as brothers.’’

Something similar was at play in the fellowship practiced by early
Christians. Christianity not only offered a new perspective on the an-
cient Israelite faith but also attempted to create a new kind of society
based not on kinship ties but on shared devotion to the face of God as
revealed in the person of Jesus Christ. Rodney Stark makes a compel-
ling case for this in The Rise of Early Christianity, arguing that early
Christianity flourished largely for the new ethical vision it wrought in
the morally troubled cities of the Mediterranean world then under
Roman imperial sway. The focus of Christian ethics is mercy, com-
manded by God in this life and rewarded in the next. As Stark notes, a
Christian ethics of love and charity that went beyond family and tribe
was a tremendously attractive and galvanizing force against the chaos
and misery marking the urban life of the day. It brought consolation,
trust, solidarity, mercy—all the result of a willingness to sacrifice for
the face of God, to view as small and inconsequential the things of this
world next to the promises of the next. The idea that God loves human-
ity demanded that Christians love one another if they were to cooperate
with divine favor. This required not only witnessing to the claims of
the Gospel but also creating the conditions by which society might
more effectively cohere and flourish at a time of ethical ambiguity and
social deprivation, that is, amidst a situation that encouraged selfishness
rather than selflessness, and bitterness and vengefulness rather than
kindness.

The new orientation that Islam brought to the ethics of seventh-
century Arabia was variously elaborated over the centuries. Ibn Hazm,
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tenth-century scholar of Andalusia, was one of many who gave a philo-
sophical character to the ethics of Islam. The only thing of lasting value,
he argued, is God.14 Therefore, the only thing worth working for is
God. Everything else ends in sorrow, but the person who is oriented
toward God (al-tawajjuh lil-llah) and works for the next life (al-akhira)
is never the object of envy and enmity. He is even gladdened by set-
backs, obstacles in his way, trials and tribulations, because these too are
counted toward the goal to which he aspires, that is, heavenly merit.
For Ibn Hazm, self-transcendence is the goal of life in this world, as he
says, ‘‘Expend your self only for a cause that is above it [higher than
yourself], and that can only be God.’’ If you choose such a path, he says,
you will no longer pay attention to the speech of people, who delight
in accusing and shaming one another, but only to the speech of the
Creator. In fact, he says, to be perceived as blameworthy is preferable
to praise, which leads to pride and self-satisfaction, whereas patient
endurance of blame and insults will be rewarded in heaven.

Ibn Hazm goes on to discuss the human faculty of discernment, the
capacity for rational decision-making, which distinguishes humans
from beasts and associates them with angels. Religion, he says, com-
mands us to avoid living according to our passions and instincts, and
for this we must use our reason, the tool given to us to hold in check our
baser inclinations that come from the irascible and appetitive aspects of
the human soul (emotions such as anger and physical cravings of the
body). Human reason is thus integral to the ethical disposition that
religion commands, empowering believers to refrain from living accord-
ing to natural inclinations alone. He sums this up anecdotally: ‘‘Whoso-
ever does ill to his family and neighbors is the most ignoble of them.
Whosoever responds in kind to their ill treatment is like them. And
whosoever does not respond in kind to their ill treatment is the noblest
of them, the best and most virtuous.’’15

Is this the Muslim equivalent of the Christian turning the other
cheek? Ibn Hazm, of course, identifies it with the ethics of the prophet
Muhammad, who, he affirms, was sent for the purpose of perfecting
noble character (makarim al-akhlaq). If you want to be virtuous, Ibn
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Hazm advises, you should not accompany those who seek prestige, ma-
terial comfort, and pleasure, because vicious dogs do the same. Were it
not for worldly ambitions, people would not seek to bring one another
down. Ambition is the cause of every anxiety, avoiding which all peo-
ples and nations agree is the goal of life. The opposite of anxiety is
emancipation of the soul (nazahat al-nafs), a virtue that ennobles one
with courage, generosity, justice, and understanding. In Ibn Hazm’s
view, a believer is not led by his irascible and appetitive faculties, but is
discerning—not simply discerning but discerning in light of the revela-
tion of God: ‘‘Whosoever affirms the vision of God [i.e., in the next
life] has intense longing for it, is greatly inclined to it, and is not con-
tent with anything that falls even the slightest degree short of it, be-
cause it is his ambition.’’16

Islam’s understanding of the ethical fruit of the spiritual life reaches
a climax in Sufism, which has had immeasurable impact on Muslim
society, especially its combination of longing for the face of God (inti-
macy with God) with an ethics that calls for enduring the evil of the
world so as to be kind to all (i.e., suffering not for its own sake but for
an ethical end). Such a stance, Sufism claims, is possible only by the
empowering disclosure of the face of God. Sufism, despite popular per-
ceptions, does not consider this world as simply a test and trial in prepa-
ration for the next. For Sufism, it is not a question of putting up with
this world as a passing illusion but of embracing existence entire as
reflection of the face of God. That is, all that exists is able to exist only
insofar as it shares in the existence of God, making creation the site of
God’s self-disclosure no less than the scripture of the Qur’an. How
could one ever spite others, seek revenge for suffering at their hands, if
they in some measure reflect the face of God, that is, the names of
God, which for the architects of Sufism are actually countless in num-
ber, forming the spiritual reality behind the world’s material appear-
ances? To be so oriented to God necessitates spiritual training,
refinement of the soul. And the goal is detachment not only from
worldly concerns but even from one’s self. After all, self-attachment is
ultimately what keeps one from total orientation to God and through
him to others as partial reflection of his image.
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Here, then, the merciful face of God is the departure point for both
spiritual and ethical existence. The cycle of existence begins with God’s
self-introduction in the Qur’an as merciful and ends by giving the soul
a godly coloring: ‘‘The color of God, and who is better than God at
coloring?’’ (2:138). It is this godly coloring of the soul that is to mark
one’s relations with all things, especially other humans, because it is
humans above all creatures who are glimmers of the face of God made
manifest in creation. This idea is well captured in a letter on the univer-
salistic dimension of Islam’s ethics by Ibn ‘Arabi, a thirteenth-century
intellectual whose thought continues to be both influential and contro-
versial today:

Kindness is obligatory . . . for the prophet said, ‘‘Indeed I have been sent
to perfect noble character’’ . . . and [for that purpose] God introduced
Himself into companionship with humans. . . . So, you undertake noble
character only through the companionship of God exclusively. Do what
pleases God and avoid what displeases Him, whether towards Him or
towards others, for conduct towards others is counted among the things
that please God. . . . All Muslims and non-Muslims are edified by those
who are attentive to the presence of God [i.e., the friends of God, awliya’
allah], and God has a claim on every Muslim in their conduct with all
God’s creatures, without exception, from every class of angel, jinn,
human, animal, plant, mineral, and inanimate creature, whether believer
or not.17

These words capture the idea, mentioned earlier, that it is makarim
al-akhlaq, not shari‘a, that gives Islam’s ethics its universalistic dimen-
sion; shari‘a may be the necessary departure point for beginning the
journey with God, but it cannot be the end, if the purpose of God’s
religion is to be realized. The ethics of Islam embodies a universal kind-
ness through recognition of the unbounded presence of God—the face
of God, which, the Qur’an says, one encounters wherever one turns. A
high stage of spiritual development is assumed here, as noted by the
great mystical poet of the thirteenth century, Rumi, who declared in
one of his quatrains that God has given the world saints as exemplars
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of his mercy to all created beings, noting in particular the universal
scope of their mercy which reflects the scope of his mercy.18 How could
it be otherwise when one realizes that all belongs to God, as Abu Hafs
al-Suhrawardi, another mystical virtuoso of the same period, put it,
‘‘Whoever claims possession of something, his altruistic outlook is not
sound, since he considers his self more entitled to the thing by possess-
ing it . . . altruism is the mark of those who see that all things belong
to God.’’19

The spiritual heritage of Sufism worked to cultivate high levels of
Muslim self-detachment and interior freedom (hurriyya), because the
face of God that constitutes exclusive object of one’s longing is univer-
sally accessible, as heralded by the Qur’an. Here, Islam, like Christian-
ity, opens a potential horizon where the concept of enemy no longer
exists, as illustrated by al-Qushayri, eleventh-century author of a popu-
lar manual on Sufism that continues to be widely read today. He wrote
that spiritual realization occurs ‘‘when one finds no difference in eating
with friend or infidel.’’20 It is not only a question of a universal morality,
extendable to all, but also the recognition that the quest for revenge is
an illusion, and al-Qushayri described kindness (ihsan, the height of
noble character) as ‘‘patiently responding to reprehensible behavior with
kind behavior.’’ He illustrated this with a story about a Muslim tailor
and his Zoroastrian client who would pay his bills with counterfeit
dirham:

The tailor would [always] take it. One day, when he had business away
from his shop, the Zoroastrian came and paid counterfeit dirham to his
assistant, who would not accept it, and so the Zoroastrian paid authentic
dirham. When the tailor returned, he asked, ‘‘Where is the shirt of the
Zoroastrian?’’ When the assistant related what had happened, he said,
‘‘What evil you have done! He has been treating me like that for some
time, and I’ve borne it patiently, casting his counterfeit money in a well,
lest another be harmed by it.’’21

In other words, enmity, the desire for retribution, is an illusion that
leads us to perpetuate the cycle of evil, but a spiritual disposition fo-
cused on the face of God is able to absorb the world’s evil and counter
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the deception of seeking vengeance. This undercuts at least one part of
the motivation to hate one’s enemy, removing a portion of evil from
the never-ending cycle of revenge. The ability to suffer patiently, then,
is indicant of spiritual maturity, as noted in a Sufi manual of the thir-
teenth century by Abu Hafs al-Suhrawardi, ‘‘Getting along with all
folk, children, neighbors, friends and all people entirely, constitutes the
[noble] character of Sufism, for by enduring insult and injury, the es-
sence of the soul is made manifest.’’22 Islam, no less than Christianity,
affirms the importance of justice, but both also possess a logic that goes
beyond justice. Al-Suhrawardi told a story about his uncle, Abu l-Najib
al-Suhrawardi, a spiritual luminary of the twelfth century:

I was with our sheikh [Abu l-Najib] on his journey to Damascus when
one of the villages sent food to him in the presence of Crusader captives
who were in chains. The table was set and the captives were to wait until
he finished, but he said to a servant, ‘‘Fetch the captives so that they
might sit at the table and eat with the brethren.’’ He brought them,
seating them at the table in a single row. The sheikh got up . . . walked
over to them, and sat with them as if one among them. He ate and they
ate, and it was made manifest on his face the humility before God that
was at work within him, the contrition and detachment from pride over
them on account of his faith, knowledge, and action.23

Where has all this gotten us? It may be impossible to determine
whether Christians and Muslims have the same understanding of God’s
countenance in all its contours, and, indeed, there may be a reason
not to want uniformity. Perspectives on the God of Abraham are not
exhaustible. After all, we speak of God as a mystery to be in relation
with and not a fact to be defined. Certainly there are similarities in the
spirituality of the two religions, the sense of standing in, even cleaving
to, the unbounded presence of God and longing for the ubiquitous face
of God. There is also similarity in the ethical potential that follows
from encounter with the face of God. The revelation of God for Chris-
tians and Muslims alike affirms self-sacrifice, not in a stoic sense of
emotionless indifference, but rather in the sense of acting for God, for
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the face of God, for a relation with the divine friend. There is a com-
mon Christian-Muslim desire to reduce the ego before the revealed
presence of God, with a resulting readiness to forgo self-interest for the
sake of a relation with God, that is, for the sake of divine favor as
ultimate goal, above any worldly standard of success. In both Christian-
ity and Islam, reverence for the one God, who is not limited to tribe,
expands one’s ethical outlook.

Does Christian affection for the face of Jesus Christ line up exactly
with Muslim attentiveness to the names of God as revealed by the
Qur’an? What is clear is that for Christians and Muslims alike, the
revelation of the face of God announces the good news (bushra, a term
used by both Christian and Muslim Arabs), that is, the good news of
the divine presence amidst humanity, offering spirituality to humans,
freeing them from the limits of self-interest and self-regard in prefer-
ence for a loving and merciful kindness inspired by the face of God.
Regardless of the unique contours the two traditions give to the divine
face, Christians and Muslims alike are moved by the realization that
spirituality, the dispositions one cultivates in the soul, are necessary
precondition for the formation of a truly noble ethical character, some-
thing, it would seem, which is desperately needed in society today, not
simply for the sake of ethical harmony but even more so for the good
of society.
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C H A P T E R F O U R

JIHAD

Is It Christian Too?

AT DIFFERENT POINTS in his letters, Saint Paul speaks of his strug-
gle to announce the good news made manifest in Jesus Christ.

The term to describe this struggle in the Arabic translation of the Bible
is jihad. Although Paul admits his own weakness, he claims that his is
not a human jihad (2 Cor. 10:3). His efforts to make the word of God
known represent a great jihad (Phil. 1:29–30; Col. 1:29–2:1; 1 Thess. 2:2),
one for which he would greatly suffer. Surely, Paul is not calling hu-
manity to violence or even just defense of a political order. Christianity
does recognize the reality of this world and the necessity of human
governance to preserve justice, protect human life, and maintain the
common good. But an explicit word from God is not needed to know
the purpose and virtues of human governance. Paul’s jihad was a strug-
gle for something beyond this world. It is the kingdom to come, knowl-
edge of which transforms the way believers live in this world even as
they anticipate the next. For this he willingly suffered, not simply to
suffer, but to make the good news known.

The prophet Muhammad also had a jihad. Was it the same as Paul’s?
In Islam, jihad means struggle to make God’s word highest. It too is
not a struggle for a human system but for the reign of God. This strug-
gle had great urgency for Muhammad. Like Paul, he set his sights on
the great day of the Lord. For both, it was not enough to live justly in
this world. One needed to prepare to meet God and be saved—or lost.
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Additionally, both Paul and Muhammad acknowledged Satan as oppo-
nent of this divine mission. They did not so much hold him responsible
for worldly injustice as see him as the spoiler of God’s good news,
seducing people from attentive focus on the world to come, from their
faith and the great struggle they too share as recipients of God’s word.
Struggle is at the heart of the human experience, but in Christianity
and Islam, it goes beyond normal affairs.

Since the days of Paul and Muhammad, Christians and Muslims
have sought to announce the word of God to the world by various
means. One is by locating evil and combating it. The concept of evil
was supposed to disappear with the death of God and the rise of psy-
choanalysis in his place. It persists, however, along with its classical
persona, Satan, serving as a useful way to label one’s political enemies:
the axis of evil, as George W. Bush once described Iran, Iraq, and
North Korea; or the great Satan, as Ayatollah Khomeini labeled the
United States. Politics aside, for Christians and Muslims, evil, charac-
terized as Satan, is the enemy of God’s good news.

Today as in the past, Christians and Muslims struggle to manifest
God’s good news in a world that fails to grasp it fully. Billy Graham
spent his life calling people to Christ for the salvation of their souls.
But the effort to proclaim the news of a world to come invariably gets
caught up with worldly matters. In a speech delivered in December
2007, Mitt Romney, a presidential candidate of the Republican Party,
responded to certain Christians who felt that his Mormon faith disqual-
ified him from holding the presidential office. Interestingly, though
affirming the First Amendment’s separation of religious authority from
the state, he also recognized that religion, all religion, is very much part
of national life. This commitment to protect people’s liberty to pursue
religion freely in the public space is, he maintained, what makes the
United States a great nation with a mission to defend religious freedom
at home and abroad.

How exactly is the nation to represent religion? Christians, to speak
only of the largest category of believers in the United States, express a
range of opinions about the relation of God’s purposes to the nation’s
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destiny. Some understand the United States to have an explicitly Chris-
tian identity, giving Christians the right of dominion over it. In this
view, the integrity of the Christian mission is tied to national identity,
making national authority something only Christians can rightly claim.
Other Christians, though they hold the nation to moral standards, do
not link God’s word to the nation’s destiny so explicitly. The reasons
for this divergence are complex. It is partly because of the way Christian
morality is understood. Some see the Bible as singular source of moral-
ity. Therefore, if the nation is to be moral, it must be grounded in an
explicitly biblical mandate; Christians of this view claim that the
Founding Fathers intended to establish a Christian nation.

By contrast, other Christians speak of multiple sources of moral
truth. In addition to the Bible, there is also natural law. Human life has
an order to it. This order originates in God, but the human mind can
recognize it apart from revelation. There is, then, an objective moral
order apart from religious inclination or personal choice. The morality
of the nation is therefore not tied to revelation but instead to recogniz-
able truths. Such truths, in this view, would apply to marriage, defined
as the union of a man and woman for the sake of procreation, and to
human life, which is to be protected at all stages, in potential (as a fetus
from the moment of conception) no less than in actuality (once outside
the womb). They would also apply to care for the poor and weak, also
members of a society that functions organically and not simply as a
collection of disconnected individuals.1 Christians of this type are keen
not simply to preserve so-called traditional values. They also recognize
a higher purpose to life, represented in a special way in the family and
society as arena of God’s creative action, but they do not necessarily
speak of the nation as having an explicitly religious identity.

Of course, we live in an age when the theory of evolution raises many
questions about the existence of a moral order determined by higher
truths. The human has become the measure of all things, including
moral choices. Many Christians accept this. For them, religion inspires
individuals as they grow in their personal relation with God but does
not translate into a moral order by which society as a whole must live.
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Still other Christians take the implications of God’s word in a more
militant direction, looking to violence in the Middle East in the hope
that it will usher in the great rapture as first step toward the inaugura-
tion of God’s kingdom on earth.

How, then, is God’s word to be made highest in this world—by care
for the downtrodden or by fighting the infidel? It would be difficult to
determine which Christian outlook best reflects Paul’s self-described
jihad. And that is the point. Believers pursue the mandate to uphold
God’s word in diverse fashion. This is also true in Islam. In the Qur’an,
the essence of jihad is struggle in the sense of sacrifice: sacrifice of one’s
worldly possessions and even of one’s self for the sake of making God’s
word manifest, indeed highest, in the eyes of the world. How exactly is
that to be accomplished? In some places in the Qur’an, jihad has a
militant tone and is linked to fighting, though it is important to under-
stand how Muslims read such verses. After all, the Bible also contains
divine calls to violence (such as Num. 31), but Christians do not read
them as directives to be carried out. In other places in the Qur’an, jihad
means struggle in the sense of Paul’s mission for Christ, witnessing a
life for God above all else, even to the point of suffering for it. This
ambiguity is also at play in the Sunna. In one hadith, the prophet says
he has been ordered to fight until people submit to no gods but the
God, and in another that the best jihad is to speak justice to oppressive
rulers. Here too, it is important to ask how Muslims read these reports.2

What human activity appropriately represents religion in this world? Is
violence a way to witness to the glory of God beyond worldly standards
of justice? In a well-known New Testament passage, Jesus equates ser-
vice of the deprived and downtrodden with the kingdom of God. And
a well-known hadith speaks of seven things that will earn God’s shade
on judgment day: a just leader, a youth reared in the worship of God, a
person with a heart bound to the mosque, two people whose mutual
love is based on a shared commitment to God’s will, a person who
rejects improper sexual offers, a person who gives charity discretely, and
a person who is overcome with tears when recalling God even in private
(i.e., his tears are not pretended piety).
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A key question, then, is representation of God’s word in the world.
After all, God’s message knows no borders. How is the good news to
be spread? How is the world to be evangelized or qur’angelized? A
terrorist figure such as Osama bin Ladin claims to be struggling to
elevate the word of God over the world. Some Muslims took satisfac-
tion in his attacks on the United States, viewing them as just requital
for what they perceived to be a U.S.-led war on Islam. Many con-
demned al-Qaeda from the start, but many others did so only when
fellow Muslims became targets, making al-Qaeda a threat to the inter-
ests of Muslims and not only the so-called West. Indeed, although al-
Qaeda still attracts youth to its ranks, its religious vision has come under
heavy attack from those who once shared it. The leaders of Egypt’s
Islamic Group and the erstwhile jihadist ideologue, Imam Sayyid al-
Sharif, remain committed to the global supremacy of Islam but realize
that terrorism actually hurts the cause.3 Their main criticism of al-
Qaeda is its failure to distinguish the battle for the other world from
political conflict in this one. Confusing God’s battle with political con-
flict encourages indiscriminate violence against all who reject one’s
religious view. Rather, they argue, Muslims should proceed with pru-
dence in addressing the wrongs committed against them by the world’s
powers.

Like Christians, Muslims have a variety of ideas on appropriate ways
to make the word of God highest in this world. Some do so by preach-
ing the message of the other world, focusing on the rewards and pun-
ishments that Muslims can expect in the hereafter. Tablighi Jama‘at, a
global group with origins in the Indian subcontinent, exhorts fellow
Muslims to perfect adherence to religious rituals apart from political
considerations. The point is to store up rewards in the kingdom to
come to offset the tribulations of the grave. Likewise, the Gülen move-
ment, mentioned in chapter 3, advances the word of God in this world
apart from political considerations. Unlike Tablighi Jama‘at, it does not
preach fear of punishments to come but focuses on acts of kindness,
representing the ethics of the next world through merciful behavior
toward others, Muslim and non-Muslim alike.
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In short, the struggle to represent God’s word is a perilous undertak-
ing. Standards of justice and other human virtues such as wisdom, mod-
eration, and patience do not depend on disclosure of a world beyond
this one. Although Christians and Muslims embrace these standards,
they also speak of something more, calling people to God in word and
in deed. The manner of carrying out such a mission is fraught with
confusion. When does jihad become jihadism? When does the struggle
to represent God’s word as highest standard in one’s life turn into a
mandate to dominate others? The revelation of a world to come has
inspired Christians and Muslims to great acts for God, but they have
also stumbled along the way. It is therefore vital to think carefully about
what representation of God’s word entails. The Bible links the kingdom
of God to service of the least among us, but it also speaks of great
battles before the coming of the kingdom. Likewise, Islam links jihad
to the battle between good and evil in one’s soul, but it also recognizes
jihad by the sword to defend and extend the sovereignty of God’s ways
in the shape of a particular legal order. To be sure, there are key differ-
ences in the way jihad is conceived by Paul of Tarsus and Muhammad
of Medina, yet at heart jihad is the struggle not only to ensure justice
but also to exhort believers to live in anticipation of judgment day. It
becomes jihadism, however, when it turns into a battle for supremacy
of one group over another. Are there instances when the Christian mis-
sion also ceases to be jihad and becomes jihadism?

The legitimacy of force to correct wrongs has long been recognized
by believers and nonbelievers alike: wrongs committed by one group
against another, one nation against another, a tyrant against his people.
But in times past Christians and Muslims saw other reasons to use
force. Theories of just war have varied through the centuries no less
than those of jihad. The need to defend a people against external ag-
gression was widely seen as legitimate, and religious motive was never
entirely ruled out. There was a sense in both religions that infidels and
apostates needed to be brought into a properly ordered relation with
God, by force if necessary, and that for their own good (the betterment
of their souls). In Christianity, the goal of converting others—or at least
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getting them to hear the word of God—offered legitimate grounds to
use force. In Islam, force was legitimate not so much for the sake of
conversion but to spread the rule of Islam as representative of God’s
order. In an age of human rights, such thinking, though persistent in
some circles,4 has no place. Defense is the only just cause for warfare.
However, even when Christians and Muslims saw religious order as a
legitimate pretext for force, moral guidelines still applied. Force could
not be used indiscriminately.

Is this the case today? The international order forged over the last
century in place of religiously based empires is a remarkable achieve-
ment, but it has been accompanied by unprecedented levels of violence,
including indiscriminate violence. The past century has witnessed mili-
tary projects that sought not to defend a people and their land but to
spread a particular view of human perfection. Here, violence has no
clear end but is used indiscriminately to eliminate those who do not fit
the definition of human perfection, whether cast in racial, political, or
religious categories. It is when representation of God’s word becomes
conflated with group supremacy that religion takes on a terrorist hue.
This is also true of secular movements with ideological philosophies
that separate purportedly correct from purportedly incorrect forms of
humanity.5 Secular philosophies too can take on jihadist hue. Whether
religious or secular, identity supremacy becomes a guiding principle,
even at the expense of moral considerations and even at the expense of
human life—collateral damage of the jihadist kind.

When it comes to the jihadism of al-Qaeda, the enemy is secularism,
viewed as satanic threat to the long-term fate of God’s word. The
deeper fear is that the eschatological horizon that opens on the world
to come is in danger of disappearing in the face of secular sentiment
that makes this world the end of human existence. The victims of al-
Qaeda’s attacks, then, are collateral damage in a larger, much more
complex, and ultimately unnecessary battle for supremacy between reli-
gion and secularism. The struggle to keep the kingdom of God credible
in the face of the perceived menace of secularization need not take
terrorist form. Indeed, in Muslim society, tyranny has often been secu-
lar, represented by colonial overlords and postcolonial dictators who
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have used secularism to justify domination. It has been argued that the
religiously minded are unable to grasp the ways of modernity and there-
fore must be forced to accept them. Yet even in the face of such tyranny,
Muslims have not lost sight of the fact that the struggle to make God’s
word known cannot proceed willy-nilly. It must take a form that works
for—not against—the greater interests of the umma, a standard that the
indiscriminate violence of al-Qaeda does not meet.

There is a larger context. The peoples of the world, Muslims in-
cluded, were once enchanted with modernity and its promises. It was
supposed to explain the mysteries of the universe and eliminate all
problems. Modernity has offered much, new political forms such as
democracy and scientific discoveries that alleviate suffering, but it has a
darker side. Many thought it would make religion obsolete. The human
mind, coupled with technical expertise and economic efficiency, would
bring about the good of all through the workings of a hand that was
invisible but no longer divine. The goal was to liberate people from
long-held systems of beliefs seen as obstacles to progress, especially the
ability to inquire critically and express oneself freely.

All of this led to great advances but also to bizarre and tragic results.
The mind alone, unchecked, cannot guarantee the moral life. Some
modernists sought to justify racist theories—and therefore imperial do-
minion—by comparing the brain size of different races. For the biologi-
cally fit, it would be just a matter of time before history would end
and all enlightened peoples overcome their native passions by remaking
themselves in the European image. Despite its accomplishments, mo-
dernity not only held out promises that failed to materialize. It also had
a decidedly supremacist aspect, and Muslims were usually placed out-
side that circle. In reaction to this disdain of Islam, some Muslims
responded in kind, calling for the supremacy of Islam over the rest of
the world. Moreover, science has proven capable of serving destructive
no less than productive ends, and capitalism, having bested socialism,
is demonstrably ill equipped to save the world: only a lucky handful
tend to thrive. Indeed, the once-vaunted claim of secularism as neutral
thinking no longer holds. For many Muslim societies, secularism has
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not been guarantor of tolerance but rather pretext for regimes to claim
moral authority over citizens in the name of helping them progress
toward modern life: Ba‘thism in Syria and Iraq, Kemalism in Turkey,
Nasserism in Egypt, and Suharto’s New Order in Indonesia. The U.S.
attempt to introduce democracy to the Middle East has been viewed
similarly. Based on experience, many Muslims conclude that the inca-
pacity for God in the human mind as by-product of modernity has been
morally disastrous for the world. There is some sense to this. One need
only look at the violence of twentieth-century Europe, perpetrated in
the name of the modern state and accompanying secular ideologies,
such as national socialism and international communism. For some
Muslims, there is urgent need to make the word of God manifest once
again to overcome the tyranny of secularism.

Indeed, God now seems to be breaking out everywhere. Is this to
be understood in the biblical sense, where God breaks out whenever
displeased with the failures of his people to live up to the demands of
their covenant with him? Or is it simply worldly ideologies now in
religious clothing? Is it God breaking out or the Antichrist? As sug-
gested, the highest aspirations of religion are never very far from evil.

Supremacism is based on the myth of perfection and its attainability
in this world. For Nazism, perfection was defined in terms of the Ger-
man race, and those who did not fit into this racial myth, the Jews, were
depicted as the Antichrist, the embodiment of evil. In the Soviet Union,
communism represented the perfection of human history, requiring
elimination of the bourgeois class for the sake of proletariat rule. The
jihadism of al-Qaeda therefore does not originate in Islam. It is a re-
sponse to modernist ideologies seen as a threat to the sustainability of
the Muslim way of life.6 Long defined primarily as a moral force, to
correct manifest injustice, jihad has now been forced into the service of
ideological ends. Key figures of the past century, notably Abu-l-A‘la
Mawdudi of Pakistan and Sayyid Qutb of Egypt, paved the way for
jihadism by recasting jihad as revolutionary ideology—in other words,
a very modernist take on jihad.7

In this way, the defense of Islam against the secularizing menace
takes on a supremacist hue—an antimodernism that is Muslim only
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insofar as it has harnessed its wagon to jihad. Moreover, in its determi-
nation to push back against an arrogant secularism, jihadism claims that
the secular never had a place in Islam alongside the call to God. This
assertion, however, ignores history. A core principle of classical Islamic
political thought is the need for balance between the realities of this
world and the demands of religion. Sultans were expected to adhere to
standards of justice but were never expected to perfect this world in the
image of the next. Nor were they declared agents of idolatry (tawaghit)
if their rule fell short of religious ideals. Certainly, excessive injustice, it
was recognized, would eventually lead to the demise of a sultan’s rule,
but the only criterion used to declare rule as insufficiently religious was
the ruler’s own declaration of his infidelity. Today, however, because of
jihadist overcompensation, a new standard has been asserted whereby a
Muslim ruler who fails to represent religion flawlessly is subject to ji-
hadist attack. The reverence for secularity, long a hallmark of Islamic
political thought, is lost on al-Qaeda. Similar instances of this historical
myopia exist in Christianity. In the sixteenth century, Anabaptists, by
discarding the heritage of Christian thinking that recognizes secular
authority, aspired to realize the kingdom of God on earth in communi-
ties set apart from the world. In one instance, this zeal turned into a
reign of terror as the Anabaptists of Münster, Germany, sought to
eliminate all life that fell short of Christian perfection.8 Just as secular-
ism can get out of control when it turns into a mission to correct believ-
ers, so religion too distorts its own purpose when it loses the reverence
for secularity that has long been part of its heritage.

This is not to say we should let go of our myths and the ideals they
embody, whether religious or secular. We should examine them criti-
cally to ensure that they are true and not false. All the same, they inspire
us to live and to achieve great things. Our myths become dangerous,
however, when we turn them into a political project to be achieved in
this world. The moment we demand the world to conform to our myths
of perfection, we run the risk of tyrannizing and even eliminating others
who stand in the way, that is, the risk of collateral damage. And so
again, when it comes to the highest ideals of religion, it needs to be
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asked whether it is the word of God or the Antichrist that is being
served.

Article 676 of the Catechism of the Catholic Church states that ‘‘the
Antichrist’s deception already begins to take shape in the world every
time the claim is made to realize within history that messianic hope
which can only be realized beyond history through the eschatological
judgment. The Church has rejected even modified forms of this falsifi-
cation of the kingdom-to-come under the name of millenarianism,
especially the ‘intrinsically perverse’ political form of a secular messia-
nism.’’ That is, the pursuit of jihad remains true only as long as it
recognizes the imperfectibility of this world. It becomes jihadism when
it turns the announcement of the world to come into a political project
to be realized in this one, a move that immediately legitimizes violence
not for moral purposes but to achieve divine perfection here and now.
Jihadism mistakenly insists on the total victory of God’s word in this
world even when the Qur’an makes clear that such victory is to be had
only at an unspecified future judgment day.

Jihadism, then, may feed on demands for greater justice in this world
but ultimately stems from anxieties about the godly character of the
umma. Is it living up to its divine mission to make God known or
has it become hopelessly compromised with secularist calculations as
advanced by infidel nations and apostate rulers? If, as jihadists claim,
secularizing processes are gradually closing off the Muslim mind to the
ultimate reality of God, something palpable and dramatic needs to be
done to prove the power of God’s word to the world. The anxiety over
the sustainability of religion in the face of a secularizing world becomes
cause to introduce the kingdom of God into this world, to make it
visible for all to see—in short, to turn it into a political project. Jihad
becomes jihadism. One is ready to die, even kill oneself, and to pursue
death actively, if it will offer a visible witness of ultimate reality before
the eyes of this world.

Religion is back in a very public way, seeking to muscle secularism
aside as lead global ideology and advance its authority over the secular
state. But what are the risks? We had Hitler, der Führer-Savior of Nazi
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Germany, and Che Guevara, the messiah of international socialism.
Both were willing to build utopian orders over the bones of those who
stood in their way. More recently, we had Khomeini. Some saw him as
the Hidden Imam, returned to save the Iranian nation (and Iranian
political rhetoric continues to harp on the return of the awaited Mahdi),
but he sent hundreds of thousands to their death on the battlefield with
the promise of paradise. And now Osama bin Ladin challenges U.S.
global hegemony with a particular kind of martyrdom, designed to pro-
claim the power of God over the world through indiscriminate display
of lethal and suicidal piety.

At play amidst all this are competing definitions of religion. Is reli-
gion about a deeper consciousness of transcendent meaning as conveyed
by revealed messages or is it about a sometimes very narrow expression
of group identity? If group identity, religion easily coalesces with
worldly agenda and political projects, mobilizing believers to kill and be
killed, not for the flag but for God apart from the flag. How does the
divine symbol, God, resonate with patriotism? In one sense, religion
has long aligned with political membership. Subjects were to follow the
religion of the ruler. But Christianity and Islam have also challenged
the reduction of religion to the interests of a single people, whether
tribe, nation, or even empire. The promoters of modernity have been
naı̈ve in thinking that religion would gradually disappear in the face of
secular progress, but the struggle for religion has taken on odd contours
that make it seem entirely worldly in its manner of proceeding. Religion
has become, unwittingly to many of its purveyors, almost indistinguish-
able from the ways of the world. This is in part the result of the ascen-
dant definition of religion as group identity. We remain at a critical
stage when it comes to jihad. Jihadism will not succeed. No utopianism
ever has. But it has the potential to create a good deal of havoc and to
recur periodically. There is great need for Christians and Muslims,
along with others, to consider its true purpose, and a key issue along
the way is a fuller grasp of the nature of religion. Oddly, in many places
across the Muslim world, there seems to be an inability to identify Islam
without accompanying negative reference to the so-called West. The
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assumption, then, is that religion is simply an identity. Therefore, be-
cause the West is not Islam, the logic goes, it must by definition be
anti-Islam. This rhetoric continues to pose great harm to Muslim
youth, closing doors to positive interaction with other peoples.

As noted earlier, the sense of jihad as used in the Qur’an is righteous
struggle for the way of God, but Muslims have nuanced jihad in a
myriad of ways over the centuries. In general, the tradition speaks of
two jihads: a lesser one of force to preserve the moral order of Muslim
society, and a greater one of spiritual combat against the baser elements
of one’s soul that prevent it from adhering to the will of God. The evil
to be combated is both external and internal—a disorder in both society
and the soul that blocks harmony with the way of God. Muslims there-
fore have options in deciding which concept of jihad best serves their
interests in today’s world.

In Islam, belief in God is itself an essential part of repelling injustice.
In a popular hadith collection compiled by the thirteenth-century Syr-
ian scholar al-Nawawi, the prophet directs a person who had asked
about the meaning of righteousness to inquire of his heart because,
Muhammad said, ‘‘Righteousness (birr) is what makes the soul content
while sin is that which leaves the soul troubled.’’ In this context, righ-
teousness connotes belief in God. Thus, faith in the soul is integral to
the moral life. The idea is elaborated by another Syrian scholar, Ibn
Qayyim al-Jawziyya, who lived a century after al-Nawawi. In Steps of
the Seekers, he speaks of two kinds of polytheism. The greater one,
associating partners with God, is not pardonable and will be punished
in the hereafter, but other kinds of belief that fall short of true mono-
theism, even if not explicitly associating partners with God, may lead
to a failure of justice in this world, requiring political redress of some
kind. Polytheism is the greatest sin in Islam, but can be viewed as a
cause of injustice in this world and not only a theological deficiency.

On the one hand, polytheism (shirk) is evil because it transgresses
the Qur’an’s revelation of God’s oneness. It is thus injustice not against
other humans but against God. Yet the Qur’an identifies shirk as a great
wrong (zulm ‘azim) that harms human society. Adam and Eve wronged
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themselves by putting themselves before God. The Israelites at Sinai
wronged themselves by worshipping the golden calf.

Injustice according to the Qur’an results from the worship of beings
other than God. If one truly believes in God, Creator and Lord of all,
who rewards and punishes on judgment day, if one truly believes in
God as singular reality, as opposed to the things of this world, if one
truly believes in God who alone sustains and saves, one would not com-
mit moral outrages or transgress the rights of others. And so, by
qur’anic reasoning, recognition of the one God results in righteousness.
It is not simply a matter of a happy outcome in the world to come.
Rather, acknowledgment of the one God checks people from elevating
themselves over others on the pretext of having divine allies. It is the
word of God that is to be highest and not the word of particular indi-
viduals or groups.

In other words, the Qur’an is decidedly antisupremacist. Its brand of
monotheism counteracts the tendency of humans to dominate others
on the pretext of possessing gods alongside God. In the end, they only
wrong themselves, that is, human society as a whole. The point is that
shirk is actually a human trick, a pretext to ignore the ethical implica-
tions of monotheism by becoming master rather than servant of others.
Evil here is seen through the prism of idolatry, which is not simply
about bowing before graven images. More profoundly, it is a disorder
that results when humans make themselves the purpose of existence.
It is no coincidence that the Qur’an’s call to monotheistic worship is
accompanied by horror at humanity’s moral failings: social hierarchies,
political ideologies, disregard for the weak and needy, elite monopoliza-
tion of wealth and power.

The failure of monotheism, in this sense, results in the decay of
society—injustices that cause economies to fail and people to abandon
cities, undermining human civilization. The Qur’an warns of past na-
tions that did not heed the counsel of prophetic messengers. They set
themselves up as arbiters of justice, arrogantly justifying a hierarchy of
power through idolatrous religiosity. In the end, the Qur’an says, they
wronged only themselves, for they will be held accountable before God
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on judgment day when the weaker elements of society, whom they
duped into following them, will ask them, their worldly overlords, why
they led them to prefer their way over the way of God. Corruption
(fasad) is the outcome of false belief that parades as truth but is really a
version of human supremacy pretending to divine purposes: glorifica-
tion of oneself, one’s class, one’s race, one’s nation, one’s religion over
others. The Qur’an castigates Jews and Christians for claiming that they
alone will be saved, a confessional arrogance that some Muslims admit
is now also true of Islam. It is this confessional partisanship that can
make it difficult for some Muslims to accept international condemna-
tion of political figures implicated in great atrocities, such as in Iraq
under Saddam Hussein and now in Darfur under Omar Bashir, simply
because they are Muslim in name. Here, ironically, as the Qur’an warns,
false belief masks itself as true belief, putting the survival of society at
risk by making good evil and evil good.

Indeed, monotheism has its own supremacist tendencies. This is no-
ticeable in Wahhabism, which is politically quietist in principle but can
morph into jihadism when made into a political project.9 Wahhabism
is allegedly inspired by the teachings of Ibn Taymiyya (died 1328), re-
vered by many as the greatest scholar of Islam. However, his teachings,
though strict, are not adequately represented by Wahhabism. For exam-
ple, in a treatise on communal harmony,10 he argued that the moral
corruption in society is the result of the failure of Muslims to agree on
a single form of monotheistic worship. It may strike us as odd to think
of ritual diversity as the cause of social degradation, but for Ibn Tay-
miyya, it raised doubts about the singularity of truth, and this, in turn,
leads to a lack of moral rigor. In his view, the failure of Muslims to
follow a single form of worship raises a significant question. Which, if
any, represents the correct way of worshipping God? Moreover, if Mus-
lims are not worshipping God in singular fashion, the conclusion could
be drawn that they have lost sight of the singularity of God. In turn,
Ibn Taymiyya avowed, this drift away from monotheistic singularity
leads to injustice in society. That is, people will make decisions accord-
ing to partisan interests rather than the truths of Islam. Instead of
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singular devotion to God’s way, people will prefer the authority of those
who serve their particular interests over those who are more competent
in governing society’s affairs justly. Thus, for Ibn Taymiyya, what starts
as theological laxity ends in a cronyism that jeopardizes the public good.

In this sense, his ultimate concern was the welfare of Muslim society.
Here, religion is not a tool to affirm group identity but a moral project,
preventing people from associating partisan interests with God’s de-
crees. For Ibn Taymiyya, then, belief in God reduced the likelihood of
bias in assessing the interests of society. It is for this reason that he
condemned the introduction of innovations into religion, not simply
because they confuse monotheistic truth but more so because they can
be politically exploited, leading to communal disunity, intra-Muslim
conflict, and loss of moral harmony.

Ibn Taymiyya’s ideas were troubling to many in his own day. He was
accused of introducing innovations into the faith and disturbing the
peace, and he would die in prison. But there was a moral vision behind
his drive for doctrinal unity. Wahhabism, in contrast, tends to place
doctrinal purity above all other considerations, turning religion into a
question of identity. In this sense, it can offer grounds for war-making
in the name of religious identity apart from moral considerations that
all would recognize as legitimate grounds for war-making.11 Wahhab-
ism shares Ibn Taymiyya’s horror of religious innovation (bid‘a) as the
summit of evil but takes it in a different direction. Whereas Ibn Taymi-
yya was concerned with the moral implications of doctrinal confusion,
Wahhabism places greater emphasis on doctrinal purity in assessing the
worth of human existence.12 Infidels, including Muslims who do not
accept the principles of Wahhabism, are potential enemies of God not
because they represent a threat to the moral order but because they fall
short of the demands of religious identity. As a result, they have no
moral worth if not clearly Muslim. In a reversal of Ibn Taymiyya, Wah-
habism can actually exacerbate conflict within Islam, encouraging Mus-
lims to condemn one another not for moral failings but for alleged
deviation from true Islam.13 Although not the cause of jihadism, Wah-
habism feeds into it, making sense of fighting and even eliminating
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others for failing to place the call to religion above all other considera-
tions. Force is justified not to achieve the moral purposes of monothe-
ism but in the name of a creed. Others, Muslims included, may lead
moral lives but become legitimate objects of attack if deemed inade-
quate representatives of the interests of the other world. Jihad becomes
jihadism when a particular definition of religion offers grounds for vio-
lence against those who fall short of religious perfection.

Believers of all types have long posed questions about evil. How can
it exist if God is all-powerful and loving? Is it a test of faith, a kind of
backdrop to religious commitment, where those who resist its seduc-
tions are rewarded in the life to come? Or does it have a reality of its
own, embodied in systemic perversities in human society that produce
poverty, homelessness, and exploitation of the weak? Why does God,
who has decreed mercy for himself, allow humans to suffer, to say noth-
ing of his permitting natural catastrophes such as hurricanes and tsuna-
mis? Theologians may claim that evil is actually the absence of good,
amounting to nothing next to the infinite goodness of God, but this is
little comfort to victims of abuse and terror and neglect. And if religion
claims to be the enemy of evil, why has it become easy prey to violent
conflict?

In April 1993, seventy-four members of a Christian group known as
the Branch Davidians were killed in a fire sparked by a botched police
attempt to penetrate the group’s compound in Waco, Texas.14 The po-
lice had initially sought to apprehend the group’s leader, David Koresh,
accused of sexual improprieties, but they soon found themselves in-
volved in a larger conflict. Koresh viewed the standoff through a biblical
lens. He saw it as a sign that the kingdom was at hand. Prophecies
spoke of battles between the forces of evil and a righteous remnant.
There would be conflict. Some would be slaughtered. But Christ’s reign
would follow. Surely the military-like siege of his compound was evi-
dence that the process had irrevocably begun.

Federal authorities were blamed for the tragic outcome, accused of
not understanding the nature of the sect they faced. Koresh is not en-
tirely innocent, however. His brand of piety led him to welcome vio-
lence as potential fulfillment of scriptural prophecy. He saw biblical
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predictions of violence as the culmination of scripture without consider-
ing their deeper intent. As a result, he could not distinguish the mes-
sage of scripture from the events of the world around him. The police
at his gates were the forces of evil, come to initiate the final battle in
which Christ would eventually triumph.

Scripture, both Christian and Muslim, does speak of cosmic battle
that pits good against evil. Believers become part of this battle. They
too are responsible for the struggle for God’s way over Satan’s. But how
is this struggle to be pursued in this world? There can be a tendency to
read the cosmic battle between good and evil into particular political
confrontations. Ronald Reagan did just that in his speeches against the
Soviet Union, which he referred to as the evil empire, although his
willingness to negotiate with the Soviets showed that he did not actually
consider the political confrontation to be spiritual warfare. To be sure,
equating worldly battles with spiritual warfare may be justified if there
is a truly moral cause. Thus, in Islam, it is necessary for the military
leader first to wage war on his soul and its baser ambitions to ensure
that when he goes to war, it is not for his own political interests but for
a truly noble cause.

Alongside this is the particular way scripture is read. Some fear that
anything short of a literal reading of scripture is tantamount to ques-
tioning its divine origin. Believing in the divine origin of scripture is
not problematic in itself, but a literal reading of scripture without atten-
tion to the historical context in which it was written can have unfortu-
nate consequences. That is, reading scripture in such a way makes it
easy to transfer its narrative from one historical moment to another. In
turn, such a fundamentalist reading of God’s word can make it difficult
to distinguish between scriptural narrative and the events unfolding at
the moment. The spiritual warfare that scripture urges is thus read into
political battles that are in fact all too worldly. The worth of scripture,
including the battles it narrates, is tied to its fulfillment on the world
stage. Violence in the world reflects God’s word and takes on divine
purpose. Jihadism therefore follows closely on the heels of projects that
confuse a worldly entity, such as the nation, or a worldly cause, such as
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global supremacy, with God’s purposes. Violence for the sake of a
worldly mission is misconstrued as religious mission. It becomes rea-
sonable from this perspective to think that we can fulfill the purposes
of religion by worldly stratagems. The political foe is understood as
God’s enemy, making negotiation and reconciliation much more diffi-
cult. To take an example, the United States, though its policies some-
times lack purpose, is generally a positive presence in the world. But in
the jihadist mindset, it is God’s enemy, stripped of all worth. It embod-
ies evil, it is an agent of idolatry (taghut), making it the antithesis of
God. This, in turn, makes sense of perpetual violence against it. Also,
some Muslims, associating the United States with Christianity, run the
risk of viewing Christians in general as political enemy as well as reli-
gious deviant.

Christianity has not been immune from such associations. It became
implicated in worldly projects, such as European colonialism and even
Nazism, which some Christians saw as fulfillment of God’s purposes.
In some circles of U.S. evangelicalism, there is a tendency to equate
Christianity with U.S. policymaking.15 This can translate into particular
support for the state of Israel, which one evangelical leader has called
God’s foreign policy. There may be political reasons for the United
States to support Israel, but to see it in biblical terms is to turn the
United States into an agent of religious promise. It is not wrong to
want America to be righteous, but equating its political objectives with
God’s is jihadism. We are taken aback when a Christian leader calls for
the assassination of a standing president who does not align with U.S.
interests. The United States has a moral role in the world, but is it
destined to save the world? If so, it makes sense to impose the American
way of life onto the world for its own redemption.

The war on terror was declared not in the name of Christianity but
for moral purposes, such as national security, global stability, and so on.
Yet, to judge from Christian media in the United States that never tire
of demonizing Islam (not just al-Qaeda) as the enemy, Christianity is
once again at risk of turning a political objective into a heavenly pur-
pose. Underlying this is the hope that in a skeptical age the empirical
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demonstration of religion on the world stage can turn back the tide of
those who say that the monkey and not God is the origin of humanity.
In this sense, the perception among some Christians is that the White
House has the role of demonstrating the truth of Christianity to those
who deny it. It is tempting to believe that utopia, perfection, heaven
can be achieved here on earth. This is not to deny that the hope for the
kingdom to come can inspire believers to great acts of service and char-
ity. The eschatological promise should have some effect here and now.
But this promise remains primarily a hope to be anticipated in a world
to come. Hanging that hope on the affairs of this world invariably re-
quires division of humanity into two camps—God’s friends and God’s
foes, Christ and Antichrist.

The spiritual masters of Islam, like their Christian counterparts, have
long noted the fickle nature of the human soul, likening it to a wild
horse in need of bridling. Here, it is the soul—not Satan—that is true
enemy. Muhammad reportedly asked his companions their view of a
friend whom you serve and honor and afterwards casts you into hell.
This, they reply, would be a false friend. He then asked their view of a
person whom you oppose, whose wishes you refuse, but who, after all
that, leads you to paradise. They reply that this would be a true friend.
Such, the prophet says, is the nature of your soul. Give in to it, it leads
to hell. Deny its inclinations, it leads to heaven.

The deceptive nature of the soul led Muslim scholars to posit a pre-
liminary jihad against the soul as necessary precondition for armed
jihad. Only by first mortifying one’s passions and desires, ensuring that
one is not under the influence of worldly ambitions, can one hope to
enter into war with a godly end in mind rather than one’s own ambi-
tions. That is, war-making cannot be pursued in the name of religion
without first ordering the soul to God rather than worldly ends. War-
making that makes supremacy its goal rather than a moral purpose has
no religious sanction, since its goal is worldly domination.

This is hardly to deny religion a role in public life. Leaving ethics
entirely to the state (i.e., to secular authorities) is problematic, because
the state sometimes needs to be checked, a role religion continues to
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play, sometimes with dramatic success—one thinks of the contribution
of John Paul II to the demise of communism. Moreover, state institu-
tions, we know, do not alone guarantee the moral life of the nation,
and so religion does have a place in helping the state achieve its purpose,
namely, the public good, even, perhaps especially, in democratic socie-
ties where individuals enjoy great freedom to pursue their private ambi-
tions sometimes recklessly. All the same, religion is in danger when it
equates heavenly purposes with state purposes. Why does it sometimes
do so?

If, as the Qur’an proposes, monotheism is key to the eradication of
injustice that comes about when people set themselves up as lords, it is
not difficult to see how Muslims would conclude that a just society can
be achieved only if governed by Islam, a kind of religious governance
by shari‘a ensuring that all people get their due as equal servants of
God. The idea that justice is served only under Islam seems a bit odd,
given that human societies have achieved a measure of justice without
Islam and even without revealed guidance, a point admitted by Muslim
scholars, most famously by Ibn Khaldun, who concluded in the four-
teenth century that although religion can serve a worldly purpose, rule,
if just, can last without it. However, for Islam at its beginnings, in the
tribal context into which it was born, monotheism was the most effec-
tive guarantor of justice for all, and so it was felt that prayer to the one
God was not enough. A polity in which Islam held sway was also
needed to ensure justice.

From this departure point, Islam, while remaining true to monothe-
istic morality, also took on political and territorial dimensions, some-
thing akin to European Christendom. Religion was no longer simply
the morality of monotheism but civilization as well: the abode of Islam
which, despite internal fragmentation, was a more or less clearly demar-
cated territory under caliphs and sultans governing in the name of
Islam. The abode of Islam (dar al-islam) was set against lands where
Islam did not hold sway, designated as the abode of war (dar al-harb),
that is, not yet subordinate to the monotheistic justice of Islam. It is
worth noting, however, just as the concept of Christendom is not to be
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found in the New Testament, so too the phrases abode of Islam and
abode of war do not exist in Qur’an and Sunna.

The reality of rule in the name of Islam did not mean that Islam
became a state affair. Rulers were not the mediators of religion. That
was the role of shari‘a scholars, guardians of morality as heirs to the
teaching authority of the prophet. The law-making capacity of the ruler
was limited to worldly governance (siyasa), including tax collection, the
organization of the army, and so on. The ruler was also subject to God’s
ways as embodied in shari‘a, understood in this sense as the rule of law.

Jihad took on diverse meanings in response to these shifting histori-
cal circumstances. In principle, to defend or extend shari‘a was seen as
ample cause for jihad, but it is important to remember that the classical
doctrine of jihad was formulated in a context of empire. The religious
scholars generally worked to ensure the moral purpose of jihad, setting
out rules for military conduct in battle that limited the use of force to
those elements of the enemy’s populace that constituted a threat to the
Muslims. Force could not be used against the populace entire, only
its combatants. At the same time, within the political culture of the
premodern past, the concept of jihad was shaped in light of the imperial
dynamic, that is, defending and extending territorial dominion. It is in
this sense that Islam took on a territorial character as one abode in
opposition to another, when, in fact, the morality of monotheism, as
Islam’s scholars themselves insist, does not depend on location. Were
Muslims who lived or did business outside the abode of Islam relieved
of religiously defined morals?

This division of the world into two abodes, even if not revealed by
God, has become a familiar part of Muslim consciousness. But it is
worth asking whether such a division of human existence is viable in
this age where Muslims live in virtually every part of the globe. There
is now no line—if there ever was—to distinguish where the abode of
Islam ends and the abode of war begins. It would be all too easy to
globalize jihad, to make it an individual duty simply to fight the enemy
on all global fronts without a clear sense of the moral purpose of de-
fending a particular territory and protecting the legitimate interests of
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its people. Traditionally, jihad did become an individual duty when the
Muslim army was unable to repel the enemy. However, even as individ-
ual duty, the goal was moral, not ritual display of piety. Jihadism, linked
to a global identity rather than a moral purpose, actually ends by killing
Muslims whose lives and properties jihad in its original meaning is
supposed to protect.

The combination of religion and empire was also the norm in Chris-
tian lands before and even after the rise of the nation state. The ruling
houses of Europe, the Hapsburgs, Bourbons, and Windsors, to say
nothing of Ferdinand and Isabella, los reyes catolicos of the Iberian pen-
insula and its many overseas dominions, were not too different in this
respect from their Muslim counterparts: Umayyads, Abbasids, Otto-
mans, and so on. Christianity too went hand in hand with empire ex-
tension, and let us not forget Pope Urban II. In a speech at Clermont,
France, in 1095 he called Christendom to a crusade to liberate the holy
land. His speech wove pious devotion together with political and terri-
torial goals, arguing that infidels had occupied Christian land. What
does it mean to say that land has a religious character? Identifying
worldly goals with the purpose of religion, Urban II linked warfare with
salvation, promising forgiveness of sins to those who answered the call
to crusade. This logic, where warfare becomes worship, is jihadism par
excellence.

It did not go unnoticed that caliphs and sultans rose and fell and
fought one another. Even if Muslims have a strong sense of belonging
to a single umma, the abode of Islam never achieved political unity.
Some Muslim potentates made alliances with infidel powers—even
with Crusaders. For a time in the thirteenth century, the greater part of
the abode of Islam fell to the Mongols, yet Islam survived and even
flourished despite the loss of imperial sway. That politics was incapable
of representing the purposes of religion was never a source of anxiety
because worldly power was not seen as guarantor of the religious integ-
rity of the community. That was the work of shari‘a scholars and spiri-
tual masters who taught people the ways of God and inspired them to
journey to his throne. When it came to caliphs and sultans, the abode
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of Islam was hopelessly fragmented. Its unity lay in a realm of shared
morality and spirituality as led by scholarly and saintly authorities who
themselves sometimes bickered but always recognized where heavenly
truth lay—with God. The political order was not irrelevant to the pur-
poses of Islam, but it did not have to be perfectly religious itself. It was
not the mediator of religious truth.

All this underwent dramatic change with colonial rule. Many blamed
the preference for moral and spiritual concerns over politics as the rea-
son for the weakness (some said backwardness) of the abode of Islam
in the face of Europe. The independent movements were partly con-
ceived as a drive to restore true Islam, that is, the Islam of the past that
had put Muslims at the top of human civilization. Religious revival was
increasingly understood to have a political purpose. Jihad was recast as
a patriotic struggle, not on behalf of God or even the caliphal leader
theoretically at the helm of a single abode of Islam, but now on behalf
of the nation. Islam in general—and jihad along with it—was welded
to the quest for national strength.

This story, the story of Islam as expression of national identity, is still
unfolding and is the subject of the next chapter. The rise of jihadism is
part of this story, whereby Islam became recast as a political project.
How has jihad come to serve the purposes of terrorism? How has jihad
for supremacy replaced jihad for morality, the jihad of al-Qaeda dis-
lodging the jihad of the Qur’an? This development has been harmful
to Muslims and, indeed, to Islam and has required tremendous global
resources and energies to combat.

The easy answer is that the more extreme brands of Islamism became
frustrated. Secular dictators remained in power, hindering the hope for
political liberalization that would allow Islamist parties to come to
power through elections. This, combined with a misplaced pride in
having repulsed a superpower from Afghanistan, an accomplishment
that would have been impossible without U.S. support, led some Islam-
ists to look to the global rather than national stage as site of spiritual
warfare. The pharaoh to be fought was not the ruler of a nation, such
as the president of Egypt, but the ruler of the world, that is, the United
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States and its various allies. This, of course, is only to talk of begin-
nings. Jihadism today has moved in so many directions, but it is worth
emphasizing the shift from national to global stage. It became logical
to think of jihad as a battle for a religious identity, a virtual umma
with no boundaries, rather than a struggle for a moral purpose. And
Wahhabism, as noted earlier, helped set the stage, especially its idea
of condemning Muslims who seem to associate partners with God.
This condemnation of associating partners with God was originally
aimed at those Muslims who invoked saints and revered imams. How-
ever, jihadism recast Wahhabism in political terms, claiming that the
ruler who fails to represent divine sovereignty is a tyrannical idol
(taghut): The scriptural narrative is mapped onto political affairs. Thus
Muslims, whether soldier or civilian, who recognize the authority of
secular rule become legitimate objects of attack, making it entirely
logical to see conflict as the place where God’s final judgment is deter-
mined. It is for this reason that the jihadist mindset sees violence
against fellow Muslims, now God’s enemies, as a way to render oneself
pleasing to God. Indeed, death in battle, one’s own death, becomes
the highest mark of piety. Death is often considered the ultimate sign
of devotion to a cause. We revere soldiers who die in battle in defense
of the nation even if in hindsight we recognize the cause was not
entirely true. But here, the battle is a heavenly one and therefore knows
no bounds.

The reduction of religion, originally a call to God, to a worldly battle
can be illustrated by a series of apostasy cases in Egypt in the 1980s and
1990s.16 In Islam, the apostate can be forced to divorce his wife if she is
Muslim, because it is not permitted for a Muslim woman to be married
to a non-Muslim man. The apostate could face death for having be-
trayed the religion of God, although this punishment does not apply
to the female apostate. These cases, which put on trial a number of
intellectuals, were remarkable in that state officials—not shari‘a schol-
ars—were made arbiters of beliefs. They were to decide the orthodoxy
of these intellectuals on the basis of their writings even when these
intellectuals professed their belief in Islam.
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In the past apostasy in Islam was not determined by state inquisition
and assessment of interior convictions but by the declarations of the
accused. Moreover, even if declaring himself not to be a Muslim, he
might be ostracized by the community but could not be punished by
the state unless his unbelief was accompanied by a declaration of war
on Muslim society—in other words, only if his unbelief constituted a
danger to a public order that was based in Islam and ensured (but not
defined) by the state.

In contrast, in these recent cases, what mattered was not the
defendants’ self-understanding but examination of writings that the
ideologically minded Muslim plaintiffs wanted the state to define as
unorthodox. These cases, then, amounted to proxy battle. The ultimate
concern for the Islamist plaintiffs was the nature of the state’s orienta-
tion—secular or religious. In other words, the intellectuals accused of
apostasy were simply collateral damage in a much larger—now global—
battle in which jihad has become the vehicle for realizing the purposes
of religion in a quest for supremacy over the secular state. In the pre-
modern past, morality had been the affair of religion, but the modern
state, once it came into being, claimed all authority for itself, including
realms that had once been left to religion to define. Thus, in seeking
revenge for the state’s usurpation of its moral authority, religion risks
overstepping the limits of its jurisdiction. As such, it risks recreating
itself in the secular image of the state. That is, religion, as in these
apostasy cases, can unwittingly accept the secularist assumption that
religion is the state’s to define and that it is at the state level that iden-
tity, religious or secular, is to be contested.

In this sense, al-Qaeda is no example of God breaking out, as if
representing the wrath of God against a world bereft of capacity for
him. Rather, it is a case of the secularization of the religious imagina-
tion, religiosity operating on secular rather than on religious terms. The
point is that religion is now contesting secularism, and sometimes beat-
ing it, on its own terms. Once modernity discarded the public relevancy
of religion, making science, not religion, the guide to human society,
piety, to show its credibility, had to demonstrate its meaning in worldly
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form. As the Enlightenment posited, the only reality is that which can
be empirically verified, a secular principle that some believers have ac-
cepted. As a result, the only way to demonstrate the empirical verifi-
ability of the kingdom to come is to act it out on the world stage in
spiritual warfare now thoroughly identified with global affairs. Jihad is
the struggle to manifest God’s word and to elevate it above all, but this
is based on the recognition that God’s word can never be adequately
represented as political project. Jihadism, by contrast, accepts the prin-
ciple of modern secularism that only this world matters. Thus, with al-
Qaeda, religion ironically aspires to modernist heights, assuming that
only political institutions can represent God’s word, and if they fail to
do that, they and those who recognize their authority are to be fought.

This is the secular dilemma that religion faces. The premodern state,
the dynasty, had no organic relation to its subjects. It ruled, collected
taxes, and was expected to preserve order, but it did not define people’s
moral character. That was generally left to one’s cultural and religious
heritage. The modern nation state, in contrast, claims an organic (i.e.,
total) relation to its people, now defined as citizens, no longer subjects.
As representative of the people rather than only the dynasty, the mod-
ern state sometimes claims the authority to define all aspects of national
life, including the moral character of society as represented in its educa-
tional programs. In other words, with modernity, morality often turns
into a state affair, defined by national legislation, a state project to
which religion itself is to conform. As a result, belief can itself become
secularized, looking to worldly projects to justify itself in the face of the
Enlightenment’s denial of nonempirical existence, such as the world
to come.17 The state, then, became touchstone of religious legitimacy,
(though, of course, many Christians and Muslims continued to tie reli-
gious legitimacy to spiritual authority or individual reading of scrip-
ture). Indeed, the state was looked to as primary representative of the
transcendent.18 It is in this world and not the other that the kingdom
of God is to be realized.

There is some echo of this in the witch hunts that peaked in Europe,
not during the Middle Ages, as many assume, but in the sixteenth and
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seventeenth centuries, when the Renaissance and Reformation were in
full swing and when the first signs appeared of a Christian interest in
making state authority the arbiter of true religion. One sees this equa-
tion of church and state authority in Calvin’s Geneva, whereas pre-
viously the state had been understood to enforce religion but not
define it. Witch-hunting, as argued by Rodney Stark, was not as wide-
spread or bloody as commonly imagined today.19 The accused often
confessed their sins and went home. His central point, however, is
that witch-hunts did not exist in isolation but formed part of a larger
battle for Christian truth that took on decidedly political, even mili-
tary, overtones.

Witches were not viewed as witches so much as heretics. It was not
a matter of a single predominant faith and a bit of black-magic sorcery
on the margin of society. What sorcery there might have been in the
past was marginal. But much more was now at stake, because a single
faith no longer held sway over Europe but instead multiple Christiani-
ties. And these varied Christianities not only had followings and insti-
tutional holdings but also increasingly looked to state authorities, kings
and princes, for legitimacy, whereas formerly it had generally been the
state that looked to religion, church authorities, for legitimacy. Witch-
hunts, like the apostasy cases mentioned earlier, were collateral damage
in a larger battle involving religion, not only religion but religion that
increasingly looked to political dominion as mark, and thus mediation,
of the truth of its claims. It is easy to deceive ourselves into thinking
that a belief must be true simply because it prevails politically.

Jihadism, that is, terrorism in the name of religion, can be under-
stood similarly. The victims of jihadism are collateral damage in a much
larger battle that is ideological rather than moral. Who is to be supreme
master of the political realm, now global and not simply national in
scope? Will it be secular or religious authority? And in this postmodern
moment, when secularism has been exposed to be—quite like reli-
gion—not scientifically neutral but simply another point of view with
its own values and principles, it can no longer claim uncontested mas-
tery over the public sphere, but must demonstrate its worth in the face



138 CHAPTER FOUR

of religion. Islam as well as Christianity and other religions in some of
their forms have locked horns with secularism at the state level as the
place where moral authority is located and thus legitimated. Are mor-
als to be secular or religious? Conceiving of the public sphere in such
either-or categories is, however, to think of things not in terms of the
good of all but rather in terms of the identity that is to be supreme in
the public sphere. The myths are not false in themselves: belief over
unbelief, good over evil, God over Pharaoh. What makes them false
is the assumption that their legitimacy can be secured only through
supremacy. The fear is that religion, if reduced to spirituality, will have
no relevancy for society, and so the spiritual dimension of religion, its
very heart, is easily discarded. Our discussion of character in chapter 3

shows that both Christianity and Islam recognize the ethical impact of
spirituality. Religion need not be politically supreme for it to be relevant
to the world.

Jihadism deploys violence of the most dramatic kind to make a
pointed statement, to challenge the assumption that the world’s author-
ities are masters of this realm. If they were, they would be able to con-
trol jihadism. Jihadists are therefore making it known in perverse
fashion that they, self-proclaimed representatives of God’s word, will
not submit to the secular powers of this world. The jihadist use of
worldly force to manifest God’s power, however, makes them very
much like the secular authorities they disdain. Furthermore, the victims
of terrorism, like the witches of the past, are simply convenient targets
used by jihadists to prove that they decide who lives and who dies, that
truth is in their hands, that they are the ones in control of the world,
and that they too—not only modern states that claim a monopoly on
the legitimate use of force—can brandish power in this world.

Jihadism shows that violence can be expressed in religious no less
than in secular terms. But violence in religious attire only clothes deeper
anxieties about the place of religion in today’s world. Witch-hunts were
only an extreme form of struggle for Christian truth. The struggle be-
tween different forms of Christianity was largely pursued by other
means: theological debate, polemics, and political maneuvering short of
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killing and maiming. Similarly, jihadism is only an extreme form of
the struggle today to find space for religion in the world. The public
manifestation of religion is not generally expressed through terrorism
but rather through media channels, political lobbying, grassroots orga-
nization, charitable endeavors, development initiatives, and debate with
secularists as well as with other believers.

The question, then, is not whether religion should be permitted to
express itself publicly but how? How is jihad to be understood today?
Terrorism, which in the recent past was secular rather than religious, is
only one among many options. It is worth considering one example of
jihad that holds to the moral implications of beliefs and refuses to re-
duce beliefs to identity. Here, utopia in this world is rejected and there-
fore recourse to violence to bring it about is denied. Here, the
orientation of religion remains a kingdom to come, always in the future,
certainly not irrelevant for human purposes in this world, but never
quite completely here and now. Here, religion is not group identity but
consciousness of the transcendent.

The example comes from nineteenth-century Algeria. The populace
had been brutally pacified by the French military to subject them to
purportedly civilized rule. The true threat to Algeria was not French
military might but the attempt to remake Algerian society in the French
image. The aim was not only to conquer Algerian lands but also Alge-
rian souls, stripping them of a native character that had been nurtured
by local customs and Muslim beliefs. The goal, then, was to liberate
them from their Muslim capacity for God. Many Algerians did assume
European ways, convinced that only by becoming like the French would
they be able to resist them. In other words, Algerian nationalists came
to see jihad as a struggle for the nation in and of itself, apart from other
considerations. This is not to trivialize the patriotic struggle. To equate
it with jihad as struggle for God without referencing the moral and
spiritual heritage that has long informed jihad, however, makes violence
for the nation ordinary rather than extraordinary, familiar and common
rather than limited to a specific time, place, and purpose.

This has been the tragic outcome in Algeria, especially in the 1990s
but still today. By playing the game according to French rules, the
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Algerian soul has come to resemble its past master, willingly using vio-
lence so that identity, rather than morality, might be supreme. It
doesn’t matter whether identity is religious or secular, the result is the
same. Both secular authorities and Islamist militants in Algeria have
adopted the methods of the former colonial overlords, namely brutal
violence. This parallels al-Qaeda and the global response to it, where
power is deployed on various sides to assert identity without referencing
morality or spirituality.

There were extraordinary exceptions to the nationalization of jihad
in Algeria, notably a spiritual figure of great influence by the name of
Shaykh ‘Alawi.20 He did advise his disciples, numbering in the thou-
sands, not to accept French citizenship, because he felt that adoption
of French law would undermine their moral character as Muslims. He
also did not oppose the struggle for independence per se. He was not
at all pleased, however, by the disdain resistance leaders showed for
the spiritual heritage of Algeria, which they viewed as an obstacle to
nationalist goals, casting it aside for a secularized version of religion.
For Shaykh ‘Alawi, the greatest threat to Islam and its moral character
was not the French colonial project but rather Muslims who saw fit to
reduce Islam to a secular, that is, political, struggle. This, he foresaw,
would lay the groundwork for the dismissal of God as true sovereign,
leading Muslims to set themselves up as masters over others for the
sake of identity apart from other moral considerations, effectively re-
placing God as purported masters of this world—the very sin the
Qur’an warns against. For ‘Alawi, the nationalists had essentially world-
ified their outlook on life, unable to see God in the world to come, only
their own glory in this one.

‘Alawi, in contrast, adhered to the message of the Qur’an: ‘‘The true
way to hurt the enemy is to be occupied with the love of the [divine]
Friend; on the one hand, if you engage in war with the enemy, he will
have obtained what he wanted from you [i.e., he will have made you
like him], and at the same time you will have lost the opportunity of
loving the Friend [i.e., you will lose sight of God by turning religion
into a secular affair].’’21 For ‘Alawi, battling the French on their terms
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would keep Muslims from their true purposes, namely consideration of
God. This would be the victory the French sought, secularization of the
Muslim soul, disposing it to politics of the most violent kind.

‘Alawi offers insight into the struggle with evil and therefore the
religious mission in this world. It may be necessary to struggle with evil
amidst the realities of the world, but evil may be compounded by the
realities of a soul that is not ordered to a purpose beyond politics alone.
‘Alawi certainly viewed French annexation of Algeria as a great injus-
tice—a failure on the part of the French to appreciate the moral point
of the Qur’an’s monotheistic message. But the greatest error in his view
was the Algerian response in kind: It was driven not by monotheistic
morality but by the same motives that drove the French. The Algerian
resistance had dangerously opened itself to take on aspects of the very
evil that it sought to repel.

In the end, it is necessary to return to the Qur’an and its conception
of shirk (polytheism) as an evil to be battled against. It is certainly de-
batable whether action that is not ordered to God (i.e., that does not
involve a proper ordering of the soul) can be truly just, because some
would say justice does not depend on the disclosure of the one God.
But the Qur’an—and Shaykh ‘Alawi—would have an ally in Saint Au-
gustine, key architect of Christian thinking on just war. Augustine
claimed that the earthly city glories only in itself whereas the heavenly
city glories in God.22 Moreover, he argued, in the earthly city, the lust
for domination lords it over its princes, as over the nations it subjugates.
And so, one city, the earthly city, loves its own strengths as displayed
by powerful leaders, whereas the other city, the heavenly city, says to
God, ‘‘I will love you, my Lord, my strength.’’23 For Augustine, Chris-
tians, even if dwelling in the earthly city, were still to order their souls
not to its purposes but to those of the heavenly one.

It is not possible to ask secular authorities, whose mission is to ensure
law and order in the earthly city, to make contemplation of God a
policy objective in the war on terror, but all of us, regardless of our
beliefs, must guard against lending our souls to the ideological tenden-
cies of global politics today, lest we become like the evil we seek to
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repel. The state is a good within the earthly city and is constrained to
operate according to its secular principles. But believers, though they
acknowledge the legitimacy of the state, have another mission to pur-
sue. They do not want to be deprived of God’s presence. Ironically, this
is the result when religion is reduced to ideology apart from moral
considerations. A common Christian-Muslim jihad to counter jihadism
can be undertaken, drawing on the moral vigor of Paul and Muham-
mad. Its main occupation, to echo Shaykh ‘Alawi, would be the divine
friend, or, in echo of Saint Augustine, the proper ordering of the soul
to the heavenly city. Ultimately, a state-led war against religious terror-
ism is not going to be enough to contain it and may even prolong it by
treating religion in state-like terms. No one seems interested in Islam
as a religious consciousness any longer, and some are surprised to learn
that Islam is in fact a religion. In other words, we have all fallen into
the trap of viewing religion as a political category.

Serious, widespread, and sustained discussion is needed about the
public expression of religion and the jihad proper to it. The discussion
needs to include Christian-Muslim recognition of God whose reign,
even if anticipated, is beyond human history. It can be contemplated as
inspiration in the struggle for moral righteousness in communities and
societies and not only individual life, but it cannot be realized as politi-
cal goal. As Augustine noted, there is no point in a nation going to war
if it ‘‘seeks to be victorious over other nations, though it is itself the
slave of [its own] base passions.’’24 A hadith puts it another way: ‘‘God
the Blessed and Exalted grants rewards according to intention.’’ The
question, then, at least for believers, is whether our intention is truly
monotheistic, truly oriented to God as source of truth or to something
else. Crusades can be moral or ideological. The same is true of jihad.
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ISLAM

More or Less Democratic than Christianity?

IN THE QUR’AN, God delegates care of the world not to a single
individual but to Adam and his progeny, making all people his rep-

resentatives (caliphs) on earth. Is this a divine mandate for democracy?
The Qur’an is not a political tract. The point, rather, is the human
responsibility to live morally. Echoing this, a hadith stipulates obedi-
ence to rulers as long as they do not command disobedience to God. In
other words, public life is to be governed according to ethical principles,
not the law of the jungle where the powerful dominate the weak. At
the very least, rulers are not to prevent people from fulfilling religious
duties that stand at the heart of a pious society. But God’s delegation
of power to humans raises questions about the nature and purpose of
rule in Islam. Is it a religious contract binding society to the ways of
God? Or is it a social contract whereby rulers govern in the interests of
the people? Does this make democracy irrelevant so long as the com-
mon good is served? What happens when rule fails its purpose? Are
Muslims to create a parallel society governed by the laws of Islam or
quietly pray for better days?

Such questions are not unknown in Christianity. To make salvation
available to all nations, Saint Paul tied it to faith in Christ apart from a
particular body of religious laws. This does not mean that Christians
have no legal concerns but rather that the grace of God is not limited
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to a cultural way of life and its attendant legal norms. Indeed, the Gos-
pel states that Christ’s kingdom is not of this world. Even if inaugu-
rated by the work of God in Jesus, it is not translatable into a political
project. The second letter of Peter exhorts believers ‘‘to honor the ruler.’’
That is, earthly power has its own purpose and differs fundamentally
from the kingdom of God. Yet the Christian message is not free of
political import. Loyalty ultimately belongs to God. This created ten-
sions for early Christians who were soldiers in the Roman army. It
continues to create tensions for contemporary Christians who challenge
regimes that beget economic injustice, neglect the poor, or fail to de-
fend the family. This is particularly troubling when such failings occur
under democratic rule. Are Christians to resist or simply wait for the
kingdom to come? How are believers to participate in God’s victory
over sin?1

Polls show a high level of Muslim support for both democracy and
public respect for Islam.2 Muslims combine secular and religious ideas
in thinking about national life. Does this mean they cannot be demo-
cratic? Democracy was not revealed by God. It arose to limit tyranny,
but religion can support democracy.3 Believers who hold that God is
the sole, unchallengeable authority look askance at rulers who set them-
selves above the law. The Qur’an is clear: God alone is Lord. The
authority of religion can be abused, but it also questions abusive power,
the prototype being Moses’ challenge of Pharaoh as recounted in both
Bible and Qur’an. It is therefore wrong to make secularization a precon-
dition for democracy. Some say that only by removing religious ideas
from the public sphere can people vote their conscience free of ideologi-
cal hindrance. Democracy in this sense is impossible: The conscience is
always informed by a set of beliefs, religious or secular, and people do
not discount them when voting. Democracy is the ability of all mem-
bers of a nation to contest public office, especially the highest, through
free and fair elections. It does not demand moral neutrality. It is rule
by the people but it is not relativism. In this sense it has something in
common with religion.

There are varied understandings of democracy. A key issue is equal-
ity. All Muslims acknowledge that only God is God. This, in principle,
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levels the playing field: No one has a privileged right to rule. At the
same time, there is a sense that rule should reflect the divine will in
some fashion. But God shows no sign of descending from his heavenly
throne to rule his creatures directly. In Islam, a messianic figure known
as the mahdi has occasionally emerged to rule directly on God’s behalf,
but this has always coincided with unusual circumstances in which
Islam is felt to be under grave threat, making direct divine intervention
vital to its well-being, and rule by the mahdi never lasts. It is a kind of
politics that serves a specific moment but is unsustainable over the long
term.

For this reason, Islam does not make politics the testing ground for
the religious integrity of the umma. Islam’s religious authorities some-
times act as counselors to rulers, and do call them to rule justly, but do
not see government as the primary agent in the struggle for belief over
unbelief. It is in the mosque, on pilgrimage, in the spiritual company
of the prophet Muhammad, and, ultimately, on judgment day, where
divine favor is won, not in royal courts or national assemblies. Politics
is to be guided by ethics but is not the place where beliefs are fulfilled.
The idea of a religious state, which has its adherents, has always been
rejected, not simply because it is politically ineffective, but more so
because it is theologically flawed.

This helps explain Muslim support for democracy in the sense of
political equality. Only God is God. No one has a special right to rule.
All are entitled to hold power if they merit it. However, political equal-
ity is one thing, moral equality is another. Although democracy has yet
to take hold in many a Muslim society, Muslims do call for government
accountability and fuller representation of the interests of the people in
national decision making. But this does not mean that all lifestyles have
equal space in the public sphere. In some Muslim societies the vote has
not been given to all (or to any), but these are the exceptions (notably
Saudi Arabia). In most places where Islam prevails, everyone has the
right to vote regardless of beliefs, and Islam enshrines certain general
principles that Muslims and non-Muslims alike embrace: justice, pro-
tection of the weak, punishment of crime, fair business practices, equal
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treatment before the law, and so on. Islam, however, also has specific
teachings on the nature of marriage, the beginning and end of life,
modest dress, financial transactions (based on profit-sharing rather than
predetermined interest), the place of religion in national education, and
curbs on some kinds of expression (slander, hate speech, or blasphemy)
when harmful to public interests; this could include public consumption
of food during Ramadan. In a nation with a Muslim majority, popular
sentiment may favor public commitment to these norms to ensure that
the polity as a whole enjoys God’s favor.

All nations give greater weight to certain voices. In the United
States, everyone has a vote, and the law does not discriminate between
one group and another, at least not since the 1960s, but the nation does
not judge all points of view equally. The capitalist is preferred to the
socialist. In some places the atheist must speak discretely, whereas in
others it is the believer who needs to be on guard. Every nation strikes
a balance between the political equality of all and the nation’s values,
which may not represent all ways of life. In the United States, some
religious groups vigorously defend the family against court efforts to
devalue it in the name of equality. It is not that such voices oppose
equality or the civil rights of all citizens. Rather, they recognize a hierar-
chy of truths that may limit equality of individual choice. For others, of
course, individual choice is the touchstone of moral truth. The point,
then, is that democracy is a form of politics but also a way a nation
expresses its values in law. Is democracy, then, the right of all to aspire
to political office or is it the right of all to determine moral values? The
concept of equality that began as a political notion has now moved into
the arena of morals, and this is the point of contention.

How, then, is a secular state to rule democratically over a believing
nation? A democratic government cannot ignore the values of its people
in the name of political equality. Here, however, we are asking a differ-
ent question. Do Muslim and Christian beliefs encourage or discourage
democracy? Does religion make the world safer for democracy? God
did not command one political system over another but instead worship
and good works. There must be specific reasons, political and theologi-
cal, that make democracy the choice of believers. Christianity and
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Islam, each in its own way, recognize that freedom is best for religion,
to protect it from state control and to allow believers to live its message
without hindrance. But to demand freedom for religion means granting
it to all, including those who publicly attack religion. Is liberty a conun-
drum for believers? In many Muslim lands, the state controls religion
and many religious figures would like greater independence from the
state but would still want the values of Islam to be affirmed at a national
level. Moreover, believers generally do not advocate anarchy but instead
affirm a set of truths. Freedom, then, is not an end in itself but instead
has a moral purpose. This may also be true for nonbelievers whose
truths are philosophical rather than religious. Is there an objective moral
order? If so, is it something humans aspire to freely or something the
state is to impose by force?

It may be tempting for believers to hope for a pious dictator to en-
force God’s will by political decree, as occurred in Pakistan under the
military rule of Zia-ul-Haqq (1977–1988). But the close association of
religion with rule invariably compromises religion, turning it into a co-
ercive tool of political power. Religion is a moral guide for society but
is no longer effective as such once made into a state project. Islam has
long worked to protect societies from political tyranny by defending
moral principles that originate in God. It can no longer do so once
religious authority is ceded to the state, as witnessed in Iran and the
Sudan.

The challenge for believers in this age is to win public representation
of their values by democratic processes. This requires a willingness to
abide by unfavorable results. Riots broke out in Jos, Nigeria, with much
loss of life when the Muslim-backed party lost state elections in No-
vember 2008. The followers of Muqtada al-Sadr made threatening
comments when the Iraqi parliament approved the security agreement
with the United States in November 2008. Hezbollah of Lebanon and
Hamas of Palestine have effectively participated in elections but have
also used violence against fellow citizens, making it unclear whether
they are democratically oriented parties or ideological movements with
militant propensities. There are counter examples. From Malaysia to
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Morocco, Islamist parties generally seek not to dominate but rather to
participate in political processes that do not always yield desired results.4

It is, then, possible to speak of jihad as a democratic struggle in which
all Adam’s progeny are recognized as God’s caliphs on earth even when
they do not vote for the Islamist project. Moral relativism is certainly a
slippery slope for believers and nonbelievers alike, and religious relativ-
ism is a challenge for believers. Can a framework of truth be preserved
at a time when respect for the individual conscience is widely acknowl-
edged? This balancing act is noticeable in Dignitatis humanae, the Vati-
can II document on religious liberty, which affirms the dignity of the
individual conscience even when failing to affirm the truth. In this fash-
ion, a framework of religious and moral truth is retained but dissent is
not cause to devalue the worth of a human being.

Why do believers opt for democracy even when affirming a hierarchy
of moral truths? Political repression, especially when directed at reli-
gion, demonstrates the need for liberty—not as an end in itself but to
protect the religion. Undemocratic contexts alone, however, do not al-
ways persuade believers of the benefits of democracy. There also has to
be a sense that the will of God, at least in some areas of national life,
has not been determined in advance (i.e., revealed). Can the will of
God be squared with the will of the people? Is God’s will for the nation
known in advance, simply needing implementation? Do people intu-
itively know God’s designs for the nation apart from explicit religious
instruction? Has God left space for people to determine his will? The
Muslim Brotherhood of Egypt, for example, opposes the appointment
of women judges and the possibility of non-Muslims running for presi-
dent, though not for lower offices. At the same time it acknowledges
that alternate viewpoints exist within Islam. The people, then, are to
decide where exactly the will of God lies in these and other matters.5

The resistance to power-sharing, of course, comes from authoritar-
ian rulers, not Muslim peoples. Jordan and Morocco are technically
constitutional monarchies, ruling in the name of Islam, but effective
power lies with the court and the prime minister is appointed by the
king, not parliament. Saudi Arabia is a dynastic monarchy under which
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leading members of the ruling clan hold key positions of state. The
Saudis cede moral supervision of society to a cadre of religious authori-
ties who in turn leave policy matters to the monarchy apart from popu-
lar input. Iran, Pakistan, and the Sudan are Islamic republics, but
limiting republican government to religious teachings has made it easy
for charismatic figures—whether clerics or generals—to claim a divine
mandate and ignore the will of the people. Muslim society also knows
secular republics ruled by life-term presidents: Algeria, Egypt, Syria,
and Tunisia. Oddly, in such secular states, the constitution defines
Islam as official religion of the state or requires the president to be
Muslim, and a state ministry of religious affairs supervises mosque ap-
pointments, religious curriculum, and so on. In such undemocratic con-
texts, Islamist groups act as important channels of popular opposition.
They also seek to wrest religious authority from state control. But they
are not clearly prodemocratic. They seek to displace the secular monop-
oly on religious authority, but some would replace the secular dictator-
ship with a religious one. What is the point of religious liberty? Is it
freedom for the sake of religious supremacy? Or freedom for all whether
or not they accept Islam? Can freedom be demanded for Islam without
granting it to all?

One cannot ignore economic realities. Most people today embrace a
democratic discourse. Still, in poorer areas of the world, the need to
work out a viable democracy may take second place to more pressing
concerns. In both Morocco and Jordan, there is unofficial competition
between the monarchy and political parties in meeting the people’s
needs. Who can deliver the goods more effectively? This competition
has a democratic element in that both monarchy and political parties
seek to win the hearts of the people, but it is impossible to compete
with the king’s resources. As a result, for the time being, the people
affirm monarchy over the institutionalization of democracy as a more
effective way to meet their basic needs. Moreover, a host of other issues
that have nothing to do with Islam can make democracy appear suspi-
cious or irrelevant to personal and national welfare: high levels of crony-
ism in the political parties, alternative sources of representation (such
as tribe or religious brotherhood), and so on.
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In Islam, religious authority is generally not the privilege of political
power, but political power is expected to adhere to certain principles in
governing society. The legitimacy of sultans or shahs rested on their
willingness to back shari‘a as the moral order of society, but political
power itself was not a religious affair. The reason for this is simple.
God is silent on the matter. The Qur’an speaks of righteous prosperity
as the way of believers but does not specify the political order to achieve
it. As a result, Muslims over the centuries have been open to all political
systems, from monarchy to democracy, as long as they are responsive to
the moral values of Islam, understood as best guarantor of righteous
prosperity. Indeed, when it came to the constitution of rule in Islam,
Muslims have long drawn on secular knowledge: Greco-Hellenistic
philosophy, Persian counsel for rulers, Byzantine forms of administra-
tion, Turkic-Mongol military prowess, and, today, Euro-American
ideas about nationhood. Muslims look to human civilization at large to
understand the purpose of rule as well as effective means of governance
(i.e., tax collection, military organization, security, public works, and
the like). In this sense, religion and rule are not one and the same. They
occupy distinct spheres, operating in a complementary fashion for the
greater good of Muslim society. An ancient saying with circulation in
classical Islam expresses the idea this way: ‘‘Religion and rule are twins.
Rule without religion has no foundation, and religion without rule has
no guardian.’’ Mitt Romney could not have put it better.6

Alongside rulers, religious scholars, the keepers of shari‘a, have acted
as custodians of the moral order. No potentate, even a descendant of
the prophet Muhammad, could ignore the religious teachings that these
scholars transmitted from one generation to the next. In this sense, the
good of Muslim society operated through division of labor. A dynastic
house exercised political power through a variety of administrative and
military offices. It was expected to rule justly for the sake of stability
and order, but such earthly power was transitory. The Qur’an speaks of
God giving rule and taking it away as he wishes. Worldly potentates
may come and go, but Islam ensures continuity through a set of moral
expectations to which all are subject. Religious scholars were always in
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the employ of sultans and shahs, but many kept their distance from
politics. At the same time, religion has had a relation to political power
in Islam, but views on the matter differed. To contextualize the discus-
sion, it will be worth mentioning three in brief.

Ibn Taymiyya (died 1328), who lived during the Mongol conquests,
showed little interest in restoring the Abbasid caliphate and did not
encourage Muslims to revolt against rulers who failed to implement
shari‘a perfectly. He did, however, have strong words for rulers who
did not at least recognize the moral authority of Islam, specifically the
Mongols who by his time had become Muslim but ruled according
to their own legal heritage. In his famous treatise on politics, Shari‘a
Governance, he gave political power a good deal of leeway when God’s
will is unspecified as long as it enforces what God has clearly revealed,
including penalties for theft, adultery, brigandage, slander, alcohol use,
and so on. The polity has a contract with God, and all—rulers and
ruled—have duties to one another and to God. The state, though not
a revealed entity, is to defend the teachings of Islam, but these teachings
are not unlimited.

In contrast, Ibn Khaldun (died 1406), a scholar from North Africa,
saw rule in Islam in much broader terms. Muslims have religious obli-
gations to perform to ensure good standing in the next world, and reli-
gion helps cement the bonds holding a nation together, but rule in
Islam involves much more than political commitment to religious
teachings. Indeed, there is a natural order to the world that explains the
rise and fall of nations. Ibn Khaldun identified it as God’s way of deal-
ing with his creation. A nation inevitably declines, regardless of its reli-
gious identity, if it ignores the socioeconomic conditions that make for
prosperous rule.

Farabi (died 950), one of Islam’s greatest philosophers, brought an-
other perspective to the question. Noting how religious claims can di-
vide a polity, he called for a system of governance in which the
teachings of religion have their place, though not to the point of under-
mining political harmony. For this reason, he awarded a central role to
reason in determining the good of the nation. Rule in Islam, though
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responsive to shari‘a, is more fundamentally geared to the well-being of
the polity as a whole. Politics according to Farabi includes religious
language, because religion embodies the beliefs by which people live.
But religious language, when publicly deployed, is to meet rational cri-
teria to ensure that rule not become sectarian, jeopardizing the common
good.

These varied outlooks continue today. Like Ibn Taymiyya, the Mus-
lim Brotherhood, although it acknowledges the rules of democracy,
views the state as defender of religion. This can have the effect of con-
flating the political platform of the Brotherhood with the will of God,
national citizenship with religious loyalty. There is also anxiety over the
nation’s standing before God because, as the Qur’an suggests, a threat
hangs over those who implement his revealed order selectively (2:85).
Additionally, some elements in the Brotherhood view democracy as
tyrannical: People, when allowed to rule themselves, will seek to domi-
nate one another and will even use democratic means to do so. Thus,
true justice exists only under divine rule when the Qur’an is the consti-
tution, shari‘a the national law, and God the head of state.

At the same time, there is a sense that Islam is under attack by
national and international forces that seek to exploit the nation for par-
tisan interests. Thus, as spelled out in the Egyptian Brotherhood’s 2005
election program, it is Islam that will best preserve the greater interests
of the umma. For this reason, the Brotherhood advances a religious
narrative in which political empowerment, obtained gradually rather
than by revolution, becomes the goal of faith.7 This, of course, is where
the Brotherhood diverges from classical Islam. It has always been felt
that the state is to be responsive to God’s rulings (ahkam), but by equat-
ing them with rule (hukuma), the Brotherhood makes politics essential
to Islam, as if Muslims are not pleasing to God if not holding the
reins of power. Thus, for the Brotherhood, the state is ultimately a
transcendent entity. Traditional religious voices criticize this outlook.
For them, the good standing of the umma does not depend on the
character of the state but rather on the moral tenor of the believing
community.8
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Like Ibn Khaldun, Morocco’s Party of Justice and Development
(PJD) does not reduce rule to particular religious teachings. In contrast
to the Brotherhood, they distinguish their political program from ques-
tions of religious identity, emphasizing justice and socioeconomic de-
velopment. For this reason, they draw attention to the dual character of
the prophet’s mission. On the one hand, as a prophet, Muhammad
issued timeless instructions for rituals and morals. On the other, as a
political leader, he gave directives that are not eternally valid. The poli-
tics of the prophet, though embodying wise principles, is historically
limited in its details. For this reason, PJD rhetoric, though not free of
religious language, also does not descend into religious sloganeering as
in the Brotherhood’s perennial cry, Islam is the solution. Its opponents
do accuse it of doublespeak, cloaking its real goal of rule by Islam be-
hind the rhetoric of justice and socioeconomic development. If really
committed to the secular character of politics, why refer to Islam at all,
because religion, explicit or implicit, is about advice giving and not
policy planning?9 PJD activity, however, is geared not to religious spe-
cifics but to religious principles, which the party leadership refers to as
political universals.10 Traditionally, these universals are known as the
five necessities: religion, life, intellect, progeny, and property. If these
basic principles were not defended, it is held, society would descend
into chaos. They are thus necessary to preserve the common good.
Moreover, in a postprophetic age, no human can claim to be backed
by heaven, making it the right of the people to choose their political
representatives. Indeed, the detailed program issued in advance of the
2007 elections indicates that the PJD is a unique form of Islamism.11 In
contrast to the Brotherhood, there is no demand for greater freedom to
promote the mission of Islam. The focus is the general purposes of
politics as understood by Islam, that is, justice and development. No
special religious training is needed to pursue such goals. Islam is one
but its politicians and missionaries have distinct roles. As a result, the
state is not the place where the religious integrity of Islam is to be
tested, even if it has a purpose that the religion recognizes, namely
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human prosperity.12 Ambiguities notwithstanding, the PJD has formu-
lated a framework for democracy that also aspires to represent the values
of Islam.

Finally, echoing Farabi, Abdolkarim Soroush, an Iranian intellectual
who has challenged the religious character of the Islamic Republic of
Iran for three decades, seeks not to expel religious language from public
life but rather to align it with the needs of the polity. He balks at
secularist notions of equality that associate it with moral freedom, but
does maintain that public affairs, including beliefs, are to be adjudicated
by reasoned argument and not simple reference to unexamined creeds.
In this way, he questions the religious legitimacy of a state that equates
its interests with Islam, turning political dissent into disobedience to
God.13 Soroush gives a modern tone to Farabi’s ideas, defining freedom
as a universal good at the heart of a virtuous polity. He thus seeks to
save Islam from being compromised by its now intimate association
with authoritarian rule. His fear is that this association makes religion
appear hostile to freedom, and this in turn would create a situation
where agnosticism is a necessary precondition for democracy—a situa-
tion he ascribes, perhaps not quite precisely, to the West. Like Farabi,
he puts religious reasoning before religious rule: Islam is not to be im-
plemented simply because it is Islam. Thus the introduction of religion
into public life cannot violate the theological freedom of the nation.
Islam is eternal insofar as it originates in God, but human knowledge
of it expands and contracts according to historical circumstances. Reli-
gious knowledge is never fixed. Those who claim to rule in the name
of religious knowledge as unchanging body of norms have therefore
misunderstood the nature of religious knowledge. Without the freedom
to inquire, including the freedom to question and dissent, believers will
not be able to know how Islam applies to contemporary circumstances,
and this ignorance will lead to the demise of religion. Thus a religious
state, even one ruling in the name of Islam, becomes the enemy of
religion when it imposes a single interpretation of Islam on the nation.

A religious society, however, is not the enemy of freedom because
religion is part of the process of public reasoning that guides a society’s
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morals. Indeed, the free discussion of beliefs is a way to ensure that
they do not get manipulated by the state, whether religious or secular.
Freedom does not require disbelief but rather the liberty to engage be-
liefs publicly. This means that beliefs have to be comprehensible. When
addressed to the public sphere, beliefs cannot appear obscure to nonbe-
lievers. Believers must be able to speak cogently to the issues of the day.
Soroush’s view of religion is individualistic, but he is not defending
moral autonomy. He is instead advocating the rationality of religion in
public life at a time when the Iranian state has made it a partisan inter-
est. If the values of religion are to have place in public life, they must
reflect an objective moral order that believers and nonbelievers alike
recognize.

Once freed of Saddam Hussein, Iraqis raced to the polls, but they
did not see democracy as a pretext to free themselves from a cultural
heritage and its moral principles. Only recently have political circum-
stances allowed for greater Muslim engagement with democracy. Fol-
lowing the 1998 fall of Soeharto’s New Order in Indonesia, the first
president to be democratically elected in the nation’s history was Ab-
durrahman Wahid, leader of the country’s largest Muslim organization.
In Indonesia, there is strong support for democracy, including free and
fair contestation of rule by political parties, equality before the law, and
freedom of the media from state control. There is also strong support
for Islam in public life, including closing restaurants during Ramadan
and monitoring sexual relations in public.14 In Islam, then, human au-
tonomy is grounded in politics (siyasa) not in morals (shari‘a)—
democracy with modesty. One enjoys autonomy in the face of state
tyranny but not before God. Liberty is thus a political category, not a
moral one. There is, of course, considerable diversity of opinion on
Islam’s morals. Democracy in Indonesia, as elsewhere, works together
with communal values, including the values of Islam.

But does this apply to non-Muslim minorities or to Muslim dissent-
ers? Is the political community equal to the believing community? In
the United States, many would be uncomfortable with a non-Christian
president even though the Constitution allows it. Pat Robertson claims
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that only Christians are qualified to rule. But the Constitution protects
minorities, a position Christians uphold. In Islam, a long-standing
principle allows for shari‘a to be suspended if applying it would lead to
civil strife (fitna). This is not simply a nice idea. In 2002 a proposal in
the Indonesian parliament to implement shari‘a as the law of the land
was defeated because it was opposed by the nation’s two largest Muslim
organizations, Nahdlatul Ulama and Muhammadiyah, which placed the
welfare of a pluralistic nation above religious hegemony.15 Some groups
aspire to religious supremacy at all costs, but for the vast majority, as
indicated, politics is a moral venture, not an ideological one: The politi-
cal integrity of Indonesia’s religious minorities is not to be trampled on
by the Muslim majority.

The Muslim hope for public decency includes both government ac-
countability and respect for the values of Islam. High levels of govern-
ment corruption have led some Muslims to form separate communities:
alternative societies, networks of piety, which live according to Islam in
a kind of religiously oriented civil society. Why entrust oneself to a
political system that exists only for its own survival? These groups also
offer services to society that the state fails to provide. As a result, they
have earned a political mandate in certain segments of society—not to
end democracy for religious supremacy but to further it by participating
in power civilly for the welfare of the nation.

In the United States, where democratic institutions are well estab-
lished, religious groups still call the nation to moral norms. Alongside
constitutionalism, the Gospel is at play in national life. James Dobson
advances the moral teachings of the Gospel, calling Christians to break
with the culture of individualism and live the culture of the family.
Promise Keepers calls the nation’s men to a godly mission as head and
protector of the family. Rick Warren of the Saddleback Church pro-
motes the social teachings of the Gospel, seeking to care for those in
most need, including AIDS victims. Catholic Charities USA also plays
a noticeable role in this regard. There are others who seek to translate
Christianity into a political project, asserting that believers are best
suited to rule the nation. Concerned that the religious character of the
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nation would be lost to secularizing forces, a cadre of preachers, notably
Jerry Falwell and Pat Robertson, helped birth the Religious Right.

For Christianity no less than Islam, there is a temptation to map the
religious community onto the nation. The idea that the United States
has a Christian character is particularly strong in evangelical communi-
ties.16 But even if disturbed by secularization, these communities are
committed to freedom as a religious value and not simply a political
one. Choice is part and parcel of religious truth because evangelicals see
salvation as an individual and voluntary process, making it counterintu-
itive to want to impose it. The commitment of evangelicals to democ-
racy is, then, partly the result of the need for freedom to share the
Gospel. This commitment holds even when national life lacks righ-
teousness. The struggle for public morality can therefore coexist harmo-
niously with the commitment to political liberty for all, that is, equal
citizenship regardless of piety.17

Beliefs can be at home with freedom. In the United States, beliefs
of all kinds, secular and religious, are at play in public life. One sees
this in elections, where Christian groups distribute voter education
guides; in courts of law, where judgments are handed down, sometimes
favorably, on the constitutionality of faith-based initiatives; and in the
lobbying efforts of faith-based interest groups.18 Religious reasoning is
not hostile to open inquiry and may even require it. When it comes to
the affairs of this world as opposed to the next, truth—believers would
concur—is never a forgone conclusion.

That it is not has long been recognized by Islam. Prayer is a duty
that God has set for all time, and certain moral teachings, such as the
prohibition of alcohol and adultery, are similarly fixed. But the way the
common good is achieved in the polity has not been predetermined by
revelation and therefore requires open inquiry. To claim truth for this
world is to reduce human existence to utopian ideologies. Believers
themselves admit that history is not over, truth not yet made fully mani-
fest. What has been problematic for many Muslims is not secularism
per se but the secularist marginalization of religious reasoning, as oc-
curred under Kemalism, Nasserism, or Ba‘thism. These ideologies as-
sumed that moral truth is a secularist monopoly and that Muslims
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simply need to accept what purportedly enlightened state authorities
tell them about the truths of the world. The Muslim desire for public
decency does not mean that politically involved Muslims are antidemo-
cratic. The complaint is not with democracy but the lack of public
morality. The feeling is that the public trust is best served by the values
of Islam along with democratic deliberation. Authoritarian regimes
block both. Thus, if democratic politics were to replace authoritarian
rule in many a Muslim society, shari‘a would not suddenly become irrel-
evant. Religious values no less than secular ones can contribute to the
common good without prejudice to democratic procedures. It is when
religion is made into an ideology that it threatens democracy. The same
is true of secularism.

This is not to suggest that religious communities ought to be demo-
cratic in their internal workings. We vote for our political leaders but
our core beliefs are too sacred to leave to a simple majority. Some
groups are democratic in their internal governance and even in matters
pertaining to God. In general, however, believers acknowledge religious
authority. Those more versed in Scripture, ordained into the priestly
order, or filled with the spirit, are awarded a privileged—though not
uncontested—authority to speak for religion. We do not vote on God
but worship him as Supreme Being as he reveals himself. Religion fol-
lows the guiding presence of God. It cannot be denied, disobeyed, or
voted upon. Jesus said that all sin will be forgiven except sin against the
Holy Spirit.

There is potential tension, then, between a community’s contract
with God (the religious contract) and its contract with the political
order in which it lives (the social contract). How to negotiate the divide
between what is eternal and what is transitory? Is the religious commu-
nity to withdraw from the wider society to pursue its contract with
God? Fight it until it too submits to divine authority? Enter into dia-
logue with it to reach some balance between heavenly and earthly con-
cerns? Can believers be responsive to both a religious and a social
contract? The invocation of God is a way to counter political and reli-
gious tyranny, but it can collide with democratic sentiment. Stanley
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Hauerwas, an American theologian, has lambasted Christianity’s love
affair with liberal democracy, which, he claims, kills Christianity by
domesticating its strongest truth claims. In contrast, John Courtney
Murray, a key architect of the Vatican II document on religious liberty,
saw liberal democracy as a source of divine wisdom. The New England
Puritans were known for their resistance to British tyranny, both politi-
cal and religious, but once established in their biblical commonwealth,
they were highly intolerant of nonconformists. Roger Williams finally
had enough, founding Rhode Island as a haven where one might enjoy
political rights regardless of creedal commitments. In the parlance of
Islam, Williams’ insight amounts to the irrevocable truth that gover-
nance (siyasa) has no final jurisdiction over shari‘a—the state does not
mediate beliefs even if it is to enforce a public morality.

Religion is a complex affair. Jesus said his kingdom is not of this
world, but his message posed a serious challenge to worldliness. Proph-
ets, including Muhammad, were sent not to lord it over others but to
scrutinize the failings, even arrogance, of worldly power vis-à-vis the
poor and dispossessed. They too, however humbly, bear the image of
God no less than the powerful, as the Qur’an notes (17:70): ‘‘We have
honored the children of Adam’’ (i.e., all humanity and not only
believers).

Religion is liberation from the standards of this world, ennobling
and dignifying in the face of those who elevate themselves over others.
And yet religion also calls for public morality. Can this be left to indi-
viduals to determine? A religion may claim a privileged authority when
it comes to its own beliefs and values, but how does it evaluate the
authority of those who do not share them? Were the New England
Puritans consistent in limiting both religious and political authority to
the saints, those chosen by God to be vessels of Christian grace, that is,
the regenerated, as opposed to those who had not shown signs of a full
conversion? Political authority is not subjective, dependent on the state
of one’s soul, but objective, common to all, and thus necessarily geared
to the common good of all. This would imply that the human mind,
whether assenting to religious authority or not, is still capable of recog-
nizing public interests.
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In contrast, all do not enjoy the same capacity for religious authority.
In the end, it is God’s exclusively, making it the preserve of a religious
community and not of outsiders. But believers also recognize that all
enjoy a right to protection and care whether professing belief in God
or not because all are made in the image of God. Still, despite long-
standing commitment to the common good as the will of God here on
earth, both Christianity and Islam have not always favored democratic
processes. There is a paternalistic side to religion. Do people at large,
uneducated and undisciplined, know what is best even when it comes
to worldly affairs? Human nature, though not evil, is weak. Is the will
of a corruptible humanity to be trusted in judging affairs on earth (i.e.,
public morality, justice, prosperity), to say nothing of affairs in heaven
(i.e., salvation)?

Christian democracy in Europe got started as a people’s movement,
blessed by Pope Leo XIII in his 1901 encyclical Graves de communi,
which described democracy not so much as mass participation in rule
but as popular Catholic action, especially on behalf of laborers who in
the immediate aftermath of the Industrial Revolution lived and worked
in deplorable conditions. The church has always called for care of oth-
ers, especially the poor and marginalized, advocating, since its begin-
nings, a concept of human rule ordered to the well-being of all. This is
clearly set out by Thomas Aquinas. However, even with the rise of
Christian democracy in Europe, fueled in large part by Catholic activ-
ism, the Catholic hierarchy of Europe remained suspicious of parlia-
mentary democracy and religious pluralism. After all, governance by
people at large, those unlearned in the faith or even hostile to it, could
lead to laws at odds with Christian values. The lesson was learned only
during the last century, when the church witnessed the devastating
threat to freedom, including religious freedom, posed by secularist ide-
ologies, such as Nazism and communism. Freedom for Catholic beliefs,
it was seen, cannot be secured without securing it for all. This lesson
was underscored by the experience of American Catholics who did not
see democracy as a threat to the authority of religion and its teachings,
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even though it did not guarantee state enforcement of them.19 A com-
mitment to religious truths and the dignity of those who believe differ-
ently can be simultaneously maintained.

A similar process has unfolded in Muslim society over the last cen-
tury. Democracy is no longer seen as a threat to Islam but has been
embraced as the best way to ensure space for shari‘a in public life. This
process is often referred to as the awakening (al-sahwa), where piety
and freedom from authoritarianism—first colonial and then postcolo-
nial—go together. This is not to be confused with the tribal movement
in Iraq, also known as the awakening, which worked with the United
States to eradicate terrorism. The course has by no means been smooth.
The awakening can take on the hue of ideological battle—between sec-
ular states and Islamist movements. What is emerging, though, is the
recognition that the kind of statehood best for Islam is the civil state
(al-dawla al-madaniyya) in which no ideology dominates and both sec-
ular and religious reasoning are afforded space in public life. Such a
state needs democracy to be what it is meant to be—a public entity that
does not define truth as forgone conclusion but continually tests all
ideas against the greater good of Muslim society. The state alone is not
arbiter of moral life but is to facilitate the process by which society
collectively strives to bring about God’s purposes for society: public
morality, justice, and prosperity. In addition, shari‘a alone cannot guar-
antee political success. Other sources of wisdom are also needed. A
religious state is therefore, and ironically, unacceptable in Islam. Islam
has place in politics but is not reducible to politics.

The verdict is still out on Islamism (i.e., political action inspired by
Islam). It is neither uniform nor static but has yet to work out the
relation of Islam to national life. Over the last century, Islamism re-
sponded to changing realities but Islamist groups are not chameleons.
They have a vision of the way the world works and the place of Islam in
it. They are not all alike, however. A key issue is the scope of religious
knowledge. Does it cover all things? Is it limited to rituals and morals
or does it apply to economics and politics as well, and is such knowledge
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predetermined in advance, that is, revealed? If religious knowledge is a
matter of rituals and morals, Muslims can pray, avoid adultery, and so
on, and hope for a favorable judgment in the world to come. However,
believers and nonbelievers expect ethical standards of public life. How
are those standards formulated? Is it the task of religious specialists who
derive principles from holy texts and apply them to life’s circumstances?
Do only believers have a say in determining these standards? Or do all
people have a natural sense for the ethics of public life irrespective of
religious convictions?

For example, Hezbollah of Lebanon participates in national and
local elections and even builds coalitions with Christian politicians.20

At its founding, it called for a religious state but realized that partial
gains could be made by participating in a political system that it does
not accept in principle.21 The question, of course, is why it rejects the
Lebanese political system. Hezbollah is a complex group. It is appar-
ently bent on the destruction of Israel.22 It acts as something of a nation
within a nation, equipped with its own military, but it also claims to be
committed to the Lebanese nation as a whole. It rejects the current
political system because that system unfairly distributes power accord-
ing to confessional interests rather than popular representation. But it
is also inspired by the thought of an Iraqi intellectual, Muhammad Baqr
al-Sadr, killed by Saddam Hussein in 1980, who left a deep mark on
contemporary Shi‘ism by greatly expanding the scope of religious
knowledge.23 He aimed to show that Islam has a global perspective
capable of competing with both communism and capitalism. Although
revelation ended, he argued, the religious heritage contains ethical con-
cepts that apply to all issues. In other words, Islam has the resources to
beget a modern state. In contrast, Shi‘ism traditionally recognizes the
limited nature of religious knowledge, allowing believers to participate
in political power that does not represent Shi‘i religious aspirations,
provided they are able to maintain their individual ethical integrity
while doing so.24

Hezbollah and other Shi‘i groups have taken up the mantle of Aya-
tollah Khomeini (died 1989), who argued that justice could be obtained
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only under religious rule.25 Political authority thus belongs to the reli-
gious scholar. For this reason, Hezbollah’s first loyalty lies beyond Leb-
anon with Khomeini’s successor, Ayatollah Khamenei, supreme leader
of the Islamic Republic of Iran. However, at a deeper level, Hezbollah
reflects the thought of Muhammad Baqr al-Sadr, who claimed that no
aspect of life is free of divine decree. No issue, even those that religion
does not explicitly address, is devoid of ethical import: urban planning,
hedge funds, the use of weapons of mass destruction, tax collection,
zoning laws, water consumption, organ transplants, sex-change opera-
tions, democracy, and so on.26 The question, again, is how to determine
the ethical status of such issues. If one says that ethics is entirely a
function of religious teachings, then all national policies take on reli-
gious value. The nation itself becomes a religious aspiration. Believers
will have to do more than just pray and avoid adultery to please God.
Thus, though participating in Lebanese politics democratically, Hez-
bollah is also tempted to dominate, claiming to do so for the nation’s
own good. Its leaders speak of liberation, the liberation of the dispos-
sessed, but do not trust secular processes to achieve it. Only Islam can
liberate. But what is the purpose of liberation? Is the goal democracy
unhindered by powerful interests or religious rule that defines all aspects
of national life, including politics and economics? Hezbollah’s commit-
ment to democracy remains ambiguous. It calls for full liberation from
corrupt politics but also espouses a belief system in which religious
knowledge is unlimited. It is not religion per se but a religious vision
that knows no bounds that is at odds with democracy.

In contrast, the AK Party of Turkey, now governing the nation, has
a strong reverence for secularity. It calls for economic and political liber-
alization but not in explicitly religious language. Liberalization, of
course, is good for Islam in a country where a secularist ideology, Kem-
alism, has long controlled the religious spirit of the nation, defining
secular modernism as the purpose of life. Some of the AK Party’s pre-
decessors, notably former Prime Minister Necmettin Erbakan, viewed
liberation from Kemalism as the first step toward establishing a reli-
gious state, leading secularist forces to topple his government in 1997.
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This coup triggered a transformation in Turkish Islamism. Previously,
Islamists had supported economic liberalization. They would hence-
forth back political liberalization too: human rights, democracy, civil
liberties, things once viewed negatively as products of the West. Kemal-
ist repression of nonstate expressions of Islam, climaxing in the removal
of Erbakan from power, led Muslim leaders to link Islam to political
freedom, seeing it as a necessary precondition for the well-being of
Islam. This development, however, is not simply a response to repres-
sive action. It has also been captured in religious language, a message
of love and tolerance without loss of Islam’s unique call.

A key figure in this regard is Fethullah Gülen, leader of a movement
numbering in the millions with interests in education, business, and the
mass media. Its activities are international in scope, with top schools
in Central Asia and interfaith initiatives in the West. Gülen seeks to
accommodate the Kemalist state. He is a deeply spiritual figure with
roots in Sufism. He is committed to the secular state but also to the
teachings of Islam. His followers are socially diverse and morally con-
servative, and some elements in Turkish society view them with caution.
In general, they reject Erbakan’s antagonistic approach to the state but
support the AK Party, especially its goal of freeing society from state
ideology.27 The leadership of the AK Party, once associated with Erba-
kan, drew on Gülen’s ideas to forge a new (post-1997) approach to
national politics: religiosity that is dynamically Muslim but also posi-
tively engaged with secular realities themselves worthy of reverence as
part of God’s created order.28 The aim of Islam, then, is ethical, not
political, seeking to restore the character of a nation disfigured by the
materialist ideology of the state. Renewal of national character, how-
ever, is not reducible to philosophical abstracts but depends on a mes-
sage that speaks to the cultural particularities and ethical loyalties of the
people, including Islam, yet also resonates with a national and global
whole.29 Gülen is thus not addressing Kemalism but Turkish society,
shaping a national framework where the ideological secularism of the
state is discredited as a partisan interest.

Gülen was a disciple of Sa‘id Nursi (died 1960) whose voluminous
commentary on the Qur’an, The Treaty of Light (Risale-ye Nur), widely
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studied in Turkey, weaves together questions of modern science with a
spiritual vision of the cosmos, leaving the impression that secularity is
itself part of Islam’s sacred narrative. Gülen, in turn, has added civic
activism to Nursi’s legacy, inspiring his followers to bring piety to life
in the form of service to the nation. Indeed, the movement calls itself
service (hizmet). Its promotion of piety operates not by preaching
(teblig) but by representing (temsil) the ethics of Islam: truthfulness,
honesty, generosity, humility, altruism, love, and so on. Islam still has
its particular norms to which Gülen is committed, but more profoundly
interacts harmoniously with secular realities through the prism of such
universal values.

Many factors have gone into the Turkish transition to democracy,
including the hope for EU candidacy, but consolidation of a religious
vision of democracy is vital in a nation committed to Islam. Gülen sees
civil society as part of God’s plan. It is therefore unnecessary to define
it in explicitly religious categories. Turkey, like Lebanon, has known
democratic shortcomings, but Islamism in Turkey has responded in a
very different way. Both Hezbollah and the AK Party participate in
democratic processes but they have contrasting understandings of the
nature and scope of religious knowledge. As a result, they do not see
the relation of religion to democratic liberty in the same light. For the
AK Party, democracy, albeit a modern phenomenon based on a social
rather than a religious contract, has religious worth as a political system.
This is not merely because it serves the common good but also because
it represents the ethics of God by challenging ideological rule that limits
the spiritual potential of the human being. For Muslims to be Muslims,
a civil society free of state control is necessary. This means, of course,
that all citizens are free. Are they, then, to be led to live according to
the dictates of religious knowledge as defining mark of Turkish ethics?
The values of Islam, to be sure, will not be barred from public life, and
the AK Party has attempted to promote them (and risked closure by
the state in 2008 when it sought to lift the headscarf ban on university
students). Still, democracy in Turkey now has religious force. It is seen
as best for Islam, backed by a powerful religious vision that recognizes
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the integrity of secular processes as part of God’s creation. Citizens who
do not accept Islam, in whole or in part, are still fully citizens. Civil
society is not free of ethical considerations to which Islam can contrib-
ute. Still, the nation need not be totally Islamized for Muslims to be
Muslims. God is at work in the nation’s commitment to democracy and
civil liberties.

Does Islam call for rule by God or rule for God? The former, rule
by God, would turn politics into a religious affair. Can the Qur’an
serve as a national constitution? Do state officials rather than religious
scholars determine Islam? Such thinking is new among Muslims,
emerging in response to European rule in the nineteenth and twentieth
centuries. Many accepted colonial power as long as it did not suppress
Islam, but others called for reform to strengthen the Muslim spirit
against Europe.30 A key element of this reformism was a growing ap-
preciation for national identity.31 The people and not only traditional
authorities were to determine the affairs of the umma, as citizens, not
subjects.

This development transformed classical notions of the relation of
religion to rule.32 Previously, a specialization of roles had been imag-
ined, religion guiding society’s morals and rule governing its politics.
Dynastic rulers had always acknowledged the moral authority of reli-
gion in public life. In turn, religious scholars supported the political
order of the day. There were, then, two sets of laws. But modern state-
hood meant that all authority would belong to the nation. The people
were to be masters of their own destiny, both political and moral. How
was Islam to factor into this new formula for Muslim society? Could
the people and their representatives be trusted to respect the ways of
God? Would it be necessary to enthrone God over the nation to ensure
the continuity of Islam? And what was to be done with non-Muslim
citizens? Did they have equal voice in determining the affairs of a Mus-
lim nation?33

Muslims still have a strong appreciation for traditional religious au-
thorities, who themselves have had to adapt to modern realities, but a
measure of democratic sentiment has left its mark on the beliefs of the
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umma no less than its politics.34 Are the people now also to determine
the morals of society no less than its public policies? If religion is the
source of morals, does this not mean that the people have the responsi-
bility of ensuring Islam’s national representation?35

How is Islam to exist alongside democracy? In theory, it should have
been a simple reformulation of power in democratic as opposed to dy-
nastic categories—the nation as a whole now in power, not a single
family. For example, in the Iranian constitutional revolution of the early
twentieth century, the goal in general was not to do away with religion
but to defend its mandate for this world—justice and prosperity in ad-
dition to public morality. The shahs were selling off the nation’s re-
sources to foreigners for their own gain. It was clear that if dynastic rule
were not checked by popular representation, the welfare of the nation
would be harmed.

But some saw it otherwise. Representative government meant that
popularly elected officials would have the authority to legislate in accor-
dance with public sentiment. Would this not lead to disregard for
shari‘a? Could the people be trusted to bring about God’s will? Some
ayatollahs supported constitutionalism, others opposed it. How was
governance to be transferred to the people without prejudice to Islam?
Was religious authority also to be democratized? In the end, it did not
matter for Iran, because the shah (Mohammad ‘Ali Shah Qajar), with
British backing, bombed the national assembly on June 23, 1908, bring-
ing the constitutional movement to a sudden end.

A variety of Islamist thinkers sought to work out the relation of
Islam to nationhood over the course of the twentieth century. At least
initially, they tended to see Islam not simply as the benchmark of na-
tional morality but as source of nationhood; only an explicitly religious
state could rule an Islamic nation. This view, which can justify authori-
tarian rule in the name of Islam, originated with Abu-l-A‘la Mawdudi
(died 1979), a South Asian Muslim who first coined the concept of
divine sovereignty (hakimiyya), conflating God’s purposes with political
power.36 Mawdudi had deep anxieties about secularism. If not checked,
it would spell the end of Islam. Rule by God was therefore the only
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way to save Muslims.37 As a first step, he founded the Islamic Group
(Jama‘at-i Islami) in 1941, several years before the partition of India,
with the goal of educating Muslims in the teachings of Islam. With the
establishment of Pakistan in 1947, it turned its attention to politics,
advancing the idea of Pakistan as a nation under divine sovereignty. It
has enjoyed limited success at the polls but encourages expectations of
rule in the image of God, blurring the lines between religion and power
(even military power).38 The Islamic Group exists throughout South
Asia but in Pakistan oscillates between political participation as means
to power and withdrawal from democratic processes to preserve its reli-
gious integrity from compromise by secular ways. It judges the failure
of the nation to implement shari‘a as offensive to God.

Mawdudi’s writings spread the central Islamist idea of rule as essen-
tial to the religious integrity of the umma. Hasan al-Banna (died 1949),
founder of the Muslim Brotherhood, shared the aversion to secular rule.
He did not spell out a political system as precisely as Mawdudi but still
assumed the religious character of government. Together, Mawdudi
and al-Banna have had tremendous impact on Islamist thinking. For
example, Hasan Turabi (born 1932), Sudanese affiliate of the Brother-
hood, built his Islamist program on previous efforts to Islamize national
law under President Ja‘far Numayri (ruled 1969–1985), which took place
incoherently at the hands of state officials inadequately trained in
shari‘a.39 That is, the state acted as chief religious authority, a complete
reversal of the classical heritage, paving the way for greater Islamization
of the nation by military rule, a project that Turabi engineered, describ-
ing it as Islam’s form of liberal representative democracy.40

The architects of Islamism did think of Islam in democratic terms.41

It was not, however, democracy in the service of God’s ways but democ-
racy as revealed by God. Mawdudi called it a theo-democracy, and
Turabi equated traditional concepts of legal reasoning, such as interpre-
tation (ijtihad) and consensus (ijma‘), with democratic principles of vot-
ing and popular will.42 When formulated as such, democracy becomes
a single option for God’s will as known in advance.

Islamism has failed as a political project because it equates Islam with
nationhood, neglecting the long-standing distinction in Islam between
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religious knowledge and political power. This recast the politics of
Islam into a specifically religious endeavor, making rule part and parcel
of the revealed order rather than autonomous entity serviceable to the
public goals of religion (public morality, justice, and prosperity). This
greatly contributed to the idea that Islam is primarily a political identity.
Breaking with tradition, Islamists speak of Islam as religion (din) and
state (dawla), equating religious devotion with political allegiance, a
formula that dictators have exploited in suppressing alternative points
of view.43 In contrast, traditional scholars note that the allegiance (al-
bay‘a) that the prophet received from his companions was allegiance
not to a form of political rule, not even a caliphate, but to Islam and its
morals: prayer, fasting, no stealing, no adultery, and exclusive worship
of God.

Indeed, making the details of the prophet’s rule essential to the reli-
gious mission of Islam would require Muslims to live according to the
sociopolitical norms of seventh-century Arabia, casting doubt on Is-
lam’s validity for all times and places.44 This is the consequence of mak-
ing politics a revealed phenomenon. It fixes religion in time, but the
tradition never viewed rule as such. The towering scholar of the classical
period, al-Mawardi (died 1058), discussed norms for governance in
Islam but never equated rule with religion. Leadership, he wrote in his
well-known political tract, The Rules of Power, exists to protect religion
(hirasat al-din) and govern the world (siyasat al-dunya). He did not say
that rule is the purpose of religion. Indeed, he was very conscious that
rule is dynastic—it comes and it goes. Only Islam remains.

The refrain that Islam is both religion and state, still common in
Islamist circles, has been nuanced. There are many reasons for this.
Islamists have always demanded freedom to advance the cause of God,
but they increasingly realize that to secure freedom for their own pur-
poses they must grant it to all. Change by force yields no benefits. This
is not to overlook Islamist propensities to violence. But there are essen-
tial differences between Islamism and Jihadism. Islamists do not con-
demn the idea of nationhood in principle. They do not define jihad as
rising up against apostate rulers.45 Furthermore, the morals of Islam
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generally apply whether dealing with friend or foe.46 Both Islamism and
Jihadism came out of the awakening that sometimes cast Islam in the
role of global dissident, locked in a struggle against colonial and now
postcolonial powers perceived to be intent on suppressing Islam. But
Islamists do not seek to eradicate all that is not explicitly Islam. Indeed,
they recognized that the enemy is authoritarian rule, not secular realities
per se.

Ambiguity of purpose remains. Opposition to authoritarian rule is
one thing. Commitment to democracy is another. Hamas won a major-
ity of the Palestinian parliament in 2006, but its violent conquest of
Gaza in 2007, which it compared to the prophet’s peaceful conquest of
Mecca, confirmed suspicions about Islamist commitments to democ-
racy. In contrast, over recent decades, the Brotherhood in Egypt has
engaged a political process that is not defined by Islam from the outset.
One way it has done so is by de-divinizing its concept of the state: The
state proper to Islam is not a religious state but a civil one. It is, then, a
worldly phenomenon and not subject to predetermined notions of what
best serves the common good of Muslim society.47 In that sense, it
can accommodate a plurality of viewpoints, both religious and secular,
provided they serve the common good and reflect the will of the people.
When allowed to participate in Egypt’s elections, the Brotherhood
plays by democratic rules. Its members in parliament act pragmatically,
advocating for the common good in light of Islam’s broader intentions.

Still, the Brotherhood aspires to ground the national constitution
in Islam. Egypt’s constitution recognizes the principles of shari‘a as
chief—but not exclusive—source of national law, and the Supreme
Constitutional Court has the task of ensuring that no law contradicts
it.48 But this is not enough for the Brotherhood. In the 2007 draft of its
political platform, the Brotherhood only thinly veiled its desire for a
national constitution wholly defined by Islam. Is the Brotherhood re-
verting to the religious state where Islam encompasses all? Or is it seek-
ing a way to guarantee Islam’s independence from civil institutions such
as the Supreme Constitutional Court?49 As noted earlier, the Catholic
Church, in the face of secularist ideologies such as Nazism and commu-
nism, more fully committed itself to political freedom as a religious
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good. It has not ceased its call to God, including its moral teachings,
but it recognizes popular sovereignty as the basis of constitutional legiti-
macy.50 It does not seek to control national governments or define na-
tional constitutions in religious terms. In contrast, the Islamism of the
Brotherhood shows that the relation of Islam to democracy has not yet
been fully worked out.

Why, though, should a Muslim society embrace a secular constitu-
tion if not representing the will of the people or the aspirations of its
most active movements? Democracy comes in different forms. In the
United States, religion is strongly at play in shaping the moral senti-
ments of the nation, but the U.S. Constitution is not defined in reli-
gious terms. Islam is committed to nonauthoritarian rule, as argued
earlier. It also seeks public respect for the values of Islam, even if not
demanding that all follow them. The force of Islamism in today’s world,
however, raises questions about constitutional outlook. Democracy, of
course, is bound to the common good of the nation. It is not simply a
venture in individualism but works to check the monopolization of
power. This idea resonates with Islamist groups too, but Islamist aspira-
tions for religious constitutionalism pose a conundrum: How exactly is
Islam to prevail as national identity in a democratic society? Can the
religious concept of covenant be aligned with the political concept of
democracy?

As noted, Islam is not to be simplistically implemented when detri-
mental to the common good. A constitution defined by Islam does not
necessarily mean that all policy is defined in advance. Rather, it could
require policymaking to heed certain principles that all affirm. Again,
it depends on one’s understanding of religious knowledge. Does it cover
all things, politics included, or is it limited? Still, a constitution defined
by Islam makes political power a religious affair. For Islamists, then,
the idea of nationhood as rule by the people is still in question. They
are able to win the hearts of many who are disgusted with corrupt
governments. And in the authoritarian contexts in which many Mus-
lims live, it is common to see rule by Islam as the ideal of justice. This
fosters ideas of nationhood that look to Islam as a bulwark against
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injustice, whereas in a nonauthoritarian context such a connection is
not evident. But this is the Islamist dilemma. It is a strong voice against
authoritarian power. But what happens when it comes to power? Is the
goal rule that is responsive to Islam, as traditionally defined, or rule by
Islam, as constitutionally defined?

Islamism is a work in project. The Brotherhood’s discourse has been
penetrated by democratic language. It has partly moved away from a
vision of religious supremacy in favor of religiously backed democracy.
It has not, though, fully defined its constitutional aspirations—rule by
God or rule for God, divine sovereignty or popular sovereignty that
includes respect for Islam’s values. Indeed, the Brotherhood’s double-
speak shows where religion ceases to be compatible with the democratic
outlook. The Brotherhood stands at a crossroads. It has nuanced its
view of the relation of the state to the divine enterprise. Its younger
members increasingly recognize that the state, though important, is not
revealed by God. Indeed, the concept of a moral covenant may feature
in future democratic politics, but in today’s pluralistic age, it will not
work if limited to a particular set of believers. Can a covenant with
God, serving as a basis for a national constitution, recognize all, believer
and dissenter alike, as equal? The answer to this depends in part on the
religious value given to dissent. It also depends on a society’s under-
standing of objective morals that all are to recognize.

The idea that it is not the religious state but the civil state that best
matches Islam reflects the failings of the secularist state, which, to judge
from its track record in Muslim society, does not rule either by the
people or for the people. In short, religion may not be enough to gov-
ern, but neither is secularism. Islamism is more responsive to—and
confident in—the popular will no less than the divine will as source of
its mandate. The notion of popular will is now integral to Islamist logic.
Even if advocating shari‘a as the vehicle by which true justice is to be
achieved, Islamist groups do not seek to limit the democratic process in
advance to a predetermined agenda. There are gray areas, including the
capacity of women and non-Muslims to hold highest offices, but Islam-
ists are increasingly comfortable at democratic contestation.
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There is now visible Islamist synergy between religion and democ-
racy as the best way to achieve the common good. And again, more
significantly, Islamist groups now generally recognize that shari‘a alone
cannot determine the common good in advance because that would
reduce religion to politics, to the detriment of Islam. The Islamist em-
brace of multiparty democracy is a lesson learned only with great pain:
Limiting politics to one viewpoint, even if divine, is a ready formula for
dictatorship, which contradicts God’s purposes for human society. Only
God is absolute. Islam, like Christianity, has realized that democracy is
the best way to preserve not only public morality but also religious
freedom. God’s voice will not be lost when the people rule.

The struggle for democracy in Islam continues to move in diverse
directions. Democracy is not always viewed as religious ideal in Islamist
circles, but Islamists do connect democracy to religious freedom. Some
Islamists, insisting on a religious definition of nationhood, do raise
questions about Islam’s relation to democracy. What can be said is that
Muslims and Christians in their own ways distinguish between rule and
religion. Religion is not all in all. It does not have all the answers, but
it does have something to offer. The common good, determined by
local societies through democratic deliberations and shared values, re-
mains a human venture that religion can support.
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C H A P T E R S I X

GOD’S RIGHTS

A Threat to Human Rights?

NEITHER THE BIBLE nor the Qur’an decisively condemns slavery.
In the past, most Christians and Muslims saw slavery as part of

God’s order. Today, human trafficking is big business, but no credible
religious authority backs it. It is considered an offense to the dignity
and equality of all peoples. In contrast, although gender equality in
public life is now the norm in many places, the largest branches of
Christianity and Islam do not recognize women as leaders of formal
prayer. Priest, preacher, and imam are religious offices. They are not
bound, it is argued, by the same rules that apply to political office or
educational opportunity or employment compensation. It is not a ques-
tion of equality per se. Both Bible and Qur’an speak of the equality of
men and women before God, and Christians of all kinds recognize the
political and civic rights of women. Rather, when it comes to the sacred,
there has to be a precedent in scripture or tradition. Certainly, women
can pray no less than men. They love God no less than men. They
play significant roles in all religious communities—as administrators,
educators, and missionaries. For many groups, though, the office of
prayer leader is ordered not to this world but to the next, making it a
divine invitation, not individual right. Many, of course, argue that God
extends this invitation to both genders equally.

185



186 CHAPTER SIX

Religious teachings, then, respond to some but not all developments
that touch on questions of human rights. Many Christians and Mus-
lims do support women as formal prayer leaders, but when it comes to
Catholics, most Evangelicals, and all branches of Islam, this is not the
official teaching. To be sure, not allowing women to be formal prayer
leaders, although to some a sign of resistance to changing times, is
not a violation of human rights.1 However, asking the government to
discriminate against religious communities that do allow women to be
formal prayer leaders would constitute such a violation. Catholics and
Evangelicals do not do that. Thus it is recognized that, as long as people
have a choice, religious communities are free to govern their own
affairs.

Other issues, abortion and gay marriage, are more controversial. U.S.
law currently defines abortion as a basic constitutional right. Many be-
lieve that gay marriage should be similarly defined. Thus, for some,
Catholic and Evangelical opposition to such issues amounts to an attack
on rights, whereas for many Catholics and Evangelicals abortion is an
attack on the right to life of the unborn and gay marriage is an attack
on the natural order of society. Who defines such issues: God, the state,
the individual?

Muslims, like Christians, are committed to the dignity of human
life. They are also sensitive to insults against the prophet and to conver-
sion out of Islam. A liberal society is one that celebrates individual
expression of conscience. A person can openly insult the prophet if so
moved. Muslim societies in general emphasize common virtues. Some
things are sacred, religion being one of them. One may not like Islam,
but one does not say so publicly. This does not mean that Muslim
society is opposed to human rights, only that it balances them against a
sense of sacred duty. What one does in the privacy of one’s own home
is another matter. Eating in public during Ramadan is discouraged if
not forbidden. Many happily fast as the religion teaches, but many,
behind closed doors, do not. Reservations about the teachings of Islam
are best kept to oneself. In Europe, not having the right to insult the
prophet or any other holy person is felt to be a constraint on freedom
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of expression, but in Muslim societies it is not. However, state discrimi-
nation against minority communities who follow a prophet the Muslim
majority considers a false prophet does constitute such a violation. In
Iran, for example, there is official persecution of the Baha’i community,
which emerged in the nineteenth century to announce a new age of
religious truth where shari‘a no longer has a place. In Malaysia, the
nation’s top religious authority, the National Fatwa Council, recently
issued an edict prohibiting non-Muslims from using the word Allah,
affirming that the god of Islam is not the god of others. It also prohib-
ited Muslims from practicing yoga. What is most sacred in the eyes of
God? Where does his glory lie? The global commitment to human
rights has encouraged new religious thinking on such matters. The
Catholic Church, for example, emphasizes the sanctity of human con-
science. Even when it errs, it retains its dignity. For this reason, the
Catholic Church has become a great defender of human rights. But not
all human rights talk is the same, and this is where the confusion lies.

The protection of human rights is often cast in terms of the right to
dissent from the majority. This is the hallmark of a liberal society. Mus-
lim societies do sometimes struggle with freedom of expression. But
a liberal society can also harm individuals when it awards individual
conscience final authority. It can, for example, rationalize moral deprav-
ity: ‘‘It’s my body and I can do whatever I want with it.’’ Or the concen-
tration of wealth alongside poverty: ‘‘It’s my money, I made it.’’ Or
predatory contracts—technically legal but still unjust: ‘‘She signed the
loan.’’ As heirs of Adam Smith, we think that the unencumbered pur-
suit of individual interests leads to the good of all. The invisible hand
is guiding society, making it right to trust market forces to determine
and achieve not only a prosperous society but also the moral good. But
how much can we trust the invisible hand to protect the rights and
interests of all?

Indeed, a focus on protecting individuals, though important, can
blind us to other kinds of human abuse. All agree on certain violations
of human rights. The human image is not to be defaced by authoritar-
ian regimes that detain, torture, and execute their citizens arbitrarily or
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restrict their political liberties. But is it a violation of human rights to
send soldiers to a war that lacks a clear moral purpose? Is government
cronyism a violation of human rights in depriving the public of compe-
tent rule, threatening national resources, and jeopardizing the welfare
of society? Is it a transgression of human rights to demand that health
care workers perform services that violate their moral conscience when
such services, such as abortion, are deemed a constitutional right?

The Qur’an says that Muhammad’s community is the best God has
created; it commands the right and forbids the wrong. In this sense,
Islam, like Christianity, is a force against moral permissiveness. One is
to live according to the spirit of God and not the spirit of the world, as
Saint Paul urges. This works fine on the individual level, but humans
are creatures of society. Do those who live according to the spirit of the
world pose a threat to God’s desire to sanctify the world with his spirit
and build it up in his image? One is to be free of the world’s ways, not
enslaved to them. Still, those who have not willingly made themselves
slaves of God are free to live as they wish, no? Many believers, including
Muslims, are committed to freedom as a religious goal. God makes
human rights a condition of true religion. One is not to be coerced.
Faith would have no point if not grounded in freedom. But events of
recent years—from suicide bombings to sectarian conflict—make it
seem that religious goals in Islam take priority over human rights. State
enforcement of Islam in some countries acts to violate freedom of reli-
gious conscience. Calls for the death of novelists, cartoonists, and
filmmakers raise questions about Islam’s commitment to free speech.
Some wonder about Islam’s teachings on women. Do they exist simply
to birth the next generation or do they have a life outside the home?

Such perceptions obscure the fact that Muslims are often the victims
of human rights abuse. States that claim to rule in the name of Islam
are not the best advocates of human rights. Is this the fault of Islam?
Or has the confusion over religious authority in today’s world made
Islam more susceptible to state machinations? Is Islam itself an oppo-
nent of human rights, making it right to want to free Muslims from
Islam? Or does the problem lie in the politicization of Islam? Do Mus-
lims long for greater freedom from the political abuse of Islam? The



GOD’S RIGHTS: A THREAT TO HUMAN RIGHTS? 189

influence of Muslim culture has a statistically insignificant relationship
to a government’s commitment to human rights.2 Thus, on a purely
empirical level, Muslims are generally like the rest of us, despite our use
of Islam to reassure ourselves of our moral superiority. We’re good, so
they must be bad.

There are contradictions. The 2004 murder of the Dutch filmmaker
Theo Van Gogh by a Muslim born and raised in Holland was a defining
moment in shifting attitudes towards Islam in Europe. At the core of
Islamophobia is the idea that Islam has no positive values in common
with other peoples. The Dutch politician, Geert Wilders, pushes this
line: Muslims, if they take Islam seriously, will inevitably be hostile
toward Europe’s way of life. Either Muslims in Europe must be Euro-
peanized or Europe will be Islamized. In contrast, in a 2008 speech,
Rowan Williams, archbishop of Canterbury, suggested a rapproche-
ment between shari‘a and British national law—interactive pluralism.
Do Muslims need special representation in British law, for example,
when it comes to marriage, divorce, inheritance? State recognition of
Islam’s family law could make Muslims more at home as British nation-
als, mitigating conflict between religious and political allegiances. At
the moment, some think of themselves as citizens of Islam rather than
Muslim citizens of Britain. To be sure, people always define themselves
through a prism of differences as well as of similarities, and this is
compounded by the historical moment, in which some seek to divide
the world into two camps, Islam and the West, forcing Muslims in
Europe to take sides, rather than combine religious and national convic-
tions into a single whole. And yet the British public decried the arch-
bishop’s suggestion. Was this Islamophobia? Or healthy resistance to
the idea that religion is the affair of particular communities and not
national society as a whole? Some have decried the appearance of
mosques in Europe and the demands of some Muslims for separate
treatment in public schools (e.g., physical education expectations). In
the United States, by contrast, police have monitored Muslim commu-
nities more aggressively since 9/11, but assimilation of Muslims into
mainstream American life has been much smoother than in Europe.
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Indeed, in Europe, the challenge is not the presence of Muslims,
but the need to develop religious forms that harmonize with long-
standing cultural particularities. In the United States, where pluralism
is quasi-sacred, there is no demand that Muslims fit in culturally, only
politically.3

In Quebec, Muslim women who wear the face veil in addition to the
head covering have been kept from voting. Of Quebec’s 7 million resi-
dents apparently only thirty-odd women wear the face veil, and Cana-
dian law has long accommodated personal circumstances at polling
stations. The Egyptian Ministry of Religious Affairs forbids women to
wear the face veil while on pilgrimage to Mecca. Islam does not require
women to veil the face but only to cover the head, and the Egyptian
state is concerned that some women wear the veil as a subversive tactic;
government officials need to identify people by face, and the face veil
challenges the authority of the state to control society. But God has
rights too, and some Muslims today link their devotion to God to
human rights, that is, religious freedom. For some Muslim women,
modesty, including the veiling of the face, is a duty to God. Are God’s
rights as lived by Muslims worthy of equal protection? The tension
arises when the rights of God to which a particular person is committed
are not seen as part of a nation’s heritage. At least one Muslim woman
in France has been stripped of her citizenship for not assimilating
enough to French cultural standards.

In April 2007, a group of Muslims in Texas went to the state capitol
to learn more about state government. All went smoothly except that
Dan Patrick, Texas state senator, stepped off the senate floor when a
local imam offered the daily prayer, the first Muslim to do so in the
Texas senate. Patrick explained that he did not want to appear to be
endorsing the prayer but later praised American tolerance in allowing
all to pray as they wish. In Britain, the leader of the Conservative Party,
David Cameron, stirred controversy by claiming that Muslims plan to
create a separate nation within Britain, governed by their own laws, but
he has also criticized British tendencies to scapegoat Muslims for soci-
ety’s problems, which, he says, are socioeconomic and cannot be attrib-
uted to a religious community.



GOD’S RIGHTS: A THREAT TO HUMAN RIGHTS? 191

In Bangladesh, a group of Muslims has pressured the government to
define the country’s Ahmadiyya minority as apostate for recognizing a
prophet after the prophet Muhammad. The government chose instead
to ban the publication of Ahmadiyya literature, stopping short of a
constitutional article condemning the Ahmadiyya, as exists in Pakistan.
Shortly thereafter, Bangladesh’s high court halted the ban. In Islam-
abad, a group of women connected to the Red Mosque raided a brothel,
the prelude to the mosque’s bloody standoff with police in 2007. They
claimed the right as individual citizens to put an end to immoral activ-
ity, although Islam traditionally awards that right to government au-
thorities exclusively. In some places in Pakistan’s North-West Frontier
Province, video shops are attacked for carrying immoral films and non-
religious music is prohibited. The return of the Taliban has not been
good for women. In some places in Indonesia, the law permits police
to jail women for being on the street at night without a headscarf.
After many years, British Airways now allows all staff to wear religious
symbols, including the Muslim headscarf, after a Christian employee
claimed the right to wear a cross at work. Imaan, a support group for
gay Muslims in Britain, entered a float in the 2006 Euro-Pride Parade
in London with the placard Gay Muslims Unveiled. The previous year
they wore rainbow burqas. Such a display of gay pride could not happen
in Muslim society. The principal of the King Fahd Academy in Lon-
don, which is funded by Saudi Arabia, defended the school’s use of
books that describe Jews as pigs and Christians as monkeys but had the
offensive chapters removed as inconsistent with the prophet’s teachings.

The former leader of Australia’s Muslim community, the Egyptian-
born Taj al-Din al-Hilali, referred to Australian women as uncovered
meat. They do not dress modestly in public, inviting sexual harassment.
Prime Minister John Howard criticized other Muslim leaders for failing
to oust him as their chief mufti. Al-Hilali, who has not learned English
after twenty years in Australia, was eventually forced to resign. He had
called for the formation of a political party for Australia’s 300,000 Mus-
lims. Other Muslim leaders fly the Australian flag outside mosques to
affirm loyalty to the nation. Jewish leaders in Australia distanced them-
selves from an Israeli academic who called on the Australian govern-
ment to cap Muslim immigration, arguing that a rise in the Muslim
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population would lead to sectarian violence. Israel’s 1 million Muslim
citizens (i.e., those in Israel since its founding in 1948, not the Palestin-
ians of the occupied territories) continue to face discrimination in land
ownership rights and access to public services; some Israeli lawmakers
would strip some of them of citizenship.

In 2007, Jewish and Christian leaders in Detroit condemned an at-
tack on a city mosque motivated by anti-Muslim bigotry. The same
year, France fired the head of the school board in Lyon for refusing to
allow local Muslims to open a high school. They had planned to operate
the school with private funding in full conformity with the national
curriculum. One in five high schools in France are Catholic and often
receive state funding, and Muslims are often more comfortable in Cath-
olic schools, which, unlike government schools, appreciate religion and
permit Muslim girls to wear the headscarf. FIFA, the rule makers of
international soccer, almost banned the Muslim headscarf but finally
left it to individual referees to decide whether it poses a danger to play.
Egypt named its first female judges in 2007 with the backing of the
rector of al-Azhar, Muhammad Tantawi, who stated that nothing in
the Qur’an bars a female from being a judge, even chief judge. By con-
trast, the powerful Islamist group the Muslim Brotherhood strongly
condemned the appointments. In a separate issue, Tantawi issued a 1988

fatwa permitting sex-change operations, not as the choice of individu-
als, but as a doctor-recommended cure for a pathological condition.

‘Ali Gom‘a, Egypt’s grand mufti, has stated that in Islam women
can be heads of state. The idea that Islam prevents women from exercis-
ing the highest levels of public authority, he argues, made sense in a
past age when caliphs combined secular authority and religious leader-
ship, but does not apply to the modern nation. In 2006, he signed a
resolution of Muslim scholars outlawing female genital mutilation. No
revealed or prophetic precedent exists in Islam for such a practice, the
resolution reads, and it calls on Muslims to end this deplorable practice.
In 2007, on a Washington Post website, Gom‘a stated that Muslims are
free to change their religion. They will be accountable to God in the
next life but are not subject to punishment in this one. In Egypt, this
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claim was roundly rejected by leading religious voices. Also in 2007, the
Egyptian state orchestrated a plebiscite to legitimize a ban on all faith-
based politics. The goal was to counter the 2005 electoral successes of
the Muslim Brotherhood. In the process the state claimed sweeping
security powers in what Amnesty International called the greatest ero-
sion of human rights in the country since the reinstatement of emer-
gency laws after the 1981 assassination of Anwar Sadat.

A new English translation of the Qur’an seeks to disassociate Islam
from violence against women. The translation, by the Iranian-Ameri-
can Laleh Bakhtiar, questions a particular verse of the Qur’an that at
face value permits husbands to beat rebellious wives (4:34). Bakhtiar,
who carefully researched the linguistic background of the disputed
word, translates it not as hit but as send away. In Turkey, the Ministry
of Religious Affairs has begun a project to reconsider the authenticity
of prophetic traditions that demean women because the prophet would
have never supported such teachings. Prince Naif, interior minister of
Saudi Arabia, a country where women are not permitted to drive a car,
has stated that gender segregation is not right. In Saudi society, the
female presence is generally viewed as offensive to public morals. Pro-
fessional women are now able to spend a night in a hotel (i.e., outside
the family home) when business takes them to other cities, though they
must register with local authorities. ‘Abd al-Rahman al-Lahim, a Saudi
human rights lawyer, has challenged the nation’s laws against promiscu-
ity. They are meant to protect women but are sometimes misused by
the police, as well as by the women’s own families, to intimidate and
abuse them. Islam does prohibit promiscuity, but these laws fail to meet
the intentions of Islam, which is to instruct, not intimidate. The result,
according to al-Lahim, is jungle shari‘a as opposed to shari‘a justice. He
defended a chemistry teacher sentenced to forty months in prison and
750 lashes for ‘‘trying to sow doubt’’ among his students by speaking
positively about Judaism and Christianity; the teacher was pardoned by
the king. Al-Lahim also defended a journalist arrested for what were
referred to as ‘‘destructive thoughts’’ by suggesting on the Internet that
homosexuality is a genetic predisposition; the case was thrown out of
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court. Al-Lahim sees the rule of law and protection of human rights as
a key concern of Islam, and what makes him effective in Saudi Arabia’s
shari‘a courts is his own shari‘a expertise.

The point is that religion can be terribly mismanaged when it comes
to human rights, and nowhere is that more striking than in a 2007 case
in Germany in which a Moroccan woman, resident in Germany, sought
protection from an abusive husband. The judge, Christa Datz-Winter,
a non-Muslim woman, ruled against the Moroccan woman, citing the
qur’anic verse that at face value allows husbands to beat rebellious wives.
Ironically, the plaintiff would have received greater protection from
Moroccan law. How is it that in Europe a non-Muslim judge, un-
trained in shari‘a, can use it to reach a verdict that fails to protect a
woman’s human rights in opposition to German law, whereas in Saudi
Arabia a Muslim lawyer can use shari‘a to protect human rights abuses
that conform to the letter but not the intention of Saudi law? Datz-
Winter was removed, but the case caused concern among Germany’s
Muslims that state officials with no training in shari‘a might use it
against them.

Islam calls not simply for the application of shari‘a but its just appli-
cation. Scholars heavily nuance the verse that appears to permit hus-
bands to beat rebellious wives. The goal of marital dissension is
reconciliation, not violence. Scholars also note that the prophet Mu-
hammad, ultimate standard of Muslim behavior, never hit his wives
and actually stated that whoever does so is ignoble (la’im). Furthermore,
the verse does not specify the means of beating, which scholars have
limited to a siwak, a stick no bigger than a small twig that Muslims
sometimes use to clean between the teeth. Datz-Winter was ignorant
not only of the shari‘a reasoning but also of family law in Islam and the
duties it imposes on both spouses. Had the husband in this case fulfilled
those duties, such as care and maintenance of the family? Had the
woman failed to fulfill hers, including her duty to make herself sexually
available if physically and psychologically able? If not, the verse not-
withstanding, punishment would have no support from shari‘a. This is
not to say that the verse is not problematic, but it is also necessary to
appreciate how Muslims deal with it.
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We are faced with a field of conundrums when it comes to religion
and human rights. Does the fact that human rights are spelled out by
international conventions make them superfluous for believers? After
all, religious traditions emphasize respect and care for others. Muslim
esteem for human life is grounded in the Qur’an, which in one verse
says that God has honored all humans, in another that all humans come
from a single soul, and in another that killing a single soul is equivalent
to killing humanity entire and saving a single soul to saving all human-
ity. A key concept in Islam is inviolability (hurma). Certain things have
been made inviolable by God. Religion is one of those things, but so
are life, progeny, dignity, and property. A key notion at play in Muslim
society is mutual respect (ihtiram). Scripture, both Bible and Qur’an,
may not speak of human rights explicitly, but it is not difficult to find
texts that call for compassion toward others: the parable of the Good
Samaritan in the New Testament and the verse in the Qur’an (4:36)
that ties true belief to kindness—not only to parents and family but also
to the needy and neighbors, whether blood relatives or not. Why, then,
do believers need international conventions to inform them of standards
of human rights?

The religious concept of human dignity does not mean indiscrimi-
nate freedom to do as one pleases. Similarly, the protection of human
rights means more than individual liberties. People have rights and free-
doms but also need a public order to realize them. Thus religious con-
cepts of dignity and secular concepts of human rights both assume a set
of moral constraints but differ in the way they name them. Islam is
clear about the right to be free from the tyranny of the powerful but
would also say that God has rights—above all the right to be wor-
shipped. Blasphemy would therefore violate God’s rights. His rights
also limit certain kinds of behavior: alcohol consumption, extramarital
sex, false accusation, theft, and so on. God has rights, but he has also
specified rights for his servants, that is, humans. These human rights
give further direction to legitimate behavior: no exploitation of the
weak, no homicide, no unjust contracts.

This system of divinely ordained rights exists to protect society, pre-
serve life, and foster decency. Why would one want to be liberated from
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the rights of God? The atrocities suffered by Jewish and other peoples
in World War II tragically demonstrated the need for a document such
as the 1948 Universal Declaration of Human Rights. No one, however,
suggested the Jews need to be protected from Judaism. Rather, they,
like everyone, need to be protected from barbaric states. Muslims too
want to be protected, and it would sound odd that such protection is to
be achieved by liberation from Islam.

There is, to be sure, slippage when it comes to religion and human
rights. Does one forfeit human rights, such as the right to life, if one
fails to respect God’s rights? The key issue here is the relation of state
power to the rights of God. Some states see their rule as part of God’s
rights and define infractions against God’s rights as a challenge to their
rule. Some nonstate actors equate justice exclusively with the rights of
God and take God’s law into their own hands, attacking secular society
indiscriminately as abominable to God. In many places, religion and its
moral guidelines are a communal performance and not the choice of
individuals. This is not inherently problematic (one can simply leave
the community) but becomes problematic when the communal way of
life—Islam in this case—is tied to national loyalty. Religious dissenters
become public enemies, and what is religiously prohibited becomes
punishable by national law.

There are serious punishments for offending the rights of God—
stoning for adultery, amputation for theft, lashing for alcohol consump-
tion. But the shari‘a heritage goes out of its way to keep enforcement
of God’s rights from state power. For example, throughout the Otto-
man period, roughly 700 years, there is no record that the state ever put
anyone to death for adultery. It could be said that Islam traditionally
places the duty of enforcing God’s rights on the individual who violates
them as a form of penance to expiate for sins. The sinner could request
to be lashed for alcohol consumption or stoned to death for adultery to
face God on judgment day with a clean slate, but the state is not to go
out of its way to enforce God’s rights.

Of course, God’s rights sometimes overlap with state concerns for
public order—crime and theft. What should be punished by law and
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enforced by the state and what should be punished by individual pen-
ance? And what is the purpose of applying shari‘a punishments? It de-
pends on who is doing the punishing. If applied by individuals and
communities, the goal might be expiation of sins or religious reform. If
applied by the state, the goal might be public order, depending on the
offense against God’s rights in question. When the state begins to pun-
ish offenses that are more relevant to individual and communal reform
than to public order, however, it is likely seeking to distract attention
from its political failures by displaying its willingness to enforce the
rights of God.

One should not overstate the case for religious freedom apart from
legitimate political concerns. Political oversight of religion is not a
unique product of the modern state. In the past, however, it was limited
to the state’s duty to preserve public order. Nizam al-Mulk, the great
vizier of the Seljuk dynasty, struck down by Isma‘ili assassins in 1092,
remarked in a celebrated treatise on politics that disorder in religious
affairs produces chaos in the land. When heresy grows rife, rebels ap-
pear. Political authorities therefore need to monitor beliefs, and this the
viziers of past Islam did, sponsoring debates on all matters of creed to
test them against humanistic reflection. But Nizam al-Mulk’s call for
political supervision of beliefs did not mean inquisition of souls. People
could believe what they wanted in the private forum, but beliefs in
public could not disturb the tranquility of society.4 The state had a
duty to ensure that religion not descend into confessional factionalism.
Today, state management of belief includes secular no less than reli-
gious beliefs. It is a balancing act.

Public order was not only the interest of rulers. It also mattered to
religion. The scholarly custodians of shari‘a affirmed the importance of
public order and the duty of the ruler to ensure it. Abu Yusuf (died
798), a prominent legal scholar of his day, addressed a treatise to the
Abbasid Caliph Harun al-Rashid (ruled 786–809). In it, echoing the
Qur’an, Abu Yusuf emphasized the ruler’s responsibility for the com-
mon good (salah). He maintained that the ruler’s political judgment
could override prophetic precedent if doing so furthered the public in-
terests of Muslim society. Abu Yusuf identified the purpose of rule as
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protection of the common good. It therefore has a religious claim on
the obedience of believers. Thus, though scholars have always defended
the independence of Islam, they also recognize that politics has its own
legitimate purposes that cannot be undermined by claims to religious
freedom.

Past concerns continue today. Beliefs in Islam sometimes become
cacophonous to the point of endangering public order, one group at-
tacking another for its particular creed, its veneration of saints, or its
manner of praying. To be sure, rulers can exaggerate this danger to
justify heavy-handed treatment of political dissent, but the chaos of
beliefs can be destabilizing when beliefs translate into political posi-
tions. Fatwas, traditionally confined to ritual and moral life, were in the
past occasionally issued in support of dynastic interests. But today
fatwa-givers increasingly address political issues much more broadly on
their own initiative and with complete lack of coherency: for and
against U.S. policies in Iraq, for and against suicide attacks, for and
against democracy, for and against peace with Israel, for and against
honor killing, and so on. This challenges the policymaking powers of
political authorities, fostering turmoil in society where individual citi-
zens take their political positions from fatwas not geared to the com-
mon good of a nation but to a particular set of beliefs.5 Today, the
question is not heresy as potential cause of rebellion, as Nizam al-Mulk
feared. But beliefs are diverse and divisive, and when they shape politi-
cal attitudes they undermine a state’s ability to hold a nation together.
This, as scholars of past Islam recognized, justifies political oversight of
religion—not its ritual and moral teachings but its place in public life.

For this reason, many nations in Muslim lands, including those ruled
by secular states, refer to religion in their constitutions. Article 29 of
the Indonesian constitution says that the state is based on the belief in
the One and Only God. Article 116 of the Malaysian constitution de-
fines ethnic Malays as Muslim. Article 2 of the Algerian constitution
says that Islam is the religion of the state, and article 76 calls the presi-
dent to glorify Islam. Article 3 of the Syrian constitution says that Islam
is the religion of the president and also a principal source of national
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law. All these nations are secular republics, unlike, for example, the
Islamic republics of Pakistan and Iran, which themselves have very dif-
ferent notions of the relation of the state to Islam. But the close relation
these secular states have to Islam raises questions of identity. Indeed,
these nations all have well-staffed ministries of religion within the state
structure, charged with the task of managing beliefs: A state ministry
appoints mosque preachers and monitors the content of sermons and
national religious education. Even Turkey and Uzbekistan, which make
no constitutional reference to Islam, have such ministries.

The religious authorities employed in these ministries are sometimes
referred to as the sultan’s clergy (shuyukh al-sultan); their credibility
among believers, especially those who dislike the state, is suspect. This
situation, however, does not make Islam completely subservient to state
policies. The state-aligned religious authorities do recognize the duty
of the state to manage national affairs but they also make use of their
positions to give the morals of Islam greater play in public discourse.
And they do not always capitulate to state requests. Their willingness
to bless state policies depends on shifting political circumstances, but
the point is that the political management of Islam is not a modern
phenomenon that appeared with the rise of the nation state.6

What is new is the demand on states to respond to international
standards of human rights that some Muslims see as offensive to Islam.
Some Muslims ascribe double standards to the intentions of interna-
tional organizations, and there may be reason to doubt the way interna-
tional conventions are applied at a local level. Indeed, some states can
exploit secular principles to justify authoritarian rule over believers who,
as believers, are deemed rationally unfit to know what is best for the
nation in the modern age. In addition to managing beliefs at home,
states are also under pressure to bring the beliefs of the nation into line
with international expectations. The ability of the state to do this de-
pends on a number of factors—including the willingness of religious
authorities to commit Islam to new realities. Some believers see this as
a way to secularize Muslim society. Is the international community to
determine God’s religion?
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At the same time, state management of beliefs sometimes implicates
religion in human rights abuse. Why? Religion, after all, can be a great
defender of human rights. Some states ignore the moral purposes of
shari‘a, subordinating it to the logic of politics. The result can be a very
narrow application of shari‘a that targets women. In places like Nigeria,
Pakistan, and Saudi Arabia, punishment of unwed mothers, even when
the cause of pregnancy is unclear, becomes the litmus test for the Is-
lamic identity of the state irrespective of other considerations. These
cases are not, then, about shari‘a per se but the subversion of its moral
vision to political interests or tribal honor. Honor killings in Muslim
societies are often justified in the name of shari‘a, but the practice origi-
nates in tribal law. Adultery does carry the death penalty, but there are
conditions that make it almost impossible to prosecute.7 For example,
there must be four witnesses to the act of penetration, which is highly
unlikely. And prudence traditionally guides all hudud cases, that is,
those that could result in corporal punishment. A shari‘a principle states
that judges should avoid hudud punishments whenever there are doubts
(idra’ al-hudud bi-l-shubuhat); circumstantial evidence is not enough to
apply hudud.

Targeting women and minorities is an easy way for a state to pretend
to Islamic legitimacy without having to subject itself to the demands of
shari‘a justice. State authorities sometimes uphold shari‘a rulings
(ahkam) without regard to their greater aims and intentions (maqasid).
To make it seem that it is committed to Islam, a state declares its readi-
ness to execute homosexuals; stone an unmarried woman for a rape-
induced pregnancy; or deny a divorced woman financial support from
her husband beyond what shari‘a stipulates, even if it results in her
impoverishment.8 The sad irony is that these states fail to meet shari‘a
standards when it comes to public life in general—rule of law, national
prosperity, basic rights that Islam would protect, such as rights against
state torture. The Qur’an is very clear about the fate of hypocrites.

This is where human rights have a role in Islam, not to replace shari‘a
but to ensure that its purposes are not subverted. When not co-opted
by political actors, shari‘a can be, as it has been in the past, a great
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bulwark against state tyranny. Public morality is important but not at
the cost of human rights that shari‘a itself enshrines, above all the right
not to be subject to political oppression. Islam may not recognize au-
tonomy from shari‘a, that is, the rights of God, though it may postpone
punishment for transgressing his rights to judgment day, but it does
recognize autonomy from political oppression, that is, from tyranny and
terrorism in the name of worldly goals. Autonomy in Islam, as noted in
chapter 5, is affirmed in relation to political power, not shari‘a. Political
liberties are fully consonant with Islam even if moral liberties are not.
There are some gray areas. For example, do women and non-Muslims
enjoy full political rights in Muslim society, such as the right to exercise
political authority at the highest level? One could ask a similar question
of other societies. Is the French public comfortable with a citizen of
Arab origin exercising political authority at the highest level?

Muslims do need to be protected—not from God and his ways but
from the ungodly ways in which his will is implemented. There is, of
course, the question of moral autonomy. Some Muslims may want to
be free of God and his rights. This is a controversial issue in societies
that emphasize common virtues. But the long-standing consensus in
Islam is that apostates are not to be killed if their apostasy is not trea-
sonous, that is, does not threaten the moral fabric of Muslim society.
This would, of course, limit atheism to the closets of Muslim society,
but the same is true, apparently, of atheism in the U.S. military. Many
Muslim women in France, for example, are grateful for the national ban
on the headscarf in the national schools because it relieves them of
communal pressure to wear one against their will. At the same time,
there are those who feel the ban violates the rights of the Muslim com-
munity in France to fulfill the rights of God. The emergent sense
among Muslims is that shari‘a functions best, its purposes most effec-
tively served, when it works hand in hand with international standards
of human rights as a check against politically motivated applications of
shari‘a.9 Women should be protected from wearing the headscarf
against their will but should also not be prevented from wearing it if
they choose to do so. Human rights do not replace shari‘a but help it
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protect Muslims and even Islam from politicized distortions of its pur-
poses. The former president of Iran, Muhammad Khatami, is a leading
example of this type of thinking.

Religion greatly values human dignity but does not necessarily cele-
brate the individual above all else. It may affirm the value of individual
conscience but at the same time does not abandon the idea of an objec-
tive moral order. Some formulations of human rights are radically indi-
vidualistic, defining the human as autonomous and unencumbered by
any duties whatsoever, whether to God or to others. Some feel that
human rights are simply the latest chapter in the West’s attempt to
colonize other peoples: The modern formulation of human rights,
though European in origin, is promoted as universal norm. In this view,
human rights become a neocolonial tool to impose a secularized defini-
tion of human life on societies that hold religion dear. Are human rights
just a way for European powers to get the rest of the world to be atheist
too and embrace individualism as the climax of human civilization?
Many nations—China comes to mind—have used this line of reasoning
to justify noncompliance with human rights standards in the name of
cultural specificity. The United States sometimes ignores human rights
standards in the name of national interests. Indeed, under the adminis-
tration of George W. Bush, the U.S. government committed actions
that the Founding Fathers gave as reasons for declaring independence
from the British Crown (e.g., transporting combatants overseas to be
tried for pretended offences). State authorities find all sorts of loopholes
to get around human rights standards. Our concern here, however, is
with religion. Does it have a unique conception of human existence
with implications for human rights? Does religion itself obstruct human
rights?

Robert Kraynak, author of Christian Faith and Modern Democracy:
God and Politics in the Fallen World, has argued that modern definitions
of human rights are traceable to the Enlightenment, not to Christianity.
Thus, Christianity, though not necessarily opposed to human rights,
does not see them as the end and purpose of human existence but as a
way to ensure the common good. Christian groups of various sorts do
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act as great defenders of human rights today. They bring global atten-
tion to the plight of the poor, decry state tyranny against citizens, and
make social justice a pillar of the Christian mission.

Still, the Christian affirmation of human rights does not mean that
Christians view humans as morally autonomous with no purpose other
than doing what they please irrespective of God’s rights. Christianity—
like Islam—affirms freedom from tyranny and oppression but not free-
dom from God. This does not mean that people lose their human rights
if they commit moral infractions (or even crimes) at odds with the Holy
Spirit. Rather, society is to protect and build up human life in the image
of God. It is this that makes human dignity God-given—and therefore
inalienable—and gives humanity an unparalleled stature in the created
order. But it does not mean individual rights without consideration of
the common good of all. The right to be free, politically, from state
tyranny is sometimes conflated with the right to be free, morally, from
duties to others. Human rights cannot offer a pretext to ignore the
connection and duty humans have to one another as common children
of God.

Freedom in Christianity, Kraynak argued, is about rights granted by
God to humans, but these rights are not absolute or unconditional.
They must be balanced by God-given duties to care for the needs of
others and society as a whole, including economic justice for all. Human
rights in Christianity would not include the right to abortion or same-
sex marriage or the right to neglect the poor and uneducated or the
right to make a contract that is technically legal but clearly immoral.
Such rights would conflict with the rights of God, glorifying (even dei-
fying) individual autonomy over the purpose of society, namely the
good of all as set forth in natural and divine law. Freedom for Christian-
ity, as for Islam, is not absolute but exists for a moral purpose.

This does not mean that religion devalues personal experience, even
subjectivity, especially when it comes to human encounter with God,
but it can diverge from liberalism in the modernist sense. Kraynak has
posited that modernist liberalism amounts to a call to protect individual
liberties not only in the political realm but also in the moral one, the
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right to determine one’s own moral way of life without reference to the
moral way of life set down by God as known from the natural order of
the universe and divine revelation. Of course, God’s mercy extends even
to those considered morally profligate, who are created in the image of
God no less than others and who have a dignity that must be respected
regardless of moral stature or political standing. And there are religious
arguments for protecting moral liberties no less than political liberties.
Religion, though, cannot overlook the rights of God. Similarly, with
Islam, there is liberty—political liberty but not to the detriment of reli-
gious morality.

Islam is a tightly regulated economy of rights (huquq) owed to God,
to fellow humans, and even to oneself. God has the right to be wor-
shipped, as embodied in various ritual duties, but has also revealed sanc-
tions against harmful behavior, as noted above. Believers who commit
offenses will have to pay the penalty either in this world or the next.
But God, if he chooses, can cover over (satr) the sins of people in his
mercy (rahma). The prophet Muhammad embodied this godly charac-
ter as model ruler, ensuring justice and righteousness but also willingly
foregoing retribution for a greater moral purpose, such as peace in
society.

Members of society also have duties to one another, and God has
forbidden Muslims from transgressing the life, property, and dignity of
others without cause (e.g., if the person is a murderer and judged to
deserve death or is an unrepentant blasphemer who also works against
the common good of Muslim society). Spouses have duties to one an-
other and to their children. In this sense, adultery is seen as a crime
against the rights of others. Society as a whole has a duty to care for
the weak and poor, and relations between individuals are to be guided
by justice, that is, everyone getting their due, especially when it comes
to commerce. Islam places great emphasis on keeping promises and
fulfilling contracts. When obligations are not met, justice can be sought,
but there is also the option to be merciful towards others in imitation
of the prophet. Rulers are to be obeyed as long as they do not transgress
the rights of God and his servants (i.e., humans). This could imply just
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rule or rule that does not offend Islam’s morality or, at a minimum, rule
that does not prevent believers from performing their ritual duties (e.g.,
praying, fasting, and so on).

This does not mean that such infractions of God’s rights, such as
adultery and neglect of the poor, do not exist in Muslim society, but
the point of shari‘a is to protect individuals. This is done by establishing
a moral society in which people exist not as a collection of individuals
but are bound together in right relations under God through a web
of rights and duties. Islam views society not as a random sample of
disconnected individuals, affirmed in their rights and unencumbered by
others, but as a complex of persons with duties no less than rights. That
is the goal of Islam: to build religious communities respectful of modest
living, not religious states, for that would put religious authority in the
hands of state officials rather than communal leaders. The state, siyasa
governance, is tasked with the preservation of public order, including
enforcement of duties people owe to one another, but there have always
been restrictions, affirmed by shari‘a, on the scope of siyasa supervision
of the moral life of society.10 A concept of privacy, the inviolability of
the family home and personal conscience, is strongly affirmed in Islam,
even if public display of one’s private life is discouraged. The history of
Islam is relatively free of inquisitorial tendencies. People’s morals have
traditionally been judged by their public conduct rather than their be-
liefs, and hypocrites were left to God to deal with in the next life and
not to humans in this one.

Muslim scholars realized long ago that Islam had not been revealed
without a purpose. God is not playing a game with humans. Rather,
Islam had been revealed for the good of society. As a result, although
specific precedents are important, they cannot be applied if the result
undermines public interests (masalih), and long-standing principles
speak to this. For example, no harm to self or others (la darar wa-la
dirar) means that a shari‘a precedent is not to be applied if doing so
causes harm to oneself or to others or, especially, to society as a whole.
Another principle states that repelling evil takes precedence over pro-
curing good (dar’ al-sharr muqaddam ‘ala jalb al-khayr), meaning that
shari‘a, understood as the good in Islam, cannot be applied if it would



206 CHAPTER SIX

produce harm such as civil strife. A hierarchy of principles thus inform
shari‘a processes, the highest of which are called the five necessities.
They are called necessities because the failure to preserve them would
result in chaos in society, undermining the very purpose of shari‘a.
These five interests, understood as universal interests, that is, as com-
mon to all, are the preservation of religion, life, progeny, dignity, and
property.

These principles are conceived as duties owed to individuals rather
than individual rights, but they do reflect a Muslim understanding of
basic rights, that is, things that cannot be violated—they enjoy inviola-
bility (hurma). In premodern Islam, the term for right (haqq) had the
same connotation as ius (right) in premodern Europe, that is, what is
due a person. In this sense, it is the right of a criminal to be punished
because that is his due. In Islam, it is held that one’s moral duties to
God and to others and to self cannot be fulfilled without a properly
functioning intellect, and so it is the Muslim’s right not to be intoxi-
cated, given that intoxication would prevent one from fulfilling what is
due God and due others.

Rights cannot be conceived apart from duties; in Islam, humans are
both right-bearing and duty-owing. A couple has sexual rights over
each other because that is what they owe each other when physically
able to do so. Premodern conceptions of rights in Islam, however, in-
creasingly coalesce with modern discourse on human rights. In other
words, the possibility of synergy between shari‘a and human rights is in
the works. The results are not unambiguous, but it does mean that
Muslims are finding ways to combine universal concepts of human life
with particular shari‘a norms.

Max Stackhouse argues that human rights necessarily involve both
universal principles and particular expressions of them.11 Universal prin-
ciples of human rights are often abstract and make no sense unless
expressed in the language of local culture and traditions, which often
include religious sentiment. In the United States, affirmation of human
liberties as well as calls for moral values are sometimes framed in reli-
gious language. Likewise, it is more accurate to consider shari‘a as a
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heritage of particular rulings (precedents) that must also be consistent
with universal principles as defined by shari‘a, that is, the five necessi-
ties, which, although abstract, enshrine core values of human existence.
Thus particular precedents, if no longer in harmony with universal prin-
ciples, need to be reconsidered if shari‘a is going to be applied according
to the intentions for which it was revealed, that is, the good of human-
ity. Such a process unfolds only gradually, and here it is illustrated in
view of gender rights in Islam.

In the past, in Muslim society as elsewhere, women did not enjoy
political and legal equality with men, nor did they hold public office.
Their place was the home. In Islam, this did not mean that they could
not leave the home or even pursue a trade. Rather, in light of the norms
of the day, they were unfit to hold authority over others, public author-
ity, such as caliph or judge, as in other premodern contexts. Elements
from the religious heritage were used to legitimize what would today
be considered restrictions on women. Many religious authorities, but
by no means all, defined women as intellectually and religiously defi-
cient. As such, they could not hold authority over others. Biblical verse
has been used for similar purpose. All of that has today been challenged,
in Muslim society as elsewhere. It is now generally assumed that
women have rights in the public sphere—to vote, to hold political of-
fice, to be appointed or elected to judgeships, if they have appropriate
credentials. Islam, which in the past was interpreted to uphold the sec-
ondary status of women, is capable of responding to current realities.

For example, the argument that women are not fit for public author-
ity is based on a verse in the Qur’an that suggests that a woman’s testi-
mony in court is inferior to a man’s. However, in issues specific to the
female body, such as adultery and abortion, Islam has always recognized
the full weight of female testimony. The operative principle in evaluat-
ing the weight of a person’s testimony is thus not gender but compe-
tence. This makes it possible to reconsider past precedents limiting
female testimony in light of a contemporary reality where women dem-
onstrate competence in public life. Of course, despite scriptural ac-
knowledgment of the equality of women and men before God, Islam,
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like traditional forms of Judaism and Christianity, bars women from
the leading role in ritual life, that is, the community’s liturgy, despite
ancient examples of female excellence in shari‘a learning and hadith
teaching. The fifty-eighth chapter of the Qur’an, The Female Dispu-
tant (al-Mujadila), was revealed to vindicate a woman against the
prophet Muhammad in a divorce case he had dismissed in favor of her
husband. There are also verses in Scripture that speak of all, male and
female, as equal in Christ, but Evangelicals do not recognize the reli-
gious authority of women, preferring other verses that seem to forbid
the public voice of women, particularly Paul’s First Letter to Timothy
(2:9–15). Were such verses meant for all time? Our goal here is not to
address gender roles within the religious community, which are not
decisively linked to human rights, provided people have the option to
leave the religious community, but rather the religion’s view of women’s
rights in public life. Is she to be confined to the family home night and
day on the basis of now outdated interpretations of God’s will?

There are precedents but there are also principles that can work to
overcome or renew past teachings. The Qur’an is understood by some
to give public authority to men exclusively. Increasingly, albeit not
without resistance, religious authorities recognize that such precedents
no longer hold if Islam is to be true to its principles. There are certainly
Muslim scholars who argue—and Muslim women who agree—that
women exist solely to birth the next generation, but a shift is in the
works where authority is not tied to gender but to competence. Illiter-
acy among women in Muslim societies is high, yet more and more
women are being educated for professional work. Notably, what is
earned by the married Muslim woman is hers to keep according to
Islam because family support is the responsibility of the male, though
if the woman chooses she can use the income for family needs. Of
course, authorities maintain that a woman’s family duties to spouse and
children take precedence over public commitments. Once these duties
are fulfilled, she is free to take a public role in building up Muslim
society at large.
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The pace of renewal is by no means uniform. In Saudi Arabia
women are not seen as an acceptable presence—let alone authority—in
public, whereas in Iran they are free to drive cars, vote, and hold office
(though not as judges). In Egypt women received suffrage rights in
1956 despite the opposition of the religious establishment, but today
the religious establishment recognizes that citizenship extends political
rights to women, including the right to hold public office, and that
these rights are not at odds with their duties as believers.12 They now
call on pious women to vote no less than they call on men, as a way to
ensure respect for Islam in political processes, even if emphasizing the
unique role of women in childrearing. Yet no one in the religious estab-
lishment would say that Muslim women have the right to be immodest
in attire or sexual mores. In other words, shari‘a is being renewed to
ensure consistency with its own principles. As long as women, no less
than men, adhere to the rights of God (i.e., Islam’s morals), nothing in
Islam prevents them from full enjoyment of political rights.

There are conundrums, because it could be argued that people enjoy
political rights only insofar as they embrace shari‘a duties. This was the
case in the premodern past, when full legal capacity was enjoyed only
by free Muslim males, leaving women, non-Muslims, and slaves, even
if their basic rights to life and livelihood were protected, in a secondary
position. History shows the difficulty people have had in separating
creedal commitments from political rights, and yet the trend, in both
Christianity and Islam, is recognition that God’s bestowal of political
rights does not depend on religious loyalties but on the willingness to
exercise such rights in conformity to just laws that preserve public de-
cency and justice, which the state is to guarantee.

That Muslim women need to be liberated from the headscarf to
protect their human rights is a dubious claim, often advanced in the
name of civilizing Muslims, itself a useful pretext to conduct warfare in
the name of liberating women. There are many reasons why a Muslim
woman wears the headscarf: personal piety, deterrent to harassment,
respect for family morals, and so on. But the headscarf is not oppressive
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by definition, given that it does not necessarily keep women from par-
ticipating in public life. In fact, in some cultures where a family’s social
standing is linked to female mores, the scarf is liberating, allowing fe-
males to venture into public life without compromising cultural atti-
tudes about female modesty, attitudes which women themselves accept.
Today, the scarf has been commoditized as a fashion industry: feminine
beauty within moral parameters. The veil continues to be a highly con-
tested issue in the battle between secularism and Islamism, turning the
female body into an ideological battleground, but it is important to
liberate ourselves from the notion that feminism is only western and
secular, requiring sexual liberty along with political liberty. Indeed,
women with and without headscarves increasingly interact in Muslim
society alongside men without provoking a human rights crisis.13

Muslim feminists, then, are not struggling for the right to be im-
modest, to abandon the headscarf or pursue romance apart from mar-
riage. Rather, they are struggling for political and legal equality: siyasa
equality alongside shari‘a morality. Even within the arena of shari‘a,
they have rights, which are seen not in terms of straightforward equality
but complementarity whereby each gender enjoys equity within the
framework of distinct roles; of course, the concept of complementarity
can sometimes be used to keep women in traditional roles. It should be
remembered that rights are never given by the powerful. Equality is
achieved by struggle, as is well known from American history. This is
no less true for Muslim women who join in the struggle for Islam.
Muslim women have been actively participating in the so-called awak-
ening of Islam—al-sahwa—especially the struggle to win respect for
Islam in public life. They expect their male counterparts to acknowl-
edge their contribution to the struggle by recognizing their liberties in
the public sphere. Zaynab al-Ghazali of the Muslim Women’s Associa-
tion was a prime example of this, informing her husbands that her role
in the struggle for Islam gave her full liberty in public life.14 One can
also point to the role of women in the Islamic Revolution in Iran and
in the ongoing contestation over national identity in Turkey—between
a secularist state and a Muslim society. Having struggled on behalf of
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Islam in the public sphere, these women, in the name of Islam, do not
intend to return to traditional definitions of womanhood and have been
disappointed when their male counterparts expect them to do so.15 One
sees a similar trend in Zanan, the Iranian feminist journal,16 and also
in the teachings of Hidayat Tuksal, professor of theology at Ankara
University. These women are not challenging Islam’s morality but want
political liberties as well as legal equality in the public sphere.

Legal equality, again, is more difficult within the scope of shari‘a
where the concept of equity is preferred. There are problems here,
though, because it could imply that women have a secondary legal status
when it comes to shari‘a concerns that others would not view as specific
to religion—divorce, court testimony, child custody, and the like; but
even here, shari‘a development is possible, as seen in Morocco’s 2004
family law that gave women equal rights in family life. It should be
noted, however, that the immediate results of this development have
been very mixed. Attitudes about gender do not change simply because
the law does.

Islam has its own internal logic of rights, which is not necessarily
inconsistent with human rights. The challenge is not rights per se but
rather a secularized conceptualization of human life that Muslims, like
Christians, find troubling. Human rights discourse often emphasizes
moral as well as political autonomy, the rights of individuals over the
rights of communities. Humans have rights but so does God. Muslim
women are claiming modernity in a unique way, not as arbiters of their
own moral destiny but as political actors in modern society.

Some might posit that the communitarian vision of the human being
is incompatible with individual rights. This would be true if a religious
community were given state backing to punish those who offend its
beliefs and values. It is not a community’s values per se that pose a
problem to those who dissent from them, but rather a state that in the
name of national identity claims jurisdiction over a community’s values,
especially international communities—a state-defined national identity
over against a community’s extranational identity. The question, then,
is not whether communal values result in human rights abuses, for ex-
ample, when a community bans or ostracizes dissenters, but whether
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states have the right to enforce communal values. Does a state have
jurisdiction over the rights of God? Is the state to be object of worship
along with God? There have been heads of state who expected quasi-
divine reverence, placing themselves above the law and formulating reli-
gion in highly nationalistic terms.

One of the most egregious contemporary examples is President Sa-
parmurat Niyazov of Turkmenistan, who until his death in 2006 con-
sidered himself both president and prophet. He required citizens to
accept his spiritual teaching, the Ruhnama, and forced Muslims to re-
vere it alongside the Qur’an. Is it the state that claims loyalty on our
core beliefs and values or a nonstate and even extraterritorial (i.e., extra-
national) authority? Catholics are dispersed in nations across the globe
and are led by local bishops, but they also look to the Vatican as spiritual
guide and moral authority. This does not poses challenges to national
loyalties but can cause tensions when national laws contradict the moral
teachings of the Church.

As noted earlier, some Muslims, especially in Europe, feel split be-
tween national and extranational (religious) identities. Are they des-
tined for radicalization? Can a nation accommodate the religiosity of
minorities, such as Muslims in Europe, within its cultural heritage?
Will Europe have to be Islamized or Islam Europeanized? It most likely
will not be so black or white. But European societies may reconsider
ways religion is, or is not, recognized in the national heritage, to include
space for Islam along with Christian symbols and secular principles.
This is not to overlook Europe’s welcome of large numbers of immi-
grants, including Muslims, but tensions arise when nations are blind to
communal concerns for the rights of God. In other words, there is
danger in establishing religion but also in establishing secularism
whereby believers automatically become nonconformists.

State-defined national projects—whether religious or secular—often
seek legitimacy by claiming the right to liberate or protect women,
turning the female body into a battleground where national and extra-
national views of authority and identity clash. At this globalizing mo-
ment, which is transnationalizing, cross-nationalizing, denationalizing,
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the concept of the nation state is in crisis, and yet national courts remain
the place where human rights questions are negotiated and acceptable
religiosity within the parameters of national identity is defined.

This is strikingly obvious in the case of European Muslims, whose
minority status poses a question about the relation between national
(siyasa-defined) and religious (shari‘a-defined) identity, with all kinds
of confusion and conflation between the two.17 A similar tension can
be noticed elsewhere, making it worthwhile to think more expansively
about national identities and their ability to accommodate the extrana-
tional identity of religious minorities. Certainly, extranational elements
can become politicized, posing a threat to the security of the state and
the continuation of national identity. The 2005 bombings in London,
carried out by Muslim youth born and raised in Britain, demonstrates
the seriousness of this dilemma, and Britain has moved to ban groups
(such as Hizb ut-Tahrir) that foster religious radicalization. There are,
then, security concerns, but we need to be careful about conflating them
with religion in general. To what extent should a state regulate or in-
hibit the moral life of religious communities? The space accorded to
Islam in public life is partly the result of culturally distinct understand-
ings of the place of religion in national life but also reflects state man-
agement of public order.18

After fifteen years of controversy and debate, France decided in 2004

to forbid the ostensible display of all religious symbols in state institu-
tions, that is, students in state schools and civil servants employed in
government institutions: Jewish skullcaps, Sikh turbans, Christian
crosses, as well as the Muslim headscarf. It has been argued that
France’s national self-understanding as laı̈cité warranted the ban on all
display of religion. And yet some states in Germany, such as Baden-
Württemberg or Bayern-Bavaria, also restrict the Muslim headscarf—
but not Christian symbols—in state institutions.19 In these cases, public
identity is keyed not to laı̈cité but to a cultural heritage that acknowl-
edges Christianity to the exclusion of other religions. In Italy, to cite
another example, it was decided to keep crucifixes in state institutions,
including courts, not for theological considerations but as part of the
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nation’s cultural heritage. However, unlike the German states, Italy
opted for accommodation alongside the public privileging of Christian
symbols, allowing the Muslim headscarf in state institutions. That reli-
gion is not the issue per se in the headscarf controversy in Europe is
evidenced by the support of Europe’s Jewish and Christian leaders for
the right of Muslim women to wear the headscarf in all circumstances.
Other religions in Europe support the religious rights of Muslims be-
cause they too recognize the dilemma of making national identity arbi-
ter of what is and what is not acceptable religion. Is God to be
worshipped or the state? What does this say about the rights of God
when limited by state policymaking?

This tension is at play in all nations, including Muslim lands. How
do non-Muslims fit into a Sudanese or Iranian nationality that is de-
fined in terms of Islam? The tension between state-defined national
identity and other identities involves not only non-Muslim but also
Muslim minorities who do not fit into the religiosity deemed acceptable
by the state, such as Wahhabism in Saudi Arabia and Sunnism in Paki-
stan. This raises questions about the national belonging of Shi‘i minori-
ties, to say nothing of Christians.

The tension is also at play when a Muslim-majority nation has a
state that defines its identity against Islam, such as in Turkey and Uzbe-
kistan. Despite the religiosity of its citizens, the secularist state, through
courts and state-controlled ministries of religious affairs, determines
acceptable religiosity. Ironically, today, states—secular entities—claim
jurisdiction over religious life. That the state in the modern context
plays a key role in defining acceptable religiosity in the public sphere is
a challenge to the rights of God from the Muslim perspective and to
religious freedom from the human rights perspective. The Beckett
Fund for Religious Liberty traces all kinds of state abuse of religious
freedom. The victims are as often Muslims as not. What do we do in
cases where the rights of religious minorities are left out of state defini-
tions of acceptable religiosity? We still have a long way to go in dealing
with this tension between national identity and attachment to extrana-
tional (that is, religious, even otherworldly) belonging, both of which
show no signs of disappearing.
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Religion faces a dilemma, both Christianity and Islam. What to
make of a nation’s law-making process that is blind to a religion’s view
of human existence, especially its moral outlook? In response, a reli-
gious community, perceiving the nation to be a threat to its values and
way of life, may set itself in opposition to the national culture, empha-
sizing its group identity over national belonging. Religion affirms liber-
ties but not without moralities, humans rights but also God’s rights.
Thus the debate over the nature of human rights raises a question that
has been at play throughout this book. What is religion? Is it to be
understood as group identity in the political sense, over and against
other identities, or as a religious consciousness with an organic vision
of its own, a God-consciousness, that can engage human society not to
control it politically but to engage it morally? However important group
identity is as departure point, if religion is reduced to group identity,
then religions, Christianity and Islam, will have nothing to do with one
another. But if religion is also about God-consciousness, then religions
can find common motive and common purpose beyond group identity,
a sense of being similarly even if uniquely moved toward God, religious
friends with common ground, not enemies across an abyss of religious
animosity. Oddly, the question of Christian-Muslim relations has a
direct bearing on the relation of the extranational identity of religions
to national identity. If Christians and Muslims promote in their mutual
relation a fuller understanding of religion as not simply group identity
but also and more profoundly God-consciousness, it would affect their
view and way of relating to nations and political authorities: not as
group identity over and against the nation but as God-consciousness
that can embrace the nation in its worldview, creating positive rather
than negative synergy between religious convictions and national goods.
The nature of Christian-Muslim relations is important not only for the
way these two sets of believers view each other but also for the chal-
lenges and possibilities of global politics today.

NOTES

1. At the same time, advocacy for female ordination often gets linked to sup-
port for homosexuality and abortion rights. Because of this, female ordination gets



216 CHAPTER SIX

tagged as part of a morally permissive culture that views all activity, including the
divine office, in terms of individual rights. The issue, then, may not be female
ordination per se but rather its association with a definition of human existence
that many do not share. Decoupling female ordination from these issues, it has
been argued, presenting it not as a right but as a calling from God, might allow for
its acceptance. See Pamela D. H. Cochran, Evangelical Feminism (New York: New
York University Press, 2005); and Mark Chaves, Ordaining Women: Culture and
Conflict in Religious Organizations (Cambridge, MA: Harvard University Press,
1997).

2. Daniel Price, ‘‘Islam and Human Rights: A Case of Deceptive First Ap-
pearances,’’ Journal for the Scientific Study of Religion 41, no. 2 (2002): 213–25.

3. For the different situations facing Muslim communities in the United
States and Europe, see Philippa Strum and Danielle Tarantolo, eds., Muslims in the
United States (Washington, DC: Woodrow Wilson International Center for Schol-
ars, 2003); Marcel Maussen, ‘‘The Governance of Islam in Western Europe: A
State of the Art Report,’’ IMISCOE Working Papers No. 16 (Amsterdam: Interna-
tional Migration, Integration & Social Cohesion, June 2007).

4. This was a widely held notion in his day. See, for example, al-Juwayni,
Ghiyath al-Umam, ed. ‘Abd al-‘Azim al-Dib, 2nd ed. (Cairo: al-Maktabat al-
Kubra, 1981), 215–22. The idea of coercing people into communal harmony should
not be seen as a contradiction to the qur’anic verse that forbids religious coercion
(la ikraha fi l-din, 2:256) but as part of the logic of governance (i.e., achievement of
a harmonious polity). The idea can be found in both al-Farabi, Tahsil al-Sa‘ada, ed.
Ja‘far Al Yasin (Beirut: Dar al-Andalus, 1981), 79; and the Brethren of Purity, Rasa’il
Ikhwan al-Safa’, ed. Khayr al-Din al-Zirikli, 4 vols. in 2 (Cairo: al-Matba‘a al-
‘Arabiyya, 1928), section IV, letter 3, 83.

5. Mu‘tazz al-Khatib, ‘‘Fiqh wa-l-Faqih wa-l-Dawlatu l-Haditha . . . Ma-
shakil al-Tanafus bayna al-Quwwatayn: Fatwa wa-Qanun’’ al-Hayat, July, 21, 2007,
14.

6. See, for example, Moch Nur Ichwan, ‘‘‘Ulama’, State and Politics: Majalis
Ulama Indonesia after Suharto,’’ Islamic Law and Society 12, no. 1 (2005): 45–72.
For an example of how state-aligned religious authorities negotiate Islam, see Ron
Shaham, ‘‘State, Feminists and Islamists: The Debate over Stipulations in Marriage
Contracts in Egypt,’’ Bulletin of the School of African and Oriental Studies 62, no. 3

(1999): 462–83.
7. For fornication, that is, extramarital sex by unmarried people, the penalty

is 100 lashes.
8. Bruce B. Lawrence, ‘‘Woman as Subject/Woman as Symbol: Islamic Fun-

damentalism and the Status of Women,’’ Journal of Religious Ethics 22, no.1 (1994):
163–85.



GOD’S RIGHTS: A THREAT TO HUMAN RIGHTS? 217

9. Jumana Shehata, ‘‘Islam and Human Rights: Revisiting the Debate,’’ Arab
Insight 1, no. 1 (2007): 73–88.

10. For an example of how state-aligned religious authorities negotiate Islam,
see Ron Shaham, ‘‘State, Feminists and Islamists.’’

11. Max L. Stackhouse, ‘‘Why Human Rights Need God: A Christian Per-
spective,’’ in Does Human Rights Need God, eds. Elizabeth M. Bucar and Barbara
Barnett (Grand Rapids, MI: William B. Eerdmans, 2005), 25–40.

12. Barbara Stowasser, ‘‘Old Shaykhs, Young Women, and the Internet: The
Rewriting of Women’s Political Rights in Islam,’’ The Muslim World 91 (April 2001):
99–119.

13. Sema Genel and Kerem Karaosmanoglu, ‘‘A New Islamic Individualism in
Turkey: Headscarved Women in the City,’’ Turkish Studies 7, no. 3 (2006): 473–88.

14. Miriam Cooke, ‘‘Zaynab al-Ghazali: Saint or Subversive?’’ Die Welt des
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C O N C L U S I O N

ISLAM

Not a Separate Species

AMUSLIM cannot partake in the Eucharist. A Christian cannot go
on pilgrimage to Mecca. A Muslim will always question the

cross. A Christian will ask why the need for another prophet. Muslims
refer to themselves as God’s slaves, Christians as God’s children. Theo-
logical differences are significant, but various aspirations are shared, in
particular the desire to live in the presence of the one God. Christianity
and Islam have unique forms of religious expression. A church is not a
mosque. But there is resonance. Christians and Muslims both seek to
get to God: Christians through remembrance of a person, Muslims
through recitation of a book. In both cases, the experience occurs in the
heart. Christians speak of Christ in the heart, Muslims of the Qur’an.
The word of God, in both cases, aims to purify human hearts of all that
would separate believers from God. Whether remembrance of a person
or recitation of a book, one is speaking in both cases of God’s redemp-
tive action. God is the one who takes the initiative, sending his son,
sending his book, to make it possible for humans to repent and turn
back to him. Without his initiative, reassuring Christians of his love,
Muslims of his mercy, one would despair of being with him. The point,
then, is not only to live a particular kind of life but simply to live life in
its various aspects with a sense of God-consciousness.

Religion is therefore not simply an identity marker. It is a set of
beliefs with intellectual content that all peoples can discuss. People

218
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bring beliefs, both religious and secular, into public life. But once there,
these beliefs are no longer the exclusive possession of the believing com-
munity. Do we know how to discuss beliefs? Do we know how to think
about what moves us most deeply? Religious traditions have unique
claims, but they also take shape across a range of issues that matter to
all peoples. They offer a prism through which a society can explore
ideas of real import and consider the values that most inspire it.

The study of religious pluralism is one way to reflect in this fashion.
It pushes one to look at religion in a broader context and simultaneously
pulls one back to the specifics of a particular tradition. The focus of this
book has been Islam alongside Christianity. Islam is increasingly at
home in a wide range of disciplines: literature, philosophy, political
science, gender studies, and so on. Its prominence in global affairs en-
courages both Muslims and non-Muslims alike to examine their own
beliefs more precisely. It features significantly in policymaking circles.
Religion clearly does not exist in isolation. It is not agreeable to all, but
it is an undeniable reference point.

In this sense, there is a point in studying not simply a plurality of
religions but religious pluralism as well. The concern for religious plu-
ralism is particular to U.S. society but has global dimensions. It is a
key concern in Europe, India, China, Africa, now virtually everywhere.
Religious pluralism is evaluated in different ways from one culture to
another, but believers have always had to consider different kinds of
belief. Since the birth of Islam, Muslims have been thinking about
religion with others, and Christians have been a central interlocutor.
This encounter is not just interreligious communication, one group of
believers introducing themselves to another. There has been sustained
interaction on common ground where the two traditions speak in tan-
dem, sometimes with resonance and sometimes with dissonance. The
other is always a reference point. In this book, the aim has been to
direct attention to the study of religious pluralism by offering one ap-
proach to it—the study of two traditions through a single but refracted
lens.

Christianity and Islam do share ground, but they can also exist with-
out each other. Theologically, they do not need each other. Both look
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to a biblical past but also claim to have completed it on their own
unique terms. Both have also been open to new insights and possibili-
ties. The world, after all, did not end with the coming of Jesus or the
appearance of the Qur’an. For Christians, Jesus Christ is not the end,
but he is final in his uniqueness. Similarly, for Muslims, the Qur’an is
incomparable. Christians see the message of the cross as liberation from
patterns of sinfulness whereby humans inevitably fall short of pleasing
God: God is love. Muslims see the message of the Qur’an as liberation
from patterns of injustice whereby humans associate other interests
with God to justify their own ambitions: God is mercifully one.

Christianity and Islam do not perfectly match. Christians see Islam
as additional, not essential, to the sacred narrative of the biblical heri-
tage. Muslims see Christianity as a partial distortion of it. Indeed, some
religious leaders denigrate the other religion. The common ground is
fragile, but it is there. What does this particular vantage point tell us
about religion?

Despite distinct differences in wordings, especially in relation to
Jesus Christ, Christianity and Islam share a common purpose. Both call
people to live with God. That God, given the common biblical origins,
is the one God. This common purpose is pursued by believers in con-
crete moments in history. But things change, and religious communities
are faced with a challenge. The particulars of the religion may no longer
make sense even if the purpose still does. Doubts encourage new ways
of thinking about the religious tradition so that its purpose is not aban-
doned along with the elements that no longer make sense within a
given historical moment. Skepticism is, then, essential to religion as a
way to ensure that the religious message is never entirely reduced to a
set of definitions, whether articles of faith or rules of behavior. Amidst
the creeds and practices stands a relation that is known but still
mysterious.

This relation is signaled by the face of God. Does this relation offer
ethical insight for human society? It is a relation that can reduce the
power of the ego. It tempers greed that undermines communal har-
mony. In that, the face of God can be seen as a socioeconomic good,
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vital for community sustainability. Indeed, study of the face of God in
this sense may help us rethink whether a system driven by personal
interest alone can guarantee prosperity. But the struggle for a godly
society is not without its own problems, especially when the struggle
fails to see that God’s message, though worth living, is never fully real-
izable as a political project in this world. The face of God in this sense
becomes a source of terror for a world that does not perfectly conform
to its divinity. Great care, then, must be taken in locating evil in light
of the face of God. The face of God is not source of evil but does
sometimes become horribly distorted.

In addition to the disclosure of God, religion also emphasizes moral
teachings, but this does not make it antidemocratic. Some believers
understand moral life as part of a covenant with God. Others see it as
part of a natural law that reflects divine law. A constitution based on
representative democracy apart from divine sovereignty may create ten-
sion with the moral teachings of religion. Does democracy mean liberty
from political tyranny or freedom from moral teachings, including care
of the weak? Are the teachings of religion limited or unlimited? The
way religion and democracy coexist depends on a number of factors,
including definitions about the nature of democracy and the scope of
religion.

Secularism is not a precondition for democracy, but religion, to be
democratic, must acknowledge that the religiously untrained masses are
able to determine God’s will in some areas of life, to say nothing of
their own interests. At the same time, religion also recognizes the cor-
ruptible side of human nature. Religious authorities may denounce as-
pects of public life under both authoritarian and democratic rule.
Religion always runs into trouble when, in the hope of pleasing God,
its representatives seek to limit freedom in the name of divine sover-
eignty. The moral authority of religion actually depends on its own
freedom from political power. To enjoy this freedom, it must grant it
to all.

Religion has come to learn that democracy is not a threat to religious
authority. Indeed, democracy can be religion’s friend. For religion, the
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purpose of rule is the common good, and in some societies, this may
include the prevalence of religious values in public life. Still, even if
democracy is not without its moral dilemmas, religion affirms that no
one can claim to represent the sovereignty of God. Regular elections
effectively work to check rule that fails to govern in the public interest,
stifling the human spirit that religion seeks to promote.

At the same time, religion is a strongly communal phenomenon. It
is especially when believers gather in prayer that they experience life in
the presence of God. Religion, then, sometimes looks askance at the
individualism that democratic sentiment can encourage. The extent to
which religious symbols can be publicly ignored or devalued in the
name of individual freedom depends on the society in question. Ulti-
mately, as religion itself recognizes, beliefs cannot be controlled. Some
societies are uncomfortable with religious freedom, however, and see it
as a source of national instability. Others are uncomfortable with reli-
gion itself. This does not make religion a foe of human rights. Rather,
although human rights are a universal phenomenon, there are different
views on the way universal principles interact with local values, includ-
ing religiously backed values.

Religion holds the human soul to be sacred. Religion also speaks of
God as sacred. What exactly is the relation of the human soul to God?
Does the human soul lose its dignity when it spurns the sanctity of
God? Or is this dignity something intrinsic and indelible, whether or
not it recognizes God’s sanctity? This would argue for equality of con-
science even when the conscience of individuals errs, but religion also
ascribes all life to God. Human life is his. It is inviolable but not auton-
omous, at least not in its interactions with others—with family, neigh-
bor, stranger. For religion, the human person, because it is dignified by
God, is something to be built up. A society that exalts the individual or
certain classes of individuals can actually threaten the dignity of its
weaker members and the prosperity of society as a whole. Religion calls
for the defense of all persons. It thus has a powerful contribution to
make to human rights, challenging authoritarian states as well as socie-
ties that emphasize the rights of individuals over care for all.
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To conclude, this book is by no means exhaustive when it comes to
thinking about Christianity and Islam in tandem. The discussion is
ongoing and can offer much fruit. The goal for this volume has been to
illustrate one way of reflecting on religion, which, I hope many agree,
is a stimulating path for both scholars and believers to take up—and
perhaps even to do so together. Inquiry into religious pluralism is a
great challenge to the prevailing notion of religion as identity marker.
The possibility of common ground, however fragile, means that believ-
ers approach religion not simply as something their group does at cer-
tain times of the week but rather as a comprehensible phenomenon that
can be explored and discussed in light of the wider human experience.
Believers, then, are also rational in the way they comprehend and artic-
ulate beliefs. Therein lies the common ground whereby religion can be
considered pluralistically.
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